
GRANT 
OPPORTUNITIES 
FOR FIRE SAFETY 
EDUCATION

The Healey-Driscoll 
Administration announced 
that applications are being 
accepted for $2 million in 
grants to support fire and 
life safety education for 
children and older adults, 
the people most vulnera-
ble in the event of a fire at 
home.

The Student Awareness 
of Fire Education (SAFE) 
and Senior SAFE grant 
programs are administered 
by the Executive Office of 
Public Safety & Security 
and the Department of Fire 
Services. They send lo-
cal firefighters to schools, 
community groups, senior 
centers, councils on aging, 
and other venues to teach 
age-appropriate safety les-
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By Transcript Staff

There has been a dra-
matic increase in the num-
ber of overdose deaths in 
town this year, according 
to Public Health Director 
Meredith Hurley and Po-
lice Chief John Goodwin. 

They are urging res-
idents to make use of 
multiple services that are 
available to help with sub-
stance use issues. 

Winthrop experienced 
five overdose deaths in 
2023, but so far this year 
there have already been 
a dozen deaths linked to 
drug overdoses, a more 
than 200 percent increase 

over last year, according 
to town and police offi-
cials.

“This news is tragic, 
and we are now concerned 
because the holiday sea-
son is approaching, and 
we have historically seen 
rates of substance misuse 
increase overall during 
this time of year,” said 
Hurley. “We want every-
one in our community to 
know that we have many 
resources available to help 
those struggling with sub-
stance use disorder. We 
want to help save lives.”

By Adam Swift

The school commit-
tee is beginning work on 
bringing a new budget 
override vote before the 
town council.

Voters said no to a 
$4.95 million override 
request earlier this month 
that would have helped 
fund school district bud-
get shortfalls for the next 
three fiscal years.

At Monday night’s 
school committee meet-
ing, budget subcommittee 
chair Gus Martucci said 
that committee has begun 
discussions on what a new 
override request will look 
like and when it may be 
brought before voters.

“We did not take any 
votes, but we did have a 
discussion,” said Martuc-
ci of the subcommittee 
meeting earlier in the eve-
ning. “We did a quick re-
view of some of the bud-
get numbers for 24-25 and 
we had a discussion going 
about going forward with 
the override and we talk-
ed about when we want to 
go for another override, if 
we want to go for another 
override, we talked about 

what the number we’d be 
asking for to for to go to 
the town council. We had 
several different opinions 
and we’re still working on 
it.”

Discussions will con-
tinue at the next budget 
subcommittee meeting 
scheduled for Tuesday, 
Nov. 26 at 4 p.m. in the 
Harvey Hearing Room  at 
town hall.

“We’ll talk some more 
and hopefully have some-
thing to come back with,” 
said Martucci.

Town Council President 
Jim Letterie said it was 
important to stress that the 
no vote on the override on 
Nov. 7 was disappointing, 
but that the school com-
mittee is doing a great job 
trying to regroup.

“I don’t think, personal-
ly, that there is a doubt that 
there is not a need there, 
and the onus is on us to 
make sure we educate that 
need as best we can, and 
I look forward to hearing 
ASAP from the commit-
tee with their thoughts,” 
said Letterie. “I know they 
are going to put

First Makerspace patron, Dave Juengst, using the Cricut printer, with Children’s librarians 
Liz Telmosse and Diane Stangle looking on. 

Winthrop Library opens Makerspace
Story & Photos by Marianne Salza

Winthrop Public Li-
brary & Museum offered 
its inaugural Makerspace 
on November 15, open-
ing a designated area on 
the third floor for patrons 
to gather and create using 
complimentary library re-
sources. 

“We’re really excited,” 
beamed Liz Telmosse, 
Children’s Library. 
“We’re hoping people 
come in, create, and use 
their imagination.”

The Makerspace is 
equipped with tools to 
help execute one’s artis-

tic ideas such as a sew-
ing machine, spindles 
for spinning yarn, a heat 
press to transfer designs 
onto t-shirts, bags, coffee 
mugs, or hats, and a but-
ton press that makes 2 ½ 
-inch pins. 

Library patron, Dave 
Juengst, was the first 
Makerspace participant. 
He was eager to build a 
prototype of his toy de-
sign using perforated pa-
per cutouts printed from 
the library’s Cricut printer 
and cutting machine.  

“When I saw that there 
was going to be a Mak-
erspace, and they had 
all these resources open 
to me, it seemed like a 
no-brainer. I got all the 
help I needed and was 
able to make the design,” 
said Juengst. “This place 
is great, and I’m not hav-
ing to spend thousands of 
dollars on equipment. The 
library saves the day.”

The library has a clos-
et full of materials from 
origami paper to bracelet 
making supplies – and 
attendees are welcome 
to bring their own provi-
sions, as well. 

Fiber artist, Diane Stan-

gle, who works in the chil-
dren’s library section, is 
available to assist attend-
ees interested in knitting. 
She hopes that in the be-
ginning of the new year, 
the library will offer more 
opportunities for knitters 
and spinners to gather. 

The library’s initial 
plans are to open the Mak-
erspace twice a month, 
with the next Makerspace 
day being on Saturday, 
November 23, 12-2pm. 
Stangle and Telmosse 
hope to expand the pro-
gram in January to include 
workshops and classes, 
and open the space for 
crafting clubs to schedule 
meetings. 

“This is our launching 
point, and it’s just going 
to get bigger and better,” 
said Telmosse. 

Adults and children 
12 years of age and older 
are encouraged to explore 
the Makerspace. Children 
under the age of 12 must 
be accompanied and su-
pervised by an adult. Visit 
www.WinthropPublicLi-
brary.org/Maker-Space/ 
for updated information 
about programs and craft-
ing clubs. 

What’s Next?
School committee regroups 
in aftermath of override vote

Officials warn of increase 
in overdose deaths this year

TRASH 
DELAY

Due to the Thanksgiving 
Day Holiday on Nov. 

28, Thursday 11/28 will 
be picked up on Friday 

11/29; Friday 11/29 
will be picked up on 

Saturday 11/30 

NO DELAY
Monday 11/25, Tuesday 
11/26, Wednesday 11/27

Capitol Waste Services, Inc.

See SCHOOLS Page 4

See DRUG DEATHS Page 4

• 100 Gal. Minimum  • 24 Hour Service
CHECK OUR WEBSITE

 FOR DAILY LOW PRICE
NORTHEASTOILDELIVERY.COM

Per Gallon
$2.79  Price 

subject to 
change 
without 
notice

The next issue of 
The Winthrop Sun Transcript 

will be published 
Wed., NOV. 27 

in light of the Thanksgiving 
holiday on Thursday
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The following incident 
reports are among the calls 
to which the Winthrop Po-
lice Department respond-
ed on the listed dates. The 
log is a public record and 
available for review. All 
persons who are arrested 
or charged with a crime 
are presumed innocent un-
til proven guilty in a court 
of law.

MONDAY, 
NOVEMBER 4
1030: A Sewall Ave. 

resident reported that a 
person had dumped trash 
in her dumpster. The offi-
cer filed a report.

1040: An officer assist-
ed the parties with the ex-
change of papers at a mi-
nor motor vehicle accident 
on Crest Ave.

1057: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Walden St. for the civ-
il moving infraction of a 
stop sign violation. The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

1126: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Brookfield Rd. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
violating the hands-free 
law. The officer issued a 
citation to the operator.

1144: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle on Quincy 
Ave. for the civil moving 
infraction of operating an 
unregistered motor vehi-
cle. The officer followed 
the operator to his home in 
order to have the vehicle 
parked on private proper-
ty. The officer issued a ci-
tation to the operator.

1609: A resident came 
into the station to report 
being the victim of identi-
ty theft and a larceny. The 
officer filed a report.

1651: Officer Carter 
assisted a family with the 
installation of a child car 
seat.

1703: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle at 
Revere and Taylor Sts. for 
the civil moving infraction 
of a stop sign violation. 
The officer issued a cita-
tion to the operator.

1739: An officer 
stopped two motor vehi-
cles at Ocean View and 
Cora Sts. that were us-
ing the same registration 
plate.  The officer ordered 
a tow for the vehicle for 
which the plate was not 
registered.

1758: An officer re-
sponded to a report of 
three persons arguing 
loudly about the election. 
The officer spoke to the 
parties and restored the 
peace.

1849: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle at 
Shore Drive and Hawthorn 
Ave. for the civil moving 
infraction of an equipment 
violation. The officer also 
determined that the opera-
tor was unlicensed, which 
is a criminal offense. The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator for both of-
fenses and took the keys 
of the vehicle until a li-
censed operator came to 
take possession of it.

2329: An officer assist-
ed MBTA personnel with 
clearing out a homeless 
encampment at the Belle 
Isle Bridge Reservation.

2357: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Pleasant St. for the 

civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer gave 
a verbal warning to the op-
erator.

TUESDAY,
 NOVEMBER 5
0317: An officer issued 

parking tickets to six vehi-
cles without resident park-
ing stickers on Waldemar 
Ave.

0321: An officer issued 
parking tickets to eight 
vehicles without resident 
parking stickers on Pau-
line St.

0905: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Washington Ave. for 
the civil moving infraction 
of a stop sign violation. 
The officer issued a cita-
tion to the operator.

0931: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Cliff Ave. for the civ-
il moving infraction of a 
stop sign violation. The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

1324: An officer 
stopped a person oper-
ating a dirt bike with no 
plate on Cross St. The of-
ficer issued a citation to 
the operator for the crim-
inal offenses of unlicensed 
operation of a motor vehi-
cle and operating an unin-
sured motor vehicle and 
for the civil infraction of 
operating an unregistered 
motor vehicle. The dirt 
bike was taken away by a 
tow company.

1508: An officer re-
sponded to a minor two-
car motor vehicle accident 
at Main and Pleasant Sts. 
There were no injuries and 
neither vehicle was towed.

1923: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Main St. for the civil 
moving infraction of a red 
light violation. The officer 
gave a verbal warning to 
the operator.

2120: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Veterans Rd. for the 
civil moving infractions of 
a stop sign violation and 
unsafe operation. The offi-
cer issued a citation to the 
operator.

2321: A person turned 
in a Michael Kors purse 
that she had found in 
French Sq.

WEDNESDAY, 
NOVEMBER 6
0226: An officer issued 

parking tickets to six vehi-
cles without resident park-
ing stickers at Taylor and 
Harvard Sts.

0536: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Shirley St. for the civ-
il moving infraction of a 
stop sign violation. The 
officer gave a verbal warn-
ing to the operator.

1043: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Veterans Rd. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.

1054: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Veterans Rd. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.

1223: An officer re-
sponded to a report of six 
dogs running loose on 
Yirrell Beach. The Ani-

GERRY D’AMBROSIO
ATTORNEY AT LAW

IS YOUR ESTATE IN ORDER?
DO YOU HAVE AN UPDATED WILL, HEALTH CARE

PROXY, OR POWER OF ATTORNEY?
IF NOT, PLEASE CALL FOR FREE CONSULTATION

 

781-284-5657

WINTHROP POLICE BLOTTER

By Transcript Staff

A former Winthrop po-
lice lieutenant pleaded 
guilty to child sex abuse 
charges on Monday.

James Feeley, 57, was 
arrested last year while 
still a member of the Win-
throp Police Department 
and charged with rape of a 
child and multiple counts 
of indecent assault and 
battery on a child under 
14.

Feeley was scheduled to 
go to trial early next, but 
changed his plea to guilty 
in Suffolk Superior Court 
on Monday. 

Feeley was sentenced to 
four to six years in prison, 
with credit for time served, 
followed by five years of 
probation by Judge James 
Budreau. Following his 
release, Feeley will need 
to register as a sex offend-

er and seek treatment, and 
stay away from and have 
no contact with the victim.

The indictment against 
Feeley alleged that on var-
ious dates between August 
2022 and December 2023, 
he sexually assaulted a 
child, who was between 
ten and eleven years-old at 
the time

of the assaults. These 
assaults occurred at the 
defendant’s home where 
he resided with his wife 
and family in Winthrop.

According to the district 
attorney’s office, the child 
first disclosed the abuse to 
an adult on Christmas day 
last year. The defendant’s 
wife learned of the abuse 
and confronted the defen-
dant, at which time he did 
not deny the abuse, ac-
cording to the indictment

After that, Feeley went 
to a cemetery; he was 

armed with a handgun and 
made statements which in-
dicated that he was suicid-
al. The defendant’s broth-
er called Winthrop Police 
Chief Terence Delehanty 
and a Winthrop Police 
sergeant to meet Feeley at 
the cemetery. At that time, 
Feeley confessed to the 
chief and sergeant that he 
had sexually assaulted the 
alleged victim, according 
to the indictment.

The defendant was ar-
rested by the Massachu-
setts State Police on Dec. 
26, 2023.

After receiving his 
Miranda warnings, the 
defendant admitted in a 
recorded interview that 
he sexually assaulted the 
child on five or six occa-
sions, according to the dis-
trict attorney’s office.

Former Winthrop lieutenant pleads 
guilty to sex abuse charges with minor

Winthrop police arrest-
ed and charged a man after 
a brief foot pursuit follow-
ing a traffic stop Thursday 
night, Nov. 14.

Ray Lara, 29, of Boston 
was arrested and charged 
with recklessly operat-
ing a motor vehicle so as 
to endanger, leaving the 
scene of a personal inju-
ry, marked lanes viola-
tion, disorderly conduct, 
resisting arrest, failure to 
stop for police, trafficking 
in more than 10 grams of 
Fentanyl, and trafficking 
in 18 grams or more of a 
Class B drug.

On Thursday, Nov. 14, 
at about 8:45 p.m., officers 
were on patrol in the area 
of Governor’s Drive when 
they observed what ap-
peared to be a drug trans-
action involving a White 
Ford SUV, according to 
Police Chief John Good-

win.
While the SUV was 

leaving the area, offi-
cers observed the vehi-
cle cross over designated 
road markings. Officers 
activated their emergency 
lights and pulled the vehi-
cle over near Main Street, 
according to police. 

Police stated that offi-
cers spoke to the driver, 
who identified himself as 
Lara. While officers were 
conducting the traffic stop, 
they said Lara attempted to 
flee the scene and crashed 
into another vehicle.

The collision signifi-
cantly damaged both ve-
hicles, leaving the SUV 
inoperable.

Police stated that Lara 
then got out of the vehicle 
and attempted to run away 
from the scene. After a 
brief foot pursuit, officers 
were able to safely place 

LARA under arrest.
LARA was assessed by 

responding medical per-
sonnel before being trans-
ported to Winthrop Police 
Headquarters.

The driver of the other 
vehicle was transported to 
an area hospital by Action 
Ambulance for injuries 
that are believed to be se-
rious.

During a subsequent 
investigation, officers lo-
cated two plastic bags near 
where officers arrested 
Lara following the pur-
suit. One bag contained a 
white, rock-like substance 
later determined to be 19.3 
grams of crack cocaine. 
The other bag contained a 
brown, powdery substance 
later determined to be 11.9 
grams of fentanyl.

Boston man arrested on drug and motor vehicle charges

mal Control Officer issued 
a citation to the owner of 
the dogs for violating the 
town by-law.

1333: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Veterans Rd. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer gave 
a verbal warning to the op-
erator.

1343: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Veterans Rd. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.

1351: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Veterans Rd. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.

1402: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Veterans Rd. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.

1410: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Revere St. for the civ-
il moving infraction of a 
stop sign violation. The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

1415: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle at 
Walden and Lincoln Sts. 
for a civil moving infrac-
tion. The officer gave a 
verbal warning to the op-
erator.

1416: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Cliff Ave. for the civ-
il moving infraction of a 
stop sign violation. The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator, as well as for 
the civil infraction of not 
having his license in his 
possession.

1518: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
at Walden and Pauline Sts. 
for a civil moving infrac-
tion. The officer gave a 
verbal warning to the op-
erator.

1710: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle at 
Washington Ave. and Riv-
er Rd. for the civil moving 
infraction of a crosswalk. 
The officer gave a verbal 
warning to the operator.

1725: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Revere St. for the civil 
moving infraction of a red 
light violation. The officer 
issued a citation to the op-
erator.

1822: A person called 
the station to report that 
his motor vehicle was 
locked inside the parking 
lot at Kilmartin Park. An 
officer called DCR and 
they sent someone to un-
lock the gate.

1849: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Jefferson St. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
operating without head-
lights after dark. The offi-
cer gave a verbal warning 
to the operator.

2357: A repossession 
company reported the repo 
of a motor vehicle.

THURSDAY,
 NOVEMBER 7
0156: An officer issued 

parking tickets to five ve-
hicles on Bellevue Ave. 
without resident parking 
stickers.

0158: An officer issued 
parking tickets to 11 vehi-
cles without resident park-
ing stickers on Court Rd.

1215: An officer direct-
ed contractors working at 
a house on Cutler St. to 
move their vehicles, which 
were parked on the wrong 
side of the street.

1243: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Veterans Rd. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
a crosswalk violation. The 
officer gave a verbal warn-
ing to the operator.

1427: A report of a large 
tree limb that appeared 
ready to fall hanging over 

Pleasant St. was referred 
to the DPW.

1526: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle on Shirley 
St. for the civil moving in-
fraction of speeding. The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

 
FRIDAY, 
NOVEMBER 8
0125: An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Banks St. for the crim-
inal offense of attaching 
plates that are registered 
to another vehicle. The 
motor vehicle was towed.

0221: An officer issued 
parking tickets to eight 
vehicles without resident 
parking stickers on Win-
throp St.

0842: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Washington Ave. for 
the civil moving infraction 
of speeding (38 in a 25 
m.p.h. zone). The officer 
issued a citation to the op-
erator.

0851: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Washington Ave. for 
the civil moving infraction 
of speeding. The officer 
gave a verbal warning to 
the operator.

1050: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle on 
Waldemar Ave. at Pleasant 
St. for the civil moving 
infraction of speeding (35 
in a 25 m.p.h. zone). The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

1058: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle on 
Waldemar Ave. at Pleasant 
St. for the civil moving 
infraction of speeding (35 
in a 25 m.p.h. zone). The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

1250: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Shirley St. for a civil 
moving infraction. The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

1300: A resident came 
into the station to report 
a larceny by a person she 
had met on Facebook. The 
officer filed a report.

1310: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle on Shirley 
St. for the civil moving in-
fraction of speeding. The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

1321: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle on Pauline 
St. for the civil moving 
infraction of speeding (36 
in a 25 m.p.h. zone). The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

1351: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Palmyra St. for a civil 
moving infraction. The of-
ficer gave a verbal warn-
ing to the operator.

1404: An officer moved 
along several vehicles that 
were parked in the handi-
capped spaces at the high 
school.

1444: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Pauline St. for the civil 
moving infraction of vio-
lating the hands-free law. 
The officer gave a verbal 
warning to the operator.

1457: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Main St. for the civil 
moving infraction of vio-
lating the hands-free law. 
The officer gave a verbal 
warning to the operator.

1510: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Lowell Rd. for the civ-
il moving infraction of a 
stop sign violation. The 
officer gave a verbal warn-
ing to the operator.

1554: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Pleasant St. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
a stop sign violation. The 
officer gave a verbal warn-
ing to the operator.

1706: A resident came 
into the station to report a 
larceny. The officer filed a 

report.
1913: An officer direct-

ed the owner of a pick-up 
truck that was parked on 
Summit Ave. more than 12 
inches from the curb and 
obstructing traffic to move 
his vehicle.

2049: An officer direct-
ed the operators of three 
vehicles parked in the 
Fire Lane on Shirley St. to 
move their vehicles.

2330: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Veterans Rd. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.

2348: An officer dis-
persed two persons parked 
in a motor vehicle from 
Hannaford Park, which is 
closed after dark.

SATURDAY,
 NOVEMBER 9
0008: An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Veterans Rd. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
a stop sign violation. The 
officer gave a verbal warn-
ing to the operator.

0152: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle on 
Main St. for the civil mov-
ing infractions of speeding 
and a stop sign violation. 
The officer issued a cita-
tion to the operator.

0214: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Pleasant St. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.

0336: An officer issued 
parking tickets to 17 vehi-
cles without resident park-
ing stickers on Cliff Ave.

1247: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Pleasant St. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer gave 
a verbal warning to the op-
erator.
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JIM POLINO – ELIZABETH POLINO – JAMES POLINO – JONATHAN POLINO – SHARON TALLENT
ATIYEH CASSIDY – VIRGINIA BROWN – DAVID TALLENT – KATHY HICKEY – KENNY KELLEHER

HIGHLANDGROUP@COMPASS.COM | 617.846.8000
75 CREST AVE, WINTHROP, MA | 126 NEWBURY STREET, BOSTON, MA

Meet our team by 
opening your phone’s 
camera and holding it 

over the QR codeFor smooth sailing with your next move, 
call the Highland Group

Buying or selling, ask us about Compass Coming Soon and Compass Concierge

Knowledge and experience of a local agent. 
Power of the #1 brokerage in the USA!

Real Estate Transfers
BUYER 1	 SELLER 1	 ADDRESS	   PRICE   
Keating, Martine N	 Mjb Enterprises LLC	 11 Perkins St	 $975,000  
Novick, Emalie B	 Moazzam, Aziz	 173 Grovers Ave #2	 $490,000  
Martucci, Andrea	 Capone, Gary	 20 S Main St	 $587,000  
Ochoa, Jairo      	 Palange Ft	 20 Taylor St	 $625,000  
Conti, Ellen L	 3 Seal Harbor Unit 531 R	 3 Seal Harbor Rd #531	 $527,000  
Weinstein, Nancy A	 Warren, Aric C	 41 Hawthorn Ave	 $750,000  
Cano-Montoya, Juan	 Spellman Irt	 53 Upland Rd	 $785,000
Khan, Malik	 Marino, Alyssa R	 90 Terrace Ave #1	 $535,000

St. Michael’s Drama brings A Charlie Brown Christmas to 
life this weekend at St. Michael the Arc Angel on Winthrop 
Street. Performances will be in the lower church hall on Sat-
urday, November 23 at 5pm and 6pm and Sunday, Novem-
ber 24 at 1pm and 2pm. Free General Admission and free 
popcorn. Pictured Back: Aiden Mansfield, Connor Gaynor, 
Ana Sofia Gonzalez Hellwig, Katerina Dalton, Victoria Con-
nolly. Middle: Ellen Gaynor, Mackenzie Evans, Tessa O’Toole
Front: Leo Dalton. Not pictured: Francesca Mazzone, James 
Mazzone, Flynn McClelland, Alex Synnott, and Grace Turco.

Annual tree lighting ceremony set for Nov. 29
French Square will once 

again come alive with hol-
iday cheer as the Winthrop 
Chamber of Commerce 
hosts its annual Holiday 
Tree Lighting event on 
Friday, November 29, 
2024. The festivities kick 
off at 4:00 PM, ending 
with a visit from Santa 
Claus himself, promising 
a night of community spir-
it and family fun. 

Santa Claus has con-
firmed his flight into Lo-
gan Airport just in time 
to join the festivities. The 
Winthrop Fire Department 
will be on standby to meet 
Santa on the runway and 
escort our VIP guest to 
Winthrop.  With a sprinkle 
of holiday magic, Santa 
will once again illuminate 
French Square, marking 
the official start of the hol-
iday season.

The 33rd Annual Hol-
iday Tree Lighting has 
evolved from a simple 
gathering into one of Win-
throp’s most anticipated 
annual events. Hosted by 
the Winthrop Chamber of 
Commerce, the tree light-
ing not only marks the 

start of the holiday sea-
son but also serves as a 
shining example of what 
makes Winthrop a special 
place to call home.

“This tradition that 
strengthens the bond be-
tween our residents and 
local businesses,” said 
Marc Chapdelaine, Pres-
ident of the Winthrop 
Chamber of Commerce. 
“It’s a wonderful oppor-
tunity for families to cel-
ebrate the season while 
showcasing the vibrant 
spirit and collaboration 
that make Winthrop such 
a great community to live 
in and raise a family.”

This year’s event is 
shaping up to be espe-
cially exciting, with a 
lineup of performances 
that highlight local tal-
ent. The students of Cer-
vizzi’s Martial Arts will 
take center stage with a 
dynamic karate demon-
stration, showcasing the 
skill and discipline of our 
young ninjas-in-training. 
In addition, students from 
Winthrop’s School of Per-
forming Arts will once 
again showcase their tal-

ents with dance and music 
performances.

The event is made pos-
sible through the unwav-
ering support of the Win-
throp Foundation, which 
has played a vital role in 
organizing and funding the 
celebration year after year. 
Their dedication ensures 
the event remains free and 
open to all residents.  The 
Foundation’s support fully 
funded the holiday lights 
in French Square and Met-
calf Square.  

“We’re thrilled to sup-
port this wonderful tradi-
tion,” said Russ Sanford, 
Chairman of the Win-
throp Foundation. “This 
is a chance for everyone 
in Winthrop to come to-
gether and celebrate what 
makes our town so spe-
cial—its people and their 
shared love for the holiday 
season.” 

The Winthrop Book 
Depot announced that 
they will be staying open 
late to serve Hot Choc-
olate and other holiday 
treats, adding to the holi-
day spirit.  In addition, the 
restaurants in and around 

French Square are look-
ing forward to welcoming 
guests for dinner follow-
ing the night’s festivities.   

“The tree lighting is 
a fantastic event that we 
look forward to every 
year,” said Chris Thomp-
son, owner of Black Strap 
BBQ.  “It brings the whole 
community together and 
creates such a festive at-
mosphere. It’s a wonder-
ful opportunity for us to 
welcome the community, 
share our food, and be part 
of this special Winthrop 
tradition. Events like this 
remind us why we love 
being a local business 
here.”

With live performanc-
es, refreshments, and a 
visit from Santa Claus, 
this year’s celebration is 
sure to create cherished 
moments for attendees of 
all ages. The Winthrop 
Chamber of Commerce 
welcomes all to this fes-
tive evening in French 
Square on Friday, Novem-
ber 29, 2024. Dress warm-
ly, bring your friends and 
family, and prepare for an 
evening of holiday cheer.

sons to children under 18 
and adults 65 and older.

“The SAFE and Senior 
SAFE grants are a smart 
investment in fire protec-
tion, fire prevention, and 
fire safety for the most 
vulnerable members of 
our communities,” said 
State Fire Marshal Jon M. 
Davine. “I want to thank 
Governor Healey, the Ex-
ecutive Office of Public 
Safety, and the Legislature 
for supporting these pro-
grams, and I encourage 
every fire department to 
apply.”

The SAFE grant pro-
gram has contributed to 
the steepest decline in 
child fire deaths in Massa-
chusetts history. In 1994, 
there were more than two 
dozen child fire fatalities; 
the SAFE grants were 
launched the following 
year and child fire deaths 
never again reached even 
half that number. Mas-
sachusetts recently went 
more than two and a half 
years without losing a 
child to fire.

The Senior SAFE 
grants were created in 
2014 to provide education, 
smoke and carbon mon-
oxide alarm installation, 
and other services to re-
duce fire-related fatalities 
among older adults, who 

now represent the age 
group most likely to die in 
a fire.

 Fire departments of ev-
ery city, town, fire district, 
and eligible state author-
ity can apply to share in 
funding for SAFE grants, 
Senior SAFE grants, or 
both. Departments must 
meet certain requirements, 
including mandatory fire 
data reporting, to be con-
sidered. The Notice of 
Funding Opportunity, 
grant application, and el-
igibility requirements are 
available on the Depart-
ment of Fire Services’ 
website. Applications 
must be submitted by 
5:00 pm on December 10, 
2024.

$26,000 
ENVIRONMENTAL 
LEADERSHIP 
SCHOLARSHIPS 
FOR MASS HIGH 
SCHOOL SENIORS

The Henry David Tho-
reau Foundation awards 
collegiate scholarships of 
up to $26K to eight to ten 
students graduating from 
public or private high 
schools in Massachusetts. 
As Henry David Thoreau 
Scholars, these select high 
school seniors may enroll 
in any college and uni-

versity in the world while 
they major or minor in an 
environmentally related 
field. 

The Henry David Tho-
reau Scholarships are 
up to $26,000 four-year 
scholarships awarded to 
eight students graduating 
from public or private 
high schools in Massachu-
setts. High school seniors 
awarded the Henry David 
Thoreau Scholarships can 
enroll in any college and 
university in the world 
while they major or mi-
nor in an environmentally 
related field. Henry David 
Thoreau Scholars are en-
couraged to enroll in in-
ternships or study abroad 
to broaden their awareness 
and understanding of envi-
ronmental issues.  

Henry David Thoreau 
Scholars have studied a 
wide variety of environ-
mentally related areas, 
including biology, epide-
miology, oceanography, 
international affairs, and 
environmental law, and 
upon completing their un-
dergraduate degrees, they 
became members of the 
Henry David Thoreau So-
ciety.

The Henry David Tho-
reau Foundation further 
assists its scholarship 
winners by identifying 

News Briefs //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

environmentally relat-
ed internships, offering 
internship stipends, and 
providing networking op-
portunities. Upon gradu-
ation from college, Henry 
David Thoreau Scholars 
are inducted into the Hen-
ry David Thoreau Soci-
ety. A sign of success of 
the Henry David Thoreau 
Foundation’s mission to 
foster environmental lead-
ership is the support past 
scholarship winners pro-
vide to present scholarship 
winners.

To learn more about 
the Henry David Thoreau 
Foundation and the Henry 
David Thoreau Scholar-
ships, please visit thoreau-
scholar.org. Students have 
until February 1, 2025, to 
apply. 

Roberto-Herrick 
Inducted into The 
Honor Society of 
Phi Kappa Phi

Michaela Roberto-Her-
rick of Winthrop, was re-
cently initiated into The 
Honor Society of Phi Kap-
pa Phi, the nation’s oldest 
and most selective all-dis-
cipline collegiate honor 
society. Roberto-Herrick 
was initiated at MCPHS 
University.

Roberto-Herrick is 
among approximately 
20,000 students, facul-
ty, professional staff and 
alumni to be initiated into 
Phi Kappa Phi each year. 
Membership is by invi-
tation only and requires 
nomination and approv-
al by a chapter. Only the 
top 10 percent of seniors 
and 7.5 percent of juniors 
are eligible for member-
ship. Graduate students in 
the top 10 percent of the 
number of candidates for 
graduate degrees may also 
qualify, as do faculty, pro-
fessional staff and alumni 
who have achieved schol-
arly distinction.

FALL FESTIVAL EVENT

Temple Tifereth Israel held its Fall Festival on November 
17, featuring vendors that offered cozy winter items such 
as hats, mittens, paintings and patterned leggings. Eric 
Ambrose and Deanne Cordes are shown holding a home-
made cake.

Joyce Blumenthal, Amy Yorra, and Kathleen Cappuccio.

PHOTO BY ELYSE GAYNOR

LOST KEYS
$100 REWARD
11/7/24 around 4pm

 in Winthrop
7 or 8 keys + 

a FOB
617-285-2593

 
 

FIRST CHURCH OF WINTHROP  

UNITED METHODIST 
217 Winthrop Street, Winthrop, MA 02152 

Holiday Fair   

Saturday, November 23rd 9:00 am – 1:00 pm 

Gift Baskets 

Christmas Decorations 

Gift Items, Jewelry, Baked Goods, Plants, Books 

& 

MORE… 

Hot Dogs & Grill Cheese Lunches  

will be available for purchase! 
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LOOKING AT THE 
RECENT ELECTION

Dear Editor,
The Election on Tues-

day, November 5, pro-
duced a win nationally for 
Donald Trump, a Republi-
can Senate and a Repub-
lican House of Represen-
tatives.  However, there 
are interesting details that 
need to be looked at.

First, Donald Trump has 
increased his vote totals 
and percentages in each 
election since 2016. He 
got 63 million votes and 
45.9% in 2016, 74 million 
votes and 46.8% in 2020, 
and 76 million votes and 
50% in 2024.

Kamala Harris, on the 
other hand, did better this 
year than Hillary Clinton 
in 2016, but worse than 
Joe Biden in 2020. Clinton 
got 66 million votes and 
48% in 2016, Biden got 81 
million votes and 51.3% 
in 2020, and Harris got 74 
million votes and 48.3% in 
2024.

Even if 2 million peo-
ple who voted in 2020 for 
Biden switched their votes 
to Trump, there would still 
remain 5 million people 
who voted in 2020 for 
Biden that decided to skip 
the election and not vote 
for Harris or Trump. Har-
ris lost because she did not 
energize enough voters to 
support her.

The true battleground 
states of Pennsylvania, 
Michigan and Wisconsin 
(The Blue Wall) tell the 
story.  In 2016, Trump 
won these three states 
each by less than 1% and 
by a total of 80,000 votes. 
In 2020, Biden won these 
three states each by more 
than 1%, and by a total of 
250,000 votes. In 2024, 
Trump won Pennsylvania 
and Michigan by more 
than 1% and Wisconsin by 
less than 1%, and by a to-
tal of 235,000 votes.

In the Senate, Republi-
cans picked up three seats 
in red states that they were 
expected to win in West 
Virginia, Montana and 
Ohio, and there is a re-
count going on in Pennsyl-
vania. If the Republicans 
win this seat, it will be the 
only real surprise, and they 
will have a 53-47 majority.

In the House, Repub-
licans will at best pick 
up two seats, and there is 
a strong possibility that 
there will be no gain, and 
that they keep the present 
221-214 slim majority.

As Charlie Cook, of the 
highly respected, non-par-
tisan Cook Political Re-
port stated, “(this election 
is) more a ripple than a 
(red) wave.” 

In Massachusetts, 
Trump got 1.1 million 
votes and 32.8% in 2016, 
1.2 million votes and 
32.1% in 2020, and 1.2 
million votes and 36.5% 
in 2024. Clinton got 2.0 
million votes and 60% in 
2016, Biden got 2.4 mil-
lion votes and 65.6% in 
2020, and Harris got 2.1 
million votes and 61.3% 
in 2024. Again, Harris 
did better than Clinton, 
but not as well as Biden, 
and the turnout this year 
was slightly higher than in 
2016, but not as high as in 
2020. 

In the U. S. Senate 
race, Elizabeth Warren 
got 2 million votes and 
59.6% while her Repub-
lican opponent John Dea-
ton got 1.3 million votes 
and 40.4% this year.  This 
compares to 2018 when 
Warren got 1,633,371 
votes and 60.3%, while 
her Republican opponent 
Geoff Diehl got a little less 
than 1 million votes and 
36.2%.

In Winthrop, the results 
were similar, Harris (55%) 
did better than Clinton 
(53.4%), but worse than 
Biden (61.1%), while 

Trump did better against 
Harris (Trump 42.5%) than 
he did against both Clinton 
(Trump 39.6%) and Biden 
(Trump 36.6%).  Howev-
er, again the voter turnout 
was less this year (9,451) 
than in 2016 (9,727) and in 
2020 (10,301).

Warren got 54.2% of 
the vote against Deaton’s 
45.8% this year in Win-
throp compared to 2018 
when Warren got 53.5% of 
the vote compared to Die-
hl’s 39.6%.

Finally, the School 
Override Ballot Question 
lost 58% to 42%, which is 
only slightly less than the 
Fire Station Ballot Ques-
tion that lost 64% to 36% 
last year.

William Schmidt  

 
SAVE THE CBD!

Dear Winthrop 
Community,
If your spidey sens-

es are tingling after the 
Winthrop Planning Board 
meeting last week, you are 
not alone.

The Winthrop Planning 
Board would have you 
believe that converting 
the entire Center Busi-
ness District (“CBD”) to 
a 3A Mandatory Mixed 
Use (MMU) District 
gives Winthrop 221 units 
of “credit” towards Win-
throp’s 882 unit quota, 
and as such, has “zero im-
pact” on our Town Center. 
There’s only one problem 
with that – It requires 
the whole thing to com-
ply with 3A! There is no 
“credit” happening here, 
or at Seal Harbor, or for 
the 393 units at Gover-
nor’s Park. The EOHLC 
has been clear on this from 
the start.

Here are the three big-
gest problems with con-
verting the CBD (the Cen-
ter Business District) to a 

3A MMU District:
1) Legalizes (“unlocks”) 

tenement-style develop-
ment – The Town must 
now codify the words, 
“No minimum bedroom 
size, no maximum number 
of bedrooms, and no occu-
pancy limits” for any de-
velopment occurring in the 
CBD. This is unheard of. 
Further, the EOHLC cau-
tions that Winthrop should 
alter our (by ordinance) 
definition of “family” so 
as to not cap the number 
of unrelated people living 
together to only 3 humans. 

2) Eliminates true 
mixed-use – 3A restricts 
any non-residential uses 
to the ground floor. This 
means that Winthrop 
could never have an of-
fice building or a medi-
cal building or any other 
commercial establishment 
that was more than just 
one (ground) floor, in our 
“commercial” center. 

3) Prohibits establish-
ing “required” parking for 
non-residential uses – The 
businesses in our CBD 
would be procluded from 
having dedicated parking 
spots should this plan pass.  
This kills our businesses. 
Question: What kind of 
hardware store, restaurant, 
salon, etc. are you more 
likely to frequent? One 
where you can park at? 
How about in the Winter?

The CBD belongs to 
the citizens on Winthrop, 
Massachusetts. We are not 
interested in handing it 
over to developers who’ll 
transform the space into 
one big housing project, 
or squeezing out our small 
businesses. 

Stay strong Winthrop!  
Our super savvy, caring 
Community sees all. Rhet-
oric and propoganda are 
no match for the hearts 
and minds of the people 
and families who love this 
place.

Diana C. Viens

Drug Deaths //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

Schools //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

a lot of time and effort 
into it. The importance 
can’t be lost at all, this is 
an incredibly important 
thing that affects not only 
the school, but the town 
as a whole and I just hope 
people gather around and 
get together and ask the 
questions they need to 
ask.”

School Committee 
Chair Jennifer Powell said 
it is important for those 
who supported the over-
ride and put the effort in to 
understand what the next 
steps forward are for the 
schools.

“I just want to thank the 
override committee deep-
ly for the work that they 
had done, along with our 
teachers’ union and our 
staff and our families for 
all coming out to vote,” 
said Superintendent of 
Schools Lisa Howard. 
“Certainly, it was disap-

pointing for the override 
not to have passed. I was 
very confident that it was 
going to pass, and am still 
confident that the town 
council and the school 
committee are in agree-
ment to move forward and 
request it again.”

One of the important 
things the school depart-
ment will be doing going 
forward in anticipation of 
another override vote is to 
do some analytical work 
around the things it may 
have missed the first time 
around regarding informa-
tion that did not get out to 
the public, Howard said.

“I look forward to doing 
that work with any com-
mittee, whether it is the 
school committee or the 
override committee and 
reminding folks that we 
are ready for questions,” 
said Howard.

The Winthrop Depart-
ment of Public Health of-
fers free Narcan and free 
fentanyl test strips that can 
be picked up in the depart-
ment’s offices or mailed 
to an address in the com-
munity with no questions 
asked. 

There are also Peer Re-
covery Coaches available 
to support those who are 
contemplating, seeking, 
or currently recovering 
from substance use disor-
der. Abstinence from sub-

stances is not required to 
connect with Peer Recov-
ery Coaches, who are pro-
vided confidentially and 
free of charge.

Winthrop Police and 
the Department of Public 
Health are also urging res-
idents who use substances 
to never use alone or in 
isolation, where there is no 
one to help in the event of 
an overdose. Both depart-
ments urge users to ensure 
they always have Narcan 
on hand. 

Those who are using 
alone can contact the Nev-
er Use Alone Hotline at 
877-696-1996. The ho-
tline is available 24 hours 
per day, 7 days per week.

Anyone interested in 
being connected with Nar-
can, fentanyl test strips, or 
a peer recovery coach, or 
anyone who has addition-
al questions, should email 
the Winthrop Community 
and Law Enforcement As-
sisted Recovery (CLEAR) 
Team at: clearteam@win-

thropma.gov.
“We want to spread the 

word that the drugs in our 
community are claiming 
lives at a record rate this 
year,” said Goodwin. “The 
Winthrop CLEAR Team 
has multiple ways to help 
those struggling with sub-
stance use disorder, and 
we are pleading with users 
to make use of those ser-
vices before it’s too late.”

IS THE HOUSING PROBLEM 
SOLVABLE?

It is estimated that the U.S. presently is short of any-
where from four million to seven million housing units, 
including both rentals and single-family homes.

This is an astounding number that is growing larger 
every year. Housing production is lagging the demand 
that is being created by the family formation of the Gen 
Y (also known as Millennials) and Gen Z generations 
who are aging into adulthood.

 The severe imbalance created by the increase in de-
mand and the lack of supply -- which has been the trend 
in the U.S.for the past 15 years dating back to the fi-
nancial crisis -- in turn has led to home and rental costs 
that far exceed a level of affordability for the majority 
of Americans.

We recently went on one of those real estate websites 
to look at our former family home in Chelsea which 
our parents purchased in 1965 for about $20,000. The 
house, which is located in the Prattville section of the 
city, is a modest four-bedroom, 1700 sq. ft. home that 
last sold in 2011 for $305,000. Today, that home has an 
estimated value of $850,000.

To put those numbers in perspective, inflation from 
1965-2024 increased 10-fold ($1.00 in 1965 is worth 
$10.00 today), but that home’s value has increased by 
an astounding 42-fold. And from 2011 to today, infla-
tion has increased by 40% -- but the value of that home 
has gone up by almost 300%.

Our parents’ mortgage in 1965 came at a four percent 
interest rate and required a downpayment of $4000. 
Their monthly mortgage payment (without taxes) was 
about $100 per month. Today, a young couple would 
need a downpayment of $170,000 in order to buy that 
home and their monthly mortgage payment would be 
about $4000.

Our housing crisis today often is portrayed as an af-
fordability crisis for those in the lower-income brack-
ets. But as the numbers above demonstrate, purchasing 
a home today is affordable only for upper-income cou-
ples who also have families who are able to assist them 
with the large down payment that is necessary to obtain 
a conventional mortgage.

Young people also face the same lack of affordabil-
ity for rental housing. Almost nobody graduating from 
college today, even if they have a well-paying job, can 
afford an apartment on their own in Greater Boston or 
any major city. Doubling and tripling-up is the norm for 
young people unless they have financial support from 
their families.

The last time that the U.S. faced a crisis of this mag-
nitude came in the years immediately after WWII. 
Housing production during the war years had stopped 
and the millions of returning GIs who were forming 
families were in need of housing. The principal solution 
at that time was the construction of multi-unit housing 
developments -- known colloquially as “the projects” 
-- in almost every community in the country. 

Private developers (assisted by low-rate mortgag-
es backed by the Veterans Administration and Federal 
Housing Administration) also filled the need with large-
scale, cookie-cutter developments in the suburbs, the 
most notable example being the “Levittowns.” 

However, today the high costs of land acquisition, 
materials, and infrastructure improvements (including 
the need to comply with modern environmental regu-
lations) make it all but impossible for home-builders to 
construct “affordable” housing, whether single-family 
homes or multi-unit rentals.

Affordable housing advocates often cite restrictive 
zoning ordinances in many suburbs as a bar to the con-
struction of affordable housing, but even if someone 
could take a magic wand and eliminate zoning restric-
tions, new home construction would barely budge. Mas-
sachusetts has had a law (c. 40B) for many years which 
allows developers to bypass local zoning regulations if 
a community’s housing stock is deemed less than 10% 
“affordable.” But that law has barely made a dent in the 
supply of housing. Similarly, the  MBTA Communities 
law that has garnered so much attention in the past year 
figures to have a minimal impact on the housing crisis.

If it’s any consolation, the housing shortage is not 
unique to the U.S. It’s a worldwide phenomenon, from 
Europe to Australia, with much of the developed world 
facing a dire housing shortage.

Shelter is a basic human need. For millions of Amer-
icans, especially young people, the reality today is that 
both the public and private sectors are failing to address 
the ever-growing problem of our housing crisis -- and 
the inevitable result inevitably will have profound con-
sequences for the future of the country.
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10 years ago
November 19, 2014
Town Manager James 

McKenna and Chief Fi-
nancial Officer Tom Gor-
don revealed at the recent 
Town Council meeting 
that the Town of Winthrop 
has more than $2.2 million 
in free cash in its accounts, 
representing an historic 
turnaround of Winthrop’s 
financial picture.

Winthrop paid tribute to 
its war veterans this week 
in impressive fashion 
commencing with Win-
throp Center Cafe owner 
Roger Oliveira hosting a 
dinner for veterans at his 
cafe that was sponsored 
by American Legion Post 
146. The Winthrop Cham-
ber of Commerce, led by 
executive director Bet-
sy Shane and president 
Dr. Paul McGee, invited 
veterans to its breakfast 
meeting with town Veter-
ans Agent Roseann Trion-
fi-Mazzuchelli appearing 
as the guest speaker at the 
breakfast. The Chamber 
then held a flag ceremony 
in French Square. In ad-
dition, the town’s annual 
Veterans Day Program 
on the town lawn was 
well-attended.

Many Winthrop resi-
dents have been visiting 
the town's newest restau-
rant, Antique Table Tratto-
ria, to get a taste of Italy 
and simple Italian cuisine 
and to experience its clas-
sic, charming atmosphere.

The Hunger Games: 
Mockingjay Part 1 and 
Penguins of Madagascar 
are playing at the Revere 
Showcase Cinemas.

20 years ago
December 2, 2004
The Winthrop Charter 

Commission is in the pro-
cess of finalizing its rec-
ommendations for a new 
town charter after having 
conducted more than three 
dozen public meetings and 
hearing testimony from 
countless officials from 
other communities. Char-
ter Commission Chair Jo-
seph Ferrino said that an-
other public hearing will 
be held in January after 
the final charter draft is 
prepared.

The Playmakers' musi-
cal revue, A Little Trav-
elin' Music, opens this 
weekend.

A joint effort between 
the Chamber of Com-
merce and the Winthrop 
schools has produced care 
packages for five local 
soldiers who are serving 
in Iraq this holiday season.

A 37 year-old Court Rd. 
resident and former Asst. 
Harbormaster, who works 
as a process server in the 
Middlesex County Sher-
iff's Dept., has been arrest-
ed on charges of dealing 
cocaine.

The selectmen have vot-
ed 3-0 to hire an economic 
development consultant.  

Bridget Jones: The 
Edge of Reason, After the 
Sunset, and Alfie are play-
ing at the Revere Show-
case Cinemas.

30 years ago
December 8, 1994
Tax Collector Andrew 

Maylor told the selectmen 
that any boat owner who 
has not paid his town ex-
cise tax will be unable to 
acquire a mooring permit 
in the future. Maylor said 
that the town presently is 
owed $43,000 in unpaid 
boat excise taxes.

Police Officer Nancy 
Dalrymple returned to 
work this week after more 
than three years away 
from the job. Dalrymple 
originally left on materni-
ty leave in June of 1991, 
but then was fired by 
the selectmen in August, 
1992, when she alleged-
ly failed to obey an order 
from Police Chief  Ange-
lo LaMonica to return to 
work. However, the Civil 
Service Commission ruled 
that Dalrymple should 
have been disciplined, but 
not fired. In the meantime, 
Dalrymple was awarded 
$25,000 by the MCAD 
in an action she brought 
against the town for hav-
ing been excluded from 
a  drug raid (prior to her 
maternity leave) because 
of her gender. Dalrymple 
presently has another case 
against the town before 
the MCAD in which she 
is alleging sexual harass-
ment and seeking back 
pay for the period during 
which she was fired by the 
selectmen.

Santa will make his an-
nual visit to the Beach fire 
station Saturday.

Firefighter Leo Murphy 
retired from the Winthrop 
Fire Dept. this week after 
35 years of service.

Beautification Commis-
sion Chairman Frank Cos-
tantino said that parents 
who allow their young 
children to trample over 
the flower beds in French 
Square are to blame for 
the damage to the plant-
ings there.

The Frontier Group 
Inc., which purchased 
the Cliff House Nursing 
Home two weeks ago, 
now has purchased the 
Bay View Nursing home. 
The company says it will 
be expanding both loca-
tions.

Star Trek: Generations 
and The Santa Clause 
are playing at the Revere 
Showcase Cinemas.

40 years ago
December 5, 1984
School Supt. Peter Finn 

said that the proposed ed-
ucation reform bill before 
the legislature will have a 
large negative impact on 
Winthrop schools because 
the town lacks the funds to 
implement the state-man-
dated programs without 
additional state aid. The 
bill calls for a minimum 
starting salary for teachers 
of $18,000, substantial-
ly more than the present 
starting salary in Winthrop 
of $14,933. The proposed 
legislation also calls for 
teacher recertification ev-
ery seven years.

Town officials have 

announced that they will 
be hiring outside legal 
counsel to provide advice 
concerning the town's ef-
forts to fight against the 
proposed construction of 
a new sewage treatment 
plant on Deer Island.

Santa will make his an-
nual visit to the Beach fire 
station Saturday.

Four men were arrested 
this week for digging in a 
contaminated shellfishing 
bed at Belle Isle.

Townspeople are fondly 
remembering the late An-
thony LaCamera, a Win-
throp resident and noted 
Boston TV critic for three 
decades from 1948-78, 
who passed away Novem-
ber 19.

Beverly Hills Cop and 
The Killing Fields are 
playing at the Revere 
Showcase Theatres.

50 years ago
December 11, 1974
The Winthrop School 

Committee rejected a pro-
posal to include the town 
in the METCO program 
after a hearing that lasted 
several hours featuring 
both proponents and op-
ponents  Although School 
Supt. Michael Fortunato 
said that the schools could 
accommodate up to 25 
METCO students in the 
first grade, the committee 
voted 4-1 in favor of a mo-
tion by School Commit-
teeman Donald Clayman 
to reject the METCO pro-
gram, which would allow 
inner city students from 
Boston to attend Winthrop 
schools. School Commit-
teeman Richard Gill was 
the lone member to vote in 
favor of the METCO pro-
gram.

Frederick B. Smith II, 
a member of a prominent 
local family, died in a car 
accident in Nahant over 
the weekend.

The Winthrop and Vi-
king taxi companies are 
seeking fare increases 
from 80 cents to $1.05 and 
from 90 cents to $1.30 in 
certain zones of the town.

Liza Minelli and Joel 
Grey star in Cabaret at the 
Kincade Theatre.

60 years ago
December 10, 1964
The selectmen have 

called for a meeting with 
representatives from the 
various agencies in the 
town to discuss how the 
town can implement the 
national War on Pover-
ty program that was an-
nounced recently by Pres-
ident Lyndon B. Johnson. 
Many communities are 
hopeful that Johnson's 
plans will help stem the 
rising costs of public wel-
fare that are being borne 
by local communities.

The 9-1 Winthrop High 
football team, the first 
WHS grid squad ever to 
win an outright NEC title, 
will enjoy a three day trip 
to Miami, with the high-
light being tickets to the 
Orange Bowl contest be-
tween the No. 1-ranked, 
undefeated Alabama team 

and once-defeated Texas 
on New Year's night.

The Board of Appeals 
will decide the fate of a 
proposed 72-unit apart-
ment building to be con-
structed at 191 Shirley St. 
under the existing zoning 
regulations. The site pres-
ently holds a large garage 
facility.

Four men were ap-
prehended by police on 
Argyle St. as they were 
removing the engine and 
other parts of a Corvette 
Stingray which had been 
stolen in Brookline. Two 
of the men were from New 
York and two were from 
Chelsea. Judge Loschi of 
the East Boston District 
Court gave one of the men 
a suspended six-month 
sentence and the other 
three terms of one year of 
probation. Winthrop Po-
lice Sgt. Paul Abely said 
the light sentences were 
forced on the police as a 
result of a plea bargain 
because of the new search 
and seizure laws that for-
bid police entry into a cit-
izen's premises without a 
search warrant.

Doris Day, Rock Hud-
son, and Tony Randall star 
in Send Me No Flowers at 
the Winthrop Theatre.

70 years ago
December 9, 1954
Winthrop Post Office 

Supt. Ray Flannery said 
that additional workers 
will be hired at the local 
Post Office to handle the 
annual holiday rush of 
cards and packages.

The Rev. Ralph Harper, 
Rector of St. John's Epis-
copal Church for the past 
50 years, was found lying 
on North Ave. by a passing 
motorist Tuesday evening. 
Harper was carrying a box 
of candy for a six year-old 
girl who lives down the 
street when he apparently 
was stricken and fell to the 
ground.

A survey reveals that 
the driver education pro-
gram initiated at Winthrop 
High School seven years 
ago is paying off with saf-
er driving for graduates of 
the course.

The selectmen have an-
nounced the awarding of 
a contract to eliminate the 
Highlands Bridge at the 
north end of Shore Drive. 
The area underneath the 
bridge will be filled in and 
a new roadway construct-
ed.

Clark Gable and Lana 
Turner star in Betrayal at 
the Winthrop and State 
Theatres.

80 years ago
December 9, 1944
The town is in mourn-

ing this week after an-
nouncement from the War 
Dept. that three of our fine 
local lads have made the 
supreme sacrifice for their 
country. The trio are Sgt.
Lawrence Young, who was 
killed in action in France; 
Pvt. Irving Bramson, who 
was killed in Italy; and 
Pvt. Zalmon Gilbert, who 
was killed in France. All 

three were graduates of 
Winthrop High School.

The State Guard will 
hold a Stag Party Tues-
day with invasion movies, 
sports talk, lunch, and a 
military drill.

The selectmen will hold 
a public hearing to discuss 
the proposed dredging of 
the waterway between the 
town and Logan Airport.

The Winthrop Catho-
lic Woman's Club held 
the formal opening of its 
35th season at St. John the 
Evangelist Church Hall. 
Mrs. Leo Haskell is the 
club's president.

Donald O'Connor and 
Jack Oakie star in The 
Merry Monahans at the 
Winthrop and State The-
atres.

90 years ago
December 8, 1934
The recount of the re-

cent election has shown 
the complete incompe-
tency of the counters who 
overlooked many ballots 
and miscounted others.

A Christmas Basket 
Drive is being conducted 
to provide assistance to 
the unemployed.

Will Rogers stars in 
Judge Priest at the Win-
throp and State Theatres.

100 years ago
December 13, 1924
Local shoppers will find 

lots of merchandise at rea-
sonable prices in Winthrop 
stores this shopping sea-
son, so shop locally!

The annual memori-
al services conducted by 
the Elks were highlighted 
by the address of former 
selectman Joseph Barry 
before a capacity crowd. 
Barry spoke of all the 
good works that our Elks 
perform for the communi-
ty.

110 years ago
December 12, 1914
The annual Minstrel 

Show of the Winthrop 
Athletic Association, re-
plete with laughable and 
lively sketches, and en-
livened with catchy mu-
sic, was held at the K of 
C Hall before a full house 
Monday and Tuesday eve-
nings.

The cost of crime in this 
state is appalling, accord-
ing to a report from the 
state prisons. State sup-
port for the police, jails, 
and courts amounts to 
$6.5 million per year. The 
Mass. Prison Association 
recommends more pre-
ventative measures to keep 
juveniles from turning to 
a life of crime and urges 
that prisons become more 
reformatory than punitive, 
so that when a prisoner 
leaves jail, he doesn't re-
turn to his criminal ways. 
There were about 20,000 
persons who received jail 
sentences in Massachu-
setts in 1913.

120 years ago
December 10, 1904
The Women's Army and 

Navy League will re-es-
tablish the army canteen 

to the post at Ft. Banks. 
The canteen was abolished 
in 1901 by an Act of Con-
gress.

The first snowfall of the 
season did not stop the la-
dies of the Monday Night 
Club from holding their 
meeting during which 
they accepted two new 
members and conducted a 
reading and interpretation 
of Shakespeare's Twelfth 
Night.

Congressman Roberts 
has announced that he 
will file two bills aimed at 
fighting gypsy moths.

There is a call for all-
night train service to Win-
throp since there are many 
who would use the trains, 
if available, after 12 mid-
night.

The young girls and 
boys in town are enjoying 
the coasting craze with the 
recent snowfall provid-
ing just enough snow for 
coasting down Jefferson 
Ave.

130 years ago
December 8, 1894

Despite the low tem-
perature and strong wind, 
more than 700 football 
enthusiasts journeyed to 
Johnson Field on Winthrop 
St. to witness what proved 
to be the finest exhibition 
of that game ever seen in 
our town. The contesting 
teams were the Winthrop 
Athletics and the Ocean 
Sprays. Although the 
beach team was large in 
stature, they did not pos-
sess the key ingredient for 
this game, true grit. Chief 
MacNeill and two officers 
maintained good order on 
the field. The Athletics 
won by a final score of 
8-4.

The Civil War Veter-
ans will hold their annual 
ball Saturday night at their 
hall.

Diphtheria claimed the 
dear young life of Ray-
mond Winthrop Daniels, 
age three years and 11 
months. The many friends 
of his parents grieve with 
them.

140 years ago
December 12, 1884
The petitioners for the 

continuance of Boston wa-
ter met with the selectmen 
Monday evening to pres-
ent their supposed griev-
ances. Representatives 
from the Revere Water Co. 
also were on hand. The 
petitioners asked that they 
remain on Boston water 
for a period of 12 months 
before being  required to 
accept Revere water, with 
the hope that the Revere 
company will supply good 
water by that time.

Mr. Munson's choral 
group will give an enter-
tainment at Town Hall this 
week.

THE MORE Things Change ...
Items selected from past issues of the Winthrop Sun, The Winthrop Review, The Winthrop Visitor,   

The Transcript and The Sun-Transcript

LEGAL NOTICES
LEGAL NOTICE

Commonwealth
Of Massachusetts
The Trial Court

Probate and Family
Court

Suffolk Probate
And Family Court

24 New Chardon St.
Boston, MA 02114 

DIVORCE SUMMONS
BY PUBLICATION 
AND MAILING
Docket No.
SU24D1443DR
Cerisse Michelle
Bomarsi
Plaintiff
vs.
Edward Joseph
Bomarsi

Defendant
To the Defendant:
The Plaintiff has filed a 
Complaint for Divorce 
requesting that the 
Court grant a divorce for 
Irretrievable Breakdown.
The Complaint is on file at 
the Court.
An Automatic Restraining 
Order has been entered 

in this matter preventing 
you from taking any 
action which would nega-
tively impact the current 
financial status of either 
party. SEE Supplemental 
Probate Court Rule 411.
You are hereby 
summoned and required 
to serve upon: Edward 
Lopes Amaral, Jr., Esq. 

Amarl and Associates, P.C. 
246 Revere St. Winthrop, 
MA 02152 your answer, 
if any, or or before 
12/13/2024. If you fail 
to do so, the court will 
proceed to the hearing 
and adjudication of this 
action. You are also 
required to file a copy of 
your answer, if any, in 

the office of the Register 
of this Court.
WITNESS, Hon. Brian J. 
Dunn, First Justice of this 
Court.
Date: October 30, 2024
Stephanie L. Everett
Register of Probate

11/21/24
W
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VIKINGS GET BACK ON WINNING TRACK

UP AND OVER:  Seth Sacco heads for a landing after being tripped up by a KIPP defender.

SCORE CELEBRATION:  Steven Calla celebrate Sean Dolen’s 
(5) 41-yard touchdown run late in the first quarter that 
gave Winthrop a 13-0 lead.

NO DOUBT:  Sean Dolen intercepts a KIPP pass on the last 
play of the first half with Winthrop holding a 21-12 lead.

TURNING POINT: KIPP had cut Winthrop’s lead to 14-12 before fumbling a Winthrop punt late in the first half.  Sean Dolen 
(5) Will Murphy (2) and Charlie Ferrara (11) pounce on the loose ball.

DOWNFIELD TARGET:  Quarterback Matt Noonan eyes a receiver and winds up a pass.

Winthrop got back on a winning track with a convinc-
ing 42-24 thumping over KIPP Academy Thursday night 
at Miller Field.   The Vikings broke the game open on 

KIPP turnovers at the end of the first half and beginning 
of the third quarter, highlighted by a “pick six” by Will 
Murphy that put the Vikings ahead 35-12.  Winthrop (6-

4) takes on Revere (5-5) Thanksgiving Day morning at 
10 a.m. at Miller Field.
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35 REVERE ST., WINTHROP •(617) 846-6880 • WWW.WINTHROPMKTPLACE.COM
 Store Hours: Mon-Sat 7:30 am-8pm; Sun: 7:30am-7pm •  Not responsible for typographical errors.   We have the right to limit quantities.

Grocery
Great grocery specials

Meat
"Meat Cut Fresh Every Day"

"Ground Beef & Patties Ground Fresh Daily"

London Broil Shoulder Steaks ................................$4.99/lb
Grade A Chicken Wings ............................................$3.99/lb
Carando Half Boneless Spiral Ham ........................$4.99/lb
Carando Half Bone In Spiral Ham ............................$3.69/lb
Simply Mashed Potatoes ........................................ 2/$7.00
Banquet Brown & Serve Sausage ..........................2/$4.00
Oscar Mayer Bacon 12 oz pkg.....................................$8.99

Produce

Bakery

Deli

Fresh & Juicy Lemons ..........................................................59¢
Fresh & Tangy Limes ............................................................59¢
Ocean Spray Fresh Cranberries ................................ 2/$5.00
California Seedless Sweet Navel Oranges ...............$1.49/lb
Premium Golden Sweet Yams ...................................... 79¢/lb
California Fresh All Purpose Carrots 1 lb pkg .................89¢
Whole Butternut Squash .............................................. 89¢/lb
Natures Finest All Purpose Russet Potatoes ....... 2/$5.00

5 lb bag

Boston Coffee Cake ....................................................... $8.99
Ciabatta Bread ...............................................................$2.99
Cinnamon Elephant Ears 2 pk ......................................$2.99
Pillsbury Cinnamon Rolls 4 pk ...................................... $5.99
Kings Hawaiian Dinner Rolls 12 pk .............................. $3.99
8" Banana Cream Pie ..................................................... $9.99
8" Apple Pie ..................................................................... $5.99
8" Pumpkin Pie ................................................................ $6.99

Your Independent Grocer, 
Where Old Friends Meet  
And New Ones Are Made

Green Giant Canned Vegetables ........................ 10/$10.00
(ex: 3-Bean Salad & Asparagus Spears)

Progresso Vegetable Classics Soup ....................... 2/$5.00
Dunkin Donuts K-Cups ....................................................$6.99
Gold Medal Flour (ex: organic) ..................................2/$7.00
Duncan Hines Brownie Mix ........................................ 2/$3.00
Ocean Spray Cranberry Juice 64 oz ....................... 2/$6.00

(ex: 100%)
Hellmanns Mayonnaise .................................................. $5.99
Prince Pasta .................................................................4/$5.00

(ex: lasagna-jumbo shells-gluten free)
Prego Pasta Sauce ..................................................... 2/$5.00
Wishbone Salad Dressing 15 oz ............................. 2/$5.00
Ocean Spray Cranberry Sauce 14 oz ......................4/$5.00
Campbells Gravies ......................................................4/$5.00
Stove Top Stuffing ..................................................... 2/$4.00
Duncan Hines Cake Mixes ......................................... 2/$3.00

(ex: Signature Varieties)
Duncan Hines Frosting .............................................. 2/$4.00
Smart Ones Entrees ............................................... 5/$10.00
Cool Whip 8 oz ............................................................ 2/$4.00
Delizza Eclairs ............................................................ 2/$9.00
Kelloggs Eggo Waffles ............................................... 2/$6.00

(ex: thick & fluffy)
Philadelphia Brick Pack Cream Cheese ................... 2/$5.00
Tropicana Orange Juice 46 oz ................................. 2/$5.00
Hood Sour Cream 16 oz ............................................3/$5.00
Pillsbury Grand Biscuits ............................................2/$7.00

Family Pack Specials

Smithfield Domestic Ham ......................................$4.99/lb
Finlandia Imported Swiss Cheese ..........................$7.99/lb
Carando Genoa Salami ............................................$8.99/lb
Dietz & Watson Oven Roasted Turkey Breast ...$8.99/lb
Hans Kissle Red Bliss Potato Salad .....................$4.99/lb

TURKEY ORDER FORM 2024
DATE OF ORDER: ______________________________________________________

CUSTOMER NAME: ____________________________________________________

DATE & TIME TO BE PICKED UP: ___________________  

ORDER TAKEN BY: ___________

___________________________

PHONE #: __________________

(turkey weights are 
approximate)

DEADLINE FOR ALL 
TURKEY PRE-ORDERS 
IS SATURDAY NOV. 23

SHADY BROOK 
FRESH......$1.59/lb

10-16LB | 16-20 LB | 20-24 LB
SHADY BROOK HOTEL STYLE TURKEY......$2.69/lb

SHADY BROOK FRESH TURKEY BREAST (4-7lbs) $1.79/lb

BUTTERBALL  FRESH......$1.99/lb
10-16LB | 16-22 LB | 20-24LB | 24LB & UP

THANKSGIVING SALE DAYS 
THURSDAY, NOV. 14 THROUGH 
WEDNESDAY, NOV. 27, 2024

We Will Have Fresh Butterball & 
Shadybrook Turkeys Available

FROZEN TURKEYS

FRESH TURKEYS

Fresh Shady Brook & 
Butterball Turkeys Available 

Assorted Sizes
See our order form for sizes and pricing

BUTTERBALL 1.79/lb
10-14 LB | 16-20 LB | 20-24 LB

Best Yet Frozen $1.49/lb   24 - 26LB

Sal Tiano (back row, center) Winthrop High Class of 1994, is pictured with his proud family after being inducted into the 
WHS Athletic Hall of Fame. Sal earned seven varsity letters in football, hockey, and baseball and graduated from Dart-
mouth College. He was recognized by Barron’s Magazine as one top 100 financial advisors in the USA.

WHS HALL OF FAME INDUCTIONSA Winning Season 
Dolen (3 TDs) Murphy (Pick-6 INT) help
Winthrop defeat KIPP Academy, 42-24

By Cary Shuman

Jon Cadigan and the 
Winthrop High School 
coaching staff faced the 
unfortunate happening of 
losing to injuries at mid-
season two of their most 
outstanding two-way 
players, running back and 
safety Nick Cappuccio, a 
pre-season All-State se-
lection, and talented tight 
end and linebacker Nick 
Romano, who was well 
on his way to confer-
ence-wide All-Star recog-
nition.

In the absence of that 
duo, the (6-4) Vikings 
pressed on while the 
coaching staff made some 
adjustments in personnel. 
The Vikings went out and 
executed the game plans 
and the result is the assur-
ance of a winning record 
for the 2024 season after 
a 42-24 victory over KIPP 
Academy of Lynn last 
Thursday at Miller Field.

In the new-look Win-
throp offense, quarter-
back Matt Noonan and 
running backs Will Mur-
phy, Seth Sacco, and Sean 
Dolen became the Big 
Four and their combined 
firepower was again ex-
hibited against KIPP, one 
of the best charter school 
programs in the state that 
draws its players from 
Lynn, a proven sports city 
with more than 100,000 
residents.

Dolen deservedly 
earned Boston Herald Star 
of the Week recognition 
(the fourth Winthrop play-
er to be so honored) for 
his 128 yards rushing and 
three touchdowns versus 
KIPP. Dolen is averaging 
a team-best 8.8 yards per 
carry.

“Sean had an excellent 
game,” summarized Jon 
Cadigan. “His running 
style – I describe it as he 
runs angry. He runs hard, 
bounces off people, and 
refuses to get tackled by 
one guy. But he’s also 
patient, he picks up his 

blocks greats and he cer-
tainly did against KIPP.”

Murphy made the play 
of the game when he in-
tercepted a pass and re-
turned it for a touchdown. 
Murphy was selected the 
Viking Black Shirt Defen-
sive Player of the Game. 
The senior captain also 
had eight carries for 48 
yards, two receptions for 
42 yards and a touchdown, 
and a two-point conver-
sion.

“Will is one of biggest 
offensive guys in terms 
of touches,” said Cadi-
gan. “Obviously he had 
the Pick-6 which was big. 
We got a total game from 
Will, which is pretty much 
what we expect.”

Sacco contributed “an-
other solid game” with 12 
carries for 79 yards and a 
touchdown. Sacco is the 
team’s leading rusher this 
season with 770 yards and 
a huge day on Thanksgiv-
ing would get him to the 
majestic 1,000-yard mile-
stone.

“Seth has become a to-
tal football player,” said 
Cadigan. “He plays very 
well on the defensive side 
of the ball. He put in a lot 
of work in the offseason.”

Cadigan credited the 
blocking of offensive line-
men, sophomore Riley 
Moccio, and senior cap-
tains Matt Reardon, Phil 
Boncore, and Gabe Grein, 
for an “A-plus” effort in 
the trenches.

“We’re happy with the 
win,” said Cadigan. “The 
goal was to secure a win-
ning season. It’s been a 
while since we were able 
to put together three con-
secutive winning seasons, 
so that’s a pretty big deal.”

The Vikings have 
turned their focus to the 
annual Thanksgiving 
game against Revere at 
Miller Field. Interesting-
ly, the visiting Patriots 
(5-5) will have additional 
incentive as they seek to 
achieve a winning record 
for the season.

 JUMP BALL Sean Dolen (5) and Elai Machado (3) reach for 
a pass. Machado came down with an interception for KIPP.
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John “Jack” Francis 
McMahon, noted Boston 
Labor Lawyer, of Win-
throp and more recently 
of Jamaica Plain, died on 
November 7, 2024, at age 
84.

Jack was born in 
Worcester, Massachusetts, 
son of John and Helen 
McMahon. He earned de-
grees from the College of 
the Holy Cross and Bos-
ton College Law School. 
As an attorney with An-
goff, Goldman, Manning, 
Pyle, Wanger, and Hiatt, 
Jack spent his career rep-
resenting workers and 
labor unions in New En-
gland, including arguing 
for the Boston Police and 
Firefighters Departments 
in front of the United 
States Supreme Court.

 He met his wife, Sheila 
McNicholas McMahon, 
in college. Together, they 
raised five children: Ra-
chel Christopher of Re-
vere (Lawrence Christo-
pher), Peter McMahon of 
Greenfield, MA, Deirdre 
McMahon of Bala Cyn-
wyd, PA (Jason Mezey), 
David McMahon of Cam-
bridge, MA (Leah Kram-
er), and Siobhan McMa-
hon of Cambridge, MA 
(Philip Holland).

In addition to his ca-
reer at the bar, Jack had 
a lifelong love of sports. 
He played hockey and 
speed skated with multi-
ple groups in the Boston 
area. He also loved to run 
and to bike and continued 

to cycle, if in stationary 
fashion, until weeks be-
fore his death. He was 
fond of crossword puz-
zles, coffee, birdwatching, 
and the Tour de France. 
He was also an accom-
plished draftsman and 
could sketch machinery 
with precision.

He and Sheila, who died 
in 2020, delighted in their 
grandchildren: Brendan, 
Erinn, Norah, Paul, Dan-
ny, Sebastian and Rosie. 
Jack leaves behind his 
children and grandchil-
dren, as well as his broth-
ers, Richard and Jimmy, 
both of Worcester, MA. 
His brothers, Christopher 
and Michael as well as his 
wife predeceased him.

Services will be pri-
vate. Jack’s family would 
like to thank the care team 
at Springhouse Senior 
Living in Jamaica Plain, 
especially Jessie, and the 
wonderful

A r r a n g e m e n t s 
by: Burns Funeral Home

354 Boston Rd.
Billerica, MA 01821
978 808-8633
Francis P. Burns, Jr.)

©
 a

d
fin

ity

All types of services
for all types of people.

Some people prefer traditional funeral 
services. Others prefer cremation. 

Some want an elaborate ceremony. 
Then there are others who don’t 
want any ceremony at all. When 
it comes to funerals, there are 
as many options as there are 

people. And we take pride in 
being able to say we offer them all.

(617) 846-8700
www.CaggianoFuneralHome.com. 

www.CremationsbyCaggianoFH.com

Caggiano
FUNERAL HOME

147 Winthrop Street • Winthrop, Massachusetts 02152
Telephone: 617-846-8700 Fax: 617-846-8701

www.caggianofuneralhome.com

TORF FUNERAL
SERVICE

Pre-need planning with our 
price protection guarantee. 

Arrangements made at our  
facility or in the comfort of  

your own home
4 generations of  the Torf  Tradition:

Deborah Torf  Golden
Amy Torf  Golden

Hyman J. Torf  (1903-2000)
M.L. Torf  (1867-1940)

(617) 889-2900
(800)428-7161

www.torffuneralservice.com

OBITUARIES Council votes no on 3A compliance plan
By Adam Swift

The town council voted 
not to accept the Massa-
chusetts 3A Communities 
Act compliance plan rec-
ommended by the plan-
ning board at a special 
meeting on Tuesday night.

Over the past year, the 
planning board has been 
charged with crafting and 
recommending a plan to 
comply with the state law, 
which aims to increase 
multi-family housing in 
MBTA and MBTA-ad-
jacent communities. The 
town is supposed to have a 
compliance plan approved 
by the state by the end of 
the calendar year, or could 
risk losing out on state 
grant opportunities.

The plan that was rec-
ommended by the board, 
working with RKG Con-
sultants, needed five votes 
for approval at Tuesday’s 
meeting, but garnered 
only three.

Councilors John Mun-
son, John DaRos, and Ste-
phen Aiello voted in favor 
of the recommended plan 
to create two 3A zoning 
overlay districts and use 
credit for previously cre-
ated town zoning in the 
Central Business District 
(CBD) to reach the state 
requirement of creating 
zoning for 882 units in the 
town.

Councilors Pat Costi-
gan, Rob DeMarco, Su-
zanne Swope, and Coun-
cil President Jim Letterie 
voted against approval of 
the planning board recom-
mendation. 

Council Vice President 
Hannah Belcher abstained, 
after earlier introducing a 
motion to table the deci-
sion to the Dec. 3 council 
meeting to see if the state 
court comes in with a rul-
ing on a case filed by the 
town of Milton challeng-
ing the legality of 3A. 
That motion deadlocked at 
4-4 and did not pass.

Councilor Max Tas-
sinari recused himself 
from the discussion and 
vote because he works for 
MassDOT, which is men-
tioned in the 3A law.

Several of the council-
ors in favor of the planning 
board recommendation 
noted that the plan would 
essentially create no new 
housing units in the town 
since it overlays existing 
developments, and that the 
town cannot afford to miss 
out on grant opportunities, 
especially when it comes 
to potential stormwater 
and flooding issues.

Some of those opposed 
to passing the recommen-
dation noted that 3A is a 
bad law that oversteps lo-
cal zoning, and that it was 
unclear how the law could 
change and impact the 
overlay districts and the 
CBD in the future.

The planning board rec-
ommended the creation 
of two distinct overlay 
zoning districts to comply 
with section 3A, Seal Har-
bor - covering Seal Harbor 
and Fort Heath, as well as 
Governor’s Park without 
any impact on the CBD.

The planning board also 
passed a motion outlining 
necessary zoning changes, 
including the elimination 
of a special permit process 
for applicants seeking to 
pay parking in lieu fee.

“The special permit re-
quirement in this section 
would be removed and 
will be addressed during 
the site plan review pro-
cess with the planning 
board,” Letterie stated 
reading from the motion 
on the planning board rec-
ommendation.

In her remarks on the is-
sue, Swope noted that the 
3A debate has awakened 
Winthrop as a community.

“You have emailed, 
attended meetings, held 

signs, made phone calls, 
gone to court, argued 
among yourselves, talk-
ed to our representatives, 
written and filed peti-
tions, filed for an exemp-
tion,” said Swope. “Many 
of you have spent more 
time, thought, and energy 
on this issue than anyone 
around this table. Many of 
you want to hear the town 
council vote; many of you 
want to hear your voices 
heard through a town-
wide vote, as this issue has 
a great impact on our town 
now and in the future.”

Swope said she has read 
every email, been to ev-
ery meeting, read the law 
and the decisions of other 
towns during the process. 
She said she made the de-
cision to vote no on the 
planning board recom-
mendation based on sever-
al factors.

“The offset of the CBD 
is included in our 3A pro-
posal from the planning 
board and it will dictate 
our ability to change, cre-
ate, and develop what the 
town of Winthrop wants in 
the CBD,” said Swope.

Under the overlay dis-
tricts, Swope said the 
properties under state 
zoning control may not 
change immediately but 
would not be under the 
control of the town.

“The question posed to 
the (attorney general’s) 
office offers the following 
response,” Swope said. 
“Does the passage to an 
MBTA compliance zone 
require changes to existing 
properties? The answer to 
that was no, the passage of 
a zoning district to comply 
with the MBTA communi-
ty’s law does not require 
existing property owners 
who alter their properties, 
or to change otherwise 
lawful restrictions and 
leases of homeowner as-
sociation contracts.”

However, Swope said 
it merely allows the 
multi-family housing to 
be developed as a right 
should a property owner 
choose to develop it.

“The future should be 
ours, not the state’s,” said 
Swope. “As an example, 
under the current regula-
tions, Fort Heath, a fami-
ly-owned building, could 
ask the town to change the 
configuration of the build-
ing. But the abutters, the 
planning board, the ordi-
nance appeals board, the 
building inspector would 
have some oversight in 
those decisions that are 
made.”

Swope said 3A allows 
building by right.

She continued that there 
was hope that a visit by 
state housing secretary 
Ed Augustus to Winthrop 
would demonstrate that 
the town is truly different 
from other communities 
in terms of density, traffic, 
the location of the airport, 
the need for improved in-
frastructure, and the lack 
of school funding. But 
Swope said the visit by 
Augustus did not change 
Winthrop’s position with 
the state when it comes to 
3A.

“We have an exemption 
case in the courts, why is 
the town not supporting 
it?” Swope asked. “All 
of you who claimed that 
the state might take mon-
ey away, wouldn’t you 
like the courts to find us 
exempt? I don’t want to 
interfere with this case go-
ing forward, it would be 
our salvation, a vote yes 
would destroy our chanc-
es.”

Swope also noted that 
given the changing regu-
lations of 3A, a future yes 
vote on a 3A compliance 
plan could still be possi-
ble.

“For example, if the 
attorney general wrote a 

formal letter … that said 
that no additional housing 
would be built now or in 
the future as a result of 
3A … I would certainly 
reconsider my vote,” she 
said. “One last thought, 
those of you that are so 
positive that increases of 
housing will never hap-
pen here as a result of 3A 
might think about being 
willing to pay for the ad-
ditional school, increased 
personnel, and physical 
infrastructure needs. If 
this goes through, we may 
find that the costs far out-
weigh the benefits.

“We are just one of 177 
towns impacted by this 
law, hopefully we can 
join forces and success-
fully fight the state’s over-
reach.”

DaRos thanked Swope 
for input and for working 
hard on the 3A issue since 
it was first introduced. But 
DaRos said he sees the is-
sue a little differently than 
Swope does.

“At the planning 
board’s presentation last 
Tuesday … I publicly 
thanked everyone on both 
sides of this issue for all 
their hard work and great 
questions in vetting the 
3A law and guidelines 
and their implications for 
Winthrop,” said DaRos. “I 
then thanked the planning 
board for their tremendous 
effort over the past year in 
helping us all go to school 
on all things zoning, un-
derstanding the 3A law 
and guidelines, and for 
taking on the challenge of 
crafting a plan that would 
comply with the law while 
resulting in minimal to 
no impact on our already 
dense town.”

At the planning board 
meeting, DaRos said he 
then asked board chair 
Christopher Boyce to give 
the bottom line of the rec-
ommended plan’s effect 
on the town. DaRos said 
he had four key takeaways 
from the board’s recom-
mendation, and asked 
Boyce if his assumptions 
were correct.

“Number one, how will 
your recommended plan 
change Winthrop in any 
way if at all?” DaRos said. 
“My takeaway, the impact 
will be zero. Chris’s re-
sponse, that is correct.”

He also asked Boyce if 
there was any chance that 
the plan would result in 
overdevelopment such as 
in the Seaport District in 
Boston or along Revere 
Beach.

“My takeaway, there 
is no chance of that hap-
pening under this plan,” 
DaRos said. “Chris’s re-
sponse, that is correct.”

Next DaRos said he 
asked Boyce if there 
would be any impact to 
the residents of the pro-
posed overlay districts 
in Seal Harbor One and 
Three, Governor’s Park, 
and Fort Heath.

“My takeaway, there 
will be no impact to those 
residents,” DaRos said. 
“Chir’s response, you are 
correct.”

Finally, DaRos said he 
asked Boyce if the mixed-
use nature of the CBD 
would change, and Boyce 
said it would not, requir-
ing ground floor commer-
cial development as it has 
for the past decade. DaRos 
also noted that the recom-
mended plan also has an 
affordable housing com-
ponent in the event that 
there ever is new building 
in the overlay districts.

“Folks, the planning 
board was given a tough 
task, and from my view, 
they nailed it,” said 
DaRos. “They nailed it so 
well that the plan’s over-
lay districts actually zone 
for (fewer) units than exist 
in those locations today. 
God forbid if Seal Harbor 

burned down tomorrow, 
a builder would need a 
whole host of special per-
mitting to build back as 
many units as there are 
there today.”

A yes vote on the com-
pliance plan would have 
allowed the town to com-
ply with the state law 
while maintaining eligi-
bility for a list of grants 
that are key to the future 
of Winthrop, especially 
climate resiliency grants, 
DaRos said.

“People in our town are 
hurting from flooding and 
it’s only going to get worse 
if we don’t vigorously 
pursue state grants for de-
sign and engineering work 
and federal grants for con-
struction and implementa-
tion,” said DaRos. 

He added that the coun-
cil was not voting on the 
state law, but on the com-
pliance plan recommend-
ed by the planning board, 
and asked if there were 
any specific parts of the 
compliance plan that oth-
er councilors would like 
to see changed. He also 
asked if the town could 
afford a lengthy legal bat-
tle over 3A compliance, 
noting that Milton has al-
ready spent hundreds of 
thousands of dollars in its 
legal battle.

Belcher noted that there 
are still some lingering 
questions when it comes 
to 3A, chief among them, 
the decision on the Milton 
legal case.

“I’ve been consistent 
from the beginning that I 
don’t think it is appropri-
ate to vote without that in-
formation,” said Belcher. 
“We don’t have a clear 
picture of what the reper-
cussions are for non-com-
pliance, and I don’t think 
it is appropriate to vote 
without that information.”

Letterie said the 3A law 
and the debate over it has 
put an incredible amount 
of pressure on the town, 
the citizens, and the coun-
cil.

“I do want to thank 
the yes and the no peo-
ple, good points on both 
sides,” said Letterie. “I do 
want to thank our (state) 
representative Jeff Turco 
for standing with Win-
throp and helping us in ev-
ery way he can and being 
there at the meetings.”

Letterie said he believed 
there is very little debate 
that 3A is a flawed law.

“There are towns that 
are unique, we like to 
think of ourselves as 
unique, and we are to me 
unique, and there are other 
towns that I’m sure con-
sider themselves unique 
for different reasons,” he 
said. “To me, one of the 
biggest problems with this 
is we are being punished 
for doing this work ahead 
of time, for being ahead of 
the curve. We created zon-
ing to add additional units 
to help our base.”

Letterie noted that the 
town’s population has 
remained essentially un-
changed at around 19,000 
residents since the 1950s.

“We are aware of that 
and we realize that it is 
very hard for us to sur-
vive on a limited income 
stream,” said Letterie. 
“We don’t have a lot of a 
commercial base, we are 
one of the lowest in the 
state at less than six per-
cent of our tax rate based 
on commercial businesses. 
Basically, this town is sup-
ported by its citizens.”

The town has created 
waterfront zoning and 
CBD zoning that Letterie 
said in time will bring in 
more units.

“Those units don’t 
bring in an astronomical 
amount of income to the 

John (“Jack”) Francis 
McMahon

Noted Boston Labor Lawyer

ANGELO 
RALPH VOTO
Nov. 22nd 2000

24th Anniversary 8th Anniversary

LOUIS M. VOTO
Nov. 23rd 2016

I hide my tears when i say your names, but the pain in my 
heart is the same. Although I smile and seem carefree, there is 

no one who misses you more than me.
We Love & Miss You, Mom & Family

To place a 
memoriam in the  
Winthrop Sun 

Transcript,  
Please Call 

781-485-0588

SeeCOUNCIL Page 11
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WINTHROP HIGH SCHOOL ATHLETIC HALL OF FAME 2024

The 2024 WHS Hall of Fame Committee: Seated, President Robert DeGregorio, Susan 
Freedland, Richard Thibeau, and Pamela Gilfoyle Lund. Standing, Chris Tsiotos, Kevin 
Corkhum, Howard Conley, and Peg Bailey.

A delicious buffet dinner by Patsy Cimino and his crew at 
the Winthrop Meat Market & Catering in Winthrop.

Warren McPhail, WHS Class of 1986. Warren was a 3-sport athlete, an educator and a 
coach. Totaling 200 meet wins as a track coach, and 12 NEC Championships.

Pictured above is the family of Joseph Kearns, Class of 1993,  9 Varsity Letters, captain of 
the Viking Football Team that won the 1993 NEC title. Accepting for Joseph is Jill Callinan.

Marie Gambale Currier,  WHS Class of 1998. Competing in cross country, indoor and out-
door track. A 6-time NEC and Lynn Item All-Star.

Doug Milne, WHS Class of 1963. Awarded 8 Varsity letters, in football, Basketball, and 
track. US Army veteran as a Lt. Colonel with 23 years of service to his country, awarded the 
Soldiers Medal of Heroism.

Jarrett Herdt, WHS Class of 2006. Jarrett was a football, hockey, and baseball athlete, earn-
ing 11 WHS Varsity Letters.

Daniel Morgan WHS Class of 1980. Earning 9 Varsity Letters in golf, hockey, and baseball. NEC 
All-Star. Vote best male athlete by the WHS Class of 1980, and Bently Swift Award recipient.

Jenny Fucillo Golic, WHS Class of 2010. Competed in soccer, indoor and outdoor track. 
Jenny was a NEC All-Star and a recipient of the Wallace B MacLean Athletic Award and 
competed and graduated from Notre Dame University.

The WHS 1981 State Champion Baseball Team. The Viking champs sealed their fate with 
wins over Saugus, Lynn Classical, Lawrence, East Boston, and the final at Shepard Hill. Led 
by Head Coach Barry Rosen and team Captain George Sennott this team battled to the 
end, using all the skill and determination to claim the state title.

The Winthrop High 
School Athletic Hall of 
Fame Committee hosted 
its biennial Hall of Fame 
Induction Dinner Nov. 9 
at the Lodge of Elks.

Committee President 
Robert DeGregorio was 
the master of ceremonies 
for the program that hon-

ored some of the most 
outstanding athletes in 
the history of the Vikings’ 
program. 

The eight individual 
inductees in the Class of 
2024 were Maria Gam-
bale Currier (1998), Jenny 
Fucillo Golic (2010), Jar-
rett Herdt (2006), Joseph 

Kearns (1993), Doug-
las Milne (1963), Daniel 
Morgan (1980), Sal Tiano 
(1984), and Keith Welch 
(1976).

Cross country and track 
coach Warren MacPhail 
was honored with induc-
tion for his contributions 
as a coach.

The 1981 state champi-
on Winthrop High School 
baseball team, led by head 
coach Barry Rosen and as-
sistant coaches Ed Morri-
son, Tony Fucillo, and Jay 
Guthro, was also inducted 
into the Hall of Fame.

Robert DiGregorio led 
the assembled guests in a  
memorial tribute to Win-
throp High football coach 
and Bentley University 
Director of Athletics Bob 
DeFelice, who passed 
away Oct. 6, 2024.

The Hall of Fame, con-
sisting of Robert DiGre-
gorio, Susan Goldstein 
Freedland, and commit-
tee members Peg Bailey, 
Howard Conley, Kevin 

Corkhum, Courtney Finn, 
Richard Fucillo, Pame-
la Gilfoyle Lund, Phil 
Ronan, Richard Thibeau 

and Chris Tsiotos, con-
ducted a professional se-
lection process leading to 
an outstanding induction 

dinner that has become a 
much-anticipated event on 
the Winthrop sports calen-
dar. 
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Jeanne Holgersen, Robin Bertino, event moderator Sandra Hurley, Jennifer Hurley, Andrea 
Hurley, and Abby Carleton.

WINTHROP COMMUNITY HEALTH FORUM A HUGE SUCCESS

Winthrop High School hockey coaches Dale Dunbar and Michael Norris and players volun-
teered their efforts at the Health Forum.

Participating in the House of Representatives citation presentation to award recipient Dr. 
Pramodchandra Shah are former Speaker of the House Robert A. DeLeo, Rep. Jeff Turco, 
Rep. Joseph McGonagle, and Sandra Hurley.

Many residents attended 
the Winthrop Community 
Health Forum Nov. 13 at 
the Cummings School.

The annual event was 
created by former Speaker 
of the House Robert A. De-
Leo 27 years ago.

Guests were able to 
converse with medical 
personnel and representa-
tives from various health, 
wellness, elder, and public 
safety agencies. The guests 
enjoyed free healthcare 
giveaways and refresh-
ments.

Dr. Pramodchandra 
Shah and Winthrop High 
assistant football coach 
and alumnus Mark D’Am-
brosio were the keynote 
speakers.

Shah is a highly respect-
ed and beloved physician 
in town who retired after 
a distinguished 54-year 

career in medicine.  Shah 
illuminated about his 
amazing journey from his 
scholastic excellence in 
Mumbai, India, to his ar-
rival in the United States 
and Winthrop that began 
here when he was recruit-
ed by the former Winthrop 
Hospital to launch their 
emergency room and out-
patient services.

D’Ambrosio, a former 
Winthrop High football 
player who was mentored 
by Hall of Fame coach 
Tony Fucillo, talked about 
his life as a high school and 
Colby College student-ath-
lete and his professional 
career. D’Ambrosio fo-
cused a portion of his in-
spiring address on the per-
sonable challenges that he 
had to confront during his 
development years within 
his family, emerging today 

as a proud husband and 
father, and a positive role 
model for the town’s stu-
dent-athletes.

 The presenters for 
the Winthrop Commu-
nity Health Forum were 
Commonwealth Clinic 
Services, Inc., Common-
wealth Primary Care, Inc., 
Winthrop Chamber of 
Commerce, and the Win-
throp Board of Health.

The Winthrop Founda-
tion, represented by Vin-
cent Crossman at the event, 
was a major sponsor.

The Winthrop High 
School hockey team, led 
by head coach Dale Dun-
bar and assistant coach Mi-
chael Norris, turned out as 
a group to volunteer at the 
event and their generous 
assistance was acknowl-
edged by organizers of the 
forum.

Vicki Mucci, former Speaker of the House and event founder Robert A. DeLeo, Chamber of Commerce Executive Director 
Betsy Shane, Sen. Lydia Edwards, NeighborHealth Director of Communications Emily Martin, and event moderator  pre-
senter Sandra Hurley, Rep. Joseph McGonagle, and Chris Hurley.

Event honoree and keynote speaker, retired physician, Dr. Pramodchandra Shah, with his wife, Dr. Devila Shah, and their 
proud family.

The Brooks Dental table, Patty DePamphilis, Dr. Howard Brooks, Dr. Stephanie Brooks, 
Dental Assistant Mary Gillis, and Dental Assistant Ashley Arciero.

Event honoree and keynote 
speaker Mark D’Ambrosio 
is pictured with his wife, 
Chrissy D’Ambrosio, after 
his inspiring speech at the 
Health Forum.

Robin Bertino, one of the 
Community Health Forum’s 
key organizers, pictured 
with her husband, City of 
Lynn Chief Financial Officer 
Michael Bertino.

A full list of the activities, 
programs, trips, and ser-
vices offered at the Senior 
Center can be found in the 
newsletter, which is avail-
able at the Senior Center 
and on our website.

 
Monday, November 25

9:00am-3:00pm: Com-
puter Usage

10 :00am-11 :30am: 
Representative Turco Of-
fice Hours

10 :00am-11 :00am: 
Yoga with Trish ($5)

11:00am: Grab & Go 
Lunch Pick-Up

1 1 : 3 0 a m - 2 : 3 0 p m : 
Game Day / Mahjong

 
Tuesday, November 26

9:00am-3:00pm: Com-
puter Usage

9:30am-10:30am: Exer-
cise Class ($1)

10:00am: Bowling at 
the Winthrop Elks ($15.00 
annually)

10:00am-11:00am: Ex-
ploring Medicare Advan-
tage Plans/BCBS

11:00am: Grab & Go 
Lunch Pick-Up

11 :00am-12 :00pm: 
Blood Pressures

12:30pm-2:30pm: Art 
Class with Dawn ($6)

1:00pm-2:00pm: Win-
throp Police Senior Part-
nership: Tour of Metro 
North Regional Emergen-
cy   Communications Cen-
ter

Wednesday, Nov. 27

9:00am-3:00pm: Com-
puter Usage

9:15am-10:15am: Yoga 
with Trish ($5)

10 :30am-11 :30am: 
Zumba with Cindy ($5)

 The Senior Center will 
close at 12 noon. Lunches 
must be picked up before 
12 noon. 

Thursday, November 21

Senior Center closed for 
Thanksgiving

Friday, November 22 

CLOSED 

 Winthrop Senior 
Center News

35 Harvard Street, Winthrop, MA 02152    
Hours: Mon-Thurs: 8:30am-3:30p.m. /  

Friday: 8:30am-1p.m.  Phone: 617-846-8538
Website: www.town.winthrop.ma.us    

Email: COAReception@town.winthrop.ma.us

Representing HarborCOV, Cindy 
Cruz, Jessica Vindel, and Maddy 
Martinez.

The Neighborhood PACE table, Outreach and 
Marketing Coordinator Daniela Martinez Perez, 
Business Development Manager Mackenzie Cun-
ningham, and NeighborHealth Director of Commu-
nications Emily Martin.

Emma Holgersen (right) conducts a blood pressure test 
for Yvonne Westcott at the Winthrop Community Health 
Forum. 
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CONTRACTOR MOVERSMASONRY

Ronnie Z.
Leave Your  

Moving To Us
Whether It Be One Piece or More!

Call Ronnie
781-321-2499

For A Free Estimate

10% OFF FOR SENIOR CITIZENS, 
VETERANS & DISABLED

2 col. x 1 inch
$120.00

CONSTRUCTION

HOME
REPAIR?
Call AL COY
617-539-0489

Masonry &
Chimney Pointing,

Carpentry & Odd Jobs

We Clean
& Repair
Gutters

CLEANING SERVICES

Winthrop'Winthrop's s Professional Service DirectoryProfessional Service Directory

1 col. x  
1 inch
$60.00

For 3 Months
($5/wk)

L. P.
CONTRACTING

LUIGI:
(617) 846-0142

FREE ESTIMATES
… LICENSED …

INSURED

Building & Remodeling

Kitchen ✧ Bathroom
Additions ✧ Porches

Replacement windows
Garages ✧ Decks
Siding - All Types

MORELLI MASONRY & TILE
All Types of Masonry Repair, Ceramic Tile, 

Concrete Pours, Chimneys, Stairs, Walls,  
Cutting & Pointing • Restoration Cleaning

Fully Insured • No Job Too Small
Dennis Morelli

781-632-8812

mr. fix it
REPAIR MOST 

ANYTHING, DOORS, 
WINDOWS PORCHES, 

REPLACEMENT 
WINDOWS, FENCES, 

SIDING, FLOORS ETC.
SNOW PLOWING

LICENSED AND INSURED
CALL AL  

617-429-0606

handy man services

Spartan 
Cleaning 
ServiCe

Since 1978

COMMERCIAL  
RESIDENTIAL

CARPET AND UPHOLSTERY
CLEANING

Satisfaction Guaranteed
Call

617-593-4532
617-567-2926

Removes Dirt • Cleans • Deodorizes
Complete Office Cleaning

Tommy Feeley 781-771-4707Tommy Feeley 781-771-4707

Feeley & Daughters Clean-Up ServiceFeeley & Daughters Clean-Up Service
We remove all We remove all 
sorts of junk!sorts of junk!
Quick & Quick & 
convenient service.convenient service.

Free Free 
estimates!estimates!

2 col. x 2 inches
$240.00

M
OONEY ELECTRIC LLC

Residential & 
Commercial

Fully Licensed & Insured

KEVIN MOONEY
781-799-1862

• Painting & Decor
• Light Carpentry
• Finish Carpentry

More than 
30 years experience

Call Dennis
781-307-0947

DH HANDYMAN

Specializing in Home Renovations
Kitchen+Bath • Cabinets, Granite Counters •Doors+Window • Decks 

Enclosurer • Pavers + Blockwalls • Additions • Interior+Exterior Painting

ALL YOUR HOME OWNER NEEDS

PAINTING & REMODELING PAINTING & REMODELING 
SERVICESSERVICES

Call Don Falzarano
617-846-6553

LANDSCAPING

STEVEN'S
LANDSCAPING & HARDSCAPING

Spring & Fall Clean Up • Tree Trimming
Mowing, Weeding & Edging

Hedge Trimming & Removal (shrub & bushes) 
New Lawns Installed (seed or sod)

Planting & Mulching • Fence Installation
Patios, Retaining Walls & Other Hardscapes

And more!
Call or Text

For a free estimate

781-244-9997Steven 

978-876-6566Diego

Schedule a free estimate 
617-592-6447

www.dipierroconstruction.com

In business for over 40 years!

Let us turn your house into a home

HANDYMANELECTRICIAN EXTERIORS

American Exterior and
Window Corporation

Contact us for all of your
Home improvement projects 

and necessities

Call Jeff or Bob
Toll Free: 1-888-744-1756

 americanexteriorforma.com

617-699-1782
Windows,Siding,Roofing, Carpentry 
& More! All estimates, consultations 

or inspections completed by MA 
licensed supervisors. 

*Over 50 years experience. 
*Better Business Bureau Membership.

Insured 
and

Registered

Complete Financing 
Available.

No Money Down.

Roberta Will
• Painting 

• Wall Papering 
• Decorative Painting 

• Murals 
617-846-8992

PAINTING

John J. Recca 
Painting

Interior/Exterior 
Commercial/Residential

Fully Insured 
Quality Work

Reasonable Rates   
Free Estimates

781-241-2454

Joe Bertino OwnerJoe Bertino Owner
978-376-6661978-376-6661

Interior and Exterior PaintingInterior and Exterior Painting
Bertinopaintingcompany@gmail.com

POOLS

COSMO POOLS
• NEW LINERS

• INSTALLATION
•POOL OPENINGS

CALL JOHN
781-589-0505

1 col. x  
2 inches

ROOFING REPAIRS

HOME RENOVATION
ROOFING-SIDING-PAINTING

SERVING THE BOSTON AREA SINCE 2002

marcelo
de souza

617-507-1703
Lic. & insured CSL 100141LOCALLOCAL

SONNY’S
IMMEDIATE

ROOFING
778811--224488--88229977

Residential - Commercial
All types of roofing & repairs
Painting & Carpentry
Licensed
Insured
Free estimates

sonnysimmediateservices.com

TO ADVERTISE IN OUR SERVICE DIRECTORY, PLEASE CALL 
781-485-0588 OR EMAIL DEB@REVEREJOURNAL.COM

661177--997700--66331144
Free Estimates - Fully Insured

prestigepainting75@gmail.com

PPRREESSTTIIGGEE
PPAAIINNTTIINNGG

Full Service Painters

pprreessttiiggeeppaaiinnttiinnggiinncc..uuss

8-7

PLUMBING

CALL

Council //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 8

Charlestown  |  Chelsea  |  East Boston
Everett  |  Lynn  |  Revere  |  Winthrop

CLASSIFIEDSCLASSIFIEDS

SERVICESHELP WANTED–PCA
DEADLINES: For classi-
fied line ads, deadlines 
are Monday by 4 p.m.
___________

SELLING YOUR AUTO? Call 
for our 4 week special! 
Call 781-485-0588.

PCA needed in EVERETT
Monday-Friday 9a.m. 
to 2 p.m.
Call Susan 617-389-

6190
Hablo Español.
11/28

town, especially in terms 
of apartments,” said Let-
terie. “It is small com-
pared to single-family 
homes, two-family homes, 
and condominiums.”

One of the primary rea-
sons the state passed 3A in 
the first place was because 
people were concerned 
about a housing crisis in 
Massachusetts, Letterie 
said.

“If we agree with that 

premise, and that premise 
only, this bill by all ac-
counts, and this has been 
said by the yes and no 
people, doesn’t potential-
ly create any units,” he 
said. “So why would a yes 
person be happy with this 
outcome? The answer to 
that, if I could be so bold 
to answer that question, 
it’s because of the poten-
tial loss of grants.

“That’s the scare tactic, 

and it’s worthy; there are 
multiple grants that are 
affected by this, there are 
no federal grants affected 
by this, the MSBA is not 
affected by this,” Letterie 
continued. “Originally, 
there were three or four 
grants that were tied to 
this, now it is in the teens.”

One of the major grants 
tied to 3A is the MVP grant 
which the town has made 
use of in past years to the 

tune of about $700,000, 
Letterie said.

“Obviously, money is 
a concern and we rely on 
some of these grants,” 
Letterie said. “The MVP 
grant is helping us with 
Morton Street. We were 
also denied an MVP grant 
earlier this year while Re-
vere was accepted, so do I 
have concerns about that? 
I do.”

During the special 

meeting, Aiello stated that 
the 3A issue would likely 
go to a town-wide vote 
regardless of the outcome 
at the council level, and 
Letterie agreed that it was 
likely.

“This will probably be 
on a ballot sometime in 
the early spring,” said Let-
terie. “There would be a 
referendum process, there 
would be signatures that 
would have to be certified, 

and it would be on a bal-
lot.”

Ultimately, Letterie 
said his position on 3A has 
not changed over the past 
year.

“I don’t think this is the 
right thing for Winthrop,” 
he said. “I know there are 
consequences we will deal 
with, but this is not the 
right thing for Winthop at 
this time.”
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FORMERLY EAST BOSTON NEIGHBORHOOD HEALTH CENTER

617-568-4781

Refill prescriptions online via MyChart 

Home delivery 

Friendly, helpful staff 

Short wait times 

Pharmacies at 10 Gove St. and Maverick Square

Pick up your prescriptions – 
or get them delivered!

neighborhealth.com

Open House: December 6–7 from 10am to 2pm

nbss.edu/openhouse

Find your calling 
at America’s first 
trade school

NBSS_ING_1-6 page Open House_241105.indd   2NBSS_ING_1-6 page Open House_241105.indd   2 11/5/24   3:36 PM11/5/24   3:36 PM

TEMPLE TIFERETH FALL FESTIVAL

Terri Gaudreau and Mary DiRusso at Terri’s Fragrance and 
Flames  

Paul Singarella and Lindsay McIsaac, of Sublime Soul Cro-
chet, selling crocheted plushies and scrunchies 

Joslyn Smith with her grandmother, Alicia Vazquez, and Alicia Ortiz hugging her mother, 
Alicia Ortiz Paula Ronan, Ginger Cross, and Laurie and Caitlyn Jevoli shopping for winter hats 

Jean Barry, Kathy Nelson, Sue Gaughan, and Barbara Marley

Al Dominique, Dawn Mahoney, holding her Menorah-painted shell, and Colleen Murphy 
with her holiday top hat bouquet

Kathy and Jennifer Magnasco, of Kathy’s Crafts

Photos by Marianne Salza

Temple Tifereth Israel held its Fall Festival on No-
vember 17, featuring vendors that offered cozy winter 

items such as hats, mittens, and patterned leggings. 
Handsewn scarves, as well as crocheted baby clothes, 
plushies, and towels were on display at the craft fair, 
where families began their holiday shopping for every-

thing from skincare items to scented candles. Local art-
ists were also selling their photographs, paintings, sea-
sonal decorations, and embellished water bottles. 

MAIN FONT: TRAJAN
SUB FONT: MYRIAD

MAIN FONT: TRAJAN
SUB FONT: MYRIAD

Introducing

msic.website/TRIM-it  |  TRIM@msic.orgParticipating credit unions are NMLS Approved 
Lenders and Equal Housing Lenders

Get a great 30-year fixed-rate 

MORTGAGE NOW, and if rates drop, 

JUST TRIM™ IT LATER with NO FEE!

SEND US YOUR NEWS
The Transcript encourages residents to submit engagement,  

wedding and birth announcements, news releases, business and education briefs, sports stories and 
photos for publication. Items should be forwarded to our offices  

at 385 Broadway, Revere, MA 02151.  

Items can also  be faxed to 781-485-1403.   
We also encourage readers to e-mail news releases  

and photos to deb@reverejournal.com


