
By Adam Swift

The health of a single 
tree on Grovers Avenue 
was the biggest topic of 
discussion at last week’s 
town council meeting.

For several weeks, the 
town’s tree committee and 
the council have weighed 
the request made by the 
O’Learys at 170 Grovers 
Ave. to have the tree re-
moved.

In one motion, the 
council approved the rec-
ommendation made by 
the tree warden to remove 
the tree. According to an 
arborist’s report submit-
ted by the homeowners, 
the tree is not healthy and 
could constitute a haz-
ard. Councilor Suzanne 
Swope, who expressed 
concerns about the taking 
of the tree, voted against 
the removal.

In a second motion, the 
council approved having 
the homeowners pay for 
the removal of the tree, as 
well as donate four new 
trees to the town to replace 
the tree which will be re-
moved. One of the trees 

will be planted in front 
of 170 Grovers, a second 
in front of a neighbor’s 
house, and the remaining 
two will be planted at the 
town’s discretion.

Councilor Max Tassi-
nari, who raised concerns 
that the donations could 
be considered a trade-off 
for approving the removal 
of the tree, abstained from 
the vote.

The tree removal would 
allow the homeowners to 
put a new driveway on 
the property, however, 
Nathan O’Leary said he 
would not have requested 
the removal of the tree if 
it was healthy. He said the 
removal will benefit the 
town with the donation of 
the new trees and remove 
a potential hazard, as well 
as provide the opportunity 
for the new driveway.

The council meeting 
featured a good amount of 
discussion on tree health, 
state regulations regarding 
removal, and the process 
the town has in place for 
tree removals.

PROJECT PLAY 
PRESENTS FREE 
KIDS/TOTS YOGA 
AT FARMERS 
MARKET

This Sunday, July 14 at 
10:30, little ones and their 
grown ups attending the 
Winthrop Farmers Mar-
ket at Ingleside Park can 
take part in a free yoga 
class led by Kathleen 
Coffey of Be The Light 
Yoga and Pilates Studio. 
No experience necessary! 
Bring a mat or find space 
on the large mats provid-
ed. There will also be free 
pop-up play in the area 
by the gazebo from 9:30-
11:30, including a ball pit 
and Project Play’s signa-
ture climbers, tunnels and 
ride on toys. More info at 
projectplaywinthrop.org

GOV. HEALEY 
PROCLAIMS 
‘HURRICANE 
PREPAREDNESS 
WEEK’ IN 
MASSACHUSETTS

Governor Maura 
Healey signed a proclama-
tion declaring the week of 
July 7 to July 13, 2024, as 
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Rogers sworn in as Deputy Police Chief

Council approves 
Grovers Ave. tree 
removal request

MARIANNE SALZA PHOTO

The thirteenth director of Winthrop Public Library, Greg 
McClay, shown with the celebratory sign during the 125th 
anniversary party of the library on June 27. See more pho-
tos on Page  9.

WINTHROP PUBLIC LIBRARY 
CELEBRATES 125 YEARS

By Adam Swift

Stephen Rogers was 
officially sworn in as 
Winthrop’s newest Dep-
uty Police Chief during 
last week’s town council 
meeting.

The long-time Win-
throp Police Department 

fixture was promoted from 
lieutenant to fill the open-
ing created when former 
Deputy Chief John Good-
win was promoted to chief 
following the retirement 
of Terence Delehanty.

“It gives me great plea-
sure to chair this meet-
ing and to be able to see 

Stephen Rogers getting 
sworn in as our new dep-
uty chief,” said Council 
President Jim Letterie. 
“Steve has been incredible 
for the town for so many 
years in his day-to-day du-
ties, but what I look at the 
most is all he’s done for 
the youth of this town, es-
pecially with the Explorers 
Program and the Friday 
Nights Out with the kids 
down at the gym. He’s 
done so much as a coach 
for hockey and baseball 
and other youth sports.

“All that is good about 
Winthrop is personified in 
Stephen Rogers, so I want 
to congratulate him.”

Rogers has served in 
the department for over 
30 years, working as the 
supervisor of the criminal 
investigations unit, as well 
as being the senior advi-
sor for the Winthrop Po-
lice Explorer Post #99 for 

Stephen Rogers being 
sworn in by Town Clerk 
Denise Quist.

PHOTOS FROM WINTHROP POLICE DEPT.

Stephen Rogers being 
pinned by wife Kim.

Marino gives update on latest 3A, 
fire station information

By Adam Swift

Town Manager Tony 
Marino briefly updated the 
town council on several 
big ongoing issues in Win-
throp during his report at 

last week’s meeting.
At the next council 

meeting on Tuesday, July 
16, Marino said he will 
be ready to give a presen-
tation on proposed town 
water rates.

That meeting will also 

mark the official swear-
ing-in ceremony for new 
Police Chief John Good-
win. Terence Delehanty’s 
last official day as chief is 
July 14.

See UPDATE Page 3

See ROGERS Page 5

ANNUAL HORRIBLES 
PARADE

MARIANNE SALZA PHOTOS

Shown above, celebrating Independence 
Day on two wheels and in style during the 
parade are The Cycling Murray’s of Roches-
ter, New York.

Shown to the left, Granville Harris as Uncle 
Sam. See more photos on Pages 6 and 7.
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The following incident 
reports are among the 
calls to which the Win-
throp Police Department 
responded on the listed 
dates. The log is a public 
record and available for 
review. All persons who 
are arrested or charged 
with a crime are presumed 
innocent until proven 
guilty in a court of law.

MONDAY, JUNE 24
0832: An officer 

stopped a motor vehicle 
on Washington Ave. for 
the civil moving infraction 
of speeding (38 in a 25 
m.p.h. zone). The officer 
issued a citation to the op-
erator.

0915: The Animal Con-
trol Officer picked up 
a loose pitbull-mix dog 
that had been found by a 
Moore St. resident. The 
officer made contact with 
the owner, who came to 
get her dog.

0948: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Washington Ave. for 
the civil moving infraction 
of speeding. The officer 
issued a citation to the op-
erator.

1009: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Washington Ave. for 
the civil moving infraction 
of speeding. The officer 
issued a citation to the op-
erator.

1032: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle on Main 
St. for the civil moving in-
fraction of speeding. The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

1149: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle on Pauline 
St. for the civil moving in-
fraction of passing emer-
gency vehicles in the road. 
The officer gave a verbal 
warning to the operator 
and informed him of the 
rules of the road regarding 
emergency vehicles.

1206: A resident came 
to the station to report 
that a vehicle backed up 
into her parked vehicle on 
Shirley St., causing slight 
damage, and left the scene. 
The officer filed a report.

TUESDAY, JUNE 25
0049: An officer direct-

ed a group of eight per-
sons playing music loudly 
at a Shirley Ave. residence 
to end it for the night.

0525: An officer direct-
ed a group of three persons 
playing music loudly at a 
Marshall Ave. residence to 
turn it off.

0626: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
that was cutting through a 
parking lot to avoid a red 
light on Main St. The offi-
cer gave a verbal warning 
to the operator.

0956: An officer re-
sponded to a report from 
a resident that a chlorine 
truck was unable to make 
the turn from Beacon St. 
onto Shirley St. The offi-
cer informed the operator 
of the proper truck route.

1110: An officer stopped 

a person operating a mo-
ped without a helmet. The 
operator was unlicensed 
and the officer informed 
him of the laws regarding 
mopeds. The officer di-
rected the operator to walk 
the moped to his residence 
and not to operate it with-
out a driver’s license.

1250: An officer issued 
a citation to a boat trailer 
at the Public Landing.

1300: A resident came 
into the staton to report 
being the victim of a 
check-washing forgery. 
The officer filed a report.

1305: An officer issued 
a citation to a parked ve-
hicle on Somerset Ave. 
for the civil infraction of 
operating with an expired 
registration.

1754: Officers respond-
ed to a two-car motor ve-
hicle accident on Summit 
Ave. There were no inju-
ries. Neither vehicle was 
towed. The officer filed a 
report.

2019: Officers respond-
ed to a two-car motor ve-
hicle accident on Shirley 
St. There were no inju-
ries. Neither vehicle was 
towed. The officer filed a 
report.

WEDNESDAY, JUNE 26
0306: An officer direct-

ed persons on a boat at At-
lantis Marina to turn down 
their music.

0906: An officer 
stopped a motor vehi-
cle on Shirley St. for the 
civil moving infraction 
of speeding. The officer 
issued a citation to the 
operator for that offense, 
as well as for the civil in-
fraction of not having his 
license in possession.

0917: An officer issued 
parking tickets to four 
vehicles on Taylor St. for 
violating the street-sweep-
ing parking restrictions.

0936: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Main St. for the civil 
moving infraction of a red 
light violation. The officer 
issued a citation to the op-
erator.

1008: A tow company 
reported the trespass tow 
of a motor vehicle from 
Governors Park.

1039: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Washington Ave. for 
the civil moving infraction 
of speeding. The officer 
issued a citation to the op-
erator.

1119: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle on Putnam 
St. for the civil moving in-
fraction of speeding. The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

1308: A resident came 
into the station to report 
that she had been tricked 
into giving out her person-
al identifying information 
to a person who had told 
her that she had won $1 
million in a sweepstakes 
contest. The officer filed a 
report.

1311: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle at Atlantic 

and Shirley Sts. for a civil 
moving infraction. The of-
ficer gave a verbal warn-
ing to the operator.

1327: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Walden St. for the civ-
il moving infraction of a 
stop sign violation. The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

1358: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Shore Dr. for the civ-
il moving infraction of a 
marked lanes violation. 
The officer issued a cita-
tion to the operator.

1512: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
at Morton St. and Pleasant 
Park Rd. for the civil mov-
ing infraction of a stop 
sign violation. The officer 
gave a verbal warning to 
the operator.

1938: A resident came 
into the staton to report be-
ing the victim of a check 
forgery for a check that 
she had mailed to pay a 
credit card bill. The officer 
filed a report.

1957: An officer direct-
ed the owners of five vehi-
cles parked in the fire lane 
on Shirley St. to move 
their vehicles.

2119: A report of flood-
ing on Girdlestone Rd. 
was referred to the DPW.

2120: Flooding was 
reported on Washington 
Ave. in front of the Elks.

THURSDAY, JUNE 27
0604: An officer re-

sponded to a report of a 
dog left unattended in a 
yard on Beacon St. and 
barking. The officer di-
rected the owner to bring 
the dog inside.

0848: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Main St. for the civ-
il moving infraction of a 
marked lanes violation. 
The officer issued a cita-
tion to the operator.

0911: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle on Shirley 
St. for the civil moving in-
fraction of speeding. The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

0930: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Washington Ave. for 
the civil moving infraction 
of speeding. The officer 
issued a citation to the op-
erator.

0930: Officers restored 
the peace at a landlord/
tenant disturbance on 
Golden Drive.

0951: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Washington Ave. for 
the civil moving infraction 
of speeding (38 in a 25 
m.p.h. zone). The officer 
gave a verbal warning to 
the operator.

1047: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Main St. for the civil 
moving infraction of vio-
lating the hands-free law. 
The officer gave a verbal 
warning to the operator.

1054: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Veterans Rd. for the 

civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.

1205: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Pauline St. for a civil 
moving infraction. The of-
ficer gave a verbal warn-
ing to the operator.

1211: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle on Pleas-
ant St. for the civil moving 
infraction of failing to stop 
for a traffic control sign or 
signal. The officer issued a 
citation to the operator.

1359: An officer or-
dered a tow for an unreg-
istered trailer at the Public 
Landing.

1821: An officer direct-
ed the operator of a vehi-
cle parked in the Fire Lane 
on Shirley St. to move the 
vehicle.

1919: An officer ordered 
the tow of two mopeds on 
Washington Ave. being 
operated by persons who 
were unlicensed, which 
is a criminal offense. The 
officer also cited them 
for the civil infractions of 
not wearing a helmet and 
operating an unregistered 
motor vehicle.

2001: An officer issued 
a parking ticket to a vehi-
cle parked in the Fire Lane 
on Shirley St.

2047: An officer issued 
a parking ticket to a vehi-
cle parked in the Fire Lane 
on Shirley St.

2214: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Pleasant St. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
a marked lanes violation. 
The officer gave a verbal 
warning to the operator.

2342: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Crest Ave. for the civ-
il moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer gave 
a verbal warning to the op-
erator.

FRIDAY, JUNE 28
0053: An officer re-

sponded to a report of 
youths causing a distur-
bance at the 7/11. The offi-
cer watched footage of the 
incident and located the 
youths. The officer filed a 
report.

0839: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle at Shirley 
and Perkins Sts. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
a stop sign violation. The 
officer gave a verbal warn-
ing to the operator.

0844: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
at Shirley and Underhill 
Sts. for the civil moving 
infraction of a stop sign 
violation. The officer gave 
a verbal warning to the op-
erator.

0844: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle at 
Shirley St. and Washing-
ton Ave. for the civil mov-
ing infraction of a stop 
sign violation. The officer 
gave a verbal warning to 
the operator.

1022: An officer 
stopped an unlicensed op-
erator operating a scooter 
on Shirley St. The officer 
directed the operator to 
place the scooter on pri-
vate property.

1318: An officer issued 
a parking ticket to a vehi-
cle on Walden St.

1508: An officer re-
sponded to a report of 
two parties arguing over 
a parking spot on Strand 
Way. The officer restored 
the peace.

2301: An officer directd 
persons playing music 
loudly in an apartment 
on Golden Drive to turn 
down the volume.

SATURDAY, JUNE 29
1204: A person came 

into the station to report 
that his business website 
had been copied by some-
one who now was scam-
ming potential customers 
out of money. The officer 

filed a report.
1525: A person came to 

the station to leave a wallet 
that had been found at the 
Stop and Shop in Revere. 
The wallet was returned to 
the owner.

1648: An officer re-
sponded to a report of 
juveniles shooting an air-
soft rifle at Veterans Rd. 
and Shirley St. The officer, 
who did not see the rifle, 
told the youths that it will 
be confiscated if he sees it 
and their parents will be 
contacted.

1716: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
at Main and Bowdoin Sts. 
for the civil moving in-
fraction of a red light vio-
lation. The officer issued a 
citation to the operator.

1730: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Shore Drive for the 
civil moving infraction of 
a marked lanes violation. 
The officer issued a cita-
tion to the operator.

1859: An officer re-
sponded to a report of 
two youths jumping off 
the Main St. Bridge. The 
officer told them to cease 
or their parents will be 
called. He also warned 
them about the strong cur-
rent.

2256: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Revere St. for the civil 
moving infraction of op-
erating without headlights 
after dark. The officer 
gave a verbal warning to 
the operator.

SUNDAY, JUNE 30
0116: An officer issued 

a parking ticket to a ve-
hicle without a resident 
parking sticker on Walde-
mar Ave.

0136: An officer issued 
four parking tickets to 
vehicles without resident 
parking stickers on Lewis 
Ave.

0438: An officer re-
sponded to a motor vehi-
cle accident on Crest Ave. 
One vehicle was towed. 
The officer filed a report.

1005: A resident called 
the station to report that 
one of his checks had been 
forged. The officer filed a 
report.

1023: An officer re-
sponded to a report of 
a parked motor vehicle 
on Veterans Rd. with a 
smashed rear window. 
The owner said that noth-
ing appeared to have been 
taken. The officer filed a 
report.

1122: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle on Perkins 
St. for the civil moving in-
fraction of speeding. The 
officer gave a verbal warn-
ing to the operator.

1125: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle at Shirley 
St. and Veterans Rd. for 
the civil moving infraction 
of a stop sign violation. 
The officer gave a verbal 
warning to the operator.

1156: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle on Shirley  
St. for the civil moving 
infraction of a stop sign 
violation. The officer gave 
a verbal warning to the op-
erator.

1224: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Governors Drive for 
the civil moving infraction 
of a stop sign violation. 
The officer issued a cita-
tion to the operator.

1244: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Washington Ave. for 
the civil moving infrac-
tion of speeding (45 in a 
25 m.p.h. zone). The offi-
cer issued a citation to the 
operator for that offense 
as well as for operating an 
unregistered motor vehi-
cle.

1252: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle on 
Washington Ave. for the 
civil moving infractions of 
a marked lanes violation 
and unsafe operation. The 

officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

1304: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Washington Ave. for 
the civil moving infraction 
of speeding. The officer 
issued a citation to the op-
erator.

1316: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
at Bates and Washington 
Aves. for a civil moving 
infraction. The officer 
gave a verbal warning to 
the operator.

1319: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Shirley St. for the civ-
il moving infraction of a 
number plate violation. 
The officer issued a ci-
tation to the operator for 
that infraction and issued 
a verbal warning for ex-
cessive window tint.

1338: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Veterans Rd. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.

1357: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Shirley St. for the civ-
il moving infraction of a 
number plate violation. 
The officer issued a cita-
tion to the operator.

1401: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Governors Dr. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer gave 
a verbal warning to the op-
erator.

1459: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Shirley St. for the civ-
il moving infraction of an 
illegal registration plate 
cover. The officer gave a 
verbal warning to the op-
erator.

2024: An officer moved 
along a group charging 
their phones on the high 
school property. 

2027: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Tafts Ave. for the civ-
il moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.

2108: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
at Fairview and Morton 
Sts. for the civil moving 
infraction of a passing vi-
olation. The officer issued 
a citation to the operator.

2236: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Pleasant St. for the 
civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer is-
sued a citation to the op-
erator.

2258: An officer 
stopped a scooter on St-
urgis St. and issued a ci-
tation to the operator for 
the criminal offenses of 
unlicensed operation of a 
motor vehicle and for op-
erating an uninsured mo-
tor vehicle. A passenger 
was cited for not wearing 
a helmet.  The scooter was 
towed.

2350: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Lincoln St. for a civ-
il moving infraction. The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

MONDAY, JULY 1
0011: An officer stopped 

a motor vehicle on Main 
St. for the civil moving 
infraction of speeding (30 
in a 25 m.p.h. zone). The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

0036: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Main St. for the civil 
moving infraction of mak-
ing an improper turn. The 
officer issued a citation to 
the operator.

0124: An officer issued 
a parking ticket to a vehi-
cle on Loring Rd.

0126: An officer issued 
10 parking tickets to ve-
hicles without resident 
parking stickers on Harbor 
View Ave.
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“This was brought up 
at our last meeting on a 
request for the removal of 
a tree at 170 Grovers Av-
enue,” said Council Pres-
ident Jim Letterie. “There 
was some information that 
was requested by the town 
council.”

Tree Warden Paul 
O’Donnell said a report 
submitted by a certified 
arborist suggests that the 
tree is in declining health 
and should be removed.

“This tree possesses 
many traits that deem it to 
be a potentially hazardous 
tree,” said O’Leary, read-
ing from the report. “Were 
this to fall, the likelihood 
of impact of a target is 
high.”

O’Leary said the report 
states that the tree could 
impact the sidewalk, the 
road and parked cars, and 
even nearby homes.

O’Leary added that 
while it would have been 
in his right as a homeown-
er to ask that a healthy tree 
be removed, he did not 
consider requesting the 
driveway until a similar 
tree in front of his house 
of the same age fell and 
revealed its rot and decay.

“Similarly, the tree 30 
feet away exhibited the 
same symptoms, and we 
saw an opportunity to re-
move that tree, plant some 
new ones, and get a drive-
way,” said O’Leary. “We 
are trying to strike a bal-
ance here between what 
we would need in a drive-
way to reduce our need to 
park on the road, to reduce 
congestion on the road for 
the benefit of the town, and 
then, in place of the tree, 

to plant four for the benefit 
of the environment.”

Tassinari said the arbor-
ist’s report did convince 
him that there is a need 
to remove the hazardous 
tree, but that he did have 
concerns about the remov-
al costs and the donations 
being included as part of 
the removal request.

“I would like to make 
a note that I don’t think 
the town should be doing 
business based on who can 
and cannot afford to buy 
their way out of an ordi-
nance in terms of making 
a donation or paying for 
the removal of a tree,” he 
said. “I believe that you 
and Mrs. O’Leary made 
that in good faith, not just 
because you want a drive-
way, but because you also 
believe in having more 
green coverage on your 
street, which is excellent.”

O’Leary said he was not 
proposing the donations 
to gain leverage with the 
town, but said he was told 
that there was a formula 
in place for replacing full-
grown trees with younger 
trees.

In a letter to the editor 
in this week’s paper, resi-
dent Diana Viens said the 
council should not have 
approved the taking of the 
tree.

She stated that the tree 
warden showed poor judg-
ment in failing to refuse to 
deny the removal request 
at the onset, then failing to 
take the advice of the Tree 
Committee to preserve the 
tree, and then advocating 
in favor of the removal at 
the Town Council level.

News Briefs //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 2
“Hurricane Preparedness 
Week,” to emphasize the 
importance of planning 
and preparing for hurri-
canes and other tropical 
systems, which most of-
ten impact Massachusetts 
during the months of Au-
gust and September.

During the week-long 
initiative, the Massachu-
setts Emergency Manage-
ment Agency (MEMA) 
will focus on hurricane 
preparedness messaging 
and offer informational re-
sources to individuals and 
municipalities on what can 
be done before, during, 
and after a tropical system 
impacts Massachusetts to 
protect life and property.

“During Hurricane Pre-
paredness Week, I urge all 
residents to take stock of 
their emergency supplies 
and to plan and prepare 
ahead of peak hurricane 
season,” said Governor 
Healey. “Near-record 
warm ocean temperatures 
are expected to fuel more 
frequent and intense trop-
ical storms, meaning there 
may be increased likeli-
hood for us in Massachu-
setts to experience a hur-
ricane.”

Atlantic Hurricane Sea-
son runs from June 1 to 
November 30 each year. 
This year, National Oce-
anic and Atmospheric 
Administration (NOAA) 
forecasters at the Climate 
Prediction Center antic-
ipate an above-normal 
2024 Atlantic Hurricane 
Season with 17 to 25 
named storms.

“While areas along 
the coast are more likely 
to sustain damage from 
hurricane hazards such 
as high winds and storm 
surge, we know from 
experience that tropical 
storms can impact areas 
across the state, both on 
the coast and inland,” said 
Lieutenant Governor Kim 
Driscoll.

“If you live or work 
within an evacuation zone, 
now is the time to plan 
where you would go and 
how you would get there 
if a tropical system were 
to impact Massachusetts,” 
said Public Safety and Se-
curity Secretary Terrence 
Reidy. “Our state and lo-
cal emergency manage-
ment agencies regularly 
plan and train to respond 
to hurricanes and other se-
vere weather hazards, and 
I encourage all residents 

and visitors in Massachu-
setts to do the same.”

In advance of peak hurri-
cane season, MEMA devel-
oped and published online 
hurricane safety tips and 
resources and distributed 
a multilingual hurricane 
preparedness toolkit to 
Emergency Management 
Directors throughout the 
Commonwealth to reach 
all individuals, including 
underserved and vulnerable 
populations. MEMA has 
also partnered with Mass-
DOT and several regional 
transit authorities to place 
hurricane preparedness 
messaging on digital bill-
boards and buses. MEMA 
continues to address hur-
ricane preparedness, re-
sponse, and recovery ef-
forts through numerous 
coordination meetings, 
trainings and exercises, in-
cluding annual training for 
local officials on Hurrevac 
– an online tool that assists 
emergency managers with 
evacuation timing, deci-
sion, and technical support.

“We were fortunate last 
September when Hurricane 
Lee tracked offshore as it 
approached Massachusetts, 
but this once again high-
lighted the need for us to 
be prepared,” said MEMA 
Director Dawn Brantley. 

“Every household should 
have an emergency kit and 
a plan inclusive of all mem-
bers’ needs and abilities.”

How residents and 
visitors can prepare: 
Know Your Evacuation 

Zone  – Visit  www.mass.
gov/knowyourzone  to 
learn if you live or work 
in a hurricane evacuation 
zone. If you live in an area 
that may flood and may 
need assistance evacu-
ating, plan with family, 
neighbors, and friends 
who may be able to as-
sist, and contact your local 
public safety officials to 
make them aware of your 
needs.

Make an Emergen-
cy Plan  – A plan should 
address how your fami-
ly would communicate, 
evacuate, and shelter in 
place if needed. Be sure to 
account for the needs of 
all your family members, 
including seniors, chil-
dren, individuals with dis-
abilities, and pets:  https://
www.mass.gov/info-de-
tails/make-a-family-emer-
gency-plan. If you receive 
medical treatment or home 
health care services, work 
with your medical provider 
to determine how to main-
tain care and service if you 

are unable to leave your 
home or have to evacuate.

Build an Emergency 
Kit  – Build an emergency 
kit that will sustain your 
household for three to five 
days without power. For 
tips on what to include, vis-
it  https://www.mass.gov/
info-details/build-an-emer-
gency-kit

Stay Informed  – Every 
family should have multi-
ple methods for receiving 
emergency alerts and is 
encouraged to reach out 
to their local officials for 
preparedness and emergen-
cy information specific to 
their community, including 
available local emergency 
notification systems. The 
Commonwealth’s 2-1-1 ho-
tline is available 24x7 for 
non-emergency assistance 
and is available with trans-
lation in more than 150 lan-
guages and can be accessed 
via video relay services. To 
learn more about additional 
ways to receive alerts and 
information, including the 
Emergency Alert System, 
Wireless Emergency Alerts, 
NOAA Weather Radio, and 
social and traditional news 
media, visit:  www.mass.
gov/info-details/be-in-
formed-and-receive-emer-
gency-alerts

Tree Removal //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

Update //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

BUYER 1	 SELLER 1	 ADDRESS	 PRICE
44 Locust Prime LLC	 Van Wart, David H	 44-46 Locust St              	 $550,000  
Green, Darren A        	 Roger Ft            	  7 Siren St              	 $888,000 
Green, Darren A      	 Rogers Ft              	 7 Siren St                     	 $888,000

Real Estate Transfers

JIM POLINO – ELIZABETH POLINO – JAMES POLINO – JONATHAN POLINO – SHARON TALLENT
ATIYEH CASSIDY – VIRGINIA BROWN – CHRISSY D’AMBROSIO – DAVID TALLENT – KATHY HICKEY – KENNY KELLEHER

HIGHLANDGROUP@COMPASS.COM | 617.846.8000
75 CREST AVE, WINTHROP, MA | 126 NEWBURY STREET, BOSTON, MA

Meet our team by 
opening your phone’s 
camera and holding it 

over the QR codeFor smooth sailing with your next move, 
call the Highland Group

Buying or selling, ask us about Compass Coming Soon and Compass Concierge

Knowledge and experience of a local agent. 
Power of the #1 brokerage in the USA!

Marino said the public 
works department was out 
cleaning up Yirrell Beach 
recently, and he thanked 
residents who have helped 
to continue the clean up 
efforts at the beach.

In addition to the town 
council meeting on July 
16, there is also the next 
meeting with RKG Con-
sultants scheduled for that 
day at the senior center to 
continue discussions on 
plans for the MBTA 3A 
Communities Act.

Last week, Marino said 
the town was looking to 
price out having Zoom ca-
pabilities put in at the se-
nior center for the meeting 
so that more people could 
take part. 

The town manager add-
ed that the meeting will be 
broadcast live on WCAT 
and taped for anyone who 
wants to watch the meet-
ing later, as well.

The town is also look-
ing to move forward with 
a survey to garner public 
input on potential sites for 
a new fire station.

At a recent council 
meeting, Marino said the 

town would be looking 
for feedback on potential 
sites including the old 
middle school, the Little 
League A field, and the 
Wadsworth Building. Last 
fall, voters defeated a pro-
posal to locate a $40 mil-
lion firehouse at the Wad-
sworth site.

In addition to the three 
sites presented to the coun-
cil in June, Marino said 
the town is finalizing some 
information on the poten-
tial of the town basketball 
courts as a firehouse site, a 
suggestion made by Coun-
cilor Pat Costigan at the 
June meeting.

“We are taking a look at 
the depth of the lot,” said 
Marino.

The standard fire station 
the town proposed has a 
depth of 90 feet, and needs 
an additional apron space 
for the apparatus of 100 
feet.

“We are looking at 190 
feet, so we want to make 
sure we can make it with 
the depth of the lot and 
how tall that retaining wall 
would be,” said Marino.

Shown above, The Vinyl Echoes 
band kicked off the Sunday Night 
Concert Series in spectacular fash-
ion. In the front row is lead guitarist 
Mark Loud. Back row, from left, are 
bass guitarist Paul Rogalski, vocalist 
Valerie Moscone, drummer John 
Barrett, vocalist Chris McGonagle, 
and rhythm guitarist Frank Tavano.

Shown left, photojournalist Mari-
anne Salza (right) with her father, 
Glenn Salza (left), her mother, 
Joanne Salza, and her friend, Mark 
Loud of the Vinyl Echoes band.

WINTHROP’S OWN VINYL ECHOES BAND ROCKS REVERE AT SUMMER CONCERT SERIES

Vinyl Echoes vocalist Chris McGonagle of Winthrop is 
pictured at the concert with his wife, Jean McGonagle 
(right), their son, J.C. McGonagle (left) and daughter, Ashley 
McGonagle.

Cary Shuman Photos

The Revere Parks and 
Recreation presented its 
first Sunday Night Concert 
of 2024 with an appear-
ance by the Vinyl Echoes 
band at the American Le-
gion Lawn.

Revere resident Valerie 
Moscone and Winthrop 

resident Chris McGonagle 
performed popular songs 
to the accompaniment of 
lead guitarist Mark Loud 
of Winthrop, bass guitarist 
Paul Rogalski of Bever-
ly, guitarist Frank Tavano 
of Revere, and drummer 
John Barrett of Revere.

Moscone and McCona-
gle combined on a tremen-

dous duet performance of 
“I’ve Had The Time of 
My Life” from the movie, 
“Dirty Dancing.”

The band drew many at-
tendees to the dance floor 
for a set that spanned from 
Roy Orbison, The Temp-
tations and Carly Simon 
to the Beatles, Fleetwood 
Mac, and Nancy Sinatra 
(“These Boots Were Made 
For Walking”).
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IN SEARCH OF 
WHS CLASS OF 
1984 MEMBERS

Dear Editor:
 We are in search of the 

Winthrop High School 
Class of 1984.  Our 40th 
Class Reunion is quickly 
approaching on August 
17, 2024 at the Winthrop 
Elks.  Please contact Da-
vid Hubbard at gdavid-
hubbard@gmail.com or 
join us on Facebook Win-
throp High School Class 
of 1984 group page if you 
are a missing classmate 
or know contact informa-
tion for any of our missing 
classmates. We hope we 
see you all there.

MISSING:
Anthony Sinnott
Brian Bouchard
Charles McCarthy
Christine Paci
Daniel Melia
David Melchionda
Ed Krovitz
Eddie Dalton
Eric Sirote
Erin Wells
Gary Pelletier
George Collins
James Martin
Jodi Seaman
Joe Disessa
John Altri
John McCollom
Katy Lockyer
Kenneth Mascis
Kevin Mascis
Kevin J Sheehan
Kim Muise
Kristen Barry
Linda Tedeschi
Lisa Altri
Lynn Ferullo
Matthew Troy
Michael Gillis
Nancy Reese
Nora Trussell
Patrick Fennell
Paul Hampton
Richard Beshere
Richard Delrossi
Richard Driver
Stephanie Mccann
Vikki Hoomis
 Thank you,

WHS Class of 1984 
Reunion Committee

LOOKING AT THE 
DEBATE

Dear Editor,
I can’t help but think 

of an old adage that my 
mother would say in Ital-
ian.  Unfortunately, I nev-
er learned Italian, but the 
translation, she said, was 
something like:  “Some-
one can do good all their 
life, but if they do one 
wrong thing, people re-
member that.”  I couldn’t 
help but think of that say-
ing after the June 27 Pres-
idential debate.  President 
Biden was not on his usu-
al game as he spent most 
of his time, necessarily, 
trying to correct Trump’s 
misinformation and out-
right lies.  that was a task 
in its own, but the Presi-
dent also had a cold.

I compare his perfor-
mance with his brilliant 
March 7th State of the 
Union address of just 3 
months ago, when he was 
direct, lucid and displayed 
his many years of expe-
rience as Senator, Vice 
President, and President.  
However, I’ve learned, 
through a few years, to 
vote for a candidate based 
on his/her record.

This past Feb. 29, 2024, 
I wrote a letter to the ed-
itor sharing the website 
www.whitehouse.gov/
therecord, which elabo-
rates the Biden-Harris re-
cord of development of 15 
million jobs (current num-
ber), 7x more than the last 
3 Republican presidents 
combined. In addition, 
47 million out of the 49 
million jobs created since 
Ronald Reagan left office 
were created by Demo-
crats.   The only thing the 
last 3 Republican presi-
dents have in common:   
recessions.

In addition, the site 
notes vast infrastructure 
efforts, the lowest unem-
ployment record in the 
history of the country, the 

lowest unemployment rate 
among Black Americans, 
and the lowering of fami-
lies everyday expenses in 
areas of health insurance, 
clean energy tax credits, 
prescription drugs for se-
niors, and $0 tax increase 
for families earning less 
that $400,000.

Biden’s fought to pre-
serve Social Security and 
lowered seniors’ health 
care expenses by capping 
out-of-pocket prescription 
drug expenses at $2,000/
year.  Medicare recipients 
will not pay more than 
$35/month for insulin 
and all Medicare recipi-
ents will receive free vac-
cines.  Biden’s trying to 
make these benefits for all 
non-Medicare recipients

In and effort to level the 
tax playing field, Biden 
also put in place a Senator 
Warren initiated 15% min-
imum tax on billion-dollar 
corporations and a 1% sur-
charge on corporate stock 
buybacks.  The Biden-Har-
ris administration also 
lowered the national defi-
cit with the single largest 
annual reduction in Ameri-
can history.

Note, most of the big 
corporation CEO’s for 
whom former President 
Trump negotiated the 12-
2017  two (2) trillion dol-
lar tax cuts used those cuts 
not for “trickle down” job 
development but for buy-
ing back their own stocks!!  
Trump has openly planned 
to give even more tax cuts 
to the big corporations and 
well connected, many of 
whom have historically 
paid $0 in taxes or cer-
tainly less than the current 
15% minimum billionaire 
tax.

I”ll vote for President 
Biden again for President 
based on his strong re-
marks of Friday, 06-28-
24:  “I may walk slower, 
talk slower, debate not as 
well…but I tell the truth, 
and I get things done!” 
There’s no way I’ll aban-
don Joe Biden because he 
has a moral compass and 
because of what he’s done 
for the American people 
over these many years and 
particularly in the past 4 
years.    I don’t need his 
opponent to dismantle all 
the good that President 
Biden and his administra-
tion have done.

​​​​​​​Donna Segreti Reilly

WITH REGARDS  
TO 3A ZONING

Dear Town Council 
Members:

Government has the 
power to define law, but 
it also has the responsi-
bility to promote and pro-
vide for the health, safety 
and welfare of its citizens, 
and to protect the well-be-
ing and tranquility of the 
community, as provided 
under the 10th amend-
ment of the Constitution.  
Furthermore, our govern-
ment has the duty: to ap-
ply the law to all citizens 
in an equal, uniform and 
non-discriminatory man-
ner; to not apply excessive 
penalties/sanctions; and to 
not infringe upon consti-
tutionally protected indi-
vidual rights.  For many 
reasons, already presented 
by Winthrop residents to 
our elected officials, it ap-
pears that the MA Zoning 
Act, ch 40A, sec 3A (i.e. 
The MBTA Communities 
Act) has seriously failed to 
meet these requirements.

The Town Council has 
the obligation to protect 
Winthrop residents from 
a law that abrogates our 
citizens’ rights and is det-

rimental to the quality of 
life in our whole commu-
nity, and most specifically 
in the proposed designated 
zones. This mandated stat-
ute deserves to be legally 
challenged before there is 
any agreement by Coun-
cil for town compliance. 
I believe that the Council 
should vote a resounding 
no on 3A, until the court 
rules on: the validity of 
this law; the legality of its 
specific mandated require-
ments; the law’s unequal 
application to selected 
town residents, living in 
designated zones; and the 
unauthorized power of 
the administrative body 
(the EOHLC, formerly 
the DHCD) to set and en-
force specific regulations, 
beyond guidelines, for 
non-compliance under 3A.  
The first of these challeng-
es is scheduled to go be-
fore a full panel of the SJC 
in October, 2024 (i.e. The 
Milton Case).  The initial 
ruling is likely to provide 
clarity on what we are 
actually voting for. Early 
voting by our Council has 
the potential of premature-
ly locking Winthrop into 
avoidable, overreaching 
state mandates.

Below are my concerns 
and questions, which I 
request that the Council 
weigh seriously, before 
voting on 3A of the Zon-
ing Act. Other residents 
have already raised oppo-
sition to 3A, including but 
not limited to: the elimi-
nation of some important 
town zoning restrictions 
and procedures that ensure 
livable conditions for res-
idents; the issue of densi-
ty and over-population; 
traffic congestion; safety 
issues; the drain on town 
resources; and higher ex-
penses due to the greater 
demand on our infrastruc-
ture and services. 

My intent here is to 
present some additional 
information and concerns 
for the Council’s consider-
ation before voting on 3A.

1.   3A’s Related Costs 
and Lack of State Funding 
for Compliance

This law includes no 
guaranteed financial com-
pensation to our town, nor 
any defined positive ben-
efits. Rather, the state ex-
pects our town to absorb 
all the additional costs, 
resulting from this law’s 
mandated compliance.  
Winthrop certainly cannot 
afford this extra financial 
burden! If the state was 
operating in good faith, 
3A’s law would have in-
cluded immediate funding 
to the identified MBTA 
communities to incen-
tivize their compliance, 
rather than threatening the 
loss of “possible future 
grant funds”. Future grant 
money is not guaranteed! 
Previously, our town re-
ceived about $2.3 million 
from a Massworks Grant. 
Although $2 million is 
helpful, it will not nearly 
offset all the increased ex-
penses to the town under 
3A with overdevelopment 
and occupancy increases.  
We should not build our 
town budget on the “hope” 
of possible future funding 
that the state is dangling 
before us for compliance. 
The rumor that the town 
could receive upwards to 
$15-$20 million in future 
grant money is completely 
ludicrous, given the com-
peting financial needs of 
all the other 350 Massa-
chusetts towns and cities, 
and our States’s own sig-
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HURRICANE BERYL: 
A HARBINGER OF THINGS 

TO COME?
By now we’ve all become aware of Hurricane Beryl, 

which left a trail of death and destruction in its wake 
during the past week stretching from the Southern Ca-
ribbean to Texas as it set records for the strongest-ever 
hurricane -- a Category 5 -- this early in the season.

Beryl grew -- and maintained -- its ferocity thanks 
to the warmest-ever sea surface temperatures for June 
in the Atlantic. Warm ocean waters are the jet fuel for 
hurricanes and in the case of Beryl, provided the key 
ingredient for Beryl’s rapid intensification and re-inten-
sification as it traveled over thousands of miles of ocean.

Hurricane forecasters in April issued a forecast for 
an extremely active hurricane season and Beryl’s re-
cord-setting run appears to be only a prelude to what 
may be in store for those of us who live along the coast 
in the coming months.

As we have noted in the past, there is no escape any-
where in the world from the effects of climate change. 
We can only hope that our little corner of the globe will 
luck out for another year and we’ll escape the wrath of 
the worst that Mother Nature can throw at us.

READY TO TURN ON,
TUNE IN, DROP OUT

As newspaper people, by necessity we’re political 
junkies, whether at the local, state, or federal levels.

When it comes to national news, we try to read as 
much as we can from reputable news sources to learn 
as much as we can about the issues and the candidates.

So it’s always been a bit of a surprise when we see 
polls indicating that public interest in the upcoming 
election is at an all-time low.

We realize that this is a result of many factors, chief 
among them that we have two candidates for president 
who are old enough to be the great-grandfathers of the 
youngest voters and that neither candidate provides in-
spiration to any of us. In addition, with their surrogates 
and spokespersons feeding us the same banal “spin” 
night after night, trying to convince us not to believe 
what we see and hear with our own eyes and ears, we all 
just want to tune out the mind-numbing noise.

We want the truth, but all we get is something far 
short from both sides.

We were listening to the Classic Rock station on our 
Sirius Radio the other day and the haunting sound of 
“For What It’s Worth” by Buffalo Springfield came on. 
The song was written in the mid-’60s, but it’s as timely 
today as it was then with lyrics perfectly capturing to-
day’s political climate:

There’s battle lines being drawn
Nobody’s right if everybody’s wrong
Singing songs and they carrying signs
Mostly say, “Hooray for our side” 
In the wake of the fiasco of the first presidential de-

bate, even we are ready to throw in the towel -- we give 
up.

Or, to put it another way, in the famous words of ad-
vice espoused by Timothy Leary (the Harvard profes-
sor-turned-guru of psychedelic drugs) at the same time 
that For What It’s Worth was playing on the airwaves, it 
just might be time to, “Turn on, tune in, drop out.”

The boarded up slide at Crest Avenue Park.

OUR CHILDREN 
AND PARKS 
DESERVE BETTER

Dear Editor,
Yet another spring has 

come and gone, and the 
boarded up slide at the 
Crest Ave. Playground 
remains boarded up. My 
oldest son will turn four 
this summer, and this slide 
has been broken since the 
very first time he visited 
the park. I can’t specify 
exactly how long it’s been 
broken, but the timeframe 
can be measured in years. 
Reasons from town lead-
ership for the delayed re-
pair have varied with the 
years, but a lack of urgen-

cy has been consistent. 
This is just one example 
of a broken item at a park 
not being replaced or fixed 
quickly. Other times it’s 
swings, or ladders, or ex-
posed sharp edges. 

To make matters more 
frustrating, offers to re-
place small items, like a 
baby swing, are generally 
rebuffed while children 
wait nearly a year for a 
replacement. At least one 
local mom is known to 
have simply hung up a 
new swing herself. Our 
children, and our parks, 
deserve better. 

Sincerely,
Chris Aiello

See LETTERS Page 5
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nificant financial woes!
In addition, some town 

officials have suggested 
that we may have just “pa-
per compliance” to 3A, 
based on overlays in some 
proposed zones, with little 
or no new development, 
although this is question-
able. It seems highly un-
likely that the state will 
reward us with huge grant 
funding for little or no new 
development. The town is 
risking far too much with 
3A compliance without 
any defined benefits stated 
in the law!

2.   3A’s Requirement 
for Designated Zones.  

The application of 3A’s 
district zone requirement 
is blatantly discriminato-
ry and unfair to residents 
in these proposed desig-
nated zones. They will be 
subjected to 3A regula-
tions and rules, different 
than those for other town 
residents, who will be 
protected by current town 
zoning laws. This unequal 
treatment under the law 
will selectively target only 
some residents, in which 
they and their properties 
will be adversely affected 
and deprive them of their 
equal rights as citizens. 
Who will be the “sacrifi-
cial lambs” in our town 
if 3A is approved by the 
Council?

Residents in the desig-
nated zones will not only 
bear the burden of overde-
velopment in their neigh-
borhoods but will also be 
negatively impacted with 
the lifting of zoning re-
strictions and procedures 
under this law. 3A prohib-
its restrictions on the num-
ber of occupants per unit 
and on the number or size 
of bedrooms allowable per 
unit.

Thus, it will be permis-
sible for existing units, 
designed for 2-4 people to 
double or triple their occu-
pancy. This is particularly 
concerning in the pro-
posed zones with existing 
buildings, which house 
many units (e.g. Fort 
Heath, Governor’s Park, 
et al). If you doubt that 
this could happen in Win-
throp, then please look 
at our surrounding com-
munities. There is direct 
evidence (and first-hand 
knowledge) which shows 

that Individual units/ 
apartments are adding 
more bedrooms, reducing 
their sizes, converting liv-
ing & dining rooms into 
bedrooms, and eliminat-
ing most common space. 
Individual bedrooms are 
being rented to unrelat-
ed occupants, resulting 
in 7-8 individuals crowd-
ed into units/ apartment 
designed for 2-4, who 
share one bathroom and a 
small kitchen, with rents 
per room about $1200 
- $1400/mo. Under 3A, 
without occupancy restric-
tions in zoning districts, 
it would it be permissible 
for owners of apartment 
buildings (e.g. Fort Heath 
Apartments) to increase 
their occupancy rate. It 
may also be allowable to 
construct an extension or 
additional building on the 
premises currently used 
for parking. The negative 
consequences to neigh-
borhoods in the proposed 
designated zones appear 
obvious. Do we want 
Winthrop to mirror other 
surrounding communi-
ties and be forced to deal 
with potential problems to 
health and safety, related 
to over crowdedness?

Council members, I 
urge you to vote NO on 
3A. It will divide our 
neighborhoods into zones, 
which will unlawfully 
discriminate against se-
lected citizens, will allow 
for unequal application of 
3A, and will deprive these 
residents of equal rights 
and zoning protections 
now offered to other town 
residents. Pitting residents 
against each other is very 
bad for our community.

3.   Proposed Desig-
nated Zones that include 
Condominiums.

There are proposed 
zones with large condo-
minium complexes (e.g. 
Seal Harbor 1 & 3, and 
Governor’s Park), and 
other proposed zones with 
smaller condominium 
buildings. These owners 
and their units have been 
regulated and protected 
by their condo documents 
since their existence. It 
is my understanding that 
the 3A Zoning Act and its 
requirements WILL SU-
PERSEDE the existing 
condominium documents, 

their rules and regulations. 
The language of 3A seems 
clear, so condos within 
designated zones are NOT 
EXEMPT from 3A and 
its requirements.  If your 
understanding is different 
than mine, then please ob-
tain in writing a clear legal 
statement from the State 
and/or Secretary Augustus 
(EOHLC), stating to the 
effect that:  When 3A is 
put on a condo building or 
over land zoned for con-
dos, then the condo rules 
apply, not 3A. Securing 
this legal statement from 
the State is essential, so 
that there is no misinfor-
mation or speculation re-
garding the legal impact 
on condo owners residing 
in the proposed designated 
zones under 3A.

 
4.  Consequences to the 

Submittal of Plans for 3A 
Compliance

There are only two fully 
state-approved 3A plans, 
while the rest remain in 
the queue, after having 
signed on the dotted line. 
Submitting ANY com-
pliance plan has the ef-
fect of “Agreeing” to the 
terms of the state’s man-
date. Thereafter, the state 
can adjust, expand upon, 
redline, and tweak the 
town’s initial proposal. A 
premature Yes vote by the 
Council significantly hurts 
the People of Winthrop by 
agreeing to an ambiguous 
law that expressly requires 
continuous compliance to 
all changed requirements.

Isn’t it far better for the 
Council to vote NO now 
and maintain control and 
self-determination over 
our zoning, rather than re-
linquishing this control to 
the state? Once the state 
gains a foothold in our 
town, we will have no con-
trol over future changes to 
state regulations within 
our designated zones.

5.  State Mandates and 
3A Zoning.

It has been suggest-
ed that 3A Zoning is 
no different than other 
State-mandated require-
ments, such as a flood zone 
overlay. This is entirely 
false, which is why Justice 
Georges refused to grant 
Attorney General Andrea 
Cambell’s request to fast-
track the Milton case. 

The Justice noted that the 
State’s zoning mandate 
involved novel questions 
of law which required a 
hearing before a full panel 
of judges, and input from 
experts via Amicus Briefs, 
to understand, and make 
a determination on a case 
that will have widespread 
implications across the 
Commonwealth.  

3A of the Zoning Act is 
the first time, since home 
rule was passed, that the 
state has ever mandated 
local zoning, which in-
volves local implementa-
tion (not preemption, like 
40B). 3A requires ongoing 
compliance with the EO-
HLC’s ongoing require-
ments within our locally 
implemented 3A Zones. 
Any changes that the town 
deems necessary for our 
residents require special 
approval by the EOHLC, 
so as not to decrease the 
anticipated unit compaci-
ty within these zones. Our 
land is no longer our own.  
This is unprecedented.

6.  Winthrop defined as 
an MBTA Community

The assumption is that 
more development and 
higher occupancy rates in 
town will result in great-
er use of the MBTA. Is 
there any available evi-
dence that more residents 
will rely on the unreliable 
MBTA and relinquish their 
cars? Public transportation 
is not so easily accessible 
in Winthrop, with no train 
station or a bus route to 
Beachmont station, only 
to Orient Heights station. 
It seems unreasonable that 
Winthrop should bear the 
burden of 3A, based on 
precarious assumptions, 
while neighboring East 
Boston with five train sta-
tions and bus lines is ex-
empt.

7. The Executive Office 
of Housing and Livable 
Communities (EOHLC), 
formerly the Dept of 
Housing and Community 
Development (DHCD) - 
Lack of Legal Authority 
and Power under 3A of the 
Zoning Act. 

According to a Memo-
randum by Alexander Wh-
iteside (3/23, see attach-
ment), the requirements 
set forth by DHCD/ now 
EOHLC are not support-
ed by the 3A law. Thus, 

this administrative body 
is exercising power and 
authority not legally given 
to it by the state, nor stated 
in the language of the 3A 
statute. Whiteside states 
that it “…seeks to impose 
numerous substantive le-
gal requirements and re-
strictions so as to greatly 
expand the scope of the 
municipal zoning obliga-
tions required by Subsec-
tion (a) and to impose a lit-
any of specific steps which 
MBTA communities must 
take to meet their newly 
defined obligations” (p. 
12). According to Wh-
iteside: “With respect to 
Section 3A, this body has 
not been given regulatory 
power by the Legislature 
and has no authority to is-
sue regulations” (p. 8).  

Based on precedent in 
previous court cases, Wh-
iteside states that these 
cases “support a con-
clusion that this body’s 
Compliance Guidelines 
for Muti-family Zoning 
Districts under Section 3A 
of the Zoning Act cannot 
be legally enforced”. He 
states that this agency does 
not have the legal authori-
ty “… to impose the sub-
stantive requirements and 
directives contained in the 
Guidelines” (p. 11). “The 
conclusion is inescapable 
that the Guidelines are le-
gally ineffective and unen-
forceable” (p.12).

Based on this informa-
tion, therefore, it seems 
reasonable and responsi-
ble for the Council to vote 
NO on 3A.

8.  Town Council Vote.
It has been suggested 

that the Council vote Yes 
now, and that they can 
always change it to a No 
later. If this change in po-
sition was attempted, it 
would involve stopping 
projects in mid-develop-
ment and filing a lawsuit 

against the state! This 
“strategy” does not seem 
feasible or wise!  Chang-
ing a Yes to a No vote to 
stop on-going develop-
ment would likely have 
major legal issues and 
ramifications for the town; 
completed projects would 
not be reversible, and zon-
ing changes if already ap-
plied to existing dwellings 
(e.g. no occupancy limit) 
could not be undone. Also, 
how would the town pos-
sibly fund a sole lawsuit 
against the state?

A better strategy is to 
vote NO on 3A now and 
unite with other opposing 
communities, who are le-
gally challenging the 3A 
law on many issues. There 
is safety in numbers and 
certainly less costly to join 
other opponents, than for 
Winthrop to go it alone!

 
9.  Action by the Town 

Council.
For all the reasons pre-

sented in this letter, and 
in conjunction with previ-
ously expressed concerns 
by others, it seems that 
the most responsible and 
reasonable action by the 
Council is to vote NO on 
3A of the Zoning Act. This 
NO vote will protect our 
community and its best 
interests, so Winthrop res-
idents will not be unduly 
burdened by the irrevers-
ible consequences of this 
legislation.

N.B. As requested in 
#3, I look forward to re-
ceiving your written legal 
response, regarding the 
application of 3A’s re-
quirements to condomini-
ums within the proposed 
zones, and whether 3A 
requirements “supersede” 
condominium documents?

Council Members, 
thank you for your time 
and consideration of this 
letter.

Carol A. Facella, 

First Priority Credit Union’s Vice President and Lending Manager, Steve Borgerson (third 
from the left) is seen here presenting First Time Home Buyer Safi S. (second from the left) 
with a check for $30,806 which was used for down payment and closing cost assistance for 
the purchase of his new condo in Winthrop. First Priority Credit Union was able to secure 
the down payment assistance grant through the Credit Union’s Partnership with the 
Federal Home Loan Bank of Boston. The FHLBB’s  Equity Builder Program provides grant 
funds to assist qualified First Time Home Buyers with the purchase of a primary residence. 
Safi was the second credit union member that they able to secure grant funds for. Said 
Mr. Borgerson “with affordable housing being such a challenge for the average person 
the credit union was happy to participate in the Equity Builder Program and make home 
ownership possible for two of our members”.  Also seen in the picture is Brian Spehar, Sr. 
Underwriter at FPCU (first from the left)  and attorney Joseph Cattoggio (forth from the 
left), who facilitated the sale of the property.

FIRST PRIORITY CREDIT UNION MAKING 
HOME-OWNERSHIP DREAMS A REALITY

more than two decades.
“We’ve given up one 

guy who bleeds Winthrop 
blue for another guy who 
bleeds Winthrop blue,” 
said Goodwin, referring to 

former Chief Delehanty. 
“In my career, I’ve never 
seen anybody more com-
mitted and more dedicat-
ed. We’re going to take 
a great department and 

make it greater.”
Town Clerk Denise 

Quist swore in Rogers as 
the new deputy chief, and 
he was pinned by his wife 
Kim.

Council president addresses meeting decorum
By Adam Swift

Following a spirited 
exchange during the pub-
lic comment period at the 
end of the June 18 town 
council meeting, Council 
President Jim Letterie pro-
vided a brief refresher on 
council rules on decorum 
at last week’s meeting.

At the June 18 meet-
ing, Precinct 5 Councilor 
Joseph Aiello and Jack 
Dowd, a resident who of-
ten provides input during 
the regular public input 
sessions, got into a back 
and forth over a recent 
DCR meeting Aiello at-
tended. Letterie gaveled 
for order during the ex-
change that continued past 
the speaking time limit, 
and asked Dowd to leave 
the meeting if he couldn’t 
control himself.

At last week’s meet-
ing, Aiello apologized to 
Dowd and for his behav-
ior. Dowd declined to ac-
cept the apology.

“The last meeting, we 
had a number of conten-
tious issues, and I have to 
make a public apology to 
Jack Dowd,” said Aiello. 
“I want to make clear that 
I violated my own value 
system. It doesn’t mat-
ter what a member of the 
public says to me, or how 

you say it; my responsibil-
ity is to serve the public, to 
listen, to absorb, to make 
judgments when asked to 
vote, and nothing.

“I violated that; I vio-
lated that with Mr. Dowd, 
and I really am sorry that I 
did that,” Aiello continued. 
“While I’m not forgiven, it 
is important for the public 
to understand I crossed a 
line I should never cross 
personally, and I am very 
sorry for that.”

During last week’s pub-
lic comment period, Dowd 
said he was frustrated that 
he believes Aiello often 
seeks to clarify his com-
ments or imply that his 
ideas are nonsense.

If a councilor has a dis-
agreement with something 
he says, Dowd said they 
should put that issue on a 
future meeting’s agenda, 
and not rebut him during 
the public comment peri-
od.

Prior to Aiello’s apolo-
gy, Letterie read from the 
council rules a number of 
relevant sections that ap-
ply to decorum and behav-
ior from both the council 
members and the public.

The rules state, among 
other things, that dis-
course at council meetings 
shall be marked by courte-
sy and respect, even in the 

face of disagreement, and 
that discussion should be 
centered on the issues at 
hand.

“Members of the town 
council shall conduct 
themselves in an orderly 
manner to ensure that the 
business of the town is at-
tended to as expeditiously 
and as deliberate as the 
process allows,” Letterie 
added. “Councilors shall 
address requests to speak 
through the council pres-
ident and shall not speak 
until recognized; discus-
sion shall be limited to 
to topic before the coun-
cil, and extraneous issues 
shall have no place in the 
debate.”

During the public 
speaking sections of the 
meeting, Letterie said the 
council rules stipulate that 
comments from the public 
shall not invoke personal-
ities, but shall be limited 
to the business of govern-
ment issues in the town of 
Winthrop.

“People addressing the 
council shall do so in an 
orderly manner, and shall 
not make repetitious, 
slanderous, or irrelevant 
comments, nor shall they 
engage in disorderly con-
duct,” stated Letterie.

WINTHROP CENTER 
COMMERCIAL SPACE

HIGHLY VISIBLE CORNER LOT
Contact Francine @617-285-6418
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We have changed our name.  
Our commitment to community-based care is the same.

Learn more at neighborhealth.com

Same neighbors.
New name.

CELEBRATING INDEPENDENCE DAY WITH THE 142ND ANNUAL HORRIBLES PARADE

  

It's that time of year! 
  

Photos should be at a beach or swimming pool setting.
Please include your child's name and the paper you wish 

to be published in.

SEND YOUR BEACH BABY TO: promo@reverejournal.com by  
Thursday, August 15th

Photos will be published in our Aug. 21and 22 issues of 
The Revere Journal, Winthrop Sun Transcript, Lynn Journal, 
The Everett Independent, Chelsea Record & East Boston Times.

Not responsible for lost or unpublished Photos.

BeachBeach
Baby Baby PaPaggeses
23rd

Annual

Share your favorite Beach Babe! 
Adults, Children, Pets, All are welcome!

Photos by Marianne Salza

Winthrop residents 
donned patriot, comical, 
and creative costumes 
during the 142nd Point 
Shirley Horribles Parade 
on July 4 in celebration of 
Independence Day. Fami-
lies tossed candy to spec-
tators from a disco float, 
drifted past Yirrell Beach 
in hot air balloons, and 
toted chickens in a wagon 
on route to festivities in 
Coughlin Park.

The “Winthrop Yard Sale” group costume makes their way down the street.

“Patriots” Maddie Callah, Mattea Puopolo, Elaina D’Ambrosio, Jordana Puopolo, Mila Cal-
lah, and Nolie Clark.

Little ones excitedly watching a fire truck drive by.

Patriot participants waving to spectators along Shirley Street.

The Scramko, Poto, and Murphy PIzzicannella Families donning their costumes, “Tootie 
Fruity.”
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CELEBRATING INDEPENDENCE DAY WITH THE 142ND ANNUAL HORRIBLES PARADE

sized to scale

2column-by-
4-inch ad 

minimum buy
3.37”-x-4”

BUY ONE, 
GET ONE 
OFF

BUY ONE, 
GET ONE 
OFF½

July July 
SpecialSpecial

Cross-Community  
Advertising available

BUY 1 WEEK OF ADVERTISING IN JULY GET 1 WEEK ½OFF

4-WEEK MONTH 
LONG 2X4-RUN

deb@reverejournal.com
mdibella@winthroptranscript.com
charlestownads@hotmail.com

deb@reverejournal.com
mdibella@winthroptranscript.com
charlestownads@hotmail.com

All ads must run in July to receive 
promotional pricing.

781-485-0588 

$100/WK

OR EMAIL US ATOR EMAIL US AT

Children riding in the bed of a disco-themed truck tossing candy to spectators.

Tommy, Danielle, and Lilah Logan with Pesto.

Mary Beth Pickard, Poppy Guerena, 3, and Tim Guerena, 
dressed as “Baby Shark Family.”

Peter Gill with grand marshal Deborah Hurley O’Toole, Em-
my-award winning senior producer of Phantom Gourmet, 
and her daughter, Tessa O’Toole.

Leo Garfinkel, 7, dressed as a truck hitting Storrow Drive, 
with his mother, Laura Crimaldi, in their costume “Winthrop 
Gets Storrowed.”

Grand marshal, Deborah Hurley O’Toole, and her daughter, 
Tessa, tossing necklaces to the crowd.

Tina and Eddie Montone, with their sons, Andrew, 5, and 
Edward, 2, driving in the “Dumb and Dumber”-inspired 
Mutt Cutts car.

Claire, 5, and Lisa DuBois.The Ross and Nucci Families enjoying the festivities.
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SportsSports

35 REVERE ST., WINTHROP • (617) 846-6880
WWW.WINTHROPMKTPLACE.COM

New Store Hours starting June 22: Mon-Sat 7:30 am-8pm;  
Sun: 7:30am-7pm

 Not responsible for typographical errors. 
 We have the right to limit quantities.

Grocery
Great grocery specials

Deli

Your Independent Grocer, Where Old Friends Meet And New Ones Are Made
SALE DAYS THURSDAY, JULY 11TH THROUGH WEDNESDAY JULY 17TH 2024

Krakus Imported Polish Ham .........................$6.99/lb
Carando Mortadella .......................................$6.99/lb
Margherita Hot Cappicola .............................$6.99/lb
Corner Shop Provolone Cheese ..................... $3.99/lb

Weekend Specials
Friday, July 12th through Sunday, July 14th

"while supplies last"

Produce
California Sweet & Juicy Black Plums ........$2.59/lb
California Sweet & Juicy Red Plums ...........$2.59/lb
Fresh & Sweet Plump Blueberries 
full pint pkg ............................................ 2/$5.00 limit 6
Fresh Southern Butter & Sugar Sweet Corn ... 6/$2.99
Fresh Hot House Slicing Tomatoes .............$1.59/lb
Natures Finest All Purpose 
White Potatoes  5 lb bag ....................................$3.99

BAKERY

Our Own Chocolate Chip Brownies 4pk ............$3.99
Our Own Hamburger & Hot Dog Rolls .......... 2/$7.00

DELI

Our Own In Store Cooked Chickens ......$6.99 + meal tax

PRODUCE

Fresh & Crisp Large Iceberg Lettuce .... 2/$3.00 limit 4

MEAT

Grade A Boneless Chicken Breast .................. $2.99/lb

GROCERY

Hood Ice Cream ................................................2/$6.00

Meat
"Meat Cut Fresh Every Day"

London Broil Steaks ......................................$5.99/lb
Blade Steaks ..................................................$5.99/lb
Grade A Chicken Wings .................................$3.99/lb
Boneless Chicken Thighs .............................. $3.29/lb
Bob Evans Mashed Cauliflower ................... 2/$6.00
Resers Twice Baked Potatoes ......................... $4.99

Fage Yogurt ................................................ 10/$10.00
Kraft Barbecue Sauce ................................... 2/$3.00
Tide Simply Laundry Detergent & Pods .......2/$7.00
Starkist Solid White Canned Tuna .............. 3/$4.00
Skippy Peanut Butter .................................... 2/$5.00
Barilla Pasta ....................................................4/$5.00

(ex: gluten free-protein-tortellini-pasta ready)
Classico Pasta Sauce ....................................2/$6.00
Dole Fruit Bowls ............................................. 2/$5.00
Kellogg's Special K Cereal .............................2/$8.00

(Family-Size Only)
Folgers Canned Coffee ........................................$3.99

(ex: decaf)
Smuckers Uncrustables ...............................2/$6.00
Best Yet French Fries ...................................2/$6.00
Plant Oat Milk  52 oz .................................... 2/$5.00
Simply Lemonade  52 oz ............................... 2/$5.00

Bakery
Assorted Scones  3 pk ....................................... $4.49
Cinnamon Rolls  6 pk ............................................$4.99
8" Apple Crumb Pie .............................................. $5.99

Winthrop LL 12-year-old falls in Final Four of District 16 Tournament

DON’T WAIT! RESERVE YOUR SPACE NOW AND GET YOUR 
AD IN THE EYES OF THOUSANDS. CALL 781-485-0588

RESERVE YOUR SPACE NOW!

By Cary Shuman

The Winthrop Little 
League 12-year-old Wil-
liamsport team showed its 
resilience with a dramatic 
9-8 victory over East Lynn 
Sunday, but the postsea-
son journey ended the next 
night in a loss to Lynnfield 
in the Final Four of the 
District 16 Tournament.

The three games in three 
nights journey for Man-
ager Mike Triant’s con-
tingent had begun with a 
tough 5-4 loss to Peabody 

West Saturday at MacAr-
thur Park in Peabody.

Bryce O’Brien kept 
Winthrop in contention 
with an outstanding relief 
pitching performance, tak-
ing the mound in the sec-
ond inning.

Winthrop took the lead, 
4-3, in the fourth, but Pea-
body scored runs in the 
top of the fifth and top of 
the sixth to eke out the vic-
tory.

Winthrop started the 
game with three straight 
basehits as Ryan McK-

The Winthrop Little League Williamsport 12-year-old All-Star team is pictured before its game against Peabody West in 
the District 16 Tournament. Front row, from left, are Declan Cassidy, Ryan McKenzie, Brandon Vaughan, Wyatt Hanlon, 
Jace Eruzione, and Gavin Sorrentino. Back row, from left, are Coach Mike Triant, Rich Vivolo, Chase Triant, Tyler Smith, 
Bryce O’Brien, Matthew Vasel, Coach Greg Cassidy, Camden Lounsbury, and Coach Geoff Lounsbury.

Chelsea Fast Pitch Softball League legendary catcher George Triant (third row, second from left) is pictured with the many 
Winthrop Little League supporters who traveled to Peabody Saturday night to root on the local contingent. Mr. Triant 
is the father of Winthrop coach Mike Triant and the grandfather of 12-year-old baseball and basketball standout Chase 
Triant.

enzie, Chase Triant, and 
Brendan O’Brien loaded 
the bases. Winthrop scored 
two runs on two walks.

Winthrop made some 
outstanding defensive 
plays in the game, with 
outfielders Chase Triant 
and Matthew Vasel throw-
ing out runners at home 
plate and third base re-
spectively.

Cam Lounsbury, Ryan 
McKenzie, and Jace Eruz-
ione each had two hits in 
the game versus Peabody.

Chase Triant pitched 5 
2/3 innings, striking out 
12 batters in a 9-8 victory 
over East Lynn Sunday in 
Swampscott.

East Lynn tied the game 
at 6-6 before Ryan McK-
enzie led off with a single 
to ignite a three-run surge.

East Lynn rallied for 
two runs in the bottom of 
the seventh before McK-
enzie nailed down the win 
by getting the final EL hit-
ter on a popup to shortstop 
Chase Triant.

Winthrop ran out of 
steam in a loss to Lynn-
field Monday night in the 
double-elimination tour-
nament. Bryce O’Brien, a 
mainstay throughout the 
tournament, provided an 
offensive highlight with a 
solo home run.

Triant said his team 
showed a lot of heart by its 
response to the tough, one-
run loss to Peabody West 
and he will treasure the 
memories of Winthrop’s 
strong and spirited run in 
the 11-team tournament.

“I’m so proud of every 
one of the kids that were 
on this team and the guys 
who coached with me,” 
said Triant. “It was an 
amazing experience for all 
of us, and I hope that it’s 
something that Winthrop 
Little League and baseball 
in the town can build off 
of. I know that it’s some-
thing that all of these kids 
will be better athletes and 
young men from it.”

Winthrop Little League 12-year-old All-Star Jace Eruzione 
joins a pre-game photo with members of his family, uncle 
Danny Eruzione (far left) and Danny’s girlfriend, Maggie 
Krawczyk (far right), and his grandparents, College of the 
Holy Cross three-sport standout Vinnie Eruzione and Anne 
Eruzione.

Turning out to support the Winthrop Little League 12-year-
old team in Peabody were Joseph Ferrara, his three sons, 
Franco Ferrara, Joey Ferrara, and Tommaso Ferrara, and 
Cormac Mahoney.
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WINTHROP PUBLIC LIBRARY CELEBRATES 125TH ANNIVERSARY
Photos & Story by Marianne Salza

Winthrop Public Li-
brary & Museum celebrat-
ed its 125th anniversary on 
June 27 with a celebration 
sponsored by The Win-
throp Foundation, Win-

throp Charities, The Meat 
Market, Winthrop Market-
place, Balloon City, local 
coffee roasters, Allison 
and Devin Macon, and a 
generous, anonymous do-
ner.

“A library is a growing 

organism. While we are 
celebrating the anniversa-
ry of this library, it is not 
the same library as it was 
125 years ago,” said Di-
rector Greg McClay. “The 
library has grown physi-
cally. It’s doubled in size 
– and not just because of 
books – for meeting spac-
es, art exhibits, and pro-
gramming.”

The library’s collection 
started with 4,000 books; 
and now shelves 70,000 
books, and is part of a 
consortium of over two 
million books.

“There is constant 
growth and change. New 
ideas and innovations 
come with that,” said Mc-
Clay, the 13th library di-
rector.

By the end of 2024, the 
library will be installing a 
handicap ramp in the chil-
dren’s department; and 
anticipate enhancing the 
back parking lot entrance 
to be handicap accessible 
within the next few years. 
McClay mentioned that 
the library plans on adding 
more study spaces and is 
looking into developing a 
makerspace.

“Our online presence 
is bigger than ever; but in 
the next 20 years, it’s go-
ing to be unimaginable,” 
said McClay, who re-
ceived certificates of con-
gratulations from the State 
Senate and Winthrop Im-

provement & Historical 
Association. “The health 
of the library depends on 
the community.”  

Guests enjoyed musi-
cal entertainment by the 
Squeezebox Stompers and 
refreshments, including 11 

different cakes inspired by 
desserts from throughout 
the decades.

The Squeezebox Stompers provided musical entertainment during the Winthrop Public 
Library’s 125th Anniversary on June 27.

Winthrop Public Library staff members: Frank Ferrara, Dom DeMasi, Tammy Cody, Mary 
Lou Osborne, Diane Stangle, and Greg McClay.

Joe Heafitz, Mary Lou Osborne, Eric Reidister, Legislative 
Aid to Senator Lydia Edwards, who presented Director 
Greg McClay with a certificate of recognition.

Librarian, Mary Lou Osborne, Stephen Ruggiero, Councilor 
Pat Costigan, and Council President Jim Letterie.

Stephanie Honan and Christine Reilly, of 
the Winthrop Improvement & Historical 
Association.

Gillian Teixeira, chair of the library’s board 
of trustees, who presented McClay with a 
plaque in honor of past directors.

Amy and Madeline Carroll serving cakes 
from throughout the decades.

Councilor Hanna Belcher and Councilor 
Suzanne Swope.

Joanne Hillman, Jeanne Murray, Liz Regan, and Nancy Tufo.

Vicki Mucci, Rosemarie and Peter Ottaviano, and Bob 
DeLeo.

Luca Analetto, Simon Pelletier, and Mike Eruzione.

Community members gathering at Winthrop Public Library for its 125th anniversary celebration on June 27.

Michael Herbert, president of the Winthrop Improvement 
& Historical Association, presented the Winthrop Public 
Library with a plaque for 135 years of dedicated service to 
the community, with Greg McClay and Mary Lou Osborne.

Alex Bianchino and her mother, Jeanni Carroll.

Elizabeth, Joan, and Ron Spinney.
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A full list of the activities, 
programs, trips, and ser-
vices offered at the Senior 
Center can be found in the 
newsletter, which is avail-
able at the Senior Center 
and on our website.

 
Monday, July 15

9:00am-3:00pm: Com-
puter Usage

1 0 : 0 0 a m - 11 : 0 0 a m : 
Yoga with Trish ($5)

1 0 : 0 0 a m - 11 : 3 0 a m : 
Rep. Turco Office Hours

11:00am: Grab & Go 
Lunch Pick-Up

1 1 : 3 0 a m - 2 : 3 0 p m : 
Game Day/Mahjong

 
Tuesday, July 16

9:00am-3:00pm: Com-
puter Usage

11 : 0 0 a m - 1 2 : 0 0 a m : 
Blood Pressures

11:00am: Grab & Go 
Lunch Pick-Up

1 2 : 0 0 p m - 1 : 0 0 p m : 
MVES Summer BBQ

12:30pm-2:30pm: Art 
Class with Dawn ($5)

 
Wednesday, July 17 
9:00am-3:00pm: Com-

puter Usage
9:30am-10:30am: Yoga 

with Trish ($5)
10:00am-12:00pm: Be-

reavement & Caregiver 
Support Group

10 :00am-12 :00pm: 
Charlie Card Workshop

10 :00am-12 :00pm: 
Low Vision Support 
Group

1 0 : 3 0 a m - 11 : 3 0 a m : 
Zumba with Cindy ($5)

11:00am: Grab & Go 
Lunch Pick-Up

11:30am-12:30pm: Tai 
Chi / Qi Gong ($5)

 
Thursday, July 18

9:00am-3:00pm: Com-
puter Usage

9:30am-10:30am: Exer-
cise Class: ($1)

10:00am-11:30am: Cof-
fee & Conversation

12 :00pm-12 :30pm: 

Dine -In/Grab and Go 
Lunch Pick Up

12:45om-3:00pm: Bin-
go

 
Friday, July 19 

9 : 0 0 a m - 1 2 : 0 0 p m : 
Computer Usage

10:00am-11:00am: Line 
Dancing

11:00am: Grab & Go 
Lunch Pick-Up

11:30am-12:30pm: Cre-
ative Writing Workshop

 Senior Lunch Pro-
gram: The Senior Center 
offers in-person dining 
on Thursdays from 12-
12:30pm. Grab and Go 
Lunches are also available 
for pick up Monday – Fri-
day between 11am and 
1pm. To reserve a lunch, 
please stop by the front 
desk or call the Senior 
Center at 617-846-8538 
by 11am the day before 
(for Monday lunch, reser-
vations must be made by 
11am on Friday). Menus 
are available on our web-
site and at the Senior Cen-
ter.  Please note, lunches 
cannot be held overnight; 
they must be picked up on 
the day that they were re-
quested for.

 
Senior Van. The Senior 

Van runs Monday - Thurs-
day from 8:45am-3pm. 
Reservations are on a first 
come, first served basis, 
and can be made by call-
ing the Senior Center at 
least two weekdays prior 
to the desired date.  Rides 
to medical appointments 
will be prioritized. A list 
of destinations and pricing 
is available on our website 
and in our newsletter.

 Winthrop Senior 
Center News

35 Harvard Street, Winthrop, MA 02152    
Hours: Mon-Thurs: 8:30am-3:30p.m. / Friday: 8:30am-1p.m.

Website: www.town.winthrop.ma.us   
Email: COAReception@town.winthrop.ma.us 

   Phone: 617-846-8538

TORF FUNERAL
SERVICE

Pre-need planning with our 
price protection guarantee. 

Arrangements made at our  
facility or in the comfort of  

your own home
4 generations of  the Torf  Tradition:

Deborah Torf  Golden
Amy Torf  Golden

Hyman J. Torf  (1903-2000)
M.L. Torf  (1867-1940)

(617) 889-2900
(800)428-7161

www.torffuneralservice.com

©
 a

d
fin

ity

All types of services
for all types of people.

Some people prefer traditional funeral 
services. Others prefer cremation. 

Some want an elaborate ceremony. 
Then there are others who don’t 
want any ceremony at all. When 
it comes to funerals, there are 
as many options as there are 

people. And we take pride in 
being able to say we offer them all.

(617) 846-8700
www.CaggianoFuneralHome.com. 

www.CremationsbyCaggianoFH.com

Caggiano
FUNERAL HOME

147 Winthrop Street • Winthrop, Massachusetts 02152
Telephone: 617-846-8700 Fax: 617-846-8701

www.caggianofuneralhome.com

OBITUARIES
Michael Vito Lombardo

Co-founder and CEO of GlideFast 
Consulting, an Elite ServiceNow Partner

 Michael Vito Lombar-
do, 37, of Topsfield, sadly 
passed away on Saturday, 
July 6, 2024, after a cou-
rageous battle with cancer. 
He faced the disease with 
incredible strength, cour-
age, and dignity. 

Michael was born on 
January 31, 1987, in Mal-
den to Lorraine and Jason 
Lombardo.  He was raised 
in Everett.  More of a stu-
dent of life than the class-
room, Michael received 
his GED and subsequent-
ly completed the YearUp 
program.  After YearUp, 
Mike began his career as a 
help desk analyst and rose 
to become a system ad-
ministrator at a large hos-
pital in Boston where he 
successfully led their im-
plementation of ServiceN-
ow.  This pivotal moment 
ignited Mike’s love for 
ServiceNow.  He eager-
ly consumed and learned 
everything he could about 
the platform, shaping his 
vision for the future. Mi-
chael went on to become 
the co-founder and CEO 
of GlideFast Consulting, 
an Elite ServiceNow Part-
ner. Under his leadership, 
the organization grew into 
an international company 
with over 600 employ-
ees. Michael deeply cared 
about each person that 
works for GlideFast and 
their families, feeling a 
profound responsibility to 
help them become the best 
versions of themselves. 
He was dedicated to their 
success, always striving to 
support their growth, hap-
piness, and well-being.

His immense career 
successes were surpassed 
only by the beautiful fam-
ily he and his wife, Jessica 
created together.  Michael 
and Jessica grew up on 
the same street and were 
friends since their pre-teen 
years.  Their friendship 
eventually grew to true 
love, one that was built 
on trust, support, and lots 
of laughter.  Michael and 
Jessica have two incred-
ible children together, 
Sophia (11) and Olivia 
(7).  Both of Michael’s 
daughters have inherited 
Michael’s infectious smile 
that brightens every room 

they walk into, an unwav-
ering love for their family, 
and a silly disposition that 
allows them to find humor 
and joy in any situation.

In addition to his career 
and family, Mike was a 
dedicated philanthropist. 
He served on the board 
of the Joe Andruzzi Foun-
dation, which aids can-
cer patients and families 
who are facing financial 
insecurity.  Michael was 
also a staunch support-
er of YearUp, a nonprofit 
organization devoted to 
providing professional de-
velopment opportunities 
to young adults.  Addition-
ally, Michael answered the 
call to anyone who need-
ed support, assistance, or 
help- it truly brought him 
joy to give to others.  

Michael is survived by 
the love of his life and 
wife, Jessica; his loving 
children, Sophia and Ol-
ivia; his proud mother 
and father, Lorraine and 
Jason Lombardo; his late 
step-dad, Neil Shapiro; 
his mother-in-law, Luann 
Butera; his father-in-law, 
Big Artie Gadman; his 
grandmother Grace Silva; 
Jess’ grandparents, Tom 
and Barbara Butera; his 
sister, Andrena Lombar-
do Silva and her husband, 
Kenny Silva; his broth-
er-in-law and best friend, 
Artie Gadman; his God-
mother, Maryann Manis-
calco and her partner, Greg 
Buccini; his aunts and un-
cles: Joe and Claire Silva, 
Dennis and Dawn Silva; 
his cousins, Gina Man-
iscalco, DJ Silva, Doug 
Silva, Eric Silva and the 
late Joey Silva; his many 
nieces and nephews, Ju-
lia Silva, Francesca Silva, 
Lily Gadman, John Silva, 
and Arthur Gadman, and 
countless friends.  

Visitation for Michael 
will be held on Friday, July 
12 from 4 to 8 p.m. at Paul 
Buonfiglio & Sons Fu-
neral Home, 128 Revere 
Street, Revere.  A Funeral 
Mass will be celebrated in 
St. Anthony’s Parish, 250 
Revere Street, Revere, 
Saturday, July 13 at 11 
a.m. Interment to follow at 
Woodlawn Cemetery, 302 
Elm Street, Everett

In lieu of flowers, please 
consider donating to Lom-
bardo Legacy Fund- Joe 
Andruzzi Foundation

Jimmy passed away after a 
brief illness in Crystal Beach, 
Florida where he resided for 
the last 10 years. His heart 

always remained in Boston. 
He loved to reminisce about his 
life growing up in Beachmont 

and raising a family in  
Winthrop. He will be missed 

by his family and friends.

A Celebration of Life will be 
held this Friday, July 12, 

2024 from 11:30 to 1:30 at the 
Beachmont Yacht Club,
168 Pearl Ave, Revere.

Interment following at 
Woodlawn Cemetery, Everett.

James R.  
McGilvery

Mar. 2, 1942- Apr. 18,  2024

OBITUARIES
All obituaries and death 

notices will be at a cost of 
$150.00 per paper. 

Includes photo.No word Limit. 
Please send to 

obits@reverejournal.com
or call 781-485-0588

To place a memoriam in the
Winthrop Sun Transcript, 

call 781-485-0588

George W. Bol-
ster, born June 

17th, 1929, 
passed away 
peacefully at 

home on July 5th, with 
family by his bedside. He 
was 95 years old.

Born in Worcester, 
George lost his mother 
when he was a toddler and 
was ultimately raised with 
his brother, Harold by 
their maternal grandfather, 
George “Gramp” Doherty 
in Charlestown.  

A hard worker from a 
very young age, George 
had a number of jobs 
growing up. He started 
a savings account at the 
“Five Cent Savings Bank” 
in Boston with the first 
nickel he ever earned. To 
this day, he still retained 
the bankbook showing 
that first deposit.

A graduate of Boston 
Technical High School, 
George joined the US 
Marines when the Korean 
War broke out and served 
proudly from 1950-1952 
(active) and was honor-
ably discharged in 1959. 
Even when time robbed 
him of many memories, 
he always remembered he 
was a US Marine and in-
sisted he wear a Globe and 
Anchor pin every single 
day.

After active duty, 
George was a welder for 
the Watertown Arsenal, 
and later, a union iron-
worker, working on many 
of the buildings in down-
town Boston. He began 
Bolster Texaco in 1955 in 
Winthrop Center, work-
ing the evening shift as an 
ironworker until he was 
confident his business was 
secure. He later purchased 
the corner lot at 2 Shir-
ley Street and it became 
known as Bolster Shell, 
or just “Bolster’s” with its 
big neon sign on the can-
opy. He would go on to 
purchase land on Veterans 
Road and turn it into The 
Automall.

An avid Harley David-
son rider, George rode 
for more than 60 years, 
even trailering his bike to 
the Colorado Rockies to 
ride while in his eighties. 
He was very proud of the 
antique car collection he 
amassed over the years, 
and he was known for 
driving around in many 
different cars, often partic-
ipating in Town parades. 
Jay Leno once called him 

personally to congratulate 
him on his collection after 
being sent a DVD copy of 
the WCAT feature “Cream 
of the Crop” about his col-
lection.

George leaves his chil-
dren, George Jr., and his 
companion, Kim of Win-
throp, Jackie Gemme and 
her husband, Larry of 
New Salem, MA, Michael 
and his companion, Shir-
ley of Winthrop, and his 
daughter, Susan, also of 
Winthrop.

George was grandfather 
to George Doherty Bolster 
and his wife, Shanna of 
Rowley, MA, Christopher 
John Bolster and his wife, 
Justine of Winthrop and 
Justin Gordon Bolster and 
his wife, Vanessa of Prince 
Edward Island, Canada.

George was a brand 
new Great-grandfather 
to Noah Glenn Bolster of 
Rowley, MA.

George also leaves his 
nephew Bruce Bolster 
and his wife, Linda of 
Winthrop, his grand-niec-
es, Christina and Laura 
of Winthrop, his brother, 
Charles Bolster of Rut-
land, MA, and his niece, 
Christine Conroy of Cal-
ifornia. George was pre-
deceased by Marguerite 
(O’Brien) Bolster and by 
his nephews, David Bol-
ster of Winthrop and Ste-
ven Bolster of California, 
as well as his brother, Har-
old, also of California.  

A funeral service 
was held in the Caggia-
no-O’Maley-Frazier Fu-
neral Home on Wednes-
day, July 10. Services 
concluded with military 
honors in Winthrop Cem-
etery (Old section).

In lieu of flowers me-
morial donations may 
be made to Live and Let 
Live Farm at www.live-
andletlivefarm.org or to 
the New England Shelter 
for Homeless Veterans at 
www.nechv.org.

To sign the online 
guestbook go to www.cag-
gianofuneralhome.com.

Pauline Rodrigues
 Resident of Winthrop for over 57 years

George Bolster
Owned Bolster’s Shell, Bolster’s Texaco and 

The Automall, all of Winthrop

 Pauline Rodrigues of 
Winthrop passed away at 
home surrounded by her 
loving family on July 3, 
2024. She was 95 years 
old.

Born in Boston, she was 
the beloved daughter of 
the late Josephine (Lifave) 
and William Screnci. A 
resident of Winthrop for 
over 57 years, she worked 
for many years at the for-
mer Curtains Plus prior to 
her retirement.

She was the devoted 
wife of the late Romeo J. 
Rodrigues and the loving 
mother of Janet Rodrigues 
Martino of Winthrop, 
Mark Rodrigues and his 
wife, Dodie of Saugus, 
Joann Amatucci and her 
husband, Anthony of Win-
throp and the late Paul 
Rodrigues and his wife, 
Judi of Stoughton; dear 
sister of Ralph Screnci of 
Florida and the late Peter 
Screnci, Betty Scolaro and 
Mary Aquino; cherished 
grandmother of Michael, 
Jessica, Matthew, Lauren, 
Brittani, Kurt, Nicholas, 

Adam, Mark, and John. 
Great grandmother of 
Samantha, Scarlett, Vin-
cenzo, Vittorio, Monica 
and Joseph. She is also 
survived by many loving 
nieces and nephews.

The funeral was con-
ducted from the Cag-
giano-O’Maley-Frazier 
Funeral Home, Winthrop 
on Tuesday, July 9 fol-
lowed by a Funeral Mass 
in St. John the Evangelist 
Church. Services conclud-
ed with the interment in 
the Belle Isle section of 
Winthrop Cemetery.

To sign the online 
guestbook, go to www.
caggianofuneralhome.
com.
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THINK OF IT AS 
AN OWNER’S 
MANUAL FOR 
 YOUR MONEY.

A public service message from the U.S. General Services Administration.

The free Consumer Action Handbook. In print and online at 
ConsumerAction.gov, it’s the everyday guide to getting the most 
for your hard-earned money. For your free copy, order online at 
ConsumerAction.gov; write to Handbook, Pueblo, CO 81009; or 
call toll-free 1 (888) 8 PUEBLO. 

2x2 classified 

ad size shown 
to scale

12 weeks of
 eyes on your ad

CHOOSE FROM SIX COMMUNITIES TO ADVERTISE IN!

12 WEEKS  1 PRICE
One 2x2 Ad → April - June ← ONLY $18000*

By Adam Swift

Acting Mayor Patrick 
Keefe and former mayor 
Dan Rizzo will square off 

for the city’s top job on 
Nov. 7 in the municipal 
general election.

As of press time with 
unofficial results, Rizzo 

topped the ballot in the 
four-way preliminary elec-
tion for mayor on Tuesday 
with 2,627 votes, followed 
by Keefe with 2,488 votes 

with all precincts report-
ing with the exception of 
Ward 5, Precinct 1 late on 
Tuesday. All vote totals 
were unofficial as of Tues-

day night.
The preliminary race 

saw four long-time coun-
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50 CENTS

THINKING OF BUYING OR SELLING?
CALL LILIANA MONROY 

617.820.6649
Liliana has more than $50,000,000+ 

in sales worth of experience!

NEWS BRIEFS

• 100 Gal. Minimum  • 24 Hour Service
CALL FOR DAILY LOW PRICE

Per 
Gallon

$3.65  Price 
subject to 
change 
without 
notice

See Page 17 for a See Page 17 for a 
stroll through timestroll through time

See Page 3 for a See Page 3 for a 
stroll through timestroll through time

DAYTIME BRIDGE 
MACHINERY 
INSTALLATION AT 
CHELSEA STREET 
BRIDGE 

The Massachusetts 
Department of Trans-
portation (MassDOT) is 
announcing that it will 
be conducting work to 
install span guide roller 
machineries on the Chel-
sea Street Bridge in East 
Boston and Chelsea. This 
work is scheduled to take 
place Monday through 
Friday, during the hours 
of 9:00 a.m. to 3:00 p.m. 
This work is schedule to 
begin on Monday, Sep-
tember 25 and will con-
clude on Friday, Novem-
ber 17. There will be no 
weekend closures during 
scheduled Sumner Tunnel 
closures. The work will 
require off peak tempo-
rary lane and sidewalk 
closures. The bridge will 
remain fully operational 
during the installation of 
the new machinery and 
pedestrian access across 
the bridge will be main-
tained at all times. The 
schedule for this work is 
weather dependent and is 
subject to change without 
notice. 

Drivers who are trav-
eling through the area 
should reduce speed and 
use caution. 

 Appropriate signage, 
law enforcement details, 
and advanced message 
boards will be in place to 
guide drivers through the 
work area. 

For more information 
on traffic conditions, trav-
elers are encouraged to: 

See NEWS BRIEFS Page 2

See ELECTION Page 12

HAAS TOPS THE TICKET IN AT-LARGE PRELIMINARY

Ward 1 Ward 4 Ward 5

Top 5 Primary At-Large candidates

The Race for Ward 1
By Adam Swift

Incumbent Jo-
anne McKenna, the 
top vote-getter with 
676 votes, and John 
Stamatopoulos, 235 
votes, came out on 
top in the Ward 1 pre-
liminary election on 
Tuesday.

They will move 
onto the Nov. 7 gen-
eral municipal elec-
tion ballot.

McKenna current-
ly serves as the Coun-
cil President Pro Tem 
and was an educator 
in the Revere schools 
for over 30 years. She 
also chairs the city’s 
public art commis-
sion.

McKenna, a life-

long Beachmont resi-
dent, still lives in the 
same house she grew 
up in.

She has served as 
the Ward 1 Council-
lor for the past eight 
years. In her years 
as the ward council-
lor, McKenna said 
she has always been 
available to meet 
with people, take all 
calls, and resolve all 
problems brought to 
her attention.

McKenna said she 
has spent her life vol-
unteering and work-
ing for the city that 
she loves.

Stamatopoulos a 
Chief Executive and 

By Adam Swift

Paul Argenzio, 
the top vote-getter 
with 702 votes, and 
Gregory Murray, 242 
votes,  topped the 
ballot in the Ward 4 
preliminary election 
on Tuesday night, 
moving onto the Nov. 
7 municipal general 
election ballot.

The candidates are 
seeking to replace 
Patrick Keefe, who 
currently serves as 
acting mayor and is 
running for a full term 
in the mayor’s office.

Argenzio is a 
lifelong resident of 
Ward 4 who cur-
rently serves as the 
city’s Superintendent 
of Public Works. He 
has also served as 
the chair of the city’s 
traffic and parking 
commission for the 
past five years.

Argenzio stated 
that the city must 
ensure that its new 

residents, along with 
families who have 
resided in Revere for 
generations, can con-
tinue to afford to live 
in the city, and that 
city services such as 
police, fire, and pub-
lic works, grow to 
meet the needs of the 
rising population.

Murray said safety 
is his number one pri-
ority if elected to the 
council. He said there 
needs to be safety for 
students in school, 
as well as more pro-
grams for teens after 
school. In addition, 
Murray said there 
needs to be improved 
safety for the city’s 
senior citizens, both 
in their homes and in 
the streets.

With the city grow-
ing, Murray said the 
city needs to increase 
its public safety per-
sonnel and give them 
the tools to succeed.

Proctor Ave. res-
ident Herby-Jean 
Baptiste finished 
third with 168 votes.

By Adam Swift

Incumbent John 
Powers and Ange-
la Guarino-Sawaya 
topped the Ward 5 
preliminary election 
on Tuesday, moving 
onto the Nov. 7 mu-
nicipal general elec-
tion ballot.

Angela Guarino 
Saway, was the top 
vote-getter with 668 
votes,  with Powers 
coming in second 
with 432 votes.

Powers, who served 
as councillor for two 
decades has said that 
he is running on his 
long record of his 
past achievements for 
the ward, which most 
recently have includ-
ed the building of the 
new Point of Pines 
fire station. He said 
he is proud of his ser-
vice in Ward 5.

Guarino-Sawaya is 
a graduate of Suffolk 
University with near-
ly 20 years experi-

ence with the Boston 
Public Schools. She 
has volunteered with 
organizations such 
as the Revere Little 
League, Immaculate 
Conception School, 
and President of the 
Point of Pines Beach 
Association.

She stated that the 
most pressing issues 
facing Ward 5 today 
are over-develop-
ment, traffic man-
agement, and coastal 
resiliency. She said 
she plans to stop 
overdevelopment by 
implementing a mor-
atorium and enacting 
a sensible planning 
review. 

The other candi-
dates on the ballot 
were Ralph Celestin  
with 177 votes, and 
Randall Mondestin 
with 152.

The Race for Ward 4 The Race for Ward 5

O n  t h e  C a m p a i g n  T r a i l

Robert Haas III Anthony  Zambuto Marc Silvestri Michelle Kelley Juan Pablo Jaramillo

IT’S RIZZO AND KEEFE

IN THE RACE FOR MAYOR

VS VS VS

See WARD 1 Page 12

Greg MurrayPaul ArgenzioJohn StamatopoulosJoanne McKenna John PowersAngela Guarino-Sawaya

MARAIANNE SALZA PHOTO

Dan Rizzo is welcomed to his reception at Casa Lucia by many 
guests with open arms as State Rep. Jeffrey Turco looks on.

CARY SHUMAN PHOTO

Acting Mayor Patrick Keefe, with his wife, Jennifer, as they enter his campaign recep-
tion at Fine Line on Revere Beach. 

All votes are unofficial as of 
press time on Tuesday night.

By Adam Swift

The first weekend 
of February saw re-
cord-breaking cold across 
New England.

The Winthrop schools, 
like everyone else across 
the region, faced some 
challenges as the tempera-
tures went into a freefall, 
but came out of the cold 
snap without any major 
issues.

Superintendent of 

Schools Lisa Howard said 
preparation was key as the 
mercury began to drop on 
Friday, and she ultimately 
made the decision not to 
close school.

At Monday night’s 
School Committee meet-
ing, Howard walked 
through the process the 
district goes through when 
facing the potential for in-
clement weather.

“The most difficult part 
of my job each year is de-

ciding whether or not to 
have a snow day,” said 
Howard, joking that it has 
left a mark on her that she 
once called a snow day  
for a day when no snow 
ultimately fell from the 
skies.

“I do have a tremendous 
amount of support from 
my 15-year-old son, who 
convinces me if it looks 
like it is going to snow to 

Special to the Transcript

Have you ever want-
ed to own your own fire 
truck? Well, you’re in 
luck! The Town of Win-
throp is currently auc-
tioning off two used fire 
trucks — a 1996 Pierce 
Dash - Tilt Cab Fire Pump-
er and a 1989 GMC Model 
TC7D04 E-One (used as 
a Rescue 1). Both of the 
fire trucks are perfect for 
road construction compa-
nies or for use in a small 
fire department. These on-
line auctions are open to 

the public at municibid.
com and end on Monday, 
February 13.

Why are these auctions 
important? These auc-
tions are helping to bring 
money right back into im-
proving Winthrop’s com-
munity. 100% of the pro-

ceeds from these auctions 
go back to the Town of 
Winthrop. These funds are 
used for road maintenance, 
setting up local events for 
residents, community pro-
grams, public safety initia-
tives, and more! 

The 1996 Pierce Dash 
- Tilt Cab Fire Pumper 
has 69,401 miles on it and 
features a 6v92T Detroit 
Diesel Motor and Allison 
HT 740 Transmission. The 
1989 GMC Model TC7D04 
E-One has 27,708 miles on 
it and features a Onan 7.5 
KW Diesel Generator.

Town of Winthrop 
auctioning off two used fire trucks; 
Proceeds to help local community

Council votes on 
charter change 
recommendations
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DELI HELP WANTED
MUST BE OVER 18 YEARS OLD | MUST BE  

FLEXIBLE WITH HOURS | DAYS-EVENING-WEEKENDS
PLEASE CALL MARC OR CHRIS 617-846-6880

CALL TODAY AND FIND OUT WHAT SETS US APART FROM THE REST!      617.846.1020      C21SEAPORT.COM      218 WINTHROP ST., WINTHROP 2-9

Thinking of Buying, Selling, or Thinking of Buying, Selling, or 
need to rent your apartment? need to rent your apartment? 

We've got you covered.We've got you covered.
Call Jan Stevens at 617-877-6455 

or Kimberly Hodson at 760-214-6865

Winthrop, MA 02152 | 617-846-9900

Check out our website;   cottagehillrealestate.com

Single Family Beach Oasis
A Must See — 129 Strandway

$895,000— Offered by Elizabeth Ferrara

New to Market!New to Market!

EElliizzaabbeetthh  FFeerrrraarraa  
((778811))  771188--77009944

SENATOR LYDIA 
EDWARDS TO HOST 
A COFFEE HOUR

On Tuesday February 
14 from 1-2pm Senator 
Lydia Edwards will be 
hosting a coffee hour at 
the Robert DeLeo Senior 
Center, 35 Harvard St in 
Winthrop.

“I want to thank the 
Winthrop Council on Ag-
ing for providing space to 
host this coffee hour. I’m 
looking forward to hearing 
about issues constituents 
in Winthrop are facing and 
speaking with them about 
my legislative priorities. 
Happy Valentine’s Day!” 
said Senator Lydia Ed-
wards (D-Boston)

CELEBRATE BLACK 
HISTORY MONTH

Looking for ways to 
celebrate and learn about 
Black history in the Mys-
tic? Check out these op-
portunities and commu-
nity events happening 
around the watershed:

• Explore the works of 
Medford Poet Laureate 
Terry E. Carter. We were 
excited to see Terry E. 
Carter, GreenRoots and 
environmental justice fea-
tured in the newest instal-
lation at the Mystic Mural 
Project (pictured above) 
— a 22-year-long mu-
ral project near Blessing 
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CALL FOR DAILY LOW PRICE

Per 
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$3.65  Price 
subject to 
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Schools make it through cold snap Two Winthrop Middle School sixth grade students, Esta-
fania and Gabriella “Gabby”, found a wallet and turned it 
into Officer Bonavita, who was able to locate and return 
the item to its very happy owner.   Thank you Estafania and 
Gabby -- great community service!

LOST & FOUND

By Adam Swift

The Town Council will 
remain a nine-member 
body for the foreseeable 
future.

Last week, the council 
voted on proposed char-
ter changes recommended 
by the Ordinance Review 
Committee (ORC). While 
a number of proposals will 
be forwarded to the state 
for a potential vote by 
town residents in Novem-
ber, one recommendation 
which would have cut the 
number of town council-
ors from nine to seven and 
done away with precinct 
seats failed to pass muster 
with the council.

In addition to the coun-
cil’s composition, the 
council also failed to ap-
prove a part of that rec-
ommendation that would 
have cut a councilor’s term 
from four to two years. 
A similar measure to in-
crease the Town Council 
President’s term from two 
to four years also failed to 
move forward.

A charter change rec-
ommendation needed a 
yes vote from six of the 

nine councilors to poten-
tially be placed in front of 
voters in the fall.

The remaining recom-
mendations from the ORC 
did gain the council’s ap-
proval, and will appear on 
the November ballot pro-
vided the state deems they 
can legally move forward.

Some of those proposed 
charger changes include 
tougher language in the 
council’s abandonment 
language for members 
who consistently miss 
meetings, and a recall pro-
vision for elected officials.

Council President 
James Letterie said that 
the recommendations 
from the ORC on the 
council composition and 
term lengths were part of 
an effort to increase par-
ticipation in elections and 
potentially attract candi-
dates so there are more 
contested races.

But a number of coun-
cilors said those recom-
mendations would either 
not achieve that goal or 
would weaken represen-
tation for the town’s resi-
dents.

See CHARTER Page 3

By Stephen Quigley

Boston Mayor Michelle 
Wu delivered her State of 
the City Address at the 
MGM Music Hall next 
door to Fenway Park last 
week in which the mayor 
noted the achievements 
that have been accom-
plished over the past year 
and outlined a vision for 
making Boston a greener 
and more affordable city 
in which  to live and work 
by 2030.

“The state of the city is 
strong,” said Wu adding, 
“We have the resources, 
the resolve, and respon-
sibility to make it even 
stronger.”

Wu praised city em-
ployees for making “every 
accomplishment and con-
stituent service delivered, 
every detail of the agenda 
we’re sharing here tonight 
— this is only possible be-
cause of you.

“Our cabinet is two-
thirds people of color,” 
Wu noted. She singled 

out Boston natives Bos-
ton Police Commissioner 
Michael Cox; Trinh Nguy-
en, the Chief of Worker 
Empowerment; and Se-
gun Idowu, Chief of Eco-
nomic Opportunity and 
Development, for their 
commitment to Boston’s 
residents.

“Three bus lines are en-
tirely fare free,” said Wu, 
“and now we are accel-
erating over two dozen, 
new, dedicated bus lanes, 
expanding our bike net-

work, and organizing even 
more neighborhood Open 
Streets events.”

The mayor highlighted 
that public safety will be 
important, noting that 900 
guns were taken off the 
streets and that violent and 
property crime are at the 
lowest levels in 15 years. 

Bringing welcome news 
to many neighborhood 
residents who have bitter-
ly complained about the 
indifference of the Boston 
Planning and Redevelop-
ment Agency, Wu called 
for “charting a new course 
for growth, with people 
as our compass.  Tomor-
row, I’ll sign an executive 
order establishing a Plan-
ning Advisory Council to 
fully integrate long-range 
planning, and begin mod-
ernizing our zoning code.” 

Wu noted that she aims 
to “sustainably” increase 
the population of Boston 
from its current number of 
675,000 to 800,000.

Affordable housing also 
figured in her goals.  Wu 

said that more than 3,800 
housing units were per-
mitted, including 1,300 
affordable units.

Wu said “every square 
foot of city-owned prop-
erty” has been analyzed 
“and we have identified 
several parcels that could 
be used for affordable 
housing units.”

If “local builders 
work with us to design 
high-quality, affordable 
homes that enhance the 
surrounding neighbor-
hood, we will give you 
the land for free. And we 
will provide increased 
mortgage assistance so 
our residents can afford to 
buy these homes,” said the 
mayor.

Wu set a goal of 2030 
to have the city’s public 
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The Boston Police 
Department is seeking 
the public’s assistance 
in efforts to locate 
Reina Morales Rojas, 
41, of East Boston. 
She is described as 
a Hispanic Female, 
5’5”, 145lbs, black 
hair and brown eyes. 
We are praying Reina 
is found and returned 
with her family.

Anyone with infor-
mation regarding her 
whereabouts is ad-
vised to contact 911 
or A-7 Department at 
(617) 343-4324.

Police seek help with local missing person

MAYOR’S OFFICE PHOTO BY ISABEL LEON

Mayor Michelle Wu delivers 
remarks during the 2023 
State of the City adderess at 
the MGM Music Hall.

Special to the Times-Free Press

Albert J. “AJ” Moscone, 
Jr. has been accepted into 
the Boston Bar Associ-
ation’s Public Interest 
Leadership Program. Each 
year, the Boston Bar As-
sociation’s Public Interest 
Leadership Program wel-
comes a select group of 
talented and highly-mo-
tivated lawyers to partic-
ipate in a year-long pro-
gram designed to provide 
intensive leadership and 
professional development 
training.

Moscone is the founder 
of Moscone Law, where 
he focuses on an array of 
matters, including crim-
inal, civil, and business 
litigation as well as trans-
actional and hospitality 
matters. He has success-
fully litigated before a 
judge or jury in multiple 
venues throughout the 
Commonwealth, as well 
as in Federal Court, and 
has guided home and 
business owners through 
transactional and zoning/
licensure matters.

He was born and raised 
in East Boston, he cur-
rently serves on the Board 
of Directors for the East 
Boston Chamber of Com-
merce as well as the East 
Boston YMCA.

The notification letter is 

as follows:
On behalf of the Bos-

ton Bar Association, I am 
pleased to welcome you 
to the 2023 class of the 
Public Interest Leadership 
Program (PILP). You have 
been selected from a num-
ber of impressive appli-
cants to join this tremen-
dously talented group of 
attorneys. Congratulations 
on this achievement!

I am confident that 
your PILP experience will 
deepen your engagement 
and involvement as a lead-
er both in the BBA and 
within the community at 
large. Further, I hope the 
bonds you develop with 
fellow PILP participants 
will enrich your experi-
ence and growth during 
the program and beyond.

I wish you and your 
class all the best and look 
forward to working with 
you this year.

Albert J. “AJ” Moscone.

Moscone accepted into program

Wu sets ambitious agenda in State of the City address

Michael Coughlin Jr.

Tree Eastie, a non-profit 
organization that focuses 
on planting and maintain-
ing trees while educating 
residents about their bene-
fits, has been doing its part 
in an effort to increase 
East Boston’s scarce tree 
canopy. 

East Boston’s tree can-
opy sits at 7% – the low-
est in the City of Boston 
– which is woeful consid-
ering the average is 27%. 

“We need a lot more 
trees. We’ve got a lot of 
heat islands, and because 
of the effects of the high-
ways and the airport and 
also the flooding that we 
get along the coastline, 
we need a lot of trees just 
from an environmental 
standpoint,” said Tree 
Eastie Founder Bill Mas-
terson. 

Not only do trees help 
environmental aspects 
like reducing air pollution, 
but they can cool down 
streets, filter stormwater, 

and even increase proper-
ty value, according to Tree 
Eastie. 

That being said, the 
non-profit is doing its best 
to increase the neighbor-
hood’s tree canopy and 
has had great success as 
they have planted 164 
street trees over the last 15 
months, a number Master-
son is proud of. 

“That’s a big number 
… these are small trees. I 
mean, they’re only proba-
bly 10 or 12 feet tall, but, 
I mean, they’re going to 
grow two to three feet a 
year, and fast forward 10 
years from now, there’s 
going to be a lot of shade,” 
said Masterson. 

One of the main reasons 
Tree Eastie was able to 
plant that many trees was 
due to its relatively new 
and strong relationship 
with the City of Boston. 
In negotiations that took 
place for about a year, the 
non-profit was able to se-

Tree Eastie is
making tremendous 
environmental strides 

See TREE EASTIE Page 9

See page 8 for 

Mayor Wu’s 

complete speech.

Opening of New District A-7 Police Station in East Boston. Among those who turned out for the event are Mayor Michelle 
Wu (cutting the ribbon), Rep. Adrian Madaro (third from left holding the ribbon), Veronica Robles, City Councilor Gabriela 
Coletta, Boston Police Commissioner Michael Cox (behind Mayor Wu’s left), Police Captain Dean Bickerton (behind Mayor 
Wu’s right), Amelia Marcella (helping to cut the ribbon) and Skip Marcella.

RIBBON CUTTING FOR NEW POLICE STATION IN EASTIE

By Cary Shuman

Encore Boston Harbor 
President Jenny Holaday 
said it all about the opening 
of the WynnBET Sports-
book Tuesday at the five-
star resort/casino in Ever-
ett.

“It’s sports betting in the 
nation’s best sports town,” 
remarked Holaday. “Every-
one is thrilled and excited 
it’s here.”

Holaday was joined 
by Everett Mayor Carlo 
DeMaria, Speaker of the 
House Ron Mariano, State 
Reps. Joseph McGonagle 
and Dan Ryan and an ar-
ray of professional athletes 
at the grand opening of 
the new sportsbook which 
is another step in Encore 
bringing a spectacular Las 
Vegas-style experience to 
Everett.

“This has been long 
overdue,” said DeMaria, 
who led the way for the 
Encore resort/casino to 
be built in the city. “Peo-
ple have been able to go 
to other states to wager on 
sports. We made the same 
argument when we were 
bringing the casino to Ev-
erett – why not keep the 
money here in the commu-
nity? This sportsbook is a 
very nice facility.”

DeMaria said he had the 
opportunity to chat with 
Johnny Damon, one of the 

sports celebrities in atten-
dance at Tuesday’s event. 
“I thanked him for break-
ing the Curse of the Bam-
bino,” remarked DeMaria.

An historic day for 
Massachusetts

Boston sports fans, 
who have enjoyed several 
championships by the New 
England Patriots, Boston 
Red Sox, Boston Celtics, 
and Boston Bruins in this 
century, can now legally 
wager on professional and 
college sports at Encore – 
and they’re excited about 
the opportunity.

Mike Capone of Malden 
was one of the first patrons 
to wager after Holaday per-
sonally led the countdown 

By Adam Swift

The Planning Board ap-
proved the site plans for 
two separate retail mari-
juana facilities at its meet-
ing last week.

Both facilities, one at 
260-270 Second Street 
and one at 307 Broadway, 
were approved for special 

permits by the Zoning 
Board earlier in January.

“The space is zoned in-
dustrial, which allows this 
type of use,” said Shei-
la Grant, the attorney for 
DMS Trinity on Second 
Street. “It is currently uti-
lized as office space and a 
flower wholesaler. We will 
utilize space on the first 
floor, which has its own 
separate entrance.”

There are also 14 park-
ing spaces set aside for 
the business, which meets 
zoning requirements, 
Grant said.

Trinity DMS is a social 

equity applicant, as well as 
a minority owned business 
enterprise.

“They are committed to 
outreach and hiring within 
the city, as well,” Grant 
said.

Concrete Garden at 307 
Broadway had its easi-
est night in front of a city 
board since the business 
was first proposed last 
year.

Earlier in January, the 
ZBA granted a special 
permit for the business, 
despite some ongoing 
concerns about the own-
er of the 307 Broadway 

property. 
Concrete Garden prin-

cipal Vladimir Samuel has 
agreed to make upgrades 
to the building to bring it 
in compliance with city 
regulations.

At last week’s Planning 
Board, Samuel quickly 
ran through the site plan 
and provided some infor-
mation on lighting and se-
curity cameras before the 
board voted to approve the 
site plan.

In other business, the 
board approved the site 

Special to the Record

Senator Sal DiDome-
nico with his colleague 
Representative Marjorie 
Decker and the Lift Our 
Kids Coalition have ac-
celerated the timetable for 
lifting kids out of Deep 
Poverty by filing Senate 
and House bills (SD 501, 
HD 507) at the start of the 
2023-2024 legislative ses-
sion. A campaign launch 
event was held last week 
to build support for this 
legislation and introduce 
it to members of the Leg-
islature.  The Act to Lift 
Kids Out of Deep Poverty, 
which Senator DiDome-
nico has led on for years, 
would raise the maximum 
cash assistance grant by 

25% a year until it reaches 
half of the federal poverty 
level. Families living be-
low half the poverty lev-
el are considered to be in 
Deep Poverty. Under the 

bill, grants would increase 
each year and would keep 
pace with inflation as the 
poverty level goes up. 

After decades of fro-
zen cash assistance levels, 

Senator DiDomenico and 
Representative Decker led 
the charge in the Legisla-
ture to raise grants three 
times for a total increase of 
32% beginning in January 
2021. This was a huge step 
forward for families in our 
communities and they are 
looking to continue build-
ing on this momentum.

“It is simply unaccept-
able that we have near-
ly 70,000 children in the 
Commonwealth living 
so far below the federal 
poverty level,” said Sena-
tor DiDomenico, the lead 
sponsor of the Senate bill 
and Assistant Majority 
Leader of the Massachu-
setts Senate. “While the 
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By Adam Swift

More than a half a cen-
tury later, the first steps of 
man on the moon still in-
spire awe and wonder.

Now, thanks to the 
Space Adventure exhibit 
currently running at 121 
Webster Ave., visitors can 
experience the thrill of lu-
nar exploration complete 
with more than 300 origi-
nal NASA items.

Visitors will have the 
opportunity to experience 
the Mercury, Gemini and 
Apollo missions – re-
sponsible for bringing the 
first humans to the lunar 
surface – through a series 
of immersive rooms that 
include original artifacts 
that no one has ever seen 
or been given access to 
before. These include the 
control panel and count-
ing clock of the Houston 

Space Center, comput-
ers used in 1960, radios 
used for communication 
between spacecraft and 
Earth, astronaut suits, 
cameras used to capture 
the famous images of the 
lunar surface and astro-
nauts, work tools and de-
vices that filtered the air 
inside the modules, the 
Apollo mission food menu 
featuring items that could 
be stored for decades and 

products developed espe-
cially for the personal hy-
giene of astronauts while 
they were in the space.

The exhibition is di-
vided into several stages. 
The first is a 180-degree 
immersive video that 
welcomes and transports 
visitors to the space en-
vironment they are about 
to immerse themselves 

Rep. Marjorie Decker and Sen. Sal DiDomenico.

DiDomenico launches campaign 
to lift kids out of deep poverty

NASA comes to Chelsea
PHOTO COURTESY OF SPACE ADVENTURE

City Councillor Calvin Brown at the exhibit.

Planning Board approves marijuana dispensary site plans

Special to the Record

More than three dozen 
fire service leaders from 
across Massachusetts, in-
cluding Chelsea Deputy 
Chief Edward McGarry, 
graduated from  the Mas-
sachusetts Firefighting 
Academy’s Chief Fire Of-
ficer Management Train-
ing Program.

The four-month pro-
gram for new chief of-
ficers and chief officer 
candidates is delivered 
jointly by the Massachu-
setts Firefighting Acade-
my and the University of 
Massachusetts Edward J. 
Collins Jr. Center for Pub-

lic Management. Through 
classroom instruction and 
out-of-class assignments, 
the course delivers inten-
sive training in the non-
fire suppression aspects of 
managing a municipal fire 
department.

“The Chief Fire Officer 
program is a tremendous 
opportunity for new chiefs 
and rising officers,” said 
State Fire Marshal Peter 
J. Ostroskey, who gradu-
ated from the program in 
2002. “The rigorous in-
struction in such a wide 
variety of topics will help 
these graduates provide 

Local fire service leaders 
complete program

State Fire Marshal Peter J. Ostrokey (right), with Chelsea 
Deputy Chief Edward McGarry.

See NASA Page 5

See ENCORE Page 6

See McGARY Page 2

Longtime Chelsea School 
Committee member 
Rosemarie Carlisle greets 
former New England 
Patriots star receiver 
Julian Edelman at an event 
Tuesday at Encore Boston 
Harbor, celebrating the 
launch of legalized sports 
betting in Massachusetts.

Wynner’s Circle
Sports betting 
begins at Encore By Cary Shuman

Encore Boston Harbor 
President Jenny Hola-
day said it all about the 
opening of the WynnBET 
Sportsbook Tuesday at the 
five-star resort/casino in 
Everett.

“It’s sports betting in 
the nation’s best sports 
town,” remarked Holaday. 
“Everyone is thrilled and 
excited it’s here.”

Holaday was joined 
by Everett Mayor Carlo 
DeMaria, Speaker of the 
House Ron Mariano, State 
Reps. Joseph McGonagle 
and Dan Ryan and an array 
of professional athletes at 
the grand opening of the 
new sportsbook which 
is another step in Encore 
bringing a spectacular Las 
Vegas-style experience to 
Everett.

“This has been long 
overdue,” said DeMaria, 
who led the way for the 
Encore resort/casino to be 
built in the city. “People 
have been able to go to 
other states to wager on 
sports. We made the same 
argument when we were 
bringing the casino to Ev-
erett – why not keep the 
money here in the com-
munity? This sportsbook 
is a very nice facility.”

DeMaria said he had 
the opportunity to chat 

with Johnny Damon, one 
of the sports celebrities in 
attendance at Tuesday’s 
event. “I thanked him for 
breaking the Curse of the 
Bambino,” remarked De-
Maria.

An historic day for 
Massachusetts

Boston sports fans, 
who have enjoyed several 
championships by the New 
England Patriots, Boston 
Red Sox, Boston Celtics, 
and Boston Bruins in this 
century, can now legally 
wager on professional and 
college sports at Encore – 
and they’re excited about 
the opportunity.

Mike Capone of Mal-
den was one of the first 
patrons to wager after 

Special to the Independent

Senator Sal DiDome-
nico with his colleague 
Representative Marjorie 
Decker and the Lift Our 

Kids Coalition have ac-
celerated the timetable for 
lifting kids out of Deep 
Poverty by filing Senate 
and House bills (SD 501, 
HD 507) at the start of the 

2023-2024 legislative ses-
sion. A campaign launch 
event was held last week 
to build support for this 
legislation and introduce 
it to members of the Leg-
islature.  The Act to Lift 
Kids Out of Deep Poverty, 
which Senator DiDome-
nico has led on for years, 
would raise the maximum 
cash assistance grant by 
25% a year until it reaches 
half of the federal poverty 
level. Families living be-
low half the poverty lev-
el are considered to be in 
Deep Poverty. Under the 
bill, grants would increase 
each year and would keep 
pace with inflation as the 
poverty level goes up. 

After decades of fro-
zen cash assistance levels, 

Senator DiDomenico and 
Representative Decker led 
the charge in the Legisla-
ture to raise grants three 
times for a total increase of 
32% beginning in January 
2021. This was a huge step 
forward for families in our 
communities and they are 
looking to continue build-
ing on this momentum.

“It is simply unaccept-
able that we have near-
ly 70,000 children in the 
Commonwealth living 
so far below the federal 
poverty level,” said Sena-
tor DiDomenico, the lead 
sponsor of the Senate bill 
and Assistant Majority 
Leader of the Massachu-
setts Senate. “While the 
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Rep. Marjorie Decker and Sen. Sal DiDomenico.

DiDomenico launches campaign 
to lift kids out of deep poverty

Everett’s Shinay Aristhene demonstrates good form that 
earned him 2nd place in the 50-yard hurdles.

Nicole Brandao (109) clears the last hurdle on her way to a 
first place finish in the 50-yard hurdles.

EHS COMPETES IN GREATER BOSTON LEAGUE TRACK
The Crimson Tide came away with win and a loss to Medford in Greater Boston League track action Monday at 

Malden High School, as the boys pulled away to a 51-35 victory but the girls were tipped 46-40.

Special to the Independent

More than three dozen 
fire service leaders from 
across Massachusetts 
including Everett Depu-
ty Chief Sabato LoRus-
so graduated from the 
Massachusetts Firefight-
ing Academy’s Chief 
Fire Officer Management 
Training Program.

The four-month pro-
gram for new chief of-
ficers and chief officer 
candidates is delivered 
jointly by the Massachu-
setts Firefighting Acade-
my and the University of 
Massachusetts Edward J. 
Collins Jr. Center for Pub-
lic Management. Through 
classroom instruction and 
out-of-class assignments, 
the course delivers inten-
sive training in the non-
fire suppression aspects of 
managing a municipal fire 
department.

“The Chief Fire Officer 
program is a tremendous 
opportunity for new chiefs 
and rising officers,” said 
State Fire Marshal Peter 
J. Ostroskey, who gradu-
ated from the program in 
2002. “The rigorous in-
struction in such a wide 
variety of topics will help 
these graduates provide 
the leadership that their 
departments and commu-
nities deserve. Complet-
ing the program is a ma-
jor accomplishment and I 
want to congratulate them 
on their initiative and ded-
ication to professional de-
velopment.”

The Chief Fire Officer 
Management Training 
Program covers a spec-
trum of topics considered 
essential for effective 
public sector manage-
ment. It includes human 

State Fire Marshal Peter J. Ostroskey (right). With Everett 
Deputy Chief Sabato LoRusso.

Local fire service leaders 
complete program

BRIAN GIANNELLI HONORED AT CITY HALL

Parking Enforcement Officer Brian Giannelli (second from left) was presented with an appreciation citation by the City 
Council for his heroic efforts on the early morning of Dec. 22, 2022, alerting residents to a two-alarm fire in Vine Street. 
Shown at the ceremony are (left to right) Brian Giannelli Jr. (son), Brian Giannelli, Keith Giannelli (brother), Carlo Giannelli 
(son), Kenny Giannelli (uncle), Mary (mother-in-law) and Councilor Wayne Matewsky.

See TRAINING Page 2

Wynner’s Circle
Sports betting 
begins at Encore

Everett Mayor Carlo 
DeMaria and Rep. Joe 
McGonagle are pictured at 
the WynnBET Sportsbook 
at Encore Boston Harbor 
on the historic first day of 
legalized sports betting in 
Massachusetts.

BOB MARRA PHOTOS

 By Cary Shuman

Lynn Councilor-at-Large Bri-
an LaPierre attended the grand 

opening of the WynnBet Sports-
book on Jan. 31 at Encore Boston 
Harbor.

LaPierre was accompanied by 
his wife, former Lynn English 
High School softball great Kelly 
Curtin LaPierre for the official 
launch of legalized sports betting 
in Massachusetts.

During the festivities, the 
LaPierres interacted with sever-
al Boston sports celebrities who 
were in attendance for the mo-
mentous event.

“It’s exciting to be here on an 
historic day for Massachusetts 
and Encore Boston Harbor with 
the launch of legalized sports bet-
ting,” said Brian. “Sports betting 
has been a long time coming to 
our state, and it’s going to bring 

Friday, February 10, 2023
Th e Ly n n Jo u r n a L
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HELP
WE NEED HOMES 

TO SELL!!
CALL US NOW!!

CHELSEA
2 Family 1st Floor has 2 levels w/2 baths, 

H/W Floors, Lg Lot, Lots of Parking Won’t 
Last! #106G $550’s

EAST BOSTON COMING SOON
Gorgeous 2Br 2 Bath Condos, H/W Floors, 
C/AC, Quartz, SS Bosch Appliances, Plus 

Garage Parking!
Call for Details!

WINTHROP - RENT
For Rent – Prime Center Loc. w/ Full Basement, 
Ideal for Retail, Medical, Day Care, $2,900/mo

Call for Details
Linda 617-306-9605

WINTHROP
Mixed Use Commercial Plus 3 Residential, 

6 Car Parking, Great for Investors! 
#130S $949,000

WINTHROP
Lovely 7 Rm, 3 Br, 2 Bath Home, H/W Floors, 

Mod Kitchen, F.P. 
Beautiful Detail, 

Easy walk to Beach 
& Shops! 

Won't Last 
$485,000

WINTHROP
Amazing 3 Br 2 Bath Home, Open Kitchen Liv-
ing Area w Cathedral Ceiling, Mod Kit/w Corian 

Counters SS Refrig. Fireplace LV Oversized 
finished basement, C/

AC, Deck with IG 
Pool Extremely well 

maintained home 
Must See! Won’t 
Last! $499,900

SALE PENDING

EAST BOSTON
ORIENT HEIGHTS

Location Location! Bungalow style 
1 family, 3 Brs Full Dr, H/W Floors, 

Gorgeous detail throughout

WINTHROP
Hard to Find! A Vacant lot (over 5,000 s.f.) with 

a foundation on it! Also has a 2 story garage.
 Great for Builders, or Make your own 

Dream home!  #455P $275K

EAST BOSTON 
GREENWAY LOCATION!

Mod 1 Br Condo, New kitchen, SS Appl, 
Quartz Counters! H/W Floors, Steps to T 

& Greenway! $329,900

SALE PENDING

REVERE - WEST
2 Family, Great Move in Condition! Custom 

Cabinets, New Bath, Roof, C/AC, H/W Floors, 
Quartz, SS Appl, Too Much to List! $629,000

• 100 Gal. Minimum  • 24 Hour Service
CALL FOR DAILY LOW PRICE

Per 
Gallon

$2.55  
Price subject 
to change 

without 
notice

TRASH 
NOTICE

Due to the president's 
Day Holiday, on Monday, 
February 19th , 2018 Trash 
will be delayed by one day.
Capitol Waste Services, Inc.

Our Offices will be 
OPEN

Monday, February 19th

President’s Day
9AM – 5PM

Thomas Boyan, Sr

Marie Butera

Richard Buttiglieri

Theresa Conte

Dr. Adrian Costanza

Dorothy Cordaro

Gerardo Iannuzzi

Patricia Muse

Paul Penta, Jr. 

Antonetta Salamone
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$1.5 MILLION FOR 
NORTHERN STRAND 
COMMUNITY TRAIL

The Executive Office of 
Energy and Environmental 
Affairs has approved a $1.5 
million grant regarding the 
development of the Northern 
Strand Community Trail led 
by a Revere on the Move part-
ner organization, Bike to the 
Sea. 

Revere has a one-mile 
stretch in North Revere. The 
Northern Strand Community 
Trail has been in development 
for over 20 years. The North 
Revere segment is a major 
part in the project that creates 
a continuous 7.5-mile rail trail 
running from West Everett, 
through Malden and Revere 
to the Saugus River and soon 
into Lynn. The North Revere 
segment allows users to en-
joy spectacular views of the 
Rumney Marsh. 

The funding, awarded 
through the Executive Office 
of Energy and Environmental 
Affairs’ (EEA) Gateway City 
Parks Program, enables the 
design of the trail, develop-
ment of bid-ready construc-
tion documents, and receipt 
of all necessary construction 
permits. When completed, the 
trail will span 10 miles and 

See DeLEO Page 3

REVERE RECREATION HOSTS PAINT 
& SKATE NIGHT AT CRONIN RINK

Joseph Arrigo was all smiles at the Revere Recreation Paint & 
Skate Night on Feb. 10 at the Cronin Skating Rink in Revere. 
Please see more photos on Page 10.

By Sue Ellen Woodcock

For years the abutters of 
Route 1 have put up with the 
noise from millions of cars, 
and now some city councillors 
want to have Mayor Brian Ar-
rigo contact the MassDOT to 
install barriers along Route 1 
between Route 16 and Cope-
land Circle.

Ward 5 Councillor Charles 
Patch, Ward 4 Councillor 
Patrick Keefe and Ward 1 
Councillor Joanne McKen-
na teamed up on a motion at 
last last week’s council meet-
ing. Patch said he and the late 

Councillor Robert Haas Jr. 
tried to get barriers installed 
in 2011 and received no re-
sponse.

“We should get more re-
spect from the state and fed-
eral government,” Patch said..

Keefe noted that more af-
fluent communities are often 
granted sound barriers.

Ward 2 Councillor Ira No-
voselsky pointed out that Sau-
gus got barriers along Route 
1 installed along a new ball 
field.

“It’s a quality-of-life is-
sue,” he said.

Barriers are easily seen 

Have you ever had an idea 
for how you could make im-
provements to the Revere 
community? So have the ap-
plicants to the mini-grant pro-
grams hosted by Revere on 
the Move and the Alcohol, To-
bacco and Other Drugs Task 
Force; and this time, these 
ideas are going to become a 
reality.

Every year a group of Re-
vere residents and institution-
al leaders meet together to 
select the awardees of mini-
grants offered to the public 
through the community-led 
organizations, Revere on the 
Move and the Alcohol, Tobac-
co, and Other Drugs (ATOD) 

Task Force. Both the ATOD 
Task Force and Revere on the 
Move are initiatives of the 
MGH Revere CARES Coa-
lition. Revere on the Move 
is additionally co-led by the 
Healthy Community Initia-
tives Office at the City of Re-
vere.

This year over $20,000 
was awarded to fund ideas to 
make Revere a healthier place 
to work, to play, and to raise 
a family. The Revere on the 
Move mini-grant program 
offered $10,605 in funding 
for permanent changes, pro-
gram implementation, and 
youth-led projects that would 
help prevent or reduce obe-

sity in children and adults. 
The ATOD Task Force fund-
ed projects totaling $9,500 to 
reduce youth substance use, 
improve their mental health, 
and increase opportunities for 
positive youth engagement.

In addition to the mini-
grants already funded, Revere 
on the Move has extended 
their permanent change and 
program mini-grant appli-
cations to Sunday, March 4. 
Up to $1,395 is available for 
ideas that make it easier to 
eat healthy and be active for 
all. The application is open 

Revere's TND
receives $50,000
state grant for jobs

Special to The Journal

Monday morning the Bak-
er-Polito Administration 
awarded $500,000 to nine 
projects through the Urban 
Agenda Grant Program. The 
Revere arm of The Neigh-
borhood Developers (TND) 
was one group given $50,000 
in funding to help establish 
workforce development ser-
vices in Revere to support lo-
cal residents to acquire newly 
created jobs.

Lt. Gov. Karyn Polito along 
with Housing and Economic 
Development Secretary Jay 
Ash came to Revere City Hall 
to present the check to the 
Neighborhood Developers.

“Our administration under-
stands the importance of local 
leadership and its impact on 
the lives of residents,” said 
Lt. Governor Karyn Polito. 
“The Urban Agenda Grant 
Program relies on the strong 
partnerships between local 
government, non-profits and 

the business community that 
are critical to fostering eco-
nomic success and building 
stronger neighborhoods in ev-
ery region in Massachusetts.”

Revere is rebuilding its 
economic and employment 
base by utilizing large-scale 
and high value assets includ-
ing Suffolk Downs, Wonder-
land, a soon-to-close NECCO 
plant, and the MassDevelop-
ment TDI Waterfront District.

The program seeks to un-
lock community-driven re-
sponses to local obstacles, 
and promote economic devel-
opment opportunities through 
partnership-building, problem 
solving, and shared account-
ability in urban centers. The 
competitive awards offer flex-
ible funding for local efforts 
that bring together commu-
nity stakeholders to pursue 
economic development ini-
tiatives. These awards will 
fund projects in Boston, Clin-

Real estate values continue to be strong in Revere

Lt. Gov. Karyn Polito, Ann Houston of The Neighborhood Developers, State Rep. RoseLee Vincent, 
Bob O' Brien of Revere Economic Department, Mayor Brian Arrigo and Secretary of Housing and 
Ecomonic Development  Jay Ash at the announcement of the Urban Agenda Grant Program on 
Monday morning in the Revere City Council Chambers.

By Sue Ellen Woodcock

The Revere real estate mar-
ket in 2017 was definitely a 
good one with higher prices 
for homes than in 2016, but 
a drop in the number of new 
listings, making home-buying 
an adventure.

“These are the highest pric-
es we’ve seen in the last eight 
years,” said Maureen Celata, 
owner/broker of MCelata Real 
Estate. “And 2018 is going to 
be another banner year. Inven-
tory is low now, but everyone 
is looking to the spring.”

According to figures from 
the Massachusetts Associa-
tion of Realtors, the median 
sales prices was $376,250, 
a 4.9 increase over prices in 
2016.

Homes also were also on 
the market 41 days, a 26.8 
percent increase over the 56 

days on the market in 2016.
The number of listings in 

2017 also dropped to 265, 
10.8 percent down from 297 
in 2016. The good news for 
sellers is that the original list-
ing price was matched 100 
percent of the time.

The condominium mar-
ket saw similar trends with 
the median sales price at 
$315,000, up 16.7 percent 
over 2016. Days on the mar-
ket also dropped from 67 in 
2016 to 47 days on the market

“Inventory is low now and 
everyone is looking toward 
the spring,” Celata said

The rental market is also 
strong with rents ranging from 
$1,200 to $3,000. Cleat noted 
that if someone is paying big 
rent they just might be capable 
of buying and taking advan-
tage of first-time homebuyers 
programs.

“2017 was a fantastic year 
to be in real estate,” said Joe 
Mario of Century 21 Ma-
rio Real Estate. “There’s a 
lot of confidence and equity 
in homes. For 35 years now 
it’s been positive. Now is the 
time to sell. Revere is getting 
the overflow from the Boston 
market and people are moving 
to Revere.

Mario said Revere is desir-
able because of its proximity 
to Boston, and it’s a hidden 
gem with a beautiful beach.

Mario is looking forward 
to the spring market, drawing 
from Boston and surrounding 
communities. He added that 
the Revere School system is 
also a draw for buyers.

“It all adds to the future 
growth of Revere,” he said.

See MINI GRANTS Page 3

See  TND GRANT , Page 3
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HELP
WE NEED HOMES 

TO SELL!!
CALL US NOW!!

CHELSEA
2 Family 1st Floor has 2 levels w/2 baths, 

H/W Floors, Lg Lot, Lots of Parking Won’t 
Last! #106G $550’s

EAST BOSTON COMING SOON
Gorgeous 2Br 2 Bath Condos, H/W Floors, 
C/AC, Quartz, SS Bosch Appliances, Plus 

Garage Parking!
Call for Details!

WINTHROP - RENT
For Rent – Prime Center Loc. w/ Full Basement, 
Ideal for Retail, Medical, Day Care, $2,900/mo

Call for Details
Linda 617-306-9605

WINTHROP
Mixed Use Commercial Plus 3 Residential, 

6 Car Parking, Great for Investors! 
#130S $949,000

WINTHROP
Lovely 7 Rm, 3 Br, 2 Bath Home, H/W Floors, 

Mod Kitchen, F.P. 
Beautiful Detail, 

Easy walk to Beach 
& Shops! 

Won't Last 
$485,000

WINTHROP
Amazing 3 Br 2 Bath Home, Open Kitchen Liv-
ing Area w Cathedral Ceiling, Mod Kit/w Corian 

Counters SS Refrig. Fireplace LV Oversized 
finished basement, C/

AC, Deck with IG 
Pool Extremely well 

maintained home 
Must See! Won’t 
Last! $499,900

SALE PENDING

EAST BOSTON
ORIENT HEIGHTS

Location Location! Bungalow style 
1 family, 3 Brs Full Dr, H/W Floors, 

Gorgeous detail throughout

WINTHROP
Hard to Find! A Vacant lot (over 5,000 s.f.) with 

a foundation on it! Also has a 2 story garage.
 Great for Builders, or Make your own 

Dream home!  #455P $275K

EAST BOSTON 
GREENWAY LOCATION!

Mod 1 Br Condo, New kitchen, SS Appl, 
Quartz Counters! H/W Floors, Steps to T 

& Greenway! $329,900

SALE PENDING

REVERE - WEST
2 Family, Great Move in Condition! Custom 

Cabinets, New Bath, Roof, C/AC, H/W Floors, 
Quartz, SS Appl, Too Much to List! $629,000

• 100 Gal. Minimum  • 24 Hour Service
CALL FOR DAILY LOW PRICE

Per 
Gallon

$2.55  
Price subject 
to change 

without 
notice

TRASH 
NOTICE

Due to the president's 
Day Holiday, on Monday, 
February 19th , 2018 Trash 
will be delayed by one day.
Capitol Waste Services, Inc.

Our Offices will be 
OPEN

Monday, February 19th

President’s Day
9AM – 5PM

Thomas Boyan, Sr

Marie Butera
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Theresa Conte

Dr. Adrian Costanza

Dorothy Cordaro

Gerardo Iannuzzi

Patricia Muse

Paul Penta, Jr. 

Antonetta Salamone
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$1.5 MILLION FOR 
NORTHERN STRAND 
COMMUNITY TRAIL

The Executive Office of 
Energy and Environmental 
Affairs has approved a $1.5 
million grant regarding the 
development of the Northern 
Strand Community Trail led 
by a Revere on the Move part-
ner organization, Bike to the 
Sea. 

Revere has a one-mile 
stretch in North Revere. The 
Northern Strand Community 
Trail has been in development 
for over 20 years. The North 
Revere segment is a major 
part in the project that creates 
a continuous 7.5-mile rail trail 
running from West Everett, 
through Malden and Revere 
to the Saugus River and soon 
into Lynn. The North Revere 
segment allows users to en-
joy spectacular views of the 
Rumney Marsh. 

The funding, awarded 
through the Executive Office 
of Energy and Environmental 
Affairs’ (EEA) Gateway City 
Parks Program, enables the 
design of the trail, develop-
ment of bid-ready construc-
tion documents, and receipt 
of all necessary construction 
permits. When completed, the 
trail will span 10 miles and 

See DeLEO Page 3

REVERE RECREATION HOSTS PAINT 
& SKATE NIGHT AT CRONIN RINK

Joseph Arrigo was all smiles at the Revere Recreation Paint & 
Skate Night on Feb. 10 at the Cronin Skating Rink in Revere. 
Please see more photos on Page 10.

By Sue Ellen Woodcock

For years the abutters of 
Route 1 have put up with the 
noise from millions of cars, 
and now some city councillors 
want to have Mayor Brian Ar-
rigo contact the MassDOT to 
install barriers along Route 1 
between Route 16 and Cope-
land Circle.

Ward 5 Councillor Charles 
Patch, Ward 4 Councillor 
Patrick Keefe and Ward 1 
Councillor Joanne McKen-
na teamed up on a motion at 
last last week’s council meet-
ing. Patch said he and the late 

Councillor Robert Haas Jr. 
tried to get barriers installed 
in 2011 and received no re-
sponse.

“We should get more re-
spect from the state and fed-
eral government,” Patch said..

Keefe noted that more af-
fluent communities are often 
granted sound barriers.

Ward 2 Councillor Ira No-
voselsky pointed out that Sau-
gus got barriers along Route 
1 installed along a new ball 
field.

“It’s a quality-of-life is-
sue,” he said.

Barriers are easily seen 

Have you ever had an idea 
for how you could make im-
provements to the Revere 
community? So have the ap-
plicants to the mini-grant pro-
grams hosted by Revere on 
the Move and the Alcohol, To-
bacco and Other Drugs Task 
Force; and this time, these 
ideas are going to become a 
reality.

Every year a group of Re-
vere residents and institution-
al leaders meet together to 
select the awardees of mini-
grants offered to the public 
through the community-led 
organizations, Revere on the 
Move and the Alcohol, Tobac-
co, and Other Drugs (ATOD) 

Task Force. Both the ATOD 
Task Force and Revere on the 
Move are initiatives of the 
MGH Revere CARES Coa-
lition. Revere on the Move 
is additionally co-led by the 
Healthy Community Initia-
tives Office at the City of Re-
vere.

This year over $20,000 
was awarded to fund ideas to 
make Revere a healthier place 
to work, to play, and to raise 
a family. The Revere on the 
Move mini-grant program 
offered $10,605 in funding 
for permanent changes, pro-
gram implementation, and 
youth-led projects that would 
help prevent or reduce obe-

sity in children and adults. 
The ATOD Task Force fund-
ed projects totaling $9,500 to 
reduce youth substance use, 
improve their mental health, 
and increase opportunities for 
positive youth engagement.

In addition to the mini-
grants already funded, Revere 
on the Move has extended 
their permanent change and 
program mini-grant appli-
cations to Sunday, March 4. 
Up to $1,395 is available for 
ideas that make it easier to 
eat healthy and be active for 
all. The application is open 

Revere's TND
receives $50,000
state grant for jobs

Special to The Journal

Monday morning the Bak-
er-Polito Administration 
awarded $500,000 to nine 
projects through the Urban 
Agenda Grant Program. The 
Revere arm of The Neigh-
borhood Developers (TND) 
was one group given $50,000 
in funding to help establish 
workforce development ser-
vices in Revere to support lo-
cal residents to acquire newly 
created jobs.

Lt. Gov. Karyn Polito along 
with Housing and Economic 
Development Secretary Jay 
Ash came to Revere City Hall 
to present the check to the 
Neighborhood Developers.

“Our administration under-
stands the importance of local 
leadership and its impact on 
the lives of residents,” said 
Lt. Governor Karyn Polito. 
“The Urban Agenda Grant 
Program relies on the strong 
partnerships between local 
government, non-profits and 

the business community that 
are critical to fostering eco-
nomic success and building 
stronger neighborhoods in ev-
ery region in Massachusetts.”

Revere is rebuilding its 
economic and employment 
base by utilizing large-scale 
and high value assets includ-
ing Suffolk Downs, Wonder-
land, a soon-to-close NECCO 
plant, and the MassDevelop-
ment TDI Waterfront District.

The program seeks to un-
lock community-driven re-
sponses to local obstacles, 
and promote economic devel-
opment opportunities through 
partnership-building, problem 
solving, and shared account-
ability in urban centers. The 
competitive awards offer flex-
ible funding for local efforts 
that bring together commu-
nity stakeholders to pursue 
economic development ini-
tiatives. These awards will 
fund projects in Boston, Clin-

Real estate values continue to be strong in Revere

Lt. Gov. Karyn Polito, Ann Houston of The Neighborhood Developers, State Rep. RoseLee Vincent, 
Bob O' Brien of Revere Economic Department, Mayor Brian Arrigo and Secretary of Housing and 
Ecomonic Development  Jay Ash at the announcement of the Urban Agenda Grant Program on 
Monday morning in the Revere City Council Chambers.

By Sue Ellen Woodcock

The Revere real estate mar-
ket in 2017 was definitely a 
good one with higher prices 
for homes than in 2016, but 
a drop in the number of new 
listings, making home-buying 
an adventure.

“These are the highest pric-
es we’ve seen in the last eight 
years,” said Maureen Celata, 
owner/broker of MCelata Real 
Estate. “And 2018 is going to 
be another banner year. Inven-
tory is low now, but everyone 
is looking to the spring.”

According to figures from 
the Massachusetts Associa-
tion of Realtors, the median 
sales prices was $376,250, 
a 4.9 increase over prices in 
2016.

Homes also were also on 
the market 41 days, a 26.8 
percent increase over the 56 

days on the market in 2016.
The number of listings in 

2017 also dropped to 265, 
10.8 percent down from 297 
in 2016. The good news for 
sellers is that the original list-
ing price was matched 100 
percent of the time.

The condominium mar-
ket saw similar trends with 
the median sales price at 
$315,000, up 16.7 percent 
over 2016. Days on the mar-
ket also dropped from 67 in 
2016 to 47 days on the market

“Inventory is low now and 
everyone is looking toward 
the spring,” Celata said

The rental market is also 
strong with rents ranging from 
$1,200 to $3,000. Cleat noted 
that if someone is paying big 
rent they just might be capable 
of buying and taking advan-
tage of first-time homebuyers 
programs.

“2017 was a fantastic year 
to be in real estate,” said Joe 
Mario of Century 21 Ma-
rio Real Estate. “There’s a 
lot of confidence and equity 
in homes. For 35 years now 
it’s been positive. Now is the 
time to sell. Revere is getting 
the overflow from the Boston 
market and people are moving 
to Revere.

Mario said Revere is desir-
able because of its proximity 
to Boston, and it’s a hidden 
gem with a beautiful beach.

Mario is looking forward 
to the spring market, drawing 
from Boston and surrounding 
communities. He added that 
the Revere School system is 
also a draw for buyers.

“It all adds to the future 
growth of Revere,” he said.

See MINI GRANTS Page 3

See  TND GRANT , Page 3
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Lynn’s
Lovelines

Page 5

 Mayor Jared Nicholson de-
livered his State of the City Ad-
dress Tuesday inside the Council 
Chambers at Lynn City Hall.

“The state of the city is 
strong,” said Nicholson. “The fu-
ture of our city is bright. Both of 
those statements are true because 
of the strength of our people.”

Council President Jay Walsh 
introduced Nicholson, stating 
that, “I can’t think of a time 
where a mayor had given a 
speech for the State of the City 
Address from these Chambers. 
There have been a lot of great 
things that we’ve done here to-
gether, and we’re going to con-
tinue to do them. And with that, 
I’d like to introduce the 59th 
mayor of the City of Lynn, Jared 
Nicholson.”

Following is the text of May-
or Nicholson’s State of the City 
Address:

“Thank you, Council Presi-
dent Walsh. Good evening Coun-
cilors, School Committee mem-
bers, Legislators, Mayor McGee, 
Mayor Arrigo, Auditor DiZoglio, 

and guests.
This is my first State of the 

City address and I so appreciate 
you all being here.

Gracias a todos por estar aquí.
I want to especially thank my 

wife Katherine, my sons Henry 
and Benjamin, and my parents.

I’d also like to invite all of 
you to check out the North Shore 
Juneteenth event in the lobby 

after this honoring Black excel-
lence in our community.

I want to give a special thank 

you to everyone who stepped in 
to help the residents who were 
displaced by the cold this week-
end:

• Lynn Fire Department
• Lynn Police
• Lynn Housing Authority
• Cataldo Ambulance
• Public Health
• ISD
• Custodians
• LPS
• City Council
• City Solicitor
• Library
• Red Cross
• Salvation Army
• Concerned Citizens and 

North Shore Chabad
• Lynn Shelter Association
I’m glad that the timing of 

this speech allows me to publicly 

thank you for stepping up with-
out hesitation to help our resi-
dents in need.

Now for the state of the city.
The state of our city is strong. 
The future of our city is bright. 
Both of those statements are 

true because of the strength of 
our people. 

They’re true even in the face 
of the many challenges we face. 

They are true because we are 
14 square miles teeming with 
determination to overcome those 
challenges.

Every day when I walk into 
my office, I see the more than 
50 flags representing countries 
of origin of students in the Lynn 
Public Schools. I’m reminded 

Mayor Nicholson delivers his State of the City address

Mayor Jared Nicholson and Rep. Jenny Armini shown during the State 
of the City Address Tuesday night at City Hall.

Please see STATE OF THE CITY Page 4

GBL Champions!
Lynn Classical finishes a perfect 14-0 in league play

GBL CHAMPIONS: The Lynn Classical High School girls basketball team captured the Greater Boston 
League championship for the 2022-23 season. Front row, from left, are Lauren Wilson, Savannah Tang, 
Maegan Baker, Lauren Hennessey, Kylee Mills, Kaleigh Bullock, and Ava Thurman. Back row, from left, are 
Coach Tom Sawyer, Coach Shardaye Berry, Keisha Perez, Nevaeh Eth, Linda Jallow, Akiyah Brown, Gigi 
Ramirez, Mea Papazoglou, Coach Alina Garrity, and Coach Rob Smith.

By Cary Shuman

Undefeated and undisputed.
Coach Tom Sawyer’s Lynn 

Classical High School girls 
basketball team defeated Lynn 
English, 56-33, Tuesday to cap-
ture the Greater Boston League 

championship.
Classical won all 14 of its 

GBL games while leading the 
league in all statistical offensive 
and defensive categories. Clas-
sical defeated English twice in 
league play and in the Boverini 
Tournament championship game 

by a 50-35 score. English (11-6) 
gave Classical its toughest game 
of the season in an earlier GBL 
matchup won by Classical, 44-
42.

Classical (17-0 overall) will 

Please see CLASSICAL Page 3

Lynn Councilor-at-Large Brian 
LaPierre holds his mobile device 
from which he was able to enter 
his sports wager and execute the 
transaction at one of the Encore 
Boston Harbor betting kiosks.

LaPierre attends opening of WynnBet 
Sportsbook at Encore Boston Harbor

Welcome the new season 
with new customers

Welcome the new season 
with new customers
Our Spring Service Directory offers 12 

weeks of exposure for one single payment
Our Spring Service Directory offers 12 

weeks of exposure for one single payment

Call the Office @ 781-485-0588
or email
your rep

mdibella@winthroptranscript.com
deb@reverejournal.com

charlestownads@hotmail.com

Spring into savings today!Spring into savings today!

&

*$180 per paper

United Way honors State 
Senator Lydia Edwards 
as Legislative Champion

United Way of Massachusetts Bay Board Chair, Tom Samoluk 
presents the Legislative Champion award to Sen. Lydia Edwards.

Special to the Journal

United Way of Mas-
sachusetts Bay recently 
recognized State Senator 
Lydia Edwards as one of 
the organization’s sev-
en inaugural Legislative 
Champions for her ex-
ceptional leadership and 
steadfast commitment to 
advancing  thriving, more 
equitable communities.      

In recognition for her 
initiatives to further eco-
nomic justice in the Com-
monwealth, United Way 
of Massachusetts Bay 
honored Senator Lydia 
Edwards as a Legislative 
Champion for her advoca-
cy on behalf of housing in-
stability and people expe-
riencing homelessness and 
an unshakeable courage to 
challenge existing housing 
paradigms. 

"I am deeply honored 
to be recognized by Unit-
ed Way of Massachusetts 
Bay and our community 
partners for our collective 
efforts in pursuing eco-
nomic justice and ampli-
fying community voices," 
said Senator Edwards. 
"This award is a testament 
to the power of collabora-
tion and the tireless work 
of so many dedicated indi-
viduals and organizations. 
Together, we are making 
significant strides toward 
a more equitable and just 
Commonwealth." 

“United Way of Mas-
sachusetts Bay is proud 
to recognize Senator Ed-
wards for her leadership 
building a Massachusetts 
where everyone has access 
to financial wellbeing and 
prosperity is shared across 
race and ethnicity,” said 
Tom Samoluk, U.S. Gener-
al Counsel & Head of U.S. 
Government Relations at 
John Hancock. “Senator 
Edwards is a changemak-
er, a ‘good trouble’ maker 
and a policymaker who is 
blazing trails for commu-
nities across the Common-
wealth.” 

Also honored were Sen-
ator Brendan Crighton, 
Senator Pavel Payano, 
Senator Jason Lewis, Rep-
resentative Aaron Michle-
witz, Representative Andy 
Vargas, and Representa-
tive Joan Meschino. 

United Way of Mas-
sachusetts Bay briefed 
lawmakers and other 
stakeholders on the orga-
nization’s new strategic 
direction embracing a new 
approach to philanthropy 
to unlock opportunities 
and amplify community 
voices, and the role pol-
icy can play in creating 
change statewide.     

“Just as legislators 
bring forward some of the 
best ideas for change from 
their constituents and their 

stories, we also believe 
that creative, innovative 
solutions are rooted in the 
lived experiences of peo-
ple who have faced - and 
overcome – the systemic, 
entrenched barriers that 
held them back,” said 
Karley Ausiello, Chief of 
Community Impact.   

As part of its new ap-
proach to philanthropy 
and advancing equity, 
United Way of Massachu-
setts Bay has increased its 
investments in organiza-
tions amplifying commu-
nity voices in policy and 
advocacy.  

“This  increased invest-
ment in our public policy 
portfolio of $1.2 million 
shows we are deeply com-
mitted through our New 
Way Forward to working 
in partnership with the 
Legislature and commu-
nity partners who are also 
invested in creating sys-
tem change through policy 
and advocacy,” said Chris-
ti Staples, Vice President 
of Policy and Government 
Relations.  

United Way of Massa-
chusetts Bay’s public poli-
cy partners include Action 
for Boston Community 
Development, Alliance of 
Massachusetts YMCAs, 
Boston After School & 
Beyond, Citizens' Housing 
and Planning Association, 
Codman Square Neigh-
borhood Development 
Corporation, Inc., Comu-
nidades Enraizadas Com-
munity Land Trust, Inc., 
Essex County Community 
Organization, Fortaleza, 
Inc., Harborlight Commu-
nity Partners, Lawrence 
CommunityWorks, Mas-
sachusetts Advocates for 
Children, Massachusetts 
Afterschool  Partnership, 
Massachusetts Associa-
tion of Community De-
velopment Corporations, 
Massachusetts Housing 
and Shelter Alliance, Inc., 
Massachusetts Immigrant 
and Refugee Advocacy 
Coalition, Inc, Massachu-
setts Taxpayers Founda-
tion, Inc., Strategies for 
Children, The Midas Col-
laborative, Inc., UTEC 
Inc., Vietnamese Ameri-
can Initiative for Devel-
opment, Youth Justice and 
Power Union (YJPU). 

United Way of Massa-
chusetts Bay has played a 
critical role over the past 
six months in partnering 
with the Commonwealth 
to ensure families with 
children and pregnant 
women have access to 
emergency shelter. To 
date, UWMB has launched 
11 SafetyNet Shelter sites 
that support an estimated 
225 families daily through 
the $5M SafetyNet Shelter 
program. 

THE MORE Things Change ...
Items selected from past issues of the Winthrop Sun, The Winthrop Review, The Winthrop Visitor,  The 

Transcript and The Sun-Transcript

10 years ago
July 9, 2014
Those who didn't get a 

chance to share their two 
cents on the $1 billion ca-
sino proposal by Mohegan 
Sun last month will get an-
other shot on July 15 in the 
Revere High School Audi-
torium. According to the 
Mass. Gaming Commis-
sion (MGC), the purpose 
of this hearing is solely to 
provide an opportunity for 
those members of the pub-
lic who signed up to speak 
at the June 24 hearing, but 
were not given the oppor-
tunity to provide input to 
the MGC.

Peter Struzziero, Direc-
tor of the Winthrop Public 
Library, had the honor of 
speaking at the national 
conference and exhibition 
of the American Library 
Association (ALA) in Las 
Vegas recently. The ALA 
is the nation's oldest and 
largest library association 
with more than 62,000 
members.

The annual Winthrop 
Horribles Parade went off 
without a hitch, albeit one 
day late on Saturday, July 
5. The July 4th tradition, 
like most other events, was 
postponed a day because 
of the effects of Hurricane 
Arthur. Saturday proved 
to be a beautiful day and 
there was no shortage of 
patriotic fun despite the 
change of date.

 
20 years ago
July 15, 2004
Saturday's Sandcastle 

Festival and Family Beach 
Day at Yirrell Beach, spon-
sored by the Parks and 
Recreation Dept. and the 
Chamber of Commerce, 
was enjoyed by hundreds 
of local residents.

The upcoming Dem-
ocratic National Con-
vention in Boston is less 
than two weeks away and 
promises to bring traffic 
headaches for local res-
idents. Fire Chief Larry 
Powers said that dozens of 
streets and major arteries 
leading into the city will 
be shut down to accom-
modate convention mem-
bers.

Members of the Cem-
etery Commission have 
stated their opposition to 
the proposal for a canine 
park and dog walk on 
Kennedy Rd. adjacent to 

the Belle Isle section of 
the Winthrop Cemetery. 
The selectmen urged the 
Cemetery Commissioners 
to meet with the Canine 
Control Committee to dis-
cuss the issue.

Police Chief David 
Goldstein said his depart-
ment is investigating re-
ports of gang-related vio-
lence which involved two 
groups of youths fighting 
this past week.

30 years ago
July 21, 1994
A motorcyclist remains 

in critical condition after 
colliding with an automo-
bile on Main St. Saturday. 
Russell Pooler, 44, of 25 
Somerset Ave., was trav-
eling on Main St. when an 
automobile from the other 
direction made a left turn 
onto Marshall St., alleged-
ly in front of Pooler, caus-
ing the accident.

The Appeals Board has 
turned down a request 
from the Frontier Group 
Inc. for a special permit 
to enlarge the Cliff House 
Nursing Home. A large 
number of area residents 
had opposed the permit, 
citing increased noise and 
traffic congestion.

The death of a 36 year 
old local woman has been 
ruled an accident, accord-
ing to Winthrop Police 
Lieut. Mike McManus. 
An eyewitness said that 
the woman had been sing-
ing from the balcony of 
her third floor condo unit 
at 247 Washington Ave. 
when she swung a leg over 
the railing, appeared to 
lose her balance, and then 
fell to her death.

Bondholders of the $12 
million worth of bonds of 
the former Winthrop Hos-
pital will receive no more 
than 20 cents on the dollar 
and unsecured creditors 
of the hospital will get no 
more than 13 cents on the 
dollar pursuant to the lat-
est proposed reorganiza-
tion of the bankrupt hos-
pital. The mortgage holder 
of the building, Pioneer 
Bank, which bought the 
Winthrop Savings Bank, 
will see only pennies on 
the dollar because the 
buildings are worth only 
a fraction of the mortgage 
amount.

The Winthrop Arts As-
sociation's third annual 

Summer Arts and Crafts 
Exhibition is underway 
and will last through the 
end of July.

Vandals are believed 
responsible for two fires, 
one in the yard of the Bo-
nacorso Construction Co. 
that destroyed a boat and 
damaged two others, and 
the second in the Hodgk-
ins Auto Repair yard that 
destroyed one car and 
damaged two others. The 
vandals also stole a vehi-
cle.

The Board of Directors 
of the Winthrop Golf Club 
has voted against installing 
a safety net along Veterans 
Rd., rejecting the pleas of 
area business owner Irv 
Streeter and others, who 
cited the safety problems 
created by stray drives on 
the fourth hole that threat-
en passing cars and pedes-
trians.

40 years ago
August 1, 1984
Representatives of the 

North Suffolk Mental 
Health Association spoke 
to residents who are con-
cerned about the agency's 
plans to occupy a home in 
a residential area in which 
patients will be hosted in a 
group setting

Ernest Caggiano is the 
new President of the Win-
throp Rotary Club.

 
50 years ago
July 31, 1974
Winthrop firefighters 

are being credited with 
saving a 44-foot ketch 
from total destruction af-
ter they responded to a 
fire that had been set by 
vandals. Quick action in 
getting water poured onto 
the fire saved the Gloria, 
which is owned by a  Re-
vere man. Elks' custodian 
Salty Frazier first noticed 
smoke from the boat at 
8:00 a.m. Friday. Deputy 
Harbormaster Fred Rupp 
towed the boat from its 
mooring near Washington 
Ave. and beached it on a 
mudflat near the Elks, thus 
enabling firefighters to 
reach the vessel with their 
hoses.

60 years ago
July 30, 1964
Groundbreaking ex-

ercises were held for the 
new Winthrop Senior High 
School at Veterans Field 

last week.  The class offi-
cers of the Class of 1965, 
led by President Lance 
MacFarland, shared the 
honor of digging in with 
the first shovel. The town 
has sold $2.76 million 
worth of bonds at a rate of 
3.24 percent to finance the 
school's construction.

William Egan, chairman 
of the Advisory Commit-
tee for the past four years, 
is wanted for allegedly 
embezzling $20,000 from 
his employer, the Fiducia-
ry Trust Group of Boston. 
Egan has not been seen at 
his home on Maple Rd. 
since June 22.

70 years ago
July 29, 1954
Winthrop State Rep. 

Thomas E. Key was sworn 
in as a special justice of the 
East Boston District Court 
by Gov. Christian A. Hert-
er last week. Selectman 
Andrew Brenson, a Dem-
ocrat, has announced his 
intention to run for Key's 
seat. Fred A. Baumeister, 
a  Republican like Key, 
has announced his candi-
dacy for the post. On hand 
for the swearing-in cere-
monies were Judge Key's 
wife and three children, 
Daniel, 8, Heather, 6, and 
Thomas, 9.

Winthrop shoppers nev-
er have had it so good as 
now with the start of Vi-
king Dollar Days spon-
sored by the merchants 
of the Chamber of Com-
merce. Among the top 
buys is a 21-inch RCA 
console TV at Brill's for 
$289.95.

80 years ago
July 29, 1944
The newly-formed Cit-

izens League of Winthrop 
has declared war on un-
sightly debris and glass 
on Winthrop Beach. The 
group will seek to fill the 
gap created by the man-
power shortage that is 
handicapping the MDC.

90 years ago
July 28, 1934
Some 300 families from 

Winthrop enjoyed the an-
nual outing of the Mass. 
Bay Yacht Club Associa-
tion at Ft. Andrews. Alto-
gether, an estimated 1200 
families were on hand.

See YEARS Page 13



Page 12	 The Winthrop Sun Transcript • Thursday, July 11, 2024	 Email: editor@winthroptranscript.com

LEGAL NOTICE

PUBLIC 
HEARING 
DATE OF 

JULY 16, 2024
Notice is hereby given in 
accordance with Section 
2.9 (c) of the Code of the 
Town of Winthrop that 
the Winthrop Town Coun-
cil will conduct a Public 
Hearing on Tuesday, July 
16, 2024 in the Harvey 
Room. 
 Meeting will begin 
at 6:300PM that the 
Town Council transfer 
$80,000 from the Capital 
Stabilization Fund to the 
Stormwater Engineering 
special article account for 
Phase 2 of the Stormwa-
ter Study for the Tileston 
Rd, Girdlestone Rd, and 
Pico Ave Areas.
All information pertain-
ing to this Public Hearing 
can be reviewed at Win-
throp Town Hall , Room 5 
Town Clerks Office
Denise Quist
Council Clerk

7/11/24
W

LEGAL NOTICE
COMMONWEALTH

OF MASSACHUSETTS
THE TRIAL COURT

PROBATE AND
FAMILY COURT

Suffolk Division
24 New Chardon St.
Boston, MA 02114
(617) 788-8300

CITATION ON
PETITION FOR

FORMAL 
ADJUDICATION

Docket No.
SU24P1324EA

Estate of:
Richard L.

Zygala
Date of Death:
04/06/2024

To all interested persons:
A Petition for Formal 
Probate of Will with 
Appointment of Personal 
Representative has been 
filed by Arthur Wood, 
III of Wilmington, MA 
requesting that the Court 
enter a formal Decree 
and Order and for such 
other relief as requested 
in the Petition.
The Petitioner requests 
that: Arthur Wood, III 
of Wilmington, MA, be 
appointed as Personal 
Representative(s) of 
said estate to serve 
Without Surety on the 
bond in unsupervised 
administration.
IMPORTANT NOTICE
You have the right to 
obtain a copy of the Pe-
tition from the Petitioner 
or at the Court. You have 

a right to object to this 
proceeding. To do so, you 
or your attorney must 
file a written appearance 
and objection at this 
Court before: 10:00 a.m. 
on the return day of 
07/30/2024.
This is NOT a hearing 
date, but a deadline by 
which you must file a 
written appearance and 
objection if you object 
to this proceeding. If 
you fail to file a timely 
written appearance and 
objection followed by an 
affidavit of objections 
within thirty days (30) 
days of the return day, 
action may be taken 
without further notice 
to you.
UNSUPERVISED 
ADMINISTRATION UNDER 
THE MASSACHUSETTS 
UNIFORM PROBATE CODE 
(MUPC)
A Personal Representa-
tive appointed under the 
MUPC in an unsupervised 
ad ministration is not 
required to file an 
inventory or annual 
accounts with the Court. 
Persons interested in 
the estate are entitled to 
notice regarding the ad-
ministration directly from 
the Personal Represen-
tative and may petition 
the Court in any matter 
relating to the estate, 
including the distribution 
of assets and expenses of 
administration.
WITNESS, Hon. Brian J. 
Dunn, First Justice of this 
Court.
Date: June 24, 2024
Stephanie L. Everett,Esq.
Register of Probate

07/11/24
W

LEGAL NOTICE

COMMONWEALTH OF 
MASSACHUSETTS

LAND COURT
DEPARTMENT OF 
THE TRIAL COURT

Docket No. 
24 SM 001833

ORDER OF 
NOTICE

TO:
John O’Connor

and to all persons 
entitled to the benefit of 
the Servicemembers Civil 
Relief Act, 50 U.S.C. c. 50 
§ 3901 (et seq)
U.S. Bank Trust National 
Association, not in its 
individual capacity, but 
solely in its capacity 
as trustee of Citigroup 
Mortgage Loan Trust 
2022-RP5
claiming to have an 
interest in a Mortgage 
covering real property 
in Winthrop, numbered 

115 Read Street, given 
by Barbara J. O’Connor 
and John O’Connor and 
Jason O’Connor to Fleet 
National Bank, dated 
March 18, 2003, and 
recorded in the Suffolk 
County Registry of Deeds  
in Book 30927, Page 19, 
and now held by Plaintiff 
by assignment, has/
have filed with this court 
a complaint for determi-
nation of Defendant’s/
Defendants’ Servicemem-
bers status.
If you now are, or 
recently have been, in 
the active military service 
of the United States of 
America, then you may 
be entitled to the benefits 
of the Servicemembers 
Civil Relief Act.  If you 
object to a foreclosure 
of the above-mentioned 
property on that basis, 
then you or your attorney 
must file a written 
appearance and answer 
in this court at Three 
Pemberton Square, 
Boston, MA  02108 on 
or before 08/05/2024 
or you may lose the 
opportunity to challenge 
the foreclosure on the 
ground of noncompliance 
with the Act.
Witness, Gordon H. Piper, 
Chief Justice of this Court 
on 6/25/2024
Attest:
Deborah J. Patterson
Recorder

7/11/24
W

LEGAL NOTICE
MORTGAGEE’S NOTICE 

OF SALE OF 
REAL ESTATE

By virtue and in execu-
tion of the Power of Sale 
contained in a certain 
Mortgage given by 
Marguerite A. Cambria 
and Mark F. Cambria 
to Mortgage Electronic 
Registration Systems, 
Inc., as nominee for Ally 
Bank, its successors and 
assigns, dated February 
23, 2012 and registered 
with the Suffolk County 
Registry District of the 
Land Court as Document 
Number 801298 noted on 
Certificate of Title Num-
ber 134756, subsequent-
ly assigned to Ocwen 
Loan Servicing, LLC by 
Mortgage Electronic 
Registration Systems, 
Inc., as nominee for Ally 
Bank, its successors and 
assigns by assignment 
registered with Suffolk 
County Registry District 
of the Land Court as Doc-
ument Number 849613 
noted on Certificate of 
Title Number 134756, 
subsequently assigned 
to Ocwen Loan Servicing, 
LLC by Mortgage Electron-

ic Registration Systems, 
Inc., as nominee for Ally 
Bank, its successors and 
assigns by assignment 
registered with Suffolk 
County Registry District 
of the Land Court as Doc-
ument Number 890891 
noted on Certificate of 
Title Number 134756, 
subsequently assigned to 
New Penn Financial LLC 
dba Shellpoint Mortgage 
Servicing by Ocwen Loan 
Servicing, LLC by assign-
ment registered with 
Suffolk County Registry 
District of the Land Court 
as Document Number 
893371 noted on Cer-
tificate of Title Number 
134756, subsequently 
assigned to U.S. Bank 
National Association, not 
in its individual capacity 
but solely as Trustee for 
the RMAC Trust, Series 
2016-CTT by NewRez 
LLC, f/k/a New Penn 
Financial, LLC, d/b/a 
Shellpoint Mortgage 
Servicing by assignment 
registered with Suffolk 
County Registry District 
of the Land Court as Doc-
ument Number 904430 
noted on Certificate of 
Title Number 134756 for 
breach of the conditions 
of said Mortgage and for 
the purpose of foreclos-
ing same will be sold at 
Public Auction at 2:00 PM 
on August 1, 2024 at 16 
Pebble Avenue, Winthrop, 
MA, all and singular the 
premises described in 
said Mortgage, to wit:
SITUATED IN THE COUNTY 
OF SUFFOLK AND STATE 
OF MASSACHUSETTS: 
SAID LAND IS SHOWN 
AS LOT 305-B ON A 
SUBDIVISION PLAN 
DRAWN BY WHITMAN 
AND HOWARD, CIVIL 
ENGINEERS, DATED APRIL 
1, 1920, AS APPROVED 
BY THE COURT, FILED IN 
THE LAND REGISTRATION 
OFFICE AS PLAN NUMBER 
137-XII, A COPY OF A 
PORTION OF WHICH IS 
FILED WITH CERTIFICATE 
OF TITLE NUMBER 11877. 
THERE IS APPURTENANT 
TO THE ABOVE DESCRIBED 
LAND THE RIGHT TO USE 
SAID PEBBLE AVENUE 
FOR ALL ORDINARY AND 
USUAL PURPOSES IN 
COMMON WITH OTHERS 
ENTITLED THERETO. FOR 
TITLE REFERENCE SEE 
DEED BOOK 608 PAGE 
121 REGISTERED LAND 
FOR TITLE REFERENCE SEE 
CERTIFICATE NO. 122521
PPN: 5 141
MARGUERITE A. CAMBRIA 
AND MARK F. CAMBRIA, 
HUSBAND AND WIFE, TEN-
ANTS BY THE ENTIRETY
16 PEBBLE AVENUE, 
WINTHROP MA 02152
The premises are to 
be sold subject to and 
with the benefit of all 
easements, restrictions, 

encroachments, building 
and zoning laws, liens, 
unpaid taxes, tax titles, 
water bills, municipal 
liens and assessments, 
rights of tenants and 
parties in possession, and 
attorney’s fees and costs.
TERMS OF SALE:
A deposit of TEN 
THOUSAND DOLLARS AND 
00 CENTS ($10,000.00) 
in the form of a certified 
check, bank treasurer’s 
check or money order 
will be required to be 
delivered at or before the 
time the bid is offered. 
The successful bidder will 
be required to execute a 
Foreclosure Sale Agree-
ment immediately after 
the close of the bidding. 
The balance of the pur-
chase price shall be paid 
within thirty (30) days 
from the sale date in the 
form of a certified check, 
bank treasurer’s check or 
other check satisfactory 
to Mortgagee’s attorney. 
The Mortgagee reserves 
the right to bid at the 
sale, to reject any and all 
bids, to continue the sale 
and to amend the terms 
of the sale by written or 
oral announcement made 
before or during the fore-
closure sale. If the sale is 
set aside for any reason, 
the Purchaser at the sale 
shall be entitled only to 
a return of the deposit 
paid. The purchaser shall 
have no further recourse 
against the Mortgagor, 
the Mortgagee or the 
Mortgagee’s attorney. 
The description of the 
premises contained in 
said mortgage shall 
control in the event of an 
error in this publication. 
TIME WILL BE OF THE 
ESSENCE.
Other terms, if any, to be 
announced at the sale.
U.S. Bank National 
Association, not in its 
individual capacity 
but solely as trustee for 
the RMAC Trust, Series 
2016-CTT
Present Holder of said 
Mortgage,
By Its Attorneys,
ORLANS PC
PO Box 540540
Waltham, MA 02454
Phone: (781) 790-7800
23-000780

7/11/24, 7/18/24, 
7/25/24

W

LEGAL NOTICE
BOARD OF LICENSE 
COMMISSIONERS

PUBLIC HEARING July 
17, 2024

Notice is hereby given in 
accordance with Chapter 
138 of the Massachusetts 
General Laws and 

Title 5 of the Town of 
Winthrop’s Board of 
License Commissioners 
will conduct a public 
hearing on Wednesday, 
July 17, 2024 on or after 
6:00 p.m. in the Harvey 
Hearing Room upon  
the Win-throp Chamber 
of Commerce One Day 
Liquor License for the 
End of Summer Fest 
on August 25, 2024 in 
French Square, Winthrop 
Center, Winthrop MA 
02152 from 11:00 AM to 
3:00 PM.
At said hearing, all 
interested persons will be 
given an opportunity to 
be heard.
All documents pertaining 
to this hearing can be 
requested per email 
mpuopo-lo@town.win-
throp.ma.us , Town Hall 
Room 5, Clerks Office or 
calling 617-846-1742
Marilyn Puopolo
Clerk-Board of License

7/11/24
W

LEGAL NOTICE

Planning Board
 PUBLIC HEARING 

July 22, 2024
Notice is hereby given in 
accordance with Chapter 
40A of the Massachusetts 
General Laws and Chap-
ter 17 of the Code of the 
Town of Winthrop that 
the Winthrop Planning 
Board will conduct a pub-
lic hearing on Monday, 
July 22, 2024, at or after 
7:00 p.m. held in the 
Harvey Hearing Room 
upon the application of 
person requesting: 
7 Madison Avenue
7 Madison Avenue, LLC.
The Applicant seeks to 
redevelop the former 
Bangs Moving and Stor-
age Building to create 
a mixed-use building 
with 23 apartments and 
commercial office space.  
The apartment mix is 
sixteen (16)- 1 bedrooms 
and seven (7)- 2-bed-
room units.
The public is invited to 
attend, and interested 
parties shall have an 
opportunity to be heard. 
Copies of the application 
and plans are on file and 
available to review at the 
Town Hall Planning Of-
fice, Room 2A, Winthrop 
Town Hall. 
Darren Baird, Chairman
Denise Quist, Town Clerk
Winthrop Board of 
Appeals

7/11/24, 7/18/24
W

LEGAL NOTICE

BOARD OF APPEALS 
PUBLIC HEARING
 July 25, 2024

Case 012- 2024:
Notice is hereby given in 
accordance with Chapter 
40A of the Massachu-
setts General Laws and 
Chapter 17 of the Code 
of the Town of Winthrop 
that the Winthrop Board 
of Appeals will conduct 
a public hearing on 
Thursday, July 25, 
2024, at or after 6:30 
p.m. held in the Harvey 
Hearing Room upon the 
application of person 
requesting: 
63- 69 Putnam Street
Tieri Realty 63 LLC.- An-
tonio Tieri, President- 45 
Walnut Street, Revere, 
MA 02151
The proposed project is a 
mixed use (commercial/ 
residential) proposal 
for the redevelopment 
of the former Surf 
Cleaners building as 
part of the continued 
redevelopment of the 
63- 69 Putnam Street 
lot.  The proposed project 
is for sixteen (16)- 1 
bedroom unit apartments 
with common area, gym, 
and 13 enclosed parking 
spaces.  The adjoining 
building was redeveloped 
in 2005 and contains 
a commercial space 
which is occupied by a 
daycare and two (2)- 
2-bedroom apartments 
on the second floor.  The 
project has applied for a 
variance for a side yard 
setback.  Additionally, 
the ASPR denotes both 
a parking variance and 
total maximum coverage 
variance is required.  
However, Applicant is 
showing parking and 
maximum coverage 
compliance The public 
is invited to attend, and 
interested parties shall 
have an opportunity to 
be heard. Copies of the 
application and plans are 
on file and available to 
review at the Town Hall 
Planning Office, Room 
2A, Winthrop Town Hall. 
Darren Baird, Chairman
Denise Quist, Town Clerk
Winthrop Board of 
Appeals

7/11/24, 7/18/24
W

LEGAL NOTICE

BOARD OF APPEALS 
PUBLIC HEARING 
July 25, 2024: 

Case 011- 2024.
Notice is hereby given in 
accordance with Chapter 
40A of the Massachu-
setts General Laws and 
Chapter 17 of the Code 
of the Town of Winthrop 
that the Winthrop Board 
of Appeals will conduct 
a public hearing on 
Thursday, July 25,2024 
at or after 6:30 p.m. 
held in the Harvey 
Hearing Room upon the 
application of person 
requesting: 
7 Madison Avenue, 
Winthrop, MA 02152
7 Madison Avenue, 
LLC. - 7 Madison Avenue, 
Winthrop, MA 02152
Because the current 
building has reached 
the end of its use, the 
Applicant is seeking the 
following Variances: re-
lief of rear yard setback, 
relief of max stories, and 
relief of parking.
The public is invited to 
attend, and interested 
parties shall have an 
opportunity to be heard. 
Copies of the application 
and plans are on file and 
available to review at the 
Town Hall Planning Of-
fice, Room 2A, Winthrop 
Town Hall. 
Darren Baird, Chairman
Denise Quist, Town Clerk
Winthrop Board of 
Appeals

7/11/24, 7/18, 24
W

LEGAL NOTICE

Planning Board 
PUBLIC HEARING

July 22, 2024
Notice is hereby given in 
accordance with Chapter 
40A of the Massachusetts 
General Laws and Chap-
ter 17 of the Code of the 
Town of Winthrop that 
the Winthrop Planning 
Board will conduct a pub-
lic hearing on Monday, 
July 22, 2024, at or after 
7:00 p.m. held in the 
Harvey Hearing Room 
upon the application of 
person requesting: 
63- 69 Putnam Street
Tieri Realty 63 LLC.- An-
tonio Tieri, President- 45 
Walnut Street, Revere, 
MA 02151
The proposed project is a 
mixed use (commercial/ 
residential) proposal 
for the redevelopment 
of the former Surf 
Cleaners building as 
part of the continued 
redevelopment of the 
63- 69 Putnam Street 
lot.  The proposed project 
is for sixteen (16)- 1 
bedroom unit apartments 
with common area, gym, 
and 13 enclosed parking 

spaces.  The adjoining 
building was redeveloped 
in 2005 and contains 
a commercial space 
which is occupied by a 
daycare and two (2)- 
2-bedroom apartments 
on the second floor.  The 
project has applied for a 
variance for a side yard 
setback.  Additionally, 
the ASPR denotes both 
a parking variance and 
total maximum coverage 
variance is required.  
However, Applicant is 
showing parking and 
maximum coverage 
compliance.
The public is invited to 
attend, and interested 
parties shall have an 
opportunity to be heard. 
Copies of the application 
and plans are on file and 
available to review at the 
Town Hall Planning Of-
fice, Room 2A, Winthrop 
Town Hall. 
Darren Baird, Chairman
Denise Quist, Town Clerk
Winthrop Board of 
Appeals

7/11/24, 7/18/24
W

LEGAL NOTICE

Planning Board 
PUBLIC HEARING 

July 22, 2024
Notice is hereby given in 
accordance with Chapter 
40A of the Massachusetts 
General Laws and Chap-
ter 17 of the Code of the 
Town of Winthrop that 
the Winthrop Planning 
Board will conduct a pub-
lic hearing on Monday, 
July 22, 2024, at or after 
7:00 p.m. held in the 
Harvey Hearing Room 
upon the application of 
person requesting: 
22- 24 Pauline Street- 
Winthrop, MA 02152
Rellen , LLC
The proposed project is 
a demo of an existing 
mixed-use building and 
construct a three story, 
mixed- use building 
with six units per plan 
submitted in the Center 
Business District.
The public is invited to 
attend, and interested 
parties shall have an 
opportunity to be heard. 
Copies of the application 
and plans are on file and 
available to review at the 
Town Hall Planning Of-
fice, Room 2A, Winthrop 
Town Hall. 
Darren Baird, Chairman
Denise Quist, Town Clerk
Winthrop Board of 
Appeals
7/11/24, 7/18/24

LEGAL NOTICES

LOCAL STUDENTS EARN ACADEMIC HONORS

EMMANUEL 
COLLEGE 
CELEBRATES 
COMMENCEMENT 
EXERCISES

Emmanuel College 
in Boston celebrated its 
102nd Commencement , 
adding hundreds of gradu-
ates to the global network 
of Emmanuel alumni who 
are making their mark on 
the world. The following 
local students graduated 
from Emmanuel:

Colby Bosse of Win-
throp. Bosse received 
a Bachelor of Arts in a 
double major in Liberal 
Studies and Elementary 
Education during the cer-
emony. Bosse graduated 
magna cum laude.

Jillian Lerner of Win-
throp  Lerner received a 
Bachelor of Arts in Crim-
inology & Criminal Jus-
tice during the ceremony. 
Lerner graduated summa 
cum laude.

Michael Gillis of Win-
throp . Gillis received a 
Bachelor of Arts in Math-
ematics with a concentra-
tion in Statistics during the 
ceremony. Gillis graduat-
ed summa cum laude.
RESIDENT NAMED 
TO DEAN'S LIST 
AT UNIVERSITY OF 
NEW ENGLAND

Jack Sicurella of Win-
throp has been named 
to the Dean's List for the 
2024 spring semester at 

the University of New En-
gland. Dean's List students 
have attained a grade point 
average of 3.3 or better out 
of a possible 4.0 at the end 
of the semester.

GILLIS EARNS 
SPOT ON 
EMMANUEL 
COLLEGE SPRING 
2024 DEAN'S LIST

Emmanuel College in 
Boston has named Mi-
chael Gillis of Winthrop 
to the Dean's List for the 
Spring 2024 Semester. To 
earn a spot on the Dean's 
List, Emmanuel students 
must achieve a grade point 
average of 3.5 or higher 
for a 16-credit semester.

EMMANUEL 
COLLEGE 
ANNOUNCES  
DEAN’S LIST

In recognition of their 
outstanding academic 
achievement, Emmanuel 
College has named more 
than 800 students to the 
Dean’s List for the Spring 
2024 semester. To earn a 
spot on the Dean’s List, 
Emmanuel students must 
achieve a grade point av-
erage of 3.5 or higher for a 
16-credit semester.

Michael Gillis of Win-
throp was among those 
named.

URI CELEBRATES 
MORE THAN 4,100 
NEW GRADUATES 
DURING 2024 
COMMENCEMENT

The University of 
Rhode Island (URI) cele-
brated more than 4,100 of 
its newest alumni during 
the University's 2024 
Commencement. Nearly 
4,000 undergraduate de-
grees and 800 graduate 
degrees were conveyed to 
students during the cere-
monies which took place 
May 17-19, 2024.

Among them were:
• Daniella Zanelli
• Blinere Bytyqi 

MORE THAN 6,800 
URI STUDENTS 
NAMED TO SPRING 
2024 DEAN'S LIST

The University of 
Rhode Island is pleased 
to announce the Spring 
2024 Dean's List. Stu-
dents named to the Dean's 
List represent nearly all 
of Rhode Island's cities 
and towns, all six New 
England states, New York 
and New Jersey, and many 
other states and countries. 
They include:

• Blinere Bytyqi of 
Winthrop

• Summer Tallent of 
Winthrop 

To be included on the 
Dean's List, full-time stu-
dents must have complet-
ed 12 or more credits for 

letter grades which are 
GPA applicable during a 
semester and achieved at 
least a 3.30 quality point 
average. Part-time stu-
dents qualify with the ac-
cumulation of 12 or more 
credits for letter grades 
which are GPA applica-
ble earning at least a 3.30 
quality point average.

TOLLIVER NAMED 
TO HAMILTON 
COLLEGE DEAN'S 
LIST

Madelaine Tolliver, of 
Winthrop has been named 
to the Dean's List at Ham-
ilton College for the spring 
2024 semester.

To be named to the 
Dean's List, a student must 
have carried a course load 
of four or more graded 
credits throughout the se-
mester and earned an av-
erage GPA of 3.5 or above 
on a 4.0 scale.

Tolliver, a rising junior 
majoring in psychology, 
is a graduate of Winthrop 
High School.

LOCAL STUDENTS 
GRADUATE FROM 
TEC CONNECTIONS 
ACADEMY

Skyla Del Valle and 
Elissa Del Valle of Win-
throp were among more 
than 370 seniors gradu-
ating in June from TEC 
Connections Academy 
(TECCA). TEC Connec-

tions Academy enrollment 
has grown steadily from 
about 240 students 10 
years ago to nearly 3,000 
today with students rep-
resenting every county in 
Massachusetts.

TEC Connections 
Academy’s Class of 2024 
consists of graduates from 
many cities and towns 
across the state, including 
Worcester, Springfield, 
Lowell and more. Among 
the graduating class, near-
ly 40 percent plan to attend 
two- or four-year colleges 
or universities such as 
Providence College, Bos-
ton University, Harvard 
University, and the Uni-
versity of Massachusetts 
Lowell. Nearly 11 percent 
of the graduates plan to 
attend vocational school 
or pursue performing arts 
and athletics, while others 
plan to enter the work-
force, join the military, 
take a gap year, and more.

TEC Connections 
Academy is a tuition-free, 
online public school for 
K-12 students that offers 
a safe virtual learning en-
vironment where empow-
ered students direct their 
own educational journey. 
At TEC Connections 
Academy, state-certified 
teachers with expertise in 
the virtual environment 
foster meaningful connec-
tions with students and 
families. In addition to 
academics, teachers focus 
on building fundamental 
life skills, and tailor the 

curriculum to meet student 
needs. Students who enroll 
in the school join a collab-
orative community of their 
fellow students and educa-
tors that provides a wel-
coming, distraction-free 
learning environment.

For more information 
on TEC Connections 
Academy, please vis-
it call 800–382–6010 or 
visit www.TECConnec-
tionsAcademy.com.

TOLLIVER OF 
WINTHROP, MA 
INDUCTED INTO 
HONOR SOCIETY

Emerson College stu-
dent Jackson Tolliver of 
Winthrop, MA 02152 is 
one of 104 seniors and 
juniors inducted into Em-
erson’s Gold Key Honor 
Society on April 3, 2024 in 
a ceremony in the Semel 
Theater located in Boston, 
Massachusetts.

The Gold Key Hon-
or Society is an interdis-
ciplinary organization 
founded at Emerson in 
1962 to “recognize and 
encourage outstanding 
academic achievement.” 
Juniors in the top 5 per-
cent of their class, and se-
niors in the top 10 percent 
of their class who earn at 
least 48 credits are eligi-
ble.

Jackson Tolliver is ma-
joring in Journalism and is 
a member of the Class of 
2024.
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CONTRACTOR

MOVERS

MASONRY

Ronnie Z.
Leave Your  

Moving To Us
Whether It Be One Piece or More!

Call Ronnie
781-321-2499

For A Free Estimate

10% OFF FOR SENIOR CITIZENS, 
VETERANS & DISABLED

2 col. x 1 inch
$120.00

2 col. x 1 inch
$120.00

Your 
Ad 

Here

CONSTRUCTION

HOME
REPAIR?
Call AL COY
617-539-0489

Masonry &
Chimney Pointing,

Carpentry & Odd Jobs

We Clean
& Repair
Gutters

CLEANING SERVICES

Winthrop'Winthrop's s Professional Service DirectoryProfessional Service Directory

1 col. x  
1 inch
$60.00

For 3 Months
($5/wk)

L. P.
CONTRACTING

LUIGI:
(617) 846-0142

FREE ESTIMATES
… LICENSED …

INSURED

Building & Remodeling

Kitchen ✧ Bathroom
Additions ✧ Porches

Replacement windows
Garages ✧ Decks
Siding - All Types

MORELLI MASONRY & TILE
All Types of Masonry Repair, Ceramic Tile, 

Concrete Pours, Chimneys, Stairs, Walls,  
Cutting & Pointing • Restoration Cleaning

Fully Insured • No Job Too Small
Dennis Morelli

781-632-8812

mr. fix it
REPAIR MOST 

ANYTHING, DOORS, 
WINDOWS PORCHES, 

REPLACEMENT 
WINDOWS, FENCES, 

SIDING, FLOORS ETC.
SNOW PLOWING

LICENSED AND INSURED
CALL AL  

617-429-0606

handy man services

Spartan 
Cleaning 
ServiCe

Since 1978

COMMERCIAL  
RESIDENTIAL

CARPET AND UPHOLSTERY
CLEANING

Satisfaction Guaranteed
Call

617-593-4532
617-567-2926

Removes Dirt • Cleans • Deodorizes
Complete Office Cleaning

Tommy Feeley 781-771-4707Tommy Feeley 781-771-4707

Feeley & Daughters Clean-Up ServiceFeeley & Daughters Clean-Up Service
We remove all We remove all 
sorts of junk!sorts of junk!
Quick & Quick & 
convenient service.convenient service.

Free Free 
estimates!estimates!

M
OONEY ELECTRIC LLC

Residential & 
Commercial

Fully Licensed & Insured

KEVIN MOONEY
781-799-1862

• Painting & Decor
• Light Carpentry
• Finish Carpentry

More than 
30 years experience

Call Dennis
781-307-0947

DH HANDYMAN

Specializing in Home Renovations
Kitchen+Bath • Cabinets, Granite Counters •Doors+Window • Decks 

Enclosurer • Pavers + Blockwalls • Additions • Interior+Exterior Painting

ALL YOUR HOME OWNER NEEDS

PAINTING & REMODELING PAINTING & REMODELING 
SERVICESSERVICES

Call Don Falzarano
617-846-6553

LANDSCAPING

RAY’S LANDSCAPING GARDENING SERVICES
Mowing - Weeding

Trimming: Bushes Shrubs
Everywhere in Front & Back Yard

New Lawn, Patios, Concrete, Brick work
Call RAY — 781-526-1181 Free Estimates!

STEVEN'S
LANDSCAPING & HARDSCAPING

Spring & Fall Clean Up • Tree Trimming
Mowing, Weeding & Edging

Hedge Trimming & Removal (shrub & bushes) 
New Lawns Installed (seed or sod)

Planting & Mulching • Fence Installation
Patios, Retaining Walls & Other Hardscapes

And more!
Call or Text

For a free estimate

781-244-9997Steven 

978-876-6566Diego

Schedule a free estimate 
617-592-6447

www.dipierroconstruction.com

In business for over 40 years!

Let us turn your house into a home

HANDYMANELECTRICIAN

BBii--WWeeeekkllyy  MMoowwiinngg  
Yard Clean Ups

Trimming | Mulch
Pressure Washing

bgservice617@gmail.com

B&G 
LANDSCAPING SERVICE 

781-407-1100781-407-1100

EXTERIORS

American Exterior and
Window Corporation

Contact us for all of your
Home improvement projects 

and necessities

Call Jeff or Bob
Toll Free: 1-888-744-1756

 americanexteriorforma.com

617-699-1782
Windows,Siding,Roofing, Carpentry 
& More! All estimates, consultations 

or inspections completed by MA 
licensed supervisors. 

*Over 50 years experience. 
*Better Business Bureau Membership.

Insured 
and

Registered

Complete Financing 
Available.

No Money Down.

Roberta Will
• Painting 

• Wall Papering 
• Decorative Painting 

• Murals 
617-846-8992

PAINTING

PLASTERING

John J. Recca 
Painting

Interior/Exterior 
Commercial/Residential

Fully Insured 
Quality Work

Reasonable Rates   
Free Estimates

781-241-2454

Joe Bertino OwnerJoe Bertino Owner
978-376-6661978-376-6661

Interior and Exterior PaintingInterior and Exterior Painting
Bertinopaintingcompany@gmail.com

POOLS

COSMO POOLS
• NEW LINERS

• INSTALLATION
•POOL OPENINGS

CALL JOHN
781-589-0505

ROOFING REPAIRS

HOME RENOVATION
ROOFING-SIDING-PAINTING

SERVING THE BOSTON AREA SINCE 2002

marcelo
de souza

617-507-1703
Lic. & insured CSL 100141LOCALLOCAL

SONNY’S
IMMEDIATE

ROOFING
778811--224488--88229977

Residential - Commercial
All types of roofing & repairs
Painting & Carpentry
Licensed
Insured
Free estimates

sonnysimmediateservices.com

TO ADVERTISE IN OUR SERVICE 
DIRECTORY, PLEASE CALL 781-

485-0588 OR EMAIL 
DEB@REVEREJOURNAL.COM

AUGUSTA 
PLASTERING

Interior/Exterior
• Blueboard • Plastering
Jim 978-777-6611

Free Estimates
978-777-6611

AABBOOVVEE  &&  IINNGGRROOUUNNDD  PPOOOOLLSS

 
781-632-5750

Opening & Closing - Liners  
Accessories - Tile replacement
Filters - Concrete reconditioning

the

Guy

Spring Clean Ups
CLOVERS 

LAWN CARE
• New Lawns Installed
•  Trees and Branches 
• Mulch & Hedges
• Mowing & Fertilizing
• Junk Removal

FREE ESTIMATES
Call Kevin

617-884-2143
cloverslawncare@gmail.com

661177--997700--66331144
Free Estimates - Fully Insured

prestigepainting75@gmail.com

PPRREESSTTIIGGEE
PPAAIINNTTIINNGG

Full Service Painters

pprreessttiiggeeppaaiinnttiinnggiinncc..uuss

8-7

PLUMBING

CALL

1 col. x  
2 inches
$120.00

UNLIMITED
Highest quality

Best prices
design   plan   build   repair

778811--991133--33775599
rjwaldron05@gmail.com

Experience the elegance

8

Charlestown  |  Chelsea  |  East Boston

Everett  |  Lynn  |  Revere  |  Winthrop

CLASSIFIEDSCLASSIFIEDS

EVERETT-PCA Needed in Everett.
Please call Susan 617-389-6190. 
Hablo Español
7-10
___________

DEADLINES: For classified line 
ads, deadlines are Monday by 
4 p.m.
___________

SELLING YOUR AUTO? Call for our 4 
week special! Call 781-485-0588.

HELP WANTED

Years //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 11

Do You Want To 
Sell Your Home?

Our Advertisers 
have clients 

waiting to buy!
List your property with one of the fine
realtors who advertise regularly in the...

SUN TRANSCRIPT

W
int

hrop’s Pioneer

Winthrop
Published by the Independent Newspaper Group

Newspaper

SOLD

The voter registration 
rolls for the state primary 
on September 20 shows 
4140 Republicans and 
1247 Democrats with the 
remainder listed as unclas-
sified.

100 years ago
August 2, 1924
Residents all over town 

are rejoicing that the old 
barn of the Cottage Park 
Hotel is being demolished. 
The barn was a fire hazard, 
especially for those who 
live in the area of Bartlett 
Rd. and Cottage Park Rd.

An advertisement in the 

Sun lists lots for sale in 
Palm Beach, Florida for 
$250, touting the area as, 
"The healthiest resort in 
the world, to which all will 
come, sooner or later."

110 years ago
August 1, 1914
Now that police have 

found the briefcase of 
the woman identified as 
Ida Taylor, whose body 
washed up on Winthrop 
Beach last week, Judge 
Brown will resume his in-
quest in East Boston Dis-
trict Court to determine 
whether she committed 

suicide or was murdered.
The recent pop concert 

at the Pt. Shirley Club was 
a great success.

120 years ago
July 30, 1904
More than 100 guests 

at the Crest Hall Hotel 
enjoyed an evening of en-
tertainment and recitation 
Saturday night.

Miss Dowling of Coral 
Ave. was killed in an ac-
cident last week when her 
horse was frightened by 
a passing automobile and 
she was thrown from her 
carriage.

SEND US YOUR NEWS
The Transcript encourages residents to submit engagement, wedding and birth 

announcements, news releases, business and education briefs, sports stories and photos for 
publication. Items should be forwarded to our offices at 385 Broadway, Revere, MA 02151.  

Items can also  be faxed to 781-485-1403.  We also encourage readers to e-mail news 
releases and photos to deb@reverejournal.com
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Photos and Story by Cary Shuman

The Town of Winthrop 
held a memorial dedica-
tion ceremony July 8 for 
U.S. Marine Corps veter-
an Lou Camacho, unveil-
ing a sign in his honor at 
the corner of Hermon and 
Atlantic Streets, across 
from the Camacho family 
home.

Winthrop Veterans Of-
ficer Phil Ronan led the 
speaking program. Ronan 
began by recognizing Mr. 
Camacho’s outstanding 
contribution to the town as 
an organizer and fundrais-
er for Winthrop annual’s 
Fourth of July fireworks 
display for 35 years.

“But he was a lot more 
than that to a lot of peo-
ple and his family and 
friends,” said Ronan. “He 
was a son, a husband, 
a dad, a grandfather, a 
brother, and an uncle, and 

a friend to many. But Lou 
was true and true a Marine 
and a war hero – that’s 
what Lou was.”

Ronan highlighted Mr. 
Camacho’s heroic service 
during the Vietnam War, 
noting that he received 

the Purple Heart Medal 
and the Bronze Star Med-
al with Combat Distin-
guished Device.

“He was just a great 
guy, a great friend, a war 
hero, and it’s the town’s 
pleasure to honor a guy 
that gave so much to the 
town,” concluded Ronan.

Rep. Jeff Turco said 
he remembered visiting 
Mr. Camacho at his vid-
eo store in town after the 
Turco family moved to 
Winthrop 20 years ago.  

“He was so kind to us wel-
coming a new family into 
town,” said Turco. “He 
had a legendary influence 
on the town in terms of 
the fireworks [displays]. 
It’s so important that we 
stand together and recog-
nize our fellow citizens 

that have given so much to 
our community and say to 
the [Camacho] family that 
we’ll never forget. And 
this sign is testament to 
the fact that Winthrop will 
never forget the great Lou 
Camacho.”

Mr. Camacho’s grand-
son, Caelen Camacho, said 

of his humble grandfather, 
“My grandfather wasn’t a 
man of many words. I’m 
going to cut it [speech] 
short in his respect and 
say, ‘He was a great man 
who probably deserves all 
of this, but he would not 
think so himself.’”

Take the MBTA Ferry
Winthrop-Quincy        Aquarium/Central Wharf

One-way fare $6.50 | Children 11 and under ride free.

$2.40 from July 5 - August 5 
during the Sumner Tunnel closure.

WINTHROP-QUINCY FERRY

Weekday Schedule

To Boston

WINTHROP QUINCY
LOGAN  

AIRPORT
SEAPORT

AQUARIUM/
CENTRAL 
WHARF

6:30 AM 6:50 AM 7:10 AM 7:20 AM 7:25 AM

8:00 AM 8:20 AM - 8:40 AM 8:45 AM

- - - - -

10:30 AM 10:50 AM 11:10 AM 11:20 AM 11:25 AM

3:30 PM 3:50 AM 4:10 PM - 4:20 PM

5:20 PM - - - 5:40 PM

6:40 PM - - 7:00 PM 7:05 PM

From  Boston

AQUARIUM/
CENTRAL 
WHARF

SEAPORT
LOGAN  

AIRPORT
QUINCY WINTHROP

7:30 AM - - - 7:45 AM

8:50 AM - 9:00 AM - -

10:00 AM - - 10:15 AM

11:30 AM - - - 11:45 AM

4:30 PM 4:35 PM - 4:50 PM 5:15 PM

5:45 PM 5:50 PM 6:00 PM 6:15 PM 6:35 PM

7:10 PM 7:15 PM 7:25 PM 7:45 PM 8:05 PM

Visit MBTA.com/Ferry for more information Tickets available on the         mTicket app.

Local business Robin’s Nest ran a raffle for the necklace  
shown above, donating the money to the Winthrop 
Fireworks Fund.  Shown above, business owner Robin 
McSorley presents Paul Flanagan with the raised funds 
for the Fireworks.

ROBIN’S NEST DONATES TO 
TOWN FIREWORKS FUND

Town holds memorial dedication ceremony 
for U.S. Marine Corps veteran Lou Camacho

The American Legion Post 146 Honor Guard rendered military honors at the ceremony for 
the late Lou Camacho, a U.S. Marine Corps veteran of the Vietnam War and Past Command-
er of Post 146.

Veterans Officer Phil Ronan 
(right) invited State Rep. 
Jeff Turco to deliver remarks 
at the ceremony.

Winthrop Veterans Officer 
Phil Ronan presides over 
the memorial dedication 
ceremony.

U.S. Coast Guard Chief Al Bell presented a military coin 
to Caelen Camacho in recognition of his grandfather Lou 
Camacho’s distinguished service to his country.

Towns Councilors Pat Costigan, Suzanne Swope, John Munson, and Max Tassinari, Rep. 
Jeff Turco, and Veterans Officer Phil Ronan are pictured with members of the family of Lou 
Camacho, Nicholas Camacho, Caelen Camacho, John Camacho, and Jean Camacho, at the 
memorial dedication ceremony.

The Camacho family stands adjacently to the memorial 
sign for U.S. Marine Corporal Ronald “Lou” Camacho fol-
lowing the ceremony. From left, are Mr. Camacho’s brother, 
John Camacho, sister-in-law, Joan Camacho, grandson, 
Caelen Camacho, and Nicholas Camacho.


