
By Cary Shuman

It’s hard to determine 
which was the most im-
pressive development at 
Tuesday night’s forum 
hosted by the Winthrop 
Republican Town Com-
mittee: the larger-than-ex-
pected turnout of more 
than 100 residents; the 
comprehensive set of 
questions presented by the 
attendees that examined 
the MBTA Communities 
Act and its impact on the 
Town of Winthrop from 
every angle; or the amaz-
ingly in-depth and direct 
responses from the panel-
ists, Rep. Jeff Turco and 
Town Council President 

James Letterie.
In responding to more 

than 90 minutes of ques-
tions from the audience, 
both Turco and Letterie 
showed that they had 
“done their homework” 
and then some on the con-
troversial MBTA Commu-
nities Act, known simply 
as “[Section] 3A,” and 
how the law will impact 
Winthrop.

Forum moderator Paul 
Caruccio, chair of the 
Winthrop Republican 
Town Committee, was 
elated by the size of the 
turnout at the two-hour 
session and the diversity 
of the questions posed by 
members of the audience. 

He said he was grateful 
for the dedication of Turco 
and Letterie.

Caruccio also men-
tioned at the outset, “Jeff’s 
wife, Melissa, is having 
her birthday tonight, and 
he is spending it with his 
community. I think that 
deserves a round of ap-
plause.”

The MBTA Commu-
nities Act, which became 
state law in 2021, re-
quires that 177 cities and 
towns, including Win-
throp (The City of Bos-
ton is exempt from the 
law, which “sticks in my 
craw”, said Turco), create 

By Adam Swift

Town Manager Tony 
Marino is proposing a 
Fiscal Year 2025 budget 
that sees a 2.68 percent in-
crease in the general fund 
over the current fiscal year.

Marino is encouraging 
residents to attend town 
finance commission meet-
ings in the coming weeks 
to take part in the budget 
discussion, where it will 
go for recommendations 
before a final town council 
approval later this spring.

The total proposed 
general fund budget is 
$61,205,014, an increase 
of about $1.5 million over 
the current fiscal year. The 
proposed budget breaks 
down to $35.9 million for 
the school department, 
$17.6 million for town de-
partments, and $7.6 mil-
lion for non-departmental 
expenses.

In his budget message, 
Marino cautioned of the 
potential need for an over-
ride prior to the FY26 

budget to handle escalat-
ing school costs.

The school committee 
is currently working on 
the finishing touches on 
its own budget propos-
al, committee member 
Gus Martucci said at this 
week’s meeting. In the 
past, the school depart-
ment has typically pre-
sented both a needs-based 
budget and a level-funded 
budget.

Marino stated that the 
proposed budget is bal-
anced and honors the town 
council’s theme and man-
date of a conservative ap-
proach to both revenues 
and expenses. 

“This budget also con-
tinues our commitment to 
consolidation, maintain-
ing a commitment to res-
ident services, public safe-
ty, and public works, all of 
which fit within the Coun-
cil’s goals for the Town, 
and still maintaining a 
commitment to responsi-

Special to the Transcript

For Kids Only After-
school (FKO) is thrilled to 
announce that it has been 
awarded a grant from the 
Winthrop Cultural Coun-
cil to enhance its commu-
nity playgroup initiative.

The community play-
group, named Rise and 
Shine, provides a wel-
coming space for parents, 
caregivers, infants, and 

toddlers. Taking place 
Monday through Friday, 
between 9:30 am and 
11:30 am, FKO Win-
throp's program space 
transforms into an interac-
tive environment specifi-
cally designed for children 
aged 0 through 5. Children 
and their caretakers can 
engage in a variety of ac-
tivities, including sensory 
play, gross motor activ-
ities in the gymnasium, 

learning stations in the 
early education classroom, 
and creative play in a mul-
tipurpose space. Since 
September, over 1,000 
sign-ups for Rise & Shine 
have occurred, fostering 
connections among near-
ly 200 families of various 
backgrounds.

With the awarded grant 
funding, FKO aims to 

Winthrop Cultural Council awards FKO 
for community playgroup, Rise and Shine
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DELAY

Due to the Patriot’s Day 
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Seaport Real Estate
We need homes to 

sell our buyers.  
Thinking of selling? Call us!

HOCKEY GAME TO 
BENEFIT DOUG 
FLUTIE AUTISM 
AWARENESS 
FOUNDATION 

The annual game fund-
raiser game to benefit 
the Doug Flutie Autism 
Awareness Foundation on 
Saturday, April 13, 2024 
at the Larsen Rink at the 
Eruzione Center. 

The puck drops at 6:30 
p.m.

REGISTRY OF 
MOTOR VEHICLES 
CAUTIONS PUBLIC 
TO BEWARE OF 
DECEPTIVE AND 
MIMIC WEBSITES 

The Massachusetts 
Registry of Motor Vehi-
cles (RMV) is reminding 
customers to use only 
Mass.Gov/RMV for in-
formation or to perform 
many transactions, includ-
ing when trying to renew 
a license or registration. 
While there has been no 
sharp increase in reports 
of deceptive and mimic 
websites to the RMV, this 
is a busy time of year for 
customer transactions so 

Town Manager 
presents proposed 
FY25 budget
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Massachusetts Grand Master of Odd Fellows Ken Fearing 
gets served by Terri Vendetti of Zenith Lodge. See more 
photos on Page ∆.

ODD FELLOWS HOLD DINNER 
FOR PAST GRAND MASTERS

PHOTO BY NANCY MARTELL

The path of the April 8 eclipse as seen from the Greater Boston area.

WATCHING THE APRIL 2024 ECLIPSE
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Large crowd attends Republican Town 
Comm. meeting on MBTA Communities Act 
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The following incident 
reports are among the 
calls to which the Win-
throp Police Department 
responded on the listed 
dates. The log is a public 
record and available for 
review. All persons who 
are arrested or charged 
with a crime are presumed 
innocent until proven 
guilty in a court of law.

MONDAY, MARCH 25
0955: A resident came 

into the station to report 
that he had been the vic-
tim of identity theft and a 
larceny.

1148: An officer re-
sponded to a report of a 
disturbance on Golden 
Drive and restored the 
peace.

1219: A River Rd. resi-
dent came into the station 
to report an ongoing issue 
with her neighbors. The 
officer filed a report.

1321: A person came 

into the station to report 
that a registration plate 
had been stolen from his 
vehicle.

1538: A person came 
into the station to report 
that his motor vehicle had 
been struck and damaged 
by a hit and run operator 
on Shirley St. at Coral 
Ave. The officer filed a re-
port.

1624: An officer assist-
ed with traffic control on 
Pleasant St. where a truck 
had become disabled in 
the middle of the roadway. 
The officer diverted traffic 
until a tow truck arrived.

TUESDAY, MARCH 26
0041: An officer direct-

ed a person playing music 
loudly in his automobile 
on Almont St. to turn it 
down.

0141: An officer issued 
parking tickets to 11 ve-
hicles without resident 
parking stickers on Crystal 

Cove Ave.
1410: Officers respond-

ed to a disturbance involv-
ing juveniles who were 
fighting on Revere St. near 
the Cumberland Farms. 
The officers transported a 
youth who had a bloody 
nose to his home. An offi-
cer filed a report.

1502: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Shore Drive for the 
civil moving infraction of 
speeding. The officer gave 
a verbal warning to the op-
erator.

WEDNESDAY, 
MARCH 27

1009: A resident came 
into the station to report 
fraud on her credit card 
account. The officer filed 
a report.

1225: A Governors 
Drive resident came into 
the station to report the 
theft of a package. The of-
ficer filed a report.

1307: An officer re-
sponded to a motor ve-
hicle accident involving 
a Jeep Compass and a 
Chevy Suburban on Main 
St. There were no injuries. 
The officer filed a report.

1449: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Veterans Rd. for the 
civil moving infractions of 
speeding and a stop sign 
violation. When the officer 
determined that the vehi-
cle was uninsured (which 
is a criminal offense), he 
issued a citation to the op-
erator for the stop sign vi-
olation and gave a verbal 
warning for the speeding 
violation. The officer took 
the keys to the vehicle, 
which the owner may pick 
up at the station when the 
vehicle is insured.

2030: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
on Walden St. for the civ-
il moving infraction of a 
stop sign violation. The 
officer gave a verbal warn-
ing to the operator.

THURSDAY, MARCH 28
1414: An officer or-

dered a tow for a motor 
vehicle that had broken 
down in the middle of the 
intersection at Pauline and 
Putnam Sts.

2321: An officer or-
dered a tow for a motor 
vehicle with an expired 
registration on Bellevue 
Ave.

FRIDAY, MARCH 29
1133: A person called 

the station to report that a 
rat was swimming in his 
toilet. The caller was ad-
vised to call a pest control 

company.
1244: A resident came 

into the station to report 
being the victim of a larce-
ny by false pretense. The 
officer filed a report.

1608: Officers respond-
ed to a motor vehicle 
accident at Lincoln and 
Hermon Sts. involving 
a Dodge Caravan and a 
Chevy Sonic. There were 
no injuries. One of the ve-
hicles was towed. The of-
ficer filed a report.

2313: An officer re-
sponded to a report of 
four males arguing on 
Woodside Ave. The officer 
separated the parties and 
restored the peace. The of-
ficer filed a report.

2339: Officers respond-
ed to a report of a stolen 
Domino’s Pizza deliv-
ery vehicle. The officers 
searched the town and 
located the abandoned 
vehicle, which had heavy 
rear end damage and a 
punctured tire, on Brook-
field Rd. The vehicle was 
towed and the officer filed 
a report.

SATURDAY, MARCH 30
0939: An Underhill Rd. 

resident came into the sta-
tion to report vandalism to 
his motor vehicle. The of-
ficer filed a report.

2103: An officer stopped 
a motor vehicle on Shirley 
St. for the civil moving in-
fraction of a stop sign vio-
lation. The officer issued a 
citation to the operator for 
that infraction, as well as 
for the civil infraction of 
not having his registration 
in his possession.

SUNDAY, MARCH 31
10:47: A report of a 

dead squirrel in the road-
way on Buchanan St. was 
referred to the DPW.

1230: A person came 
into the station to report 
that she had been the vic-
tim of an assault. The offi-
cer filed a report.

1716: An officer ad-
vised two persons on a 
motorcycle on Shirley St. 
about the helmet law.

1721: An officer re-
sponded to a report from 
a Beacon St. resident that 
his daughter had been 
bitten by a dog at Massa 
Playground. The officer 
contacted the owner of the 
dog and ordered the dog to 
be quarantined. The matter 
was referred to the Animal 
Control Officer.

1905: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle at 
Veterans Rd. and Almont 
St. for the civil moving in-
fraction of a stop sign vi-
olation. The officer issued 
a citation to the operator. 
The officer also informed 
the operator that he has a 
warrant out of Boston and 
that he will need to take 
care of it on Monday.

1923: An officer 
stopped a motor vehicle 
at Ocean View and Cross 
Sts. for the civil moving 
infraction of a stop sign 
violation. The officer gave 
a verbal warning to the op-
erator.

MONDAY, APRIL 1
0110: An officer issued 

parking tickets to three 
vehicles without resident 
parking stickers on Forrest 
St.
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enrich the community 
playgroup experience by 
incorporating materials 
that celebrate the variety 
of cultures present in the 
community. This includes 
the acquisition of books 
with diverse representa-
tion, bilingual audio/visu-
al materials, instruments 
from different cultures, 
and a range of creative 
play toys.

"In alignment with our 
mission, For Kids Only 
Afterschool is dedicated to 
fostering an inclusive and 
positive environment for 
all children to thrive," said 
Deborah Kneeland Kee-
gan, Executive Director 
at FKO. "The grant from 
Winthrop Cultural Coun-
cil will play a crucial role 
in allowing us to expand 
our resources and further 
enhance the cultural pro-
ficiency within ’Rise & 
Shine’”.

One attendee, Erin 
Thompson, shared their 
heartfelt experience: 
"Community Playgroup 
has been essential to our 
daily life. As a grandpar-
ent and caregiver, know-

ing that I can take my 
grandchildren to a place 
where they get enrichment 
through activities and toys 
selected by the caring staff 
makes our days so much 
happier. We look forward 
to the monthly special 
event, whether it's enter-
tainment or a seasonal 
party; it is always a great 
time. I hope the program 
continues well into the fu-
ture."

If you are interested 
or would like more in-
formation about FKO’s 

Rise and Shine program-
ming, please contact Ash-
ley Asquith at aasquith@
fkoafterschool.org, or visit 
www.fkoafterschool.org/
rise-and-shine.

For Kids Only After-
school (FKO) is a leading 
provider of high-quality 
afterschool north of Bos-
ton. With nearly forty 
years of experience, FKO 
programs offer safe and 
nurturing environments 
where children can learn, 
grow, and thrive beyond 
regular school hours.

ble spending,” stated the 
town manager.

Marino’s budget mes-
sage, which is available 
on the town’s website, is 
separated into four major 
categories: Revenues, Ex-
penses, Capital Spending, 
and Long-Term Financial 
Planning. 

“Fiscal Year 2025’s 
revenues are forecasted 
responsibly and conserva-
tively; given the rebound 
in the new and used vehi-
cle market we have level 
funded excise tax receipts 
for FY25,” Marino stated. 
“We continue to keep our 
receipts at levels designed 
to support continuous free 
cash.”

The town’s projections 
for state aid use the figures 
supplied on the Cherry 
Sheet for the Governor’s 
proposed budget. 

“However, if the state 
aid numbers come in low-
er than what we budgeted 
for, we have already iden-
tified areas where we can 
cut and adjust the budget 
after the Town Council 
votes on it,” Marino stat-
ed.

Overall, property tax 
revenue is projected to in-
crease by the allowable 2 
½ percent in FY25, with 
an increase in the estimate 
for new growth, the tax 
revenue that comes from 
new construction. 

“The new growth esti-
mate of $550,000 is larger 
than average for Winthrop 
but is consistent with the 
recent increase in new res-
idential construction that 
we have experienced,” 
Marino stated. “We antic-
ipate that this number will 
stabilize and be reduced in 
future years as our Assess-
ing Department finishes 
entering the building per-

mit data.” Local receipts 
are projected to remain 
consistent with the last fis-
cal year.

On the expenses side, 
Marino stated that the 
proposed budget reflects a 
commitment to preserving 
residents’ quality of life 
by providing and main-
taining adequate financial 
resources necessary to 
sustain a sufficient level of 
educational and municipal 
services.

“It also responds to 
changes in the econo-
my, governmental and 
non-governmental organi-
zations’ priorities, and oth-
er changes that may affect 
our financial well-being,” 
Marino stated. “It fulfills 
the core value of support-
ing education, public safe-
ty, and public works while 
balancing fiscal respon-
sibility and fulfilling the 
Town Council’s financial 
goals.”

Winthrop saw a nomi-
nal increase in Chapter 70, 
school state aid funding, 
for FY25. 

“The continued strain 
on the school budget due 
to contractual obligations 
and increased expenses 
will need to be addressed 
in the near future,” Mari-
no stated. “The increases 
allowed with Proposition 
2 ½ and new growth is 
not enough to sustain this 
budget and an override 
will need to be considered 
before we start the FY26 
budget.”

The budget Includes a 
9.6 percent increase for 
health insurance through 
GIC, providing funding 
for the town’s 85 percent 
share of the health insur-
ance costs. Salary increas-
es for most unions and 
non-union personnel are 
calculated at 2 percent for 
FY25, and non-union per-

sonnel receive a 2 percent 
cost of living adjustment 
(COLA).

The general fund bud-
get includes trash and re-
cycling expenses totaling 
$600,000. 

“This is the same bud-
get number we carried 
last year; to lower this 
number in the long term, 
we will need to consider 
adjusting the trash fee and 
the pay-as-you-throw bag 
revenue,” Marino stat-
ed. “With increased trash 
costs on the horizon, we 
must pay close attention to 
this enterprise fund to en-
sure proper funding sourc-
es and control expenses.” 

The proposed budget 
also Includes a $60,000 
subsidy or budget trans-
fer for the Park and Rec-
reation and the Rink en-
terprise funds. “Annual 
increases in our health 
insurance, charges from 
Northeast and Essex Tech-
nical Schools, union con-
tracts, building and vehicle 
insurance, and retirement 
and pension funding take 
up most of our 2.5 percent 
tax increase per year,” stat-
ed Marino. “As a result, it 
is challenging to honor 
new staffing requests, new 
software and upgrades, 
and other new initiatives. 
Moving forward, we will 
look at each department 
and see if there are any re-
organizations that we can 
put in place to maximize 
our current staffing lev-
els.”

Marino’s budget doc-
ument also contains sec-
tions on the capital plan 
and long-term financial 
planning for the town.

The town council is ex-
pected to vote on the final 
FY25 budget at its June 18 
meeting.

School Comm. votes no on School Choice program
By Adam Swift

The Winthrop School 
Committee voted once 
again this year to not have 
the school district take 
part in the state’s School 
Choice program.

School Choice allows 
students to attend partic-
ipating school districts 
outside of their own com-
munities.

If the committee doesn’t 
vote annually on School 
Choice, the district would 
become a School Choice 
district, according to com-
mittee chair Jennifer Pow-
ell.

“Our recent approach 
has been out of concern 
for space at the schools, 
we have not approved 

this,” said Powell.
Superintendent of 

Schools Lisa Howard 
noted that while School 
Choice students would not 
be able to attend Winthrop 
schools from other dis-
tricts, it would not impact 
students from Winthrop 
who might want to attend 
a School Choice district 
outside of the town.

“My concern with 
School Choice has been 
and will continue to be 
the space in our buildings 
and that the state reim-
bursement rate per student 
does not offset how much 
this district pays to edu-
cate each student,” said 
committee member Layne 
Petrie. “So there is a finan-
cial gap there, as well.”

In other business, the 
committee also heard 
from Gorman Fort Banks 
Principal Mark McAneny 
and Arthur T. Cummings 
School Principal Andrea 
O’Leary about their re-
spective school improve-
ment plans.

“This was an extraor-
dinarily large amount of 
work for the staff to real-
ly be articulate and clear 
with the committee and 
with the community as 
well,” said Howard. “The 
new path we have taken 
and the new structure we 
have decided to utilize re-
ally speaks to us all row-
ing in the same direction, 
and I think that is huge and 

See SHCOOL CHOICE Page 4
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the RMV is issuing this re-
minder to the public about 
sites which have been cre-
ated to mislead customers 
into thinking they have 
reached the official RMV 
website.

“We urge everyone 
to be vigilant when per-
forming transactions or 
providing information on-
line for RMV-related ser-
vices. Customers should 
avoid using any unoffi-
cial third-party websites 
claiming to assist with 
RMV services, and inform 
their relatives and friends 
about this as well,” said 
Registrar of Motor Vehi-
cles Colleen Ogilvie. “On 
our official website Mass.
Gov/RMV, customers can 
look up how much spe-
cific services cost and see 
which services are avail-
able to them at no charge.”  

To ensure you are ac-
cessing the official RMV 
site, please remember the 
following:

• In Massachusetts, we 
use the term “Registry 
of Motor Vehicles” and 
“RMV,” so log-off if the 
site references the “DMV” 
or the “Department of Mo-
tor Vehicles.”

• At Mass.Gov/RMV, 
you will never be charged 
to check your license, reg-
istration or title status.

• At Mass.Gov/RMV, 
you will never be charged 
to access Registry forms 
and information.

• At Mass.Gov/RMV, 
you will never be charged 
to change your address on 
file.

The Registry active-
ly posts online about this 
topic including on X @
MassRMV, and a warning 
regarding third party web-
sites remains featured in 
the RMV’s Driver’s Man-
ual. 

Reports of fraudulent 
websites can be directed 
to the Attorney Gener-
al’s Office at http://www.
mass.gov/ago/consum-
er-resources/consum-
er-assistance/consum-
er-complaint.html and the 
Federal Trade Commis-
sion: https://www.ftc.gov/.

In addition, custom-

ers should beware of text 
messages or emails which 
claim to be from Mass-
DOT or the RMV, as these 
communications often are 
dangerous phishing scams 
and not official Mass-
DOT and RMV sources. 
These fraudulent texts and 
emails may include links, 
which do not lead to of-
ficial MassDOT or RMV 
websites, and customers 
should not follow the links 
nor reply to these messag-
es with personal informa-
tion. 

Customers with ad-
ditional questions about 
how to identify and avoid 
scams can contact the Of-
fice of Consumer Affairs 
and Business Regulation 
by calling the Consumer 
Hotline at (617) 973-8787, 
or toll-free in Massachu-
setts at (888) 283-3757.

LOCAL AUTHOR 
PAUL M MARKIS 
HOSTS BOOK 
SIGNING EVENT

Join local author Paul M 

Markis for a book signing 
event on Saturday, April 
13th, from 11 am to 1 pm 
at the Winthrop Book De-
pot located at 11 Somerset 
Street, Winthrop, MA.

Markis, a resident of 
Winthrop for the past 20 
years, was raised in East 
Boston. Many may re-
member him from his 25-
year tenure as a bartender 
at Jeveli’s Restaurant.

Attendees are encour-
aged to bring their own 
copy of Markis’s book, 
“The Cocktail Keeper: 
Recipes and Stories,” or 
purchase one at the event 
to receive a personalized 
handwritten message from 
the author.

“The Cocktail Keeper” 
is a collection of recipes, 
stories, anecdotes, and 
more, aimed at entertain-
ing the reader. The book 
provides insights into suc-
cessful bartending tech-
niques, along with recipes 
for unique cocktails ex-
plained in simple terms. 
Markis also shares humor-
ous stories from his forty 

years in the hospitality in-
dustry.

The 134-page paper-
back, priced at $15.00 
(eBook $10.00), features 
a variety of cocktail reci-
pes, famous toasts, medic-
inal cures, cocktail-making 
techniques, quips, fun facts, 
trivia, and real-life stories, 
making it a valuable addi-
tion to any home bar.

Don’t miss this opportu-
nity to meet the author and 
get a signed copy of “The 
Cocktail Keeper: Recipes 
and Stories.” Follow “The 
Cocktail Keeper” on Face-
book or Instagram for a 
preview of what’s inside.

News Briefs //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 1

BUYER 1	 SELLER 1	 ADDRESS	 PRICE
Summit Property Vent Inc	 Shah, Promadchandra C	 365 Main St	 $1,800,000  

Real Estate Transfers

JIM POLINO – ELIZABETH POLINO – JAMES POLINO – JONATHAN POLINO – SHARON TALLENT
ATIYEH CASSIDY – VIRGINIA BROWN – CHRISSY D’AMBROSIO – DAVID TALLENT – KATHY HICKEY – KENNY KELLEHER

HIGHLANDGROUP@COMPASS.COM | 617.846.8000
75 CREST AVE, WINTHROP, MA | 126 NEWBURY STREET, BOSTON, MA

Meet our team by 
opening your phone’s 
camera and holding it 

over the QR codeFor smooth sailing with your next move, 
call the Highland Group

Buying or selling, ask us about Compass Coming Soon and Compass Concierge

Knowledge and experience of a local agent. 
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Celebrate Arbor Day April 20 
at The Deane Winthrop House

Special to the Transcript

Please join the Win-
throp Improvement and 
Historical Association 
(W.I.H.A.) in the garden 
of the historic Deane Win-
throp House at 40 Shirley 
St. for an inspirational 
Arbor Day Celebration of 
Trees, April 20th 11-2pm. 
W.I.H.A. is especially 
proud to carry on the tra-
dition by presenting an 
Arbor Day Event as it was 
incorporated into the orig-
inal W.I.H.A. by-laws of 
1904 as a day of service 
by planting trees and cele-
bration for the community.

This year we are col-
laborating with the Girl 
Scouts as they complete 
their Tree Promise Badge 
and the Winthrop Loves 
Trees & GROW Organi-
zation who will be doing 
advocacy work by collect-
ing signatures to help pass 
the Municipal Reforesta-
tion Bill for trees, labor, 
and tree inventories. Their 
website is www.TreeWin-
throp.org.

Included in the festivi-
ties we’ll have Eastern Red 
Bud seedling giveaways, 
either planted in peat pots 
provided at the event or 
wrapped up bare root. 
Twig and bark craft-mak-
ing supplies available for 
kids and anyone creative. 

Theme related raffles and 
door prize memberships to 
the Arbor Day Foundation 
and finally delicious Cher-
ry Pie and coffee.

The memorial plantings 
will start at noon and in-
clude a reading of the his-
toric Arbor Day Proclama-
tion. This national holiday 
originated in 1872 in Ne-
braska when they planted 
1 million trees on that day. 
The most common date for 
Arbor Day is usually ob-
served on the last Friday 
in April, but warmer states 
generally celebrate earlier 
to make the most of ideal 
tree-planting weather.

Past members of 
W.I.H.A. to be honored 
with tree planting memo-
rials are the late Marge 
Dimes, Stephen Honan 
and Patricia Tacelli. Their 
dedication and generous 
support of W.I.H.A. will 
always be remembered. 
Their living memorials will 
be marked and illuminated 
with solar up-lighting in 
the evenings year-round. 
Many thanks to their loved 
ones who have made do-
nations in their names to 
make this possible.

We hope to see you at 
this inspiring event for 
a Healthier and Greener 
World. WIHA thanks the 
residents of Winthrop for 
their continued support of 
our events.

Sandy Joneck-Schiff, past WIHA president, James Healy, 
retired History Officer, Boston Duck Tours, and Kathy Vorse, 
WIHA Vice President.

Winthrop Improvement & Historical Association members 
learning about “Massachusetts Firsts.”

Story & Photos by Marianne Salza

James Healy, one of the 
founders of Boston Duck 
Tours, presented “Massa-
chusetts Firsts” during the 
Winthrop Improvement & 
Historical Association’s 
(WIHA) April 2 dinner 
meeting in the Deane Win-
throp House barn. Healy is 
a retired history officer for 
Boston Duck Tours and 
lives on a floating house in 
East Boston.

“Boston was founded 
in 1630. We’re one of the 
oldest cities in the United 
States. A lot of things hap-
pened here first in our na-
tion’s history,” said Healy. 
“Many of the first settlers 
in Winthrop settled here 
in 1630. They were part of 

that group of Puritans that 
came over from Boston, 
England.”

Boston implemented the 
first fire ordinance in 1631 
after the house of Thomas 
Sharp burned down. He 
had built his home with 
a wooden chimney. The 
building code outlawed 
wooden chimneys and 
thatched roofs on homes.

The first public school 
in the country was Boston 
Latin School, established 
in Boston in 1635. Stu-
dents attended the head-
master’s home for lessons 
until 1645, when a school 
house was built on School 
Street. Five signers of the 
Declaration of Indepen-
dence were students of 
Boston Latin: John Han-
cock, Samuel Adams, 
Benjamin Franklin, Rob-
ert Treat Paine, and Wil-
liam Hooper.

Harvard University was 
the first college in Amer-
ica, founded in 1636 by 
Puritans, who were strong 
supporters of education. 
The first graduating class 
was in 1642, with nine 
students.

After Thomas Lech-
ford was seen speaking to 
members of the jury out-
side of the courtroom, he 
became the first disbarred 
lawyer in the country in 
1639.

“The Puritans passed 
some of the first laws in 
the country. When they 
first came here, they as-

WIHA hosts discussion 
on ‘Massachusetts Firsts’

James Healy, one of the 
Boston Duck Tours found-
ers, explaining some of the 
first inventions, schools, 
companies, and laws that 
began in Massachusetts.

sumed everyone – being 
as religious as they were 
– would get along just 
fine and behave, but that 
wasn’t the case,” revealed 
Healy. “Boston had the 
first law in the country 
prohibiting gambling, the 
first law prohibiting smok-
ing tobacco in public, and 
they had the first law pro-
hibiting public intoxica-
tion.”

Forty-four years be-
fore the Salem witch tri-
als, Charlestown woman, 
Margaret Jones, became 

the first person in Boston 
to be convicted of witch-
craft and hanged in 1648.

The Massachusetts Bay 
Colony established a mint 
enterprise in 1652. The 
silver “pine tree shillings” 
were the first minted coins 
in the country.

“At that time, only the 
king of England could 
mint coins. It was illegal 
for anyone else; but here 
in Massachusetts, we had 
a shortage of coins,” not-

See WIHA Page 5 "The annual Winthrop 
Chamber & Community 
Awards Ceremony will be 
held on April 27 at Cot-
tage Park Yacht Club.

Each year, the Winthrop 
Chamber of Commerce 
chooses members of the 
community who have 
displayed excellence and 
contributed to our com-
munity in a positive way. 
The cocktail reception 
and ceremony will be cel-
ebrating Winthrop's best 
and brightest, including 
business owners, local 
artisans, and veterans, as 

well as coaches, teachers, 
students, and law enforce-
ment. These awardees 
provide great examples of 
why Winthrop is a great 
place to work and live!

We hope that you will 
join us in celebrating the 
best and brightest of Win-
throp on April 27 at Cot-
tage Park Yacht Club from 
6-8 p.m. Please purchase 
tickets via the Winthrop 
Chamber of Commerce. 
You can call the office 
directly at  617-846-9898 
or you can visit our social 
media to access the link."

Chamber awards set for April 27

Drawing will be held at the Krystle Campbell Team 
Post-Marathon party at Summer Shack. Winner will be 

announced online
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THANK YOU, SEN. EDWARDS
Two weeks ago, our State Senator, Lydia Edwards, set 

out very clearly her position regarding the controversial 
MBTA Communities Act and its impact upon our town in 
an Op-Ed that appeared in the Sun-Transcript on March 
28. (Sen. Edwards’s Op-Ed is posted on our web site, dated 
March 30.).

In our view, Senator Edwards made clear, in no uncer-
tain terms, her view that this law is unfair to our town. She 
wrote:

“I was shocked at the suggested target of over 800 units 
for Winthrop. My first thought was ‘Where will they go, 
who will pay for it, and how did they get that number?’....
As your senator, I intend to lead with the town council...
My promise is to fight for Winthrop. I think, after a healthy 
back-and-forth with the town council and state legislators, 
our unit count may reduce to one to two hundred units, if 
that...To place an unfunded mandate on any town, with a 
threat to defund us if we are not compliant, is wrong. We 
expect to be acknowledged for our hard work, supported 
as we go forward, and respected throughout the entire pro-
cess. I intend to fight for all of these things, as well as a 
reduction in our unit requirements.”

Our own view of the MBTA Communities Act is this: 
We at the Sun-Transcript have been around for a while 
(long before most of those who are speaking out against 
this law were born). Winthrop has a long history of stand-
ing up to powerful state authorities -- particularly Mass-
port, the MDC, and the MWRA, among others -- and we 
(and our former long-time publisher, Andrew P. Quigley) 
were in the vanguard of all of those epic battles dating back 
to the 1950s.

 Winthropites always have had a fighting spirit (which 
admittedly sometimes can be a bit over the top, including 
ourselves, on occasion) and that spirit is evident today in 
our fight against these absurd mandates — given that Win-
throp is the second-smallest town area-wise and among the 
most-densely populated communities in the state — of the 
MBTA Communities Act.

However, as Mr. Quigley often wrote, “We must be able 
to disagree without being disagreeable.”  In addition, we 
should keep in mind that our quarrel is with the state, not 
among each other. 

We feel that the position set out by Senator Edwards in 
her Op-Ed two weeks shows that she clearly is on our side 
on this issue and any effort to suggest otherwise simply is 
not accurate. We know we join with our fellow residents is 
acknowledging Senator Edwards’s support for our towns-
people’s position and we are confident that the state author-
ities eventually will modify the requirements for Winthrop 
to a far-more realistic goal.

A FREAKY FRIDAY.....
Did you feel the earthquake Friday morning?
We were sitting in our recliner in our home when the 

whole house started shaking and the chair started moving 
rapidly back and forth. We live on the coast, so at first we 
thought it might be a change of direction or increase in the 
velocity of the wind, which can cause our house to creak 
and the windows to rattle a bit.

 But we saw no change in the ripples on the water, so we 
then thought that perhaps a big truck was on the roadway. 
But there was no truck. Those two thoughts came in rapid 
succession within about five seconds, so as the shaking of 
our chair continued, our next, panicked thought was, “It’s 
an earthquake!”

Five seconds later -- about 10 seconds in total -- the 
shaking and rattling stopped.

We immediately looked out our windows to see if the 
water was receding from the shoreline, thinking that if it 
were an off-shore quake, under the ocean, there might be a 
tsunami. (Of course, there wasn’t.)

We then went on the internet to search for “Boston 
earthquake,” and there were a bunch of posts on X and 
other social media confirming that there had indeed been 
an earthquake.

The earthquake’s center was in New Jersey, where the 
seismographic recording was a 4.8. The effect in our area 
was considerably less.

Although there was no damage reported from the quake 
(even at its epicenter in New Jersey), we have to admit 
we were shaken to our core. Our otherwise calm Friday 
morning had been upended by the most random event we 
could have imagined -- an earthquake. It made us realize 
how fragile our existence is and how at a moment’s notice, 
our world can be upended.

It also made us empathize with those who are the vic-
tims of a major earthquake and for a few seconds, we un-
derstood the sheer terror that one feels amidst an event 
such as that.

We realize that some might say, “It is what it is,” but we 
have a better one: “Everything is good....until it isn’t.”

......AND A MANIC MONDAY
We had not intended to view the eclipse, so despite the 

hype, we had not purchased special eclipse eyewear. We 
figured we’d focus on what was happening around us -- the 
birds and other animals, the shadows, the suddenly-cooler 
air -- rather than on the interplay between the moon and 
the sun.

But a neighbor drove up as we were standing outside our 
home and mentioned that he had an extra pair of eclipse eye-
wear, which he offered  to us. So we took it and got a chance 
to view the eclipse safely -- and we are so glad we did.

Watching that black moon disc slide over the glowing 
sun (to about 92% of totality here in the Boston area) was 
indeed a spectacle that was jaw-dropping. Although the 
news was filled with reports of traffic jams and millions 
of people traveling to watch the event in places where the 
eclipse was 100%, viewing the actual eclipse itself brought 
about a sense of calm and serenity that we can’t describe. 
It was as if our brains were hypnotized in some way by a 
celestial, supernatural event.

All of us take the sun and the moon for granted each and 
every day. But Monday’s eclipse created a sense of won-
derment that never will be forgotten by those who viewed 
it.

WRITER RESPONDS 
TO EDWARDS’  
OP-ED 

(Ed. Note: The follow-
ing letter refers to the Op-
Ed article by State Sen-
ator Lydia Edwards that 
appeared in the Sun-Tran-
script two weeks ago. We 
urge our readers to read 
Sen. Edwards’s column, 
which is posted on our 
web site for the issue of 
March 28, in order to 
make their own judgment 
about the opinions stated 
by Senator Edwards and 
the letter-writer. Also, we 
believe that when the let-
ter-writer refers to “we,”  
she is referring to mem-
bers of the Republican 
Town Committee.)

Dear Editor:
In response to your Op 

– Ed, (of Senator Edwards 
on 3-28)  we feel it is im-
portant to tell the whole 
story about MBTA Com-
munity law 3A. We con-
tinue to hear words like 
misinformed, fear, anger, 
and confusion. We simply 
disagree. The residents of 
Winthrop have been do-
ing their due diligence and 
share the facts as we learn 
them.  You describe us as 
vitriolic, angry, and afraid 
of newcomers? We have 
asked you multiple times 
to host a meeting to help 
us understand your per-

spective, since you clearly 
do not understand the will 
of Winthrop, and you have 
yet to reply.  

Regarding how we got 
here. There is no misun-
derstanding that the law 
was passed in 2021. Let us 
also be clear that there are 
2 things at play regarding 
3A. There is the law, one 
written page, and attached 
to the law are guidelines. 
The guidelines have been 
modified multiple times 
since the Healy Adminis-
tration has been in office. 
In fact, the guidelines have 
been changed as recently 
as August 2023. The fact 
that the guidelines contin-
ue to change as cities and 
towns oppose 3A, is the 
only confusion on our end. 
How does the state expect 
cities and towns to comply 
with a law and its guide-
lines when they continue 
to change? Initially the 
law stated funding from 
3 grants may be impacted 
for non-compliance. The 
state has increased that to 
17 through amendments 
to the guidelines. Grant 
money is funded by tax-
payers. You also mention 
that the threshold required 
for approving plans was 
lowered to a simple major-
ity from a 2/3 vote to pre-
vent one person in local 
government from stalling 
projects. You neglected 
to share the other side of 
that coin. To change any 

3A approved projects af-
ter a simple majority vote. 
The rule goes back and re-
quires a 2/3 vote.

Regarding the popular-
ity of this law, our Town 
Council members have 
done a fantastic job and 
held open, respectful, and 
well-attended precinct 
meetings with regards to 
the MBTA 3A law. What 
you may not understand is 
that this bill is overwhelm-
ingly unpopular amongst 
Winthrop voters, the peo-
ple that voted for you.

Senator Edwards, you 
state that the baton has 
been passed to the local 
communities to plan for 
increased density. Win-
throp is ahead of the state 
and has already done that 
in the Center Business 
District. Our Town Coun-
cil has been planning for 
Winthrop’s future. Why 
is the burden on the 177 
MBTA communities in 
the most densely popu-
lated areas? It is not for 
the benefit of Winthrop. 
This is also a conversation 
we should have with you 
and the community. Your 
continuous statements of 
“crushing” communities, 
and very thinly veiled 
threats, do not convey the 
collaborative approach 
you claim to want to en-
gage in. Winthrop has 
been ahead of the Com-
monwealth in zoning for 
growth for several years. 

How do you, as our rep-
resentative not know that, 
and stand up for the peo-
ple of Winthrop, your con-
stituents?

You said that we will 
not be undertaking this 
without significant finan-
cial resources from the 
state. What financial re-
sources are you speaking 
of because as of this date, 
there is nothing in 3A that 
speaks to funding sources. 
You make the claim that 
this is our town Senator 
using the term “we.”  How 
did you not know that our 
data was incorrect? We 
are not 1.9 square miles in 
size. Massport has a run-
way on .3 square miles.

Lastly, you speak of dis-
heartening sources of divi-
sion in Winthrop. You are 
attempting to divide our 
Town Council by holding 
Sunday meetings with a 
select few. You say you 
will fight for Winthrop; 
however, you are fighting 
against Winthrop by forc-
ing the 3A agenda for your 
own benefit as Co-Chair 
of the Housing Commit-
tee. Make no mistake, our 
Town Council continues 
to work hard for all of 
Winthrop. We are not a 
divided community. We 
simply do not believe this 
law is constitutional or 
benefits our community in 
any way.

Carole Mietzsch
Precinct 1

transparent.”
Howard also informed 

the school committee 
that the high school has 
formed a new girls’ flag 
football team.

“It is a pilot program 
and it is self funded,” 
said Howard. “Students 

are paying for their user 
fee, which is funding the 
program, and they will 
be playing in the Massa-
chusetts league run by the 
New England Patriots.”

The team is being over-
seen by Winthrop High 
Life Skills teacher John 

Cross, and Howard said 
there is already a good 
amount of girls taking part 
in the program.

“It’s great to give an-
other activity for the kids 
to get involved in,” said 
Howard.

School committee 

member Gus Martucci 
noted that the finance sub-
committee is going over 
the final numbers for the 
proposed 2024-25 school 
year budget and should 
have the budget ready to 
present to the town coun-
cil next week. 

ed Healy. “Back in those 
days, the colonists didn’t 
pay much attention to 
what the king said.”

Boston had the first fire 
engine in the country in 
1654, as well as the first 
fire department. Members 
– who could have been 
shipwrights, carpenters, 
tailors, and businessmen 
-- were on-call and only 
paid when actively extin-
guishing flames.

Publick Occurrences, 
Both Foreign and Domes-
tic was the first newspaper 
in the country, publishing 
one edition in 1619.

“The local authorities, 
all appointed by the king, 
did not like what the edi-
tor was printing, so they 
shut the paper down,” 
explained Healy. “Boston 
didn’t get another newspa-
per until 1704. Back then, 
we did not have freedom 
of the press.”

In addition to the first 
minted coins, the thirteen 
colonies also had the first 
paper money, produced to 
pay militiamen during the 
King William’s War.

Boston had the first 
road map in the country. 
In 1698 John Tully print-
ed an almanac that includ-
ed a chart of the Boston 
area. It indicated towns, 
roads, and distances from 

Boston. The map was so 
popular that later editions 
incorporated the locations 
of taverns.

Doctor Zabdiel Boyl-
ston introduced the small-
pox inoculation to Boston 
in 1721. About once every 
decade, there was a small-
pox epidemic in Boston; 
and even if someone sur-
vived, he or she could 
have been blinded or 
scarred for the remainder 
of their lives.

“This was something 
that had been done in Chi-
na for centuries. The inoc-
ulation eventually made 
its way to Europe, and 
Boylston learned about it. 
It was very successful,” 
said Healy. “They next 
year, it saved thousands 
of lives; but many refused 
to be inoculated. They be-
lieved to be inoculated to 
prevent smallpox defied 
the will of God.”

James Baker, a medi-
cal doctor, started the first 
chocolate factory in the 
country in 1765 because 
he felt that it would be 
delightful to have a choc-
olate factory in the Mas-
sachusetts Bay Colonies. 
Baker hired Irish immi-
grant, John Hannon, to 
produce the chocolate for 
the Baker Chocolate Com-
pany in Boston.

Phillis Weatley was the 
first published black poet 
in the country in 1773. 
Born in Africa, she arrived 
to America on a slave ship 
in 1761. She was pur-
chased by Boston woman, 
Susanna Weatley, whose 
daughter taught Phillis 
how to speak English.

“Some of her poems 
were published in Boston 
newspapers, and a collec-
tion of her poems were 
published in England,” 
noted Healy. “Publishers 
in England doubted that 
a slave could have writ-
ten these poems, but John 
Hancock testified that she 
had written them.”

Slavery was legal in all 
thirteen colonies before 
the American Revolution. 
In 1783, courts ruled that 
slavery was illegal in Mas-
sachusetts. When the first 
federal census was taken 
in 1790, Massachusetts 
was the only state that had 
no slaves.

Massachusetts had the 
first state college in the 
United States, established 
in Lexington in 1839.

“Prior to that time, 
anyone who could read, 
write, or do simple arith-
metic could get a job as 
a teacher; but Massachu-
setts decided they wanted 
to improve the quality of 

education,” said Healy.
The first use of ether in 

surgery was at Massachu-
setts General Hospital in 
1846.

“Prior to that time, 
doctors were reluctant to 
perform surgery because 
it was extremely painful, 
and it was not unusual for 
the patient to die of shock 
before the surgical pro-
cedure was completed,” 
described Healy. “The 
anesthetic revolutionized 
medicine.”

Boston had the first sew-
ing machine in the country. 
It was demonstrated by its 
inventor, Elias Howe, an 
unfortunate salesman who 
eventually sold his patent 
to Isaac Singer, who paid 
Howe a portion of the 
profits from every sewing 
machine he sold.

Boston had the first can-
dy factory in 1847. Oliver 
Chase -- inventor of the 
first candy-manufacturing 
machine, which cut loz-
enges – started Chase and 
Company, which even-
tually became NECCO 
(New England Confec-
tionary Company).

Boston Female Medi-
cal College was the first 
medical school for women 
in the world, launched in 

See WIHA Page 5
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1848. In 1847 it merged 
with the Boston Univer-
sity School of Medicine, 
becoming the first co-ed-
ucational medical school.

The Boston Public Li-
brary, established in 1848, 
was the first, public, lend-
ing library in the country. 
Today, readers can borrow 
up to 75 books at a time.

Boston had the first 
jelly bean factory, started 
during the Civil War in 
1861 by William Schrafft.

“At that time, the 
Schrafft Candy Company 
had the largest candy fac-
tory in the world,” empha-
sized Healy.

The invention of roller 
skates by doctor, James 
Leonard Plimpton, in Bos-
ton in 1863, made Plimp-
ton a millionaire.

Sylvester Roper built 
the first, practical, steamed 
automobile in the United 
States in Boston, in 1863. 
It can be viewed in the 
Henry Ford Museum of 
American Innovation, in 
Michigan. Roper also in-
vented the steam-powered 
motorcycle, which he en-

joyed racing against bicy-
clists.

The first lightbulb was 
invented in 1868 by Mo-
ses Farmer, a Salem elec-
trical engineer. Famer’s 
lightbulb, with its plat-
inum filament, was too 
expensive and time con-
suming to construct; espe-
cially during a time when 
homes were not yet wired 
with electricity. Famer 
also invented the first fire 
alarm boxes that are still 
maintained on light poles 
in Boston.

“Almost everyone be-
lieves that Thomas Edison 
invented the lightbulb,” 
Healy clarified. “Thomas 
Edison comes along and 
is making power plants. 
He wants to build a pow-
er system in cities across 
the country; but the one 
thing he didn’t have was 
a lightbulb. He bought the 
patent from Moses Farm-
er. Edison spent several 
weeks trying to perfect an 
inexpensive lightbulb that 
could be mass produced, 
and that’s what he did.”

Basketball was invent-

ed by James Naismith at 
the Springfield, Massa-
chusetts YMCA in 1891, 
to create an athletic, in-
door game that could be 
played in the winter. Vol-
leyball was also invented 
by YMCA physical edu-
cation instructor, William 
Morgan in 1895.

The “Pledge of Alle-
giance” was written in 
Boston in 1892 by Baptist 
minister, Francis Bellamy.

In 1895, Hood became 
the first dairy company in 
the United States to start 
delivering milk in glass 
bottles.

“Prior to that time, you 
could go to the dairy with 
a pale and buy milk,” not-
ed Healy. “In some places, 
a milk man would come 
to your house with a large 
container of milk, and 
you’d come out and he’d 
pour the milk in a pitcher 
for you.”

In 1903 the Boston Po-
lice Department switched 
from horse-drawn car-
riages to automobiles. The 
first police car was man-
ufactured by the Stanley 

Steamer company in New-
ton, Massachusetts.

“The police officer road 
on a bench seat. A civilian 
chauffeur drove it,” de-
scribed Healy. “They pa-
trolled Beacon Hill.”

Massachusetts was the 
first state to issue license 
plates. Henry Lee Higgin-
son, founder of the Boston 
Symphony Orchestra, ad-
vocated for automobiles 
to have individual identi-
fication numbers after he 

became annoyed by the 
dust and noise they creat-
ed when driving past his 
home. The first license 
plate number was issued 
in 1903 to Frederick Tu-
dor, and the plate has been 
passed down through the 
family.

In 1903, Massachusetts 
also became the first state 
to require a driver’s li-
cense; although it was not 
necessary to pass a road 
test.

“Anyone could get a 
driver’s license by an-
swering 12 questions on 
an exam. Back in 1903, 
there were no traffic signs, 
lights, or lanes in the road. 
It was a free-for-all, and 
you were sharing the road 
with horses,” described 
Healy. “Boston’s young-
est, licensed driver was 
11-years-old, and he was 
employed as a chauffeur.”

Winthrop Improvement & Historical Association gathering in the Deane Winthrop House 
barn for the April 2 dinner meeting with guest speaker, James Healy, presenting, “Massa-
chusetts Firsts.”

CARY SHUMAN PHOTOS

Todd Sacco, Town Council President James Letterie, Rep. 
Jeff Turco, and Janet Kildery.

SCENES FROM THE TOWN REPUBLICAN COMMITTEE FORUM ON MBTA COMMUNITIES ACT

Members of the Winthrop Republican Town Committee, from left, Paul Reardon, James Gallagher, Paul Carruccio, Vera 
Carducci, Paul Ronukaitus, David Buckley, Diane Sands, and Steve Belmonte.

Moderator Paul Caruccio (left at podium), with forum 
panelists Rep. Jeff Turco and Town Council President James 
Letterie.

Paul Carruccio, moderator 
of the Winthrop Republican 
Town Committee’s forum on 
the MBTA Communities Act 
and its potential impact on 
Winthrop.

Concerned residents leading the efforts against the MBTA Communities Act, from left, 
Vasili Mallios, Kathleen Riley Cappuccio, Diana Viens, and Diane Sands.

Kathleen Riley Cappuccio and Rep. Jeff Turco, pictured at 
the forum on the MBTA Communities Act Tuesday night at 
the Robert A. DeLeo Senior Center.

new zoning districts and 
establish a certain number 
of multi-family housing 
units. Under the law, Win-
throp would be required 
to add 882 multi-family 
housing units.

Letterie said that new 
units cannot be built on 
town-owned properties 
such as Ingleside Park or 
the old Middle School 
building.

One observation from 
Tuesday’s meeting is that 
Winthrop residents will 
be closely watching the 
Town of Milton’s lawsuit 
seeking to overturn the 
MBTA Communities Act. 
That case will go before 
the Mass. Supreme Judi-
cial Court in October.

“I think the Milton law-
suit is really critical in 
this issue,” said Turco. “I 
expect the SJC to make 
a decision by the end of 

the year. The court knows 
how important it to come 
up with a decision because 
cities and towns are strug-
gling to comply or not 
comply with the law.”

Turco made it clear that 
he is opposed to the imple-
mentation of the law.

“I’m opposed to the 
law. I want to be crysyal 
clear,” Turco told the au-
dience. “I think it’s bad 
for Winthrop. I think it’s 
a bad fit for this town. I 
don’t think it recognizes 
the good, thoughtful ef-
forts of development that 
Winthrop has done over 
the last 20 or 30 years. It 
doesn’t acknowledge the 
development that’s in the 
works in the town.”

Noting the many new 
residential developments 
in Revere over the past 
decade, Turco said, “The 
Commonwealth should 
be respectful of towns like 

Winthrop who want to 
build in a thoughtful, de-
liberate way.”

One resident asked 
whether the new residenc-
es would affect school 
enrollment and create 
an increased demand for 
police, fire, and DPW 
services and necessitate 
major infrastructure im-
provements.

“I don’t want to say 
we’re at capacity, but 
the Middle/Senior High 
School was built for 960 
kids and there’s 1,100 kids 
in there now,” said Let-
terie. “The way the town 
is constituted now, I don’t 
think we can support an 
additional 882 units on top 
of what we already zone.”

Letterie, who said he is 
opposed to the new law, 
cited the fact that Win-
throp is in the top five of 
densest communities in 
the state.

“We are what the state 

wants everyone else to be. 
We shouldn’t be punished 
again for being proactive 
and doing the right thing, 
understanding our com-
munity, and growing in a 
responsible and effective 
way. I am dead set against 
this law,” said Letterie.

One resident suggested 
that a community adviso-
ry council be formed to 
keep the community well 
informed and to help the 
town address the issue. 
Letterie said he would 
consider the proposal, 
while suggesting that res-
idents attend Town Coun-
cil meetings and stay in-
formed on the issue.

Turco said he was im-
pressed by the turnout at 
the meeting.

“To have this many peo-
ple come to a public forum 
like this is wonderful,” 
said Turco. “What’s most 
important is that people 
have been very diligent 

going to Town Council 
meetings listening and 
expressing their concerns. 
It’s a sign that democra-
cy is alive and well in the 
town.”

 
Winthrop officials meet 
with Sec. Augustus on 

MBTA Communities Act
A delegation of Win-

throp officials met with 
Mass. Sec. of Housing 
and Livable Communities 
Edward M. Augustus Jr. at 
his offices in Boston Mon-
day to discuss the MBTA 
Communities Act and its 
impact on Winthrop, Rep. 
Jeff Turco and Town Man-
ager James Letterie said at 
the Winthrop Republican 
Town Committee Forum.

Town Manager Antho-
ny Marino, Sen. Lydia Ed-
wards, Town Council Vice 
President Hannah Belcher, 
and Councilors Joseph 
Aiello and John DaRos 

joined Turco and Letterie 
at the meeting.

Letterie and Marino 
made a presentation at the 
meeting that was also at-
tended by Sec. Augustus’ 
staff.

Turco said Augustus 
was receptive, but no 
commitments were made.

“We advocated that the 
town is different from oth-
er communities and needs 
to be accommodated ac-
cordingly,” said Turco. 
“Sec. Augustus said he 
understood our argument. 
He told us that he wants to 
review more information 
so he can evaluate it in the 
context of the 177 com-
munities being impacted 
by the law. He basically 
said to us, ‘If we make an 
adjustment for one, what 
does that look like for the 
other 176 communities?’”



Page 6	 The Winthrop Sun Transcript • Thursday, April 11, 2024	 Email: editor@winthroptranscript.com
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By Adam Swift

Acting Mayor Patrick 
Keefe and former mayor 
Dan Rizzo will square off 

for the city’s top job on 
Nov. 7 in the municipal 
general election.

As of press time with 
unofficial results, Rizzo 

topped the ballot in the 
four-way preliminary elec-
tion for mayor on Tuesday 
with 2,627 votes, followed 
by Keefe with 2,488 votes 

with all precincts report-
ing with the exception of 
Ward 5, Precinct 1 late on 
Tuesday. All vote totals 
were unofficial as of Tues-

day night.
The preliminary race 

saw four long-time coun-
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DAYTIME BRIDGE 
MACHINERY 
INSTALLATION AT 
CHELSEA STREET 
BRIDGE 

The Massachusetts 
Department of Trans-
portation (MassDOT) is 
announcing that it will 
be conducting work to 
install span guide roller 
machineries on the Chel-
sea Street Bridge in East 
Boston and Chelsea. This 
work is scheduled to take 
place Monday through 
Friday, during the hours 
of 9:00 a.m. to 3:00 p.m. 
This work is schedule to 
begin on Monday, Sep-
tember 25 and will con-
clude on Friday, Novem-
ber 17. There will be no 
weekend closures during 
scheduled Sumner Tunnel 
closures. The work will 
require off peak tempo-
rary lane and sidewalk 
closures. The bridge will 
remain fully operational 
during the installation of 
the new machinery and 
pedestrian access across 
the bridge will be main-
tained at all times. The 
schedule for this work is 
weather dependent and is 
subject to change without 
notice. 

Drivers who are trav-
eling through the area 
should reduce speed and 
use caution. 

 Appropriate signage, 
law enforcement details, 
and advanced message 
boards will be in place to 
guide drivers through the 
work area. 

For more information 
on traffic conditions, trav-
elers are encouraged to: 

See NEWS BRIEFS Page 2

See ELECTION Page 12

HAAS TOPS THE TICKET IN AT-LARGE PRELIMINARY

Ward 1 Ward 4 Ward 5

Top 5 Primary At-Large candidates

The Race for Ward 1
By Adam Swift

Incumbent Jo-
anne McKenna, the 
top vote-getter with 
676 votes, and John 
Stamatopoulos, 235 
votes, came out on 
top in the Ward 1 pre-
liminary election on 
Tuesday.

They will move 
onto the Nov. 7 gen-
eral municipal elec-
tion ballot.

McKenna current-
ly serves as the Coun-
cil President Pro Tem 
and was an educator 
in the Revere schools 
for over 30 years. She 
also chairs the city’s 
public art commis-
sion.

McKenna, a life-

long Beachmont resi-
dent, still lives in the 
same house she grew 
up in.

She has served as 
the Ward 1 Council-
lor for the past eight 
years. In her years 
as the ward council-
lor, McKenna said 
she has always been 
available to meet 
with people, take all 
calls, and resolve all 
problems brought to 
her attention.

McKenna said she 
has spent her life vol-
unteering and work-
ing for the city that 
she loves.

Stamatopoulos a 
Chief Executive and 

By Adam Swift

Paul Argenzio, 
the top vote-getter 
with 702 votes, and 
Gregory Murray, 242 
votes,  topped the 
ballot in the Ward 4 
preliminary election 
on Tuesday night, 
moving onto the Nov. 
7 municipal general 
election ballot.

The candidates are 
seeking to replace 
Patrick Keefe, who 
currently serves as 
acting mayor and is 
running for a full term 
in the mayor’s office.

Argenzio is a 
lifelong resident of 
Ward 4 who cur-
rently serves as the 
city’s Superintendent 
of Public Works. He 
has also served as 
the chair of the city’s 
traffic and parking 
commission for the 
past five years.

Argenzio stated 
that the city must 
ensure that its new 

residents, along with 
families who have 
resided in Revere for 
generations, can con-
tinue to afford to live 
in the city, and that 
city services such as 
police, fire, and pub-
lic works, grow to 
meet the needs of the 
rising population.

Murray said safety 
is his number one pri-
ority if elected to the 
council. He said there 
needs to be safety for 
students in school, 
as well as more pro-
grams for teens after 
school. In addition, 
Murray said there 
needs to be improved 
safety for the city’s 
senior citizens, both 
in their homes and in 
the streets.

With the city grow-
ing, Murray said the 
city needs to increase 
its public safety per-
sonnel and give them 
the tools to succeed.

Proctor Ave. res-
ident Herby-Jean 
Baptiste finished 
third with 168 votes.

By Adam Swift

Incumbent John 
Powers and Ange-
la Guarino-Sawaya 
topped the Ward 5 
preliminary election 
on Tuesday, moving 
onto the Nov. 7 mu-
nicipal general elec-
tion ballot.

Angela Guarino 
Saway, was the top 
vote-getter with 668 
votes,  with Powers 
coming in second 
with 432 votes.

Powers, who served 
as councillor for two 
decades has said that 
he is running on his 
long record of his 
past achievements for 
the ward, which most 
recently have includ-
ed the building of the 
new Point of Pines 
fire station. He said 
he is proud of his ser-
vice in Ward 5.

Guarino-Sawaya is 
a graduate of Suffolk 
University with near-
ly 20 years experi-

ence with the Boston 
Public Schools. She 
has volunteered with 
organizations such 
as the Revere Little 
League, Immaculate 
Conception School, 
and President of the 
Point of Pines Beach 
Association.

She stated that the 
most pressing issues 
facing Ward 5 today 
are over-develop-
ment, traffic man-
agement, and coastal 
resiliency. She said 
she plans to stop 
overdevelopment by 
implementing a mor-
atorium and enacting 
a sensible planning 
review. 

The other candi-
dates on the ballot 
were Ralph Celestin  
with 177 votes, and 
Randall Mondestin 
with 152.

The Race for Ward 4 The Race for Ward 5

O n  t h e  C a m p a i g n  T r a i l

Robert Haas III Anthony  Zambuto Marc Silvestri Michelle Kelley Juan Pablo Jaramillo

IT’S RIZZO AND KEEFE

IN THE RACE FOR MAYOR

VS VS VS

See WARD 1 Page 12

Greg MurrayPaul ArgenzioJohn StamatopoulosJoanne McKenna John PowersAngela Guarino-Sawaya

MARAIANNE SALZA PHOTO

Dan Rizzo is welcomed to his reception at Casa Lucia by many 
guests with open arms as State Rep. Jeffrey Turco looks on.

CARY SHUMAN PHOTO

Acting Mayor Patrick Keefe, with his wife, Jennifer, as they enter his campaign recep-
tion at Fine Line on Revere Beach. 

All votes are unofficial as of 
press time on Tuesday night.

By Adam Swift

The first weekend 
of February saw re-
cord-breaking cold across 
New England.

The Winthrop schools, 
like everyone else across 
the region, faced some 
challenges as the tempera-
tures went into a freefall, 
but came out of the cold 
snap without any major 
issues.

Superintendent of 

Schools Lisa Howard said 
preparation was key as the 
mercury began to drop on 
Friday, and she ultimately 
made the decision not to 
close school.

At Monday night’s 
School Committee meet-
ing, Howard walked 
through the process the 
district goes through when 
facing the potential for in-
clement weather.

“The most difficult part 
of my job each year is de-

ciding whether or not to 
have a snow day,” said 
Howard, joking that it has 
left a mark on her that she 
once called a snow day  
for a day when no snow 
ultimately fell from the 
skies.

“I do have a tremendous 
amount of support from 
my 15-year-old son, who 
convinces me if it looks 
like it is going to snow to 

Special to the Transcript

Have you ever want-
ed to own your own fire 
truck? Well, you’re in 
luck! The Town of Win-
throp is currently auc-
tioning off two used fire 
trucks — a 1996 Pierce 
Dash - Tilt Cab Fire Pump-
er and a 1989 GMC Model 
TC7D04 E-One (used as 
a Rescue 1). Both of the 
fire trucks are perfect for 
road construction compa-
nies or for use in a small 
fire department. These on-
line auctions are open to 

the public at municibid.
com and end on Monday, 
February 13.

Why are these auctions 
important? These auc-
tions are helping to bring 
money right back into im-
proving Winthrop’s com-
munity. 100% of the pro-

ceeds from these auctions 
go back to the Town of 
Winthrop. These funds are 
used for road maintenance, 
setting up local events for 
residents, community pro-
grams, public safety initia-
tives, and more! 

The 1996 Pierce Dash 
- Tilt Cab Fire Pumper 
has 69,401 miles on it and 
features a 6v92T Detroit 
Diesel Motor and Allison 
HT 740 Transmission. The 
1989 GMC Model TC7D04 
E-One has 27,708 miles on 
it and features a Onan 7.5 
KW Diesel Generator.

Town of Winthrop 
auctioning off two used fire trucks; 
Proceeds to help local community

Council votes on 
charter change 
recommendations
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SENATOR LYDIA 
EDWARDS TO HOST 
A COFFEE HOUR

On Tuesday February 
14 from 1-2pm Senator 
Lydia Edwards will be 
hosting a coffee hour at 
the Robert DeLeo Senior 
Center, 35 Harvard St in 
Winthrop.

“I want to thank the 
Winthrop Council on Ag-
ing for providing space to 
host this coffee hour. I’m 
looking forward to hearing 
about issues constituents 
in Winthrop are facing and 
speaking with them about 
my legislative priorities. 
Happy Valentine’s Day!” 
said Senator Lydia Ed-
wards (D-Boston)

CELEBRATE BLACK 
HISTORY MONTH

Looking for ways to 
celebrate and learn about 
Black history in the Mys-
tic? Check out these op-
portunities and commu-
nity events happening 
around the watershed:

• Explore the works of 
Medford Poet Laureate 
Terry E. Carter. We were 
excited to see Terry E. 
Carter, GreenRoots and 
environmental justice fea-
tured in the newest instal-
lation at the Mystic Mural 
Project (pictured above) 
— a 22-year-long mu-
ral project near Blessing 
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Schools make it through cold snap Two Winthrop Middle School sixth grade students, Esta-
fania and Gabriella “Gabby”, found a wallet and turned it 
into Officer Bonavita, who was able to locate and return 
the item to its very happy owner.   Thank you Estafania and 
Gabby -- great community service!

LOST & FOUND

By Adam Swift

The Town Council will 
remain a nine-member 
body for the foreseeable 
future.

Last week, the council 
voted on proposed char-
ter changes recommended 
by the Ordinance Review 
Committee (ORC). While 
a number of proposals will 
be forwarded to the state 
for a potential vote by 
town residents in Novem-
ber, one recommendation 
which would have cut the 
number of town council-
ors from nine to seven and 
done away with precinct 
seats failed to pass muster 
with the council.

In addition to the coun-
cil’s composition, the 
council also failed to ap-
prove a part of that rec-
ommendation that would 
have cut a councilor’s term 
from four to two years. 
A similar measure to in-
crease the Town Council 
President’s term from two 
to four years also failed to 
move forward.

A charter change rec-
ommendation needed a 
yes vote from six of the 

nine councilors to poten-
tially be placed in front of 
voters in the fall.

The remaining recom-
mendations from the ORC 
did gain the council’s ap-
proval, and will appear on 
the November ballot pro-
vided the state deems they 
can legally move forward.

Some of those proposed 
charger changes include 
tougher language in the 
council’s abandonment 
language for members 
who consistently miss 
meetings, and a recall pro-
vision for elected officials.

Council President 
James Letterie said that 
the recommendations 
from the ORC on the 
council composition and 
term lengths were part of 
an effort to increase par-
ticipation in elections and 
potentially attract candi-
dates so there are more 
contested races.

But a number of coun-
cilors said those recom-
mendations would either 
not achieve that goal or 
would weaken represen-
tation for the town’s resi-
dents.

See CHARTER Page 3

By Stephen Quigley

Boston Mayor Michelle 
Wu delivered her State of 
the City Address at the 
MGM Music Hall next 
door to Fenway Park last 
week in which the mayor 
noted the achievements 
that have been accom-
plished over the past year 
and outlined a vision for 
making Boston a greener 
and more affordable city 
in which  to live and work 
by 2030.

“The state of the city is 
strong,” said Wu adding, 
“We have the resources, 
the resolve, and respon-
sibility to make it even 
stronger.”

Wu praised city em-
ployees for making “every 
accomplishment and con-
stituent service delivered, 
every detail of the agenda 
we’re sharing here tonight 
— this is only possible be-
cause of you.

“Our cabinet is two-
thirds people of color,” 
Wu noted. She singled 

out Boston natives Bos-
ton Police Commissioner 
Michael Cox; Trinh Nguy-
en, the Chief of Worker 
Empowerment; and Se-
gun Idowu, Chief of Eco-
nomic Opportunity and 
Development, for their 
commitment to Boston’s 
residents.

“Three bus lines are en-
tirely fare free,” said Wu, 
“and now we are accel-
erating over two dozen, 
new, dedicated bus lanes, 
expanding our bike net-

work, and organizing even 
more neighborhood Open 
Streets events.”

The mayor highlighted 
that public safety will be 
important, noting that 900 
guns were taken off the 
streets and that violent and 
property crime are at the 
lowest levels in 15 years. 

Bringing welcome news 
to many neighborhood 
residents who have bitter-
ly complained about the 
indifference of the Boston 
Planning and Redevelop-
ment Agency, Wu called 
for “charting a new course 
for growth, with people 
as our compass.  Tomor-
row, I’ll sign an executive 
order establishing a Plan-
ning Advisory Council to 
fully integrate long-range 
planning, and begin mod-
ernizing our zoning code.” 

Wu noted that she aims 
to “sustainably” increase 
the population of Boston 
from its current number of 
675,000 to 800,000.

Affordable housing also 
figured in her goals.  Wu 

said that more than 3,800 
housing units were per-
mitted, including 1,300 
affordable units.

Wu said “every square 
foot of city-owned prop-
erty” has been analyzed 
“and we have identified 
several parcels that could 
be used for affordable 
housing units.”

If “local builders 
work with us to design 
high-quality, affordable 
homes that enhance the 
surrounding neighbor-
hood, we will give you 
the land for free. And we 
will provide increased 
mortgage assistance so 
our residents can afford to 
buy these homes,” said the 
mayor.

Wu set a goal of 2030 
to have the city’s public 
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The Boston Police 
Department is seeking 
the public’s assistance 
in efforts to locate 
Reina Morales Rojas, 
41, of East Boston. 
She is described as 
a Hispanic Female, 
5’5”, 145lbs, black 
hair and brown eyes. 
We are praying Reina 
is found and returned 
with her family.

Anyone with infor-
mation regarding her 
whereabouts is ad-
vised to contact 911 
or A-7 Department at 
(617) 343-4324.

Police seek help with local missing person

MAYOR’S OFFICE PHOTO BY ISABEL LEON

Mayor Michelle Wu delivers 
remarks during the 2023 
State of the City adderess at 
the MGM Music Hall.

Special to the Times-Free Press

Albert J. “AJ” Moscone, 
Jr. has been accepted into 
the Boston Bar Associ-
ation’s Public Interest 
Leadership Program. Each 
year, the Boston Bar As-
sociation’s Public Interest 
Leadership Program wel-
comes a select group of 
talented and highly-mo-
tivated lawyers to partic-
ipate in a year-long pro-
gram designed to provide 
intensive leadership and 
professional development 
training.

Moscone is the founder 
of Moscone Law, where 
he focuses on an array of 
matters, including crim-
inal, civil, and business 
litigation as well as trans-
actional and hospitality 
matters. He has success-
fully litigated before a 
judge or jury in multiple 
venues throughout the 
Commonwealth, as well 
as in Federal Court, and 
has guided home and 
business owners through 
transactional and zoning/
licensure matters.

He was born and raised 
in East Boston, he cur-
rently serves on the Board 
of Directors for the East 
Boston Chamber of Com-
merce as well as the East 
Boston YMCA.

The notification letter is 

as follows:
On behalf of the Bos-

ton Bar Association, I am 
pleased to welcome you 
to the 2023 class of the 
Public Interest Leadership 
Program (PILP). You have 
been selected from a num-
ber of impressive appli-
cants to join this tremen-
dously talented group of 
attorneys. Congratulations 
on this achievement!

I am confident that 
your PILP experience will 
deepen your engagement 
and involvement as a lead-
er both in the BBA and 
within the community at 
large. Further, I hope the 
bonds you develop with 
fellow PILP participants 
will enrich your experi-
ence and growth during 
the program and beyond.

I wish you and your 
class all the best and look 
forward to working with 
you this year.

Albert J. “AJ” Moscone.

Moscone accepted into program

Wu sets ambitious agenda in State of the City address

Michael Coughlin Jr.

Tree Eastie, a non-profit 
organization that focuses 
on planting and maintain-
ing trees while educating 
residents about their bene-
fits, has been doing its part 
in an effort to increase 
East Boston’s scarce tree 
canopy. 

East Boston’s tree can-
opy sits at 7% – the low-
est in the City of Boston 
– which is woeful consid-
ering the average is 27%. 

“We need a lot more 
trees. We’ve got a lot of 
heat islands, and because 
of the effects of the high-
ways and the airport and 
also the flooding that we 
get along the coastline, 
we need a lot of trees just 
from an environmental 
standpoint,” said Tree 
Eastie Founder Bill Mas-
terson. 

Not only do trees help 
environmental aspects 
like reducing air pollution, 
but they can cool down 
streets, filter stormwater, 

and even increase proper-
ty value, according to Tree 
Eastie. 

That being said, the 
non-profit is doing its best 
to increase the neighbor-
hood’s tree canopy and 
has had great success as 
they have planted 164 
street trees over the last 15 
months, a number Master-
son is proud of. 

“That’s a big number 
… these are small trees. I 
mean, they’re only proba-
bly 10 or 12 feet tall, but, 
I mean, they’re going to 
grow two to three feet a 
year, and fast forward 10 
years from now, there’s 
going to be a lot of shade,” 
said Masterson. 

One of the main reasons 
Tree Eastie was able to 
plant that many trees was 
due to its relatively new 
and strong relationship 
with the City of Boston. 
In negotiations that took 
place for about a year, the 
non-profit was able to se-

Tree Eastie is
making tremendous 
environmental strides 

See TREE EASTIE Page 9

See page 8 for 

Mayor Wu’s 

complete speech.

Opening of New District A-7 Police Station in East Boston. Among those who turned out for the event are Mayor Michelle 
Wu (cutting the ribbon), Rep. Adrian Madaro (third from left holding the ribbon), Veronica Robles, City Councilor Gabriela 
Coletta, Boston Police Commissioner Michael Cox (behind Mayor Wu’s left), Police Captain Dean Bickerton (behind Mayor 
Wu’s right), Amelia Marcella (helping to cut the ribbon) and Skip Marcella.

RIBBON CUTTING FOR NEW POLICE STATION IN EASTIE

By Cary Shuman

Encore Boston Harbor 
President Jenny Holaday 
said it all about the opening 
of the WynnBET Sports-
book Tuesday at the five-
star resort/casino in Ever-
ett.

“It’s sports betting in the 
nation’s best sports town,” 
remarked Holaday. “Every-
one is thrilled and excited 
it’s here.”

Holaday was joined 
by Everett Mayor Carlo 
DeMaria, Speaker of the 
House Ron Mariano, State 
Reps. Joseph McGonagle 
and Dan Ryan and an ar-
ray of professional athletes 
at the grand opening of 
the new sportsbook which 
is another step in Encore 
bringing a spectacular Las 
Vegas-style experience to 
Everett.

“This has been long 
overdue,” said DeMaria, 
who led the way for the 
Encore resort/casino to 
be built in the city. “Peo-
ple have been able to go 
to other states to wager on 
sports. We made the same 
argument when we were 
bringing the casino to Ev-
erett – why not keep the 
money here in the commu-
nity? This sportsbook is a 
very nice facility.”

DeMaria said he had the 
opportunity to chat with 
Johnny Damon, one of the 

sports celebrities in atten-
dance at Tuesday’s event. 
“I thanked him for break-
ing the Curse of the Bam-
bino,” remarked DeMaria.

An historic day for 
Massachusetts

Boston sports fans, 
who have enjoyed several 
championships by the New 
England Patriots, Boston 
Red Sox, Boston Celtics, 
and Boston Bruins in this 
century, can now legally 
wager on professional and 
college sports at Encore – 
and they’re excited about 
the opportunity.

Mike Capone of Malden 
was one of the first patrons 
to wager after Holaday per-
sonally led the countdown 

By Adam Swift

The Planning Board ap-
proved the site plans for 
two separate retail mari-
juana facilities at its meet-
ing last week.

Both facilities, one at 
260-270 Second Street 
and one at 307 Broadway, 
were approved for special 

permits by the Zoning 
Board earlier in January.

“The space is zoned in-
dustrial, which allows this 
type of use,” said Shei-
la Grant, the attorney for 
DMS Trinity on Second 
Street. “It is currently uti-
lized as office space and a 
flower wholesaler. We will 
utilize space on the first 
floor, which has its own 
separate entrance.”

There are also 14 park-
ing spaces set aside for 
the business, which meets 
zoning requirements, 
Grant said.

Trinity DMS is a social 

equity applicant, as well as 
a minority owned business 
enterprise.

“They are committed to 
outreach and hiring within 
the city, as well,” Grant 
said.

Concrete Garden at 307 
Broadway had its easi-
est night in front of a city 
board since the business 
was first proposed last 
year.

Earlier in January, the 
ZBA granted a special 
permit for the business, 
despite some ongoing 
concerns about the own-
er of the 307 Broadway 

property. 
Concrete Garden prin-

cipal Vladimir Samuel has 
agreed to make upgrades 
to the building to bring it 
in compliance with city 
regulations.

At last week’s Planning 
Board, Samuel quickly 
ran through the site plan 
and provided some infor-
mation on lighting and se-
curity cameras before the 
board voted to approve the 
site plan.

In other business, the 
board approved the site 

Special to the Record

Senator Sal DiDome-
nico with his colleague 
Representative Marjorie 
Decker and the Lift Our 
Kids Coalition have ac-
celerated the timetable for 
lifting kids out of Deep 
Poverty by filing Senate 
and House bills (SD 501, 
HD 507) at the start of the 
2023-2024 legislative ses-
sion. A campaign launch 
event was held last week 
to build support for this 
legislation and introduce 
it to members of the Leg-
islature.  The Act to Lift 
Kids Out of Deep Poverty, 
which Senator DiDome-
nico has led on for years, 
would raise the maximum 
cash assistance grant by 

25% a year until it reaches 
half of the federal poverty 
level. Families living be-
low half the poverty lev-
el are considered to be in 
Deep Poverty. Under the 

bill, grants would increase 
each year and would keep 
pace with inflation as the 
poverty level goes up. 

After decades of fro-
zen cash assistance levels, 

Senator DiDomenico and 
Representative Decker led 
the charge in the Legisla-
ture to raise grants three 
times for a total increase of 
32% beginning in January 
2021. This was a huge step 
forward for families in our 
communities and they are 
looking to continue build-
ing on this momentum.

“It is simply unaccept-
able that we have near-
ly 70,000 children in the 
Commonwealth living 
so far below the federal 
poverty level,” said Sena-
tor DiDomenico, the lead 
sponsor of the Senate bill 
and Assistant Majority 
Leader of the Massachu-
setts Senate. “While the 
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By Adam Swift

More than a half a cen-
tury later, the first steps of 
man on the moon still in-
spire awe and wonder.

Now, thanks to the 
Space Adventure exhibit 
currently running at 121 
Webster Ave., visitors can 
experience the thrill of lu-
nar exploration complete 
with more than 300 origi-
nal NASA items.

Visitors will have the 
opportunity to experience 
the Mercury, Gemini and 
Apollo missions – re-
sponsible for bringing the 
first humans to the lunar 
surface – through a series 
of immersive rooms that 
include original artifacts 
that no one has ever seen 
or been given access to 
before. These include the 
control panel and count-
ing clock of the Houston 

Space Center, comput-
ers used in 1960, radios 
used for communication 
between spacecraft and 
Earth, astronaut suits, 
cameras used to capture 
the famous images of the 
lunar surface and astro-
nauts, work tools and de-
vices that filtered the air 
inside the modules, the 
Apollo mission food menu 
featuring items that could 
be stored for decades and 

products developed espe-
cially for the personal hy-
giene of astronauts while 
they were in the space.

The exhibition is di-
vided into several stages. 
The first is a 180-degree 
immersive video that 
welcomes and transports 
visitors to the space en-
vironment they are about 
to immerse themselves 

Rep. Marjorie Decker and Sen. Sal DiDomenico.

DiDomenico launches campaign 
to lift kids out of deep poverty

NASA comes to Chelsea
PHOTO COURTESY OF SPACE ADVENTURE

City Councillor Calvin Brown at the exhibit.

Planning Board approves marijuana dispensary site plans

Special to the Record

More than three dozen 
fire service leaders from 
across Massachusetts, in-
cluding Chelsea Deputy 
Chief Edward McGarry, 
graduated from  the Mas-
sachusetts Firefighting 
Academy’s Chief Fire Of-
ficer Management Train-
ing Program.

The four-month pro-
gram for new chief of-
ficers and chief officer 
candidates is delivered 
jointly by the Massachu-
setts Firefighting Acade-
my and the University of 
Massachusetts Edward J. 
Collins Jr. Center for Pub-

lic Management. Through 
classroom instruction and 
out-of-class assignments, 
the course delivers inten-
sive training in the non-
fire suppression aspects of 
managing a municipal fire 
department.

“The Chief Fire Officer 
program is a tremendous 
opportunity for new chiefs 
and rising officers,” said 
State Fire Marshal Peter 
J. Ostroskey, who gradu-
ated from the program in 
2002. “The rigorous in-
struction in such a wide 
variety of topics will help 
these graduates provide 

Local fire service leaders 
complete program

State Fire Marshal Peter J. Ostrokey (right), with Chelsea 
Deputy Chief Edward McGarry.

See NASA Page 5

See ENCORE Page 6

See McGARY Page 2

Longtime Chelsea School 
Committee member 
Rosemarie Carlisle greets 
former New England 
Patriots star receiver 
Julian Edelman at an event 
Tuesday at Encore Boston 
Harbor, celebrating the 
launch of legalized sports 
betting in Massachusetts.

Wynner’s Circle
Sports betting 
begins at Encore By Cary Shuman

Encore Boston Harbor 
President Jenny Hola-
day said it all about the 
opening of the WynnBET 
Sportsbook Tuesday at the 
five-star resort/casino in 
Everett.

“It’s sports betting in 
the nation’s best sports 
town,” remarked Holaday. 
“Everyone is thrilled and 
excited it’s here.”

Holaday was joined 
by Everett Mayor Carlo 
DeMaria, Speaker of the 
House Ron Mariano, State 
Reps. Joseph McGonagle 
and Dan Ryan and an array 
of professional athletes at 
the grand opening of the 
new sportsbook which 
is another step in Encore 
bringing a spectacular Las 
Vegas-style experience to 
Everett.

“This has been long 
overdue,” said DeMaria, 
who led the way for the 
Encore resort/casino to be 
built in the city. “People 
have been able to go to 
other states to wager on 
sports. We made the same 
argument when we were 
bringing the casino to Ev-
erett – why not keep the 
money here in the com-
munity? This sportsbook 
is a very nice facility.”

DeMaria said he had 
the opportunity to chat 

with Johnny Damon, one 
of the sports celebrities in 
attendance at Tuesday’s 
event. “I thanked him for 
breaking the Curse of the 
Bambino,” remarked De-
Maria.

An historic day for 
Massachusetts

Boston sports fans, 
who have enjoyed several 
championships by the New 
England Patriots, Boston 
Red Sox, Boston Celtics, 
and Boston Bruins in this 
century, can now legally 
wager on professional and 
college sports at Encore – 
and they’re excited about 
the opportunity.

Mike Capone of Mal-
den was one of the first 
patrons to wager after 

Special to the Independent

Senator Sal DiDome-
nico with his colleague 
Representative Marjorie 
Decker and the Lift Our 

Kids Coalition have ac-
celerated the timetable for 
lifting kids out of Deep 
Poverty by filing Senate 
and House bills (SD 501, 
HD 507) at the start of the 

2023-2024 legislative ses-
sion. A campaign launch 
event was held last week 
to build support for this 
legislation and introduce 
it to members of the Leg-
islature.  The Act to Lift 
Kids Out of Deep Poverty, 
which Senator DiDome-
nico has led on for years, 
would raise the maximum 
cash assistance grant by 
25% a year until it reaches 
half of the federal poverty 
level. Families living be-
low half the poverty lev-
el are considered to be in 
Deep Poverty. Under the 
bill, grants would increase 
each year and would keep 
pace with inflation as the 
poverty level goes up. 

After decades of fro-
zen cash assistance levels, 

Senator DiDomenico and 
Representative Decker led 
the charge in the Legisla-
ture to raise grants three 
times for a total increase of 
32% beginning in January 
2021. This was a huge step 
forward for families in our 
communities and they are 
looking to continue build-
ing on this momentum.

“It is simply unaccept-
able that we have near-
ly 70,000 children in the 
Commonwealth living 
so far below the federal 
poverty level,” said Sena-
tor DiDomenico, the lead 
sponsor of the Senate bill 
and Assistant Majority 
Leader of the Massachu-
setts Senate. “While the 
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Rep. Marjorie Decker and Sen. Sal DiDomenico.

DiDomenico launches campaign 
to lift kids out of deep poverty

Everett’s Shinay Aristhene demonstrates good form that 
earned him 2nd place in the 50-yard hurdles.

Nicole Brandao (109) clears the last hurdle on her way to a 
first place finish in the 50-yard hurdles.

EHS COMPETES IN GREATER BOSTON LEAGUE TRACK
The Crimson Tide came away with win and a loss to Medford in Greater Boston League track action Monday at 

Malden High School, as the boys pulled away to a 51-35 victory but the girls were tipped 46-40.

Special to the Independent

More than three dozen 
fire service leaders from 
across Massachusetts 
including Everett Depu-
ty Chief Sabato LoRus-
so graduated from the 
Massachusetts Firefight-
ing Academy’s Chief 
Fire Officer Management 
Training Program.

The four-month pro-
gram for new chief of-
ficers and chief officer 
candidates is delivered 
jointly by the Massachu-
setts Firefighting Acade-
my and the University of 
Massachusetts Edward J. 
Collins Jr. Center for Pub-
lic Management. Through 
classroom instruction and 
out-of-class assignments, 
the course delivers inten-
sive training in the non-
fire suppression aspects of 
managing a municipal fire 
department.

“The Chief Fire Officer 
program is a tremendous 
opportunity for new chiefs 
and rising officers,” said 
State Fire Marshal Peter 
J. Ostroskey, who gradu-
ated from the program in 
2002. “The rigorous in-
struction in such a wide 
variety of topics will help 
these graduates provide 
the leadership that their 
departments and commu-
nities deserve. Complet-
ing the program is a ma-
jor accomplishment and I 
want to congratulate them 
on their initiative and ded-
ication to professional de-
velopment.”

The Chief Fire Officer 
Management Training 
Program covers a spec-
trum of topics considered 
essential for effective 
public sector manage-
ment. It includes human 

State Fire Marshal Peter J. Ostroskey (right). With Everett 
Deputy Chief Sabato LoRusso.

Local fire service leaders 
complete program

BRIAN GIANNELLI HONORED AT CITY HALL

Parking Enforcement Officer Brian Giannelli (second from left) was presented with an appreciation citation by the City 
Council for his heroic efforts on the early morning of Dec. 22, 2022, alerting residents to a two-alarm fire in Vine Street. 
Shown at the ceremony are (left to right) Brian Giannelli Jr. (son), Brian Giannelli, Keith Giannelli (brother), Carlo Giannelli 
(son), Kenny Giannelli (uncle), Mary (mother-in-law) and Councilor Wayne Matewsky.

See TRAINING Page 2

Wynner’s Circle
Sports betting 
begins at Encore

Everett Mayor Carlo 
DeMaria and Rep. Joe 
McGonagle are pictured at 
the WynnBET Sportsbook 
at Encore Boston Harbor 
on the historic first day of 
legalized sports betting in 
Massachusetts.

BOB MARRA PHOTOS

 By Cary Shuman

Lynn Councilor-at-Large Bri-
an LaPierre attended the grand 

opening of the WynnBet Sports-
book on Jan. 31 at Encore Boston 
Harbor.

LaPierre was accompanied by 
his wife, former Lynn English 
High School softball great Kelly 
Curtin LaPierre for the official 
launch of legalized sports betting 
in Massachusetts.

During the festivities, the 
LaPierres interacted with sever-
al Boston sports celebrities who 
were in attendance for the mo-
mentous event.

“It’s exciting to be here on an 
historic day for Massachusetts 
and Encore Boston Harbor with 
the launch of legalized sports bet-
ting,” said Brian. “Sports betting 
has been a long time coming to 
our state, and it’s going to bring 
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Call us NOW for a free confidential market analysis of your home!
We have preapproved Clients looking to buy!

www.century21mario.com
Si Parla Italiano • Se Habla Espanol
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HELP
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CHELSEA
2 Family 1st Floor has 2 levels w/2 baths, 

H/W Floors, Lg Lot, Lots of Parking Won’t 
Last! #106G $550’s

EAST BOSTON COMING SOON
Gorgeous 2Br 2 Bath Condos, H/W Floors, 
C/AC, Quartz, SS Bosch Appliances, Plus 

Garage Parking!
Call for Details!

WINTHROP - RENT
For Rent – Prime Center Loc. w/ Full Basement, 
Ideal for Retail, Medical, Day Care, $2,900/mo

Call for Details
Linda 617-306-9605

WINTHROP
Mixed Use Commercial Plus 3 Residential, 

6 Car Parking, Great for Investors! 
#130S $949,000

WINTHROP
Lovely 7 Rm, 3 Br, 2 Bath Home, H/W Floors, 

Mod Kitchen, F.P. 
Beautiful Detail, 

Easy walk to Beach 
& Shops! 

Won't Last 
$485,000

WINTHROP
Amazing 3 Br 2 Bath Home, Open Kitchen Liv-
ing Area w Cathedral Ceiling, Mod Kit/w Corian 

Counters SS Refrig. Fireplace LV Oversized 
finished basement, C/

AC, Deck with IG 
Pool Extremely well 

maintained home 
Must See! Won’t 
Last! $499,900

SALE PENDING

EAST BOSTON
ORIENT HEIGHTS

Location Location! Bungalow style 
1 family, 3 Brs Full Dr, H/W Floors, 

Gorgeous detail throughout

WINTHROP
Hard to Find! A Vacant lot (over 5,000 s.f.) with 

a foundation on it! Also has a 2 story garage.
 Great for Builders, or Make your own 

Dream home!  #455P $275K

EAST BOSTON 
GREENWAY LOCATION!

Mod 1 Br Condo, New kitchen, SS Appl, 
Quartz Counters! H/W Floors, Steps to T 

& Greenway! $329,900

SALE PENDING

REVERE - WEST
2 Family, Great Move in Condition! Custom 

Cabinets, New Bath, Roof, C/AC, H/W Floors, 
Quartz, SS Appl, Too Much to List! $629,000

• 100 Gal. Minimum  • 24 Hour Service
CALL FOR DAILY LOW PRICE

Per 
Gallon

$2.55  
Price subject 
to change 

without 
notice

TRASH 
NOTICE

Due to the president's 
Day Holiday, on Monday, 
February 19th , 2018 Trash 
will be delayed by one day.
Capitol Waste Services, Inc.

Our Offices will be 
OPEN

Monday, February 19th

President’s Day
9AM – 5PM

Thomas Boyan, Sr

Marie Butera

Richard Buttiglieri

Theresa Conte

Dr. Adrian Costanza

Dorothy Cordaro

Gerardo Iannuzzi

Patricia Muse

Paul Penta, Jr. 

Antonetta Salamone

Obituaries Pages 8 + 9

See NEWS BRIEFS, Page 2

$1.5 MILLION FOR 
NORTHERN STRAND 
COMMUNITY TRAIL

The Executive Office of 
Energy and Environmental 
Affairs has approved a $1.5 
million grant regarding the 
development of the Northern 
Strand Community Trail led 
by a Revere on the Move part-
ner organization, Bike to the 
Sea. 

Revere has a one-mile 
stretch in North Revere. The 
Northern Strand Community 
Trail has been in development 
for over 20 years. The North 
Revere segment is a major 
part in the project that creates 
a continuous 7.5-mile rail trail 
running from West Everett, 
through Malden and Revere 
to the Saugus River and soon 
into Lynn. The North Revere 
segment allows users to en-
joy spectacular views of the 
Rumney Marsh. 

The funding, awarded 
through the Executive Office 
of Energy and Environmental 
Affairs’ (EEA) Gateway City 
Parks Program, enables the 
design of the trail, develop-
ment of bid-ready construc-
tion documents, and receipt 
of all necessary construction 
permits. When completed, the 
trail will span 10 miles and 

See DeLEO Page 3

REVERE RECREATION HOSTS PAINT 
& SKATE NIGHT AT CRONIN RINK

Joseph Arrigo was all smiles at the Revere Recreation Paint & 
Skate Night on Feb. 10 at the Cronin Skating Rink in Revere. 
Please see more photos on Page 10.

By Sue Ellen Woodcock

For years the abutters of 
Route 1 have put up with the 
noise from millions of cars, 
and now some city councillors 
want to have Mayor Brian Ar-
rigo contact the MassDOT to 
install barriers along Route 1 
between Route 16 and Cope-
land Circle.

Ward 5 Councillor Charles 
Patch, Ward 4 Councillor 
Patrick Keefe and Ward 1 
Councillor Joanne McKen-
na teamed up on a motion at 
last last week’s council meet-
ing. Patch said he and the late 

Councillor Robert Haas Jr. 
tried to get barriers installed 
in 2011 and received no re-
sponse.

“We should get more re-
spect from the state and fed-
eral government,” Patch said..

Keefe noted that more af-
fluent communities are often 
granted sound barriers.

Ward 2 Councillor Ira No-
voselsky pointed out that Sau-
gus got barriers along Route 
1 installed along a new ball 
field.

“It’s a quality-of-life is-
sue,” he said.

Barriers are easily seen 

Have you ever had an idea 
for how you could make im-
provements to the Revere 
community? So have the ap-
plicants to the mini-grant pro-
grams hosted by Revere on 
the Move and the Alcohol, To-
bacco and Other Drugs Task 
Force; and this time, these 
ideas are going to become a 
reality.

Every year a group of Re-
vere residents and institution-
al leaders meet together to 
select the awardees of mini-
grants offered to the public 
through the community-led 
organizations, Revere on the 
Move and the Alcohol, Tobac-
co, and Other Drugs (ATOD) 

Task Force. Both the ATOD 
Task Force and Revere on the 
Move are initiatives of the 
MGH Revere CARES Coa-
lition. Revere on the Move 
is additionally co-led by the 
Healthy Community Initia-
tives Office at the City of Re-
vere.

This year over $20,000 
was awarded to fund ideas to 
make Revere a healthier place 
to work, to play, and to raise 
a family. The Revere on the 
Move mini-grant program 
offered $10,605 in funding 
for permanent changes, pro-
gram implementation, and 
youth-led projects that would 
help prevent or reduce obe-

sity in children and adults. 
The ATOD Task Force fund-
ed projects totaling $9,500 to 
reduce youth substance use, 
improve their mental health, 
and increase opportunities for 
positive youth engagement.

In addition to the mini-
grants already funded, Revere 
on the Move has extended 
their permanent change and 
program mini-grant appli-
cations to Sunday, March 4. 
Up to $1,395 is available for 
ideas that make it easier to 
eat healthy and be active for 
all. The application is open 

Revere's TND
receives $50,000
state grant for jobs

Special to The Journal

Monday morning the Bak-
er-Polito Administration 
awarded $500,000 to nine 
projects through the Urban 
Agenda Grant Program. The 
Revere arm of The Neigh-
borhood Developers (TND) 
was one group given $50,000 
in funding to help establish 
workforce development ser-
vices in Revere to support lo-
cal residents to acquire newly 
created jobs.

Lt. Gov. Karyn Polito along 
with Housing and Economic 
Development Secretary Jay 
Ash came to Revere City Hall 
to present the check to the 
Neighborhood Developers.

“Our administration under-
stands the importance of local 
leadership and its impact on 
the lives of residents,” said 
Lt. Governor Karyn Polito. 
“The Urban Agenda Grant 
Program relies on the strong 
partnerships between local 
government, non-profits and 

the business community that 
are critical to fostering eco-
nomic success and building 
stronger neighborhoods in ev-
ery region in Massachusetts.”

Revere is rebuilding its 
economic and employment 
base by utilizing large-scale 
and high value assets includ-
ing Suffolk Downs, Wonder-
land, a soon-to-close NECCO 
plant, and the MassDevelop-
ment TDI Waterfront District.

The program seeks to un-
lock community-driven re-
sponses to local obstacles, 
and promote economic devel-
opment opportunities through 
partnership-building, problem 
solving, and shared account-
ability in urban centers. The 
competitive awards offer flex-
ible funding for local efforts 
that bring together commu-
nity stakeholders to pursue 
economic development ini-
tiatives. These awards will 
fund projects in Boston, Clin-

Real estate values continue to be strong in Revere

Lt. Gov. Karyn Polito, Ann Houston of The Neighborhood Developers, State Rep. RoseLee Vincent, 
Bob O' Brien of Revere Economic Department, Mayor Brian Arrigo and Secretary of Housing and 
Ecomonic Development  Jay Ash at the announcement of the Urban Agenda Grant Program on 
Monday morning in the Revere City Council Chambers.

By Sue Ellen Woodcock

The Revere real estate mar-
ket in 2017 was definitely a 
good one with higher prices 
for homes than in 2016, but 
a drop in the number of new 
listings, making home-buying 
an adventure.

“These are the highest pric-
es we’ve seen in the last eight 
years,” said Maureen Celata, 
owner/broker of MCelata Real 
Estate. “And 2018 is going to 
be another banner year. Inven-
tory is low now, but everyone 
is looking to the spring.”

According to figures from 
the Massachusetts Associa-
tion of Realtors, the median 
sales prices was $376,250, 
a 4.9 increase over prices in 
2016.

Homes also were also on 
the market 41 days, a 26.8 
percent increase over the 56 

days on the market in 2016.
The number of listings in 

2017 also dropped to 265, 
10.8 percent down from 297 
in 2016. The good news for 
sellers is that the original list-
ing price was matched 100 
percent of the time.

The condominium mar-
ket saw similar trends with 
the median sales price at 
$315,000, up 16.7 percent 
over 2016. Days on the mar-
ket also dropped from 67 in 
2016 to 47 days on the market

“Inventory is low now and 
everyone is looking toward 
the spring,” Celata said

The rental market is also 
strong with rents ranging from 
$1,200 to $3,000. Cleat noted 
that if someone is paying big 
rent they just might be capable 
of buying and taking advan-
tage of first-time homebuyers 
programs.

“2017 was a fantastic year 
to be in real estate,” said Joe 
Mario of Century 21 Ma-
rio Real Estate. “There’s a 
lot of confidence and equity 
in homes. For 35 years now 
it’s been positive. Now is the 
time to sell. Revere is getting 
the overflow from the Boston 
market and people are moving 
to Revere.

Mario said Revere is desir-
able because of its proximity 
to Boston, and it’s a hidden 
gem with a beautiful beach.

Mario is looking forward 
to the spring market, drawing 
from Boston and surrounding 
communities. He added that 
the Revere School system is 
also a draw for buyers.

“It all adds to the future 
growth of Revere,” he said.

See MINI GRANTS Page 3

See  TND GRANT , Page 3
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MARIO REAL ESTATE
SELLERS

Call us NOW for a free confidential market analysis of your home!
We have preapproved Clients looking to buy!

www.century21mario.com
Si Parla Italiano • Se Habla Espanol

Falo Portuguese• Chúng tôi nói tiếng Việt

HELP
WE NEED HOMES 

TO SELL!!
CALL US NOW!!

CHELSEA
2 Family 1st Floor has 2 levels w/2 baths, 

H/W Floors, Lg Lot, Lots of Parking Won’t 
Last! #106G $550’s

EAST BOSTON COMING SOON
Gorgeous 2Br 2 Bath Condos, H/W Floors, 
C/AC, Quartz, SS Bosch Appliances, Plus 

Garage Parking!
Call for Details!

WINTHROP - RENT
For Rent – Prime Center Loc. w/ Full Basement, 
Ideal for Retail, Medical, Day Care, $2,900/mo

Call for Details
Linda 617-306-9605

WINTHROP
Mixed Use Commercial Plus 3 Residential, 

6 Car Parking, Great for Investors! 
#130S $949,000

WINTHROP
Lovely 7 Rm, 3 Br, 2 Bath Home, H/W Floors, 

Mod Kitchen, F.P. 
Beautiful Detail, 

Easy walk to Beach 
& Shops! 

Won't Last 
$485,000

WINTHROP
Amazing 3 Br 2 Bath Home, Open Kitchen Liv-
ing Area w Cathedral Ceiling, Mod Kit/w Corian 

Counters SS Refrig. Fireplace LV Oversized 
finished basement, C/

AC, Deck with IG 
Pool Extremely well 

maintained home 
Must See! Won’t 
Last! $499,900

SALE PENDING

EAST BOSTON
ORIENT HEIGHTS

Location Location! Bungalow style 
1 family, 3 Brs Full Dr, H/W Floors, 

Gorgeous detail throughout

WINTHROP
Hard to Find! A Vacant lot (over 5,000 s.f.) with 

a foundation on it! Also has a 2 story garage.
 Great for Builders, or Make your own 

Dream home!  #455P $275K

EAST BOSTON 
GREENWAY LOCATION!

Mod 1 Br Condo, New kitchen, SS Appl, 
Quartz Counters! H/W Floors, Steps to T 

& Greenway! $329,900

SALE PENDING

REVERE - WEST
2 Family, Great Move in Condition! Custom 

Cabinets, New Bath, Roof, C/AC, H/W Floors, 
Quartz, SS Appl, Too Much to List! $629,000

• 100 Gal. Minimum  • 24 Hour Service
CALL FOR DAILY LOW PRICE

Per 
Gallon

$2.55  
Price subject 
to change 

without 
notice

TRASH 
NOTICE

Due to the president's 
Day Holiday, on Monday, 
February 19th , 2018 Trash 
will be delayed by one day.
Capitol Waste Services, Inc.

Our Offices will be 
OPEN

Monday, February 19th

President’s Day
9AM – 5PM

Thomas Boyan, Sr

Marie Butera

Richard Buttiglieri

Theresa Conte

Dr. Adrian Costanza

Dorothy Cordaro

Gerardo Iannuzzi

Patricia Muse

Paul Penta, Jr. 

Antonetta Salamone

Obituaries Pages 8 + 9

See NEWS BRIEFS, Page 2

$1.5 MILLION FOR 
NORTHERN STRAND 
COMMUNITY TRAIL

The Executive Office of 
Energy and Environmental 
Affairs has approved a $1.5 
million grant regarding the 
development of the Northern 
Strand Community Trail led 
by a Revere on the Move part-
ner organization, Bike to the 
Sea. 

Revere has a one-mile 
stretch in North Revere. The 
Northern Strand Community 
Trail has been in development 
for over 20 years. The North 
Revere segment is a major 
part in the project that creates 
a continuous 7.5-mile rail trail 
running from West Everett, 
through Malden and Revere 
to the Saugus River and soon 
into Lynn. The North Revere 
segment allows users to en-
joy spectacular views of the 
Rumney Marsh. 

The funding, awarded 
through the Executive Office 
of Energy and Environmental 
Affairs’ (EEA) Gateway City 
Parks Program, enables the 
design of the trail, develop-
ment of bid-ready construc-
tion documents, and receipt 
of all necessary construction 
permits. When completed, the 
trail will span 10 miles and 

See DeLEO Page 3

REVERE RECREATION HOSTS PAINT 
& SKATE NIGHT AT CRONIN RINK

Joseph Arrigo was all smiles at the Revere Recreation Paint & 
Skate Night on Feb. 10 at the Cronin Skating Rink in Revere. 
Please see more photos on Page 10.

By Sue Ellen Woodcock

For years the abutters of 
Route 1 have put up with the 
noise from millions of cars, 
and now some city councillors 
want to have Mayor Brian Ar-
rigo contact the MassDOT to 
install barriers along Route 1 
between Route 16 and Cope-
land Circle.

Ward 5 Councillor Charles 
Patch, Ward 4 Councillor 
Patrick Keefe and Ward 1 
Councillor Joanne McKen-
na teamed up on a motion at 
last last week’s council meet-
ing. Patch said he and the late 

Councillor Robert Haas Jr. 
tried to get barriers installed 
in 2011 and received no re-
sponse.

“We should get more re-
spect from the state and fed-
eral government,” Patch said..

Keefe noted that more af-
fluent communities are often 
granted sound barriers.

Ward 2 Councillor Ira No-
voselsky pointed out that Sau-
gus got barriers along Route 
1 installed along a new ball 
field.

“It’s a quality-of-life is-
sue,” he said.

Barriers are easily seen 

Have you ever had an idea 
for how you could make im-
provements to the Revere 
community? So have the ap-
plicants to the mini-grant pro-
grams hosted by Revere on 
the Move and the Alcohol, To-
bacco and Other Drugs Task 
Force; and this time, these 
ideas are going to become a 
reality.

Every year a group of Re-
vere residents and institution-
al leaders meet together to 
select the awardees of mini-
grants offered to the public 
through the community-led 
organizations, Revere on the 
Move and the Alcohol, Tobac-
co, and Other Drugs (ATOD) 

Task Force. Both the ATOD 
Task Force and Revere on the 
Move are initiatives of the 
MGH Revere CARES Coa-
lition. Revere on the Move 
is additionally co-led by the 
Healthy Community Initia-
tives Office at the City of Re-
vere.

This year over $20,000 
was awarded to fund ideas to 
make Revere a healthier place 
to work, to play, and to raise 
a family. The Revere on the 
Move mini-grant program 
offered $10,605 in funding 
for permanent changes, pro-
gram implementation, and 
youth-led projects that would 
help prevent or reduce obe-

sity in children and adults. 
The ATOD Task Force fund-
ed projects totaling $9,500 to 
reduce youth substance use, 
improve their mental health, 
and increase opportunities for 
positive youth engagement.

In addition to the mini-
grants already funded, Revere 
on the Move has extended 
their permanent change and 
program mini-grant appli-
cations to Sunday, March 4. 
Up to $1,395 is available for 
ideas that make it easier to 
eat healthy and be active for 
all. The application is open 

Revere's TND
receives $50,000
state grant for jobs

Special to The Journal

Monday morning the Bak-
er-Polito Administration 
awarded $500,000 to nine 
projects through the Urban 
Agenda Grant Program. The 
Revere arm of The Neigh-
borhood Developers (TND) 
was one group given $50,000 
in funding to help establish 
workforce development ser-
vices in Revere to support lo-
cal residents to acquire newly 
created jobs.

Lt. Gov. Karyn Polito along 
with Housing and Economic 
Development Secretary Jay 
Ash came to Revere City Hall 
to present the check to the 
Neighborhood Developers.

“Our administration under-
stands the importance of local 
leadership and its impact on 
the lives of residents,” said 
Lt. Governor Karyn Polito. 
“The Urban Agenda Grant 
Program relies on the strong 
partnerships between local 
government, non-profits and 

the business community that 
are critical to fostering eco-
nomic success and building 
stronger neighborhoods in ev-
ery region in Massachusetts.”

Revere is rebuilding its 
economic and employment 
base by utilizing large-scale 
and high value assets includ-
ing Suffolk Downs, Wonder-
land, a soon-to-close NECCO 
plant, and the MassDevelop-
ment TDI Waterfront District.

The program seeks to un-
lock community-driven re-
sponses to local obstacles, 
and promote economic devel-
opment opportunities through 
partnership-building, problem 
solving, and shared account-
ability in urban centers. The 
competitive awards offer flex-
ible funding for local efforts 
that bring together commu-
nity stakeholders to pursue 
economic development ini-
tiatives. These awards will 
fund projects in Boston, Clin-

Real estate values continue to be strong in Revere

Lt. Gov. Karyn Polito, Ann Houston of The Neighborhood Developers, State Rep. RoseLee Vincent, 
Bob O' Brien of Revere Economic Department, Mayor Brian Arrigo and Secretary of Housing and 
Ecomonic Development  Jay Ash at the announcement of the Urban Agenda Grant Program on 
Monday morning in the Revere City Council Chambers.

By Sue Ellen Woodcock

The Revere real estate mar-
ket in 2017 was definitely a 
good one with higher prices 
for homes than in 2016, but 
a drop in the number of new 
listings, making home-buying 
an adventure.

“These are the highest pric-
es we’ve seen in the last eight 
years,” said Maureen Celata, 
owner/broker of MCelata Real 
Estate. “And 2018 is going to 
be another banner year. Inven-
tory is low now, but everyone 
is looking to the spring.”

According to figures from 
the Massachusetts Associa-
tion of Realtors, the median 
sales prices was $376,250, 
a 4.9 increase over prices in 
2016.

Homes also were also on 
the market 41 days, a 26.8 
percent increase over the 56 

days on the market in 2016.
The number of listings in 

2017 also dropped to 265, 
10.8 percent down from 297 
in 2016. The good news for 
sellers is that the original list-
ing price was matched 100 
percent of the time.

The condominium mar-
ket saw similar trends with 
the median sales price at 
$315,000, up 16.7 percent 
over 2016. Days on the mar-
ket also dropped from 67 in 
2016 to 47 days on the market

“Inventory is low now and 
everyone is looking toward 
the spring,” Celata said

The rental market is also 
strong with rents ranging from 
$1,200 to $3,000. Cleat noted 
that if someone is paying big 
rent they just might be capable 
of buying and taking advan-
tage of first-time homebuyers 
programs.

“2017 was a fantastic year 
to be in real estate,” said Joe 
Mario of Century 21 Ma-
rio Real Estate. “There’s a 
lot of confidence and equity 
in homes. For 35 years now 
it’s been positive. Now is the 
time to sell. Revere is getting 
the overflow from the Boston 
market and people are moving 
to Revere.

Mario said Revere is desir-
able because of its proximity 
to Boston, and it’s a hidden 
gem with a beautiful beach.

Mario is looking forward 
to the spring market, drawing 
from Boston and surrounding 
communities. He added that 
the Revere School system is 
also a draw for buyers.

“It all adds to the future 
growth of Revere,” he said.

See MINI GRANTS Page 3

See  TND GRANT , Page 3
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Lynn’s
Lovelines

Page 5

 Mayor Jared Nicholson de-
livered his State of the City Ad-
dress Tuesday inside the Council 
Chambers at Lynn City Hall.

“The state of the city is 
strong,” said Nicholson. “The fu-
ture of our city is bright. Both of 
those statements are true because 
of the strength of our people.”

Council President Jay Walsh 
introduced Nicholson, stating 
that, “I can’t think of a time 
where a mayor had given a 
speech for the State of the City 
Address from these Chambers. 
There have been a lot of great 
things that we’ve done here to-
gether, and we’re going to con-
tinue to do them. And with that, 
I’d like to introduce the 59th 
mayor of the City of Lynn, Jared 
Nicholson.”

Following is the text of May-
or Nicholson’s State of the City 
Address:

“Thank you, Council Presi-
dent Walsh. Good evening Coun-
cilors, School Committee mem-
bers, Legislators, Mayor McGee, 
Mayor Arrigo, Auditor DiZoglio, 

and guests.
This is my first State of the 

City address and I so appreciate 
you all being here.

Gracias a todos por estar aquí.
I want to especially thank my 

wife Katherine, my sons Henry 
and Benjamin, and my parents.

I’d also like to invite all of 
you to check out the North Shore 
Juneteenth event in the lobby 

after this honoring Black excel-
lence in our community.

I want to give a special thank 

you to everyone who stepped in 
to help the residents who were 
displaced by the cold this week-
end:

• Lynn Fire Department
• Lynn Police
• Lynn Housing Authority
• Cataldo Ambulance
• Public Health
• ISD
• Custodians
• LPS
• City Council
• City Solicitor
• Library
• Red Cross
• Salvation Army
• Concerned Citizens and 

North Shore Chabad
• Lynn Shelter Association
I’m glad that the timing of 

this speech allows me to publicly 

thank you for stepping up with-
out hesitation to help our resi-
dents in need.

Now for the state of the city.
The state of our city is strong. 
The future of our city is bright. 
Both of those statements are 

true because of the strength of 
our people. 

They’re true even in the face 
of the many challenges we face. 

They are true because we are 
14 square miles teeming with 
determination to overcome those 
challenges.

Every day when I walk into 
my office, I see the more than 
50 flags representing countries 
of origin of students in the Lynn 
Public Schools. I’m reminded 

Mayor Nicholson delivers his State of the City address

Mayor Jared Nicholson and Rep. Jenny Armini shown during the State 
of the City Address Tuesday night at City Hall.

Please see STATE OF THE CITY Page 4

GBL Champions!
Lynn Classical finishes a perfect 14-0 in league play

GBL CHAMPIONS: The Lynn Classical High School girls basketball team captured the Greater Boston 
League championship for the 2022-23 season. Front row, from left, are Lauren Wilson, Savannah Tang, 
Maegan Baker, Lauren Hennessey, Kylee Mills, Kaleigh Bullock, and Ava Thurman. Back row, from left, are 
Coach Tom Sawyer, Coach Shardaye Berry, Keisha Perez, Nevaeh Eth, Linda Jallow, Akiyah Brown, Gigi 
Ramirez, Mea Papazoglou, Coach Alina Garrity, and Coach Rob Smith.

By Cary Shuman

Undefeated and undisputed.
Coach Tom Sawyer’s Lynn 

Classical High School girls 
basketball team defeated Lynn 
English, 56-33, Tuesday to cap-
ture the Greater Boston League 

championship.
Classical won all 14 of its 

GBL games while leading the 
league in all statistical offensive 
and defensive categories. Clas-
sical defeated English twice in 
league play and in the Boverini 
Tournament championship game 

by a 50-35 score. English (11-6) 
gave Classical its toughest game 
of the season in an earlier GBL 
matchup won by Classical, 44-
42.

Classical (17-0 overall) will 

Please see CLASSICAL Page 3

Lynn Councilor-at-Large Brian 
LaPierre holds his mobile device 
from which he was able to enter 
his sports wager and execute the 
transaction at one of the Encore 
Boston Harbor betting kiosks.

LaPierre attends opening of WynnBet 
Sportsbook at Encore Boston Harbor

Welcome the new season 
with new customers

Welcome the new season 
with new customers
Our Spring Service Directory offers 12 

weeks of exposure for one single payment
Our Spring Service Directory offers 12 

weeks of exposure for one single payment

Call the Office @ 781-485-0588
or email
your rep

mdibella@winthroptranscript.com
deb@reverejournal.com

charlestownads@hotmail.com

Spring into savings today!Spring into savings today!

&

*$180 per paper

The Zenith Lodge of 
Odd Fellows proudly 
hosted the annual Past 
Grand Masters Dinner last 
Saturday afternoon. Noble 
Grand of Zenith Lodge 
#42 JoAnne Bocca-Riv-
ieccio and the members 
welcomed their guests 
from lodges across the 
district. Lodge members 
cooked a delicious buf-
fet, including home made 
soup to an assortment of 
desserts.

Zenith Lodge of Odd Fellows #42 Noble Grand JoAnne Bocca-Rivieccio and members of Winthrop lodge welcomed Past Massachusetts Grand Masters 
and guests to the lodge for annual Grand Masters Dinner.

Massachusetts Grand Chaplin Katherine Spaulding (right) 
led the gathering in Grace before the meal.

Setting up the buffet for a terrific dinner, Frank Rivieccio, 
Councillor John Munson, Ken O’Brien and lighting the 
flames, Jeff Schiff.

Phyllis Poor with Past Massachusetts Grand Master Mary 
Vitiello.

Shown above, Noble Grand of Zenith 
Lodge #42 JoAnne Bocca-Rivieccio (3rd 
from right) and some of her guests, from 
left, Grand Conductor Doreen Slaney, 
Grand Chaplin Katherine Spaulding, Grand 
Marshall Murphy Page, Grand Master Erik 
Fearing, Deputy Grand Master Susan Nee-
dle and Grand Treasurer Gregory Mullen.

Shown right, current and Past Grand Mas-
ters of Massachusetts of Odd Fellows, John 
Slaney, Doreen Slaney, Erik Fearing, Mary 
Vitiello and Francis Latanowich.

Massachusetts Grand Master Erick Fearing with Winthrop’s 
Noble Grand of Zenith Lodge JoAnne Bocca-Rivieccio.

From Grand Lodge Francis Latanowich with his 
Grand-Daughter Adrianna.

Presenting the Grand Master of Odd Fellows in Massachusaetts 
Erik Fearing a donation for his charity is Past Grand Master Mary 
Vitiello also shown id Noble Grand JoAnne Bocca-Rivieccio.
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DeGregorio then 
brought in Phil Boncore to 
the mound for the bottom 
of the seventh. Boncore 
retired Rockport in order, 
thanks to a great throw 
from catcher Ryan Mur-
phy to get a Viking runner 
at third on a steal-attempt.

The Winthrop Vikings 
then scored three runs In 
the top of the eighth, with 
the winning run scoring 
on a safety squeeze that 
was executed perfectly by 

Fotiades, scoring Parco. 
Winthrop then gave Bon-
core two insurance runs on 
an RBI single by Donahue 
and an error on a hard-hit 
ball by DeCarney. Bon-
core earned the victory by 
shutting down Rockport in 
the bottom of the eighth.

"It was really nice to see 
the team come back and 
battle through some ad-
versity," said DeGregorio. 
"We had some great con-
tributions from multiple 

members of the team in 
order to pull out the win."

The Vikings, who are 
2-1 on the season, are 
scheduled to travel to 
Danvers today (Wednes-
day), the Vikings' fourth 
road game in a row,  be-
fore they finally play their 
first home game tomorrow 
(Friday) against Swamp-
scott.  There will be a pre-
game dedication to mark 
the installation of a flag-
pole at Veterans Field.

They will entertain Sau-
gus at 10:00 next Wednes-
day morning.

  
BOYS LACROSSE 
OPENS SEASON 
WITH WIN 
OVER MC; HOST 
GLOUCESTER 
TOMORROW

The Winthrop High 
boys lacrosse opened its 

WHS BASEBALL 
TEAM TOPS 
ROCKPORT IN 
EXTRAS

The Winthrop High 
baseball team earned its 
second win of the season 
with a 9-6, extra-inning 
triumph under the lights at 
non-league rival Rockport 
this past Sunday evening. 
The game was a make-up 
from the postponement on 
Saturday because of the 
rain.  

Senior captain Matthew 
DeCarney started on the 
mound for the Vikings 
and tossed three strong in-
nings against a disciplined 
Rockport squad.

"We thought that this 
would be a good match 
up for us with Matt be-
cause he threw very well 
against Rockport last year 
at home," said WHS head 
coach Mark DeGregorio. 

DeCarney pitched out 
of a one-out, bases-loaded  
jam in the opening inning, 
limiting the damage to 
only one run, by striking 
out Rockport's #6 hitter 
and getting the next Vi-
king (the Rockport mascot 
also is the Viking) to fly 
out to right fielder Mat-
thew Noonan.

The Winthrop Vikings 
got on the board in the sec-
ond with a two-out rally 
when Billy Hayes walked 
and promptly stole second 
and third, with the catcher 
throwing the ball away on 
the steal of third, allowing 
Hayes to score.

"We were able to show 
what we do well, which is 
being very aggressive with 
runners on base," noted 
DeGregorio. "This has 
sort of been our bread and 
butter over the past few 
years. We are an aggres-
sive team.  We talk about 
putting the defense in con-
flict and trying to create 
mistakes.  This was a good 
example of that."

Winthrop was not done 
in the inning and pushed 
across two more runs, 
thanks to an RBI-double 
by Spencer Parco, who 
has been swinging the bat 
well for the Vikings, and 
an RBI-base hit by Petey 
Silverman.   

However, the Viking 
offense went silent for 
the next three innings 
and Rockport eventually 
moved back into the lead 
with four runs in the fifth.

"Rockport's lefty pitch-
er settled down and found 
a groove on the mound," 
said DeGregorio. "We 
had a difficult time get-
ting things going on him 
despite getting some base 
runners on."

In the meantime, De-
Gregorio lifted DeCarney 
in the fourth.

"Rockport had a good 
philosophy at the plate and 
was very patient," Degre-
gorio said. "They worked 
a lot of deep counts on 
Matt and we were forced 
to make a move early be-
cause Matt's pitch count 
was rising fast after three 
innings."  

DeGregorio handed the 
ball over to Jay Fotiades 
after Rockport singled off 
DeCarney and Jay was 
able to get out of the in-
ning by getting Rockport's 
two best hitters to ground 

out to Joseph Pumphret to 
end the threat.

Rockport then forged 
ahead with four runs in the 
fifth, the key blow coming 
from the Vikings'  #2 hit-
ter, who was able to get a 
bases-clearing double that 
made it 6-3. 

"I think on a typical 
field Michael Donahue, 
who is a fantastic center 
fielder, would have po-
tentially tracked that ball 
down," said DeGregorio. 
"However, the field di-
mensions made it difficult 
for the center fielder and 
right fielder.  Evans field 
is very unique.  The entire 
right field starting at about 
220-230 feet is a large hill 
leading into woods in the 
background.  There are 
no excuses here from the 
players or coaches, as we 
actually loved playing 
there.  It was fun to play 
on a field like that.  The 
field had a throwback feel 
to it, as it felt like a field 
from the early 1900's.  It 
was fun for our guys to 
play on, but also very chal-
lenging at the same time.  I 
thought Matthew Noonan 
handled right field fantas-
tically.  We could not have 
asked for a better job out 
of him defensively."

After Rockport moved 
ahead, DeGregorio 
brought in Matthew Rear-
don, who typically is a 
starting pitcher. "Matthew 
has been great for us over 
the last year or so," noted 
DeGregorio. "He was able 
to stall Rockport's offense.  
He threw strikes and his 
fastball was very lively.  
They had a very hard time 
catching up to the speed.  

"Going into the top of 
the sixth inning I chal-
lenged our players," De-
Gregorio continued. "I said 
we can either accept that 
we are not being effective 
against Rockport's starting 
pitcher or we can change 
our approach.  I asked our 
team,  'How badly do you 
want to win and are you 
willing to scratch and claw 
your way back into this 
game?' We decided to re-
spond and I couldn't have 
been prouder."

Noonan led off the 
sixth with a base hit and 
promptly stole second 
base.  This was followed 
by a walk to Parco, and 
both Noonan and he stole 
a base to put runners at 
second and third. A wild 
pitch allowed Noonan to 
score and Parco to move 
to third. Silverman then 
did a great job of getting 
a ball to the outfield with 
two strikes, allowing Par-
co to tag up from third to 
make it 6-5.

That set the stage for 
the dramatic seventh in-
ning. After Donahue led 
off with a walk ("It was 
a great at bat, as Michael 
was able to work the count 
and draw a walk," said De-
Gregorio), he stole second 
and advanced to third on a 
ground-out by DeCarney. 
Evan Rockefeller then 
stepped up and did a good 
job of putting the ball in 
play by fighting off a tough 
inside pitch and hitting the 
ball to the right side of the 
field, allowing Donahue to 
score the tying run.

WHS SPORTS ROUNDUP

DON’T WAIT! RESERVE YOUR SPACE NOW AND GET YOUR 
AD IN THE EYES OF THOUSANDS. CALL 781-485-0588

RESERVE YOUR SPACE NOW!
SportsSports

35 REVERE ST., WINTHROP • (617) 846-6880
WWW.WINTHROPMKTPLACE.COM

New Store Hours starting June 22: Mon-Sat 7:30 am-8pm;  
Sun: 7:30am-7pm

 Not responsible for typographical errors. 
 We have the right to limit quantities.

Grocery
Great grocery specials

Deli

Your Independent Grocer, Where Old Friends Meet And New Ones Are Made
SALE DAYS THURSDAY, APRIL 11TH THROUGH WEDNESDAY APRIL 17TH 2024

Margherita Pepperoni Salami ....................... $4.99/lb
Great Lakes Swiss Cheese ........................... $4.99/lb
Dietz & Watson Roasted Chicken Breast ...$7.99/lb
Kayem Old Time Franks ..................................$6.99/lb
Dietz & Watson Pepper Turkey ..................... $9.99/lb

Weekend Specials
Friday, April 12th through Sunday, April 14th

"while supplies last"

Produce
Fresh Sweet & Tasty Blackberries ..................$2.99
Fresh Sweet & Tasty Raspberries ...................$2.99
Italian Roma Plum Tomatoes ........................ $1.49/lb
Fresh & Crisp Jumbo Green Bell Peppers ....$1.79/lb
Sweet & Juicy Green Bartlett Pears ...........$1.69/lb
Fresh & Crisp Super Select Cucumbers .............. 89¢

BAKERY
Our Own Asst. Bagels ........................................$2.99
Our Own Chocolate Chunk 
Salted Caramel Cookies 10pk  ..........................$3.99

DELI
In Store Baked Ham ........................................$5.99/lb

PRODUCE
Fresh & Sweet Red Ripe 
Strawberries 1lb pkg .....................................2/$6.00

MEAT
Grade A Chicken Tenders ..................................$3.29/lb

GROCERY
New England Creamery Ice Cream ................2/$9.00
Large Brown Eggs dozen only  ............ 2/$6.00 limit 2

Meat
"Meat Cut Fresh Every Day"

Center Cut Steaks ........................................$5.99/lb
Top Round Roast ............................................$5.99/lb
Grade A Bone In Chicken Thighs ................... $1.49/lb
Grade A Chicken Drumsticks ..........................79¢/lb
Bob Evans Side Dishes ................................. 2/$8.00
Hormel Bacon 16 oz ........................................... $5.49
Beyond Burger Patties 8 oz ..............................$5.99

Tide Simply Detergent ..................................2/$6.00
Capri Sun Drinks .............................................2/$6.00
Barilla Pasta ....................................................4/$5.00

(ex: gluten free-protein-tortellini-pasta ready)
Classico Pasta Sauce ....................................2/$6.00
Skippy Peanut Butter .................................... 2/$5.00
Cheez-Its ..........................................................2/$7.00
Near East Rice (Asst. Varieties) ................2/$4.00
Heinz Ketchup 20 oz ..................................... 2/$5.00
Eggo Waffles & Pancakes ..............................2/$6.00

(Ex. Thick & Fluffy)
Smart Ones Entrees .....................................2/$4.00
Coles Mini Garlic Bread .................................2/$4.00
Philadelphia Cream Cheese Tubs ..................2/$7.00
Sargento Balanced Breaks ..........................2/$6.00
Turkey Hill Ice Tea & Lemonade .....................2/$4.00

Bakery
White Pizza Dough .......................................... 2/$5.00
8" Apple Crumb Pie .............................................. $5.99
7" Cannoli Cake .................................................. $10.99

See ROUNDUP Page 9

WHS HOCKEY AWARDS LUNCHEON

The Viking Hockey tradition of presenting seniors “Directors Chairs” continued during the awards luncheon for the NEC 
Champion Vikings boys Hockey. Shown above are seniors, Jackson Andy, Hunter Fife, Rob Rich, Billy Hayes, Petey Silver-
man, Glen Calla and Joe Rich were presented their chairs by Head Coach Dale Dunbar, Asst. Coaches Mike Norris, and 
Chris Finn. See more photos on Pages 8 and 9.

Winthrop’s Jillian Dempsey named to 
Boston Globe All-Time Girls Hockey Team

Jillian Dempsey

By Cary Shuman

Winthrop resident Jil-
lian Dempsey is widely re-
garded as one of the great-
est girls’ hockey players in 
Massachusetts history.

The Boston Globe af-
firmed her position of 
prominence Sunday, se-
lecting Dempsey to the 
newspaper’s all-time All- 

Scholastic Hockey second 
team.

Dempsey played inter-
scholastic hockey for the 
Rivers School in Weston, 
was the captain of the 
Harvard women’s hockey 
team, and a nominee for 
the Patty Kazmaier Award 
which is given to the na-
tion’s most outstanding 
women’s college hockey 

player. Dempsey became 
professional hockey’s all-
time leading scorer for 
the Boston Pride with 146 
points in 142 games, lead-
ing the team to three Iso-
bel Cup championships. 
She currently plays for the 
Montreal team in the Pro-
fessional Women’s Hock-
ey League (PWHL).

Asked for a quote about 

her prestigious honor, 
Dempsey said, “From my 

See DEMPSEY Page 9
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WHS NEC CHAMPIONS VIKING BOYS HOCKEY HOSTS ANNUAL AWARDS LUNCHEON  
AT WINTHROP LODGE OF ELKS

On Sunday, April 7, 
the 2024 NEC Champi-
on WHS Viking Boys 
Hockey Team’s Boosters 
hosted the annual awards 
luncheon at the Winthrop 
Lodge of Elks. This an-
nual event closes out the 

2023-2024 hockey season 
for the Vikings. 

The Vikings won the 
Northeastern Conference 
championship and ad-
vanced to the state semi-
finals where they lost in a 
shootout.

The WHS Hockey Boosters presented Coaches Dale Dunbar and Mike Norris Yeti Coolers, shown: Cara Rich, Kim Hayes, 
Heather Fife, and Leanne Silverman.

The William Falasca Coaches Award went to Mike Donahue, 
presented by Coaches Dale Dunbar and Mike Norris.

JV Coach Chris Finn, Head Coach Dale Dunbar, and Asst. Coach Mike Norris with the WHS NEC 2024 Champion Varsity Hockey Team.

The Robert “Doc” Harney Memorial Award was presented 
to Rob Rich by Head Coach Dale Dunbar and Mike Norris.

Billy Hayes was the Vikings Top Defenseman of the season, 
presented by Head Coach Dale Dunbar and Mike Norris.

The Mort Buckley Memorial Award went to Jackson Andy, 
presented by Head Coach Dale Dunbar.

The 2024-2025 WHS Viking Captains with Head Coach Dunbar and Asst. Coach Norris, Mike 
Holgersen, Phil Boncore and Mike Donahue.

The Gennaco Memorial Trophy was presented to Billy Hayes and Petey Silverman, present-
ed by Coaches Dale Dunbar and Mike Norris.

The Boosters Award went to Joe Rich, presented by Head 
Coach Dale Dunbar and JV Coach Chris Finn.

The Viking Pride Alumni Award went to Colin O’Leary, pre-
sented by Coaches Dale Dunbar and Mike Norris.

Petey Silverman was presented the coveted Keating Award 
for his outstanding career as a Winthrop High Viking, with  
82 goals and 176 points to his credit, the all-time Viking 
leading scorer on record. Presented by Head Coach Dale 
Dunbar and Asst. Coach Mike Norris.
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WHS NEC CHAMPIONS VIKING BOYS HOCKEY HOSTS ANNUAL AWARDS LUNCHEON  
AT WINTHROP LODGE OF ELKS

JV Coach Chris Finn with the WHS Viking JV Team.

Hunter Fife was presented the Alumni Award by Coaches 
Dale Dunbar and Mike Norris.

Glen Calla received the Steven Kennedy Award, presented 
by Head Coach Dale Dunbar and Asst. Coach Mike Norris.

season last week with a 
7-4 victory at Division 1 
opponent Malden Catholic 
7-4. 

"Overall, I was hap-
py with the way our first 
game went," said WHS 
head coach Brian Donnel-
ly. "There were certainly 
some sloppy moments 
throughout the game, 
which is to be somewhat 
expected early in the sea-
son, but there are certainly 
a lot of things that we need 
to clean up as we head into 
the bulk of our season."

Donnelly lauded the 
performance of Viking 
goalie Hunter Fife. "Hunt-
er played excellently and 
has become an amazing 
leader for us this year," 
said the coach. "I am really 
proud of his progress. The 
defensive unit also played 
excellently, only allowing 
four goals. It was great to 
see Sean Dolan out there 
as part of the returning 
defensive unit. Sean add-
ed some excellent stick 
skills to the group and just 
played really confidently."

The Viking offense 
showed flashes of bril-
liance, but Donnelly is 
hoping for more consis-
tency as the season pro-
gresses.

"Offensively we had 
some moments where we 
played really tight. We 
hope to try to string more 
of those moments togeth-
er while eliminating some 
sloppy mistakes," Don-
nelly said. "Ace Daig-
nault played really well, 
scoring four of our seven 
goals. It is clear he put in 
a lot of time and effort in 
the off-season and we are 
looking forward to seeing 
how he can continue to 
grow as a player. Seth Sac-
co also had two goals and 
has also come out as a su-
per-strong, solid player for 
us this year. He is a great 
face-off guy, continues to 
grow as a two-way player, 
and just showed excellent 
hustle and effort through-
out the game."

Freshman CJ Cifuni 
scored Winthrop's last goal 
to put the game away. "CJ 
started the game, which is 
a lot to ask for a freshman 
to start at the varsity lev-
el, but he has stepped up 
to the challenge and we 
are excited to see how he 
can grow into the systems 
and see how he can play as 
he grows his confidence," 
said Donnelly.

Donnelly also praised 
the effort of senior cap-
tain Robert Rich. "Robert 
played tough as always," 
noted the coach. "He is a 
ground-ball machine and 
is just out there constantly 
making things happen that 
open up opportunities for 
other players."

This past week he Vi-
kings came up short in 
contests with two pow-
erful programs, North-

eastern Conference op-
ponent Swampscott and 
non-league foe Manches-
ter-Essex.

"We had a very tough 
two days of games against 
two great teams," said 
Donnelly. 

In Monday's encoun-
ter at Swampscott, the 
Vikings got off to a fast 
start, scoring three goals 
early. However, Winthrop 
could not maintain its mo-
mentum and fell short by 
a final score of 8-5.  Mike 
Holgerson and Seth Sacco 
both scored a pair of goals 
each with Colin Cifuni 
also finding the net on a 
nice outside shot. 

"I give credit to Swamp-
scott's defense and their 
goalie," Donnelly said. 
"They did a good job of 
keeping us to outside shots 
and limiting opportuni-
ties. We definitely need 
to find the net a bit better 
next time we see them and 
make sure we improve our 
off-ball movement. Our 
defensive unit and goalie 
played well, and we just 
need to continue to learn 
our slides more and have 
confidence in each other 
that we will make the right 
decision on slides and 
checks."

This past Tuesday the 
Vikings hosted a skilled 
Manchester-Essex team 
and came up just short, 
9-8, in an intense back-
and-forth battle that could 
have gone either way.

"I thought we were 
matched-up really well 
against them and it just 
came down to who scored 
last and unfortunately, this 
time it was them," noted 
Donnelly. Senior captain 
Rich had a breakout game, 
netting a hat trick, includ-
ing a game-tying goal with 
around four minutes to 
play, and had a nice assist. 
"Robert is a work-horse 
and plays with confidence 
and strength that allows 
our other players to also 
play to their strengths," 
lauded Donnelly.

Junior midfielder Ste-
ven Holgerson scored two 
goals. Sophomore long 
stick middie (LSM) Col-
in O’ Leary, sophomore 
attack Ace Daignault, and 
sophomore midfielder 
Seth Sacco also reached 
the back of the Manches-
ter net.

"Our defensive unit 
played really well through-
out the game and senior 
captain Hunter Fife made 
some lights-out saves 
in goal," said Donnelly. 
"Hunter has continued 
to show great leadership 
this year and has come 
up with some huge saves 
and clears that have kept 
us in these close games. 
He has been great with 
communication and has 
been getting the defense 
talking. The defensive 
unit anchored by Donovan 

Cassidy, Dan Thomai, and 
Sean Dolan, with Colin O' 
Leary at LSM, have also 
been great, limiting some 
strong offensive teams to 
few goals. 

"We started this game 
pretty sloppily and need 
to strengthen our funda-
mentals and tighten up 
our systems as we move 
forward," Donnelly con-
cluded. "It was not the 
result we wanted, but the 
coaching staff is proud of 
the effort coming from 
both sides of the ball and 
hope to learn what we can 
from the last two losses 
and continue to build on 
the numerous positive as-
pects that we see day-in 
and day-out."

Donnelly and his 
crew will host NEC foe 
Gloucester tomorrow 
(Friday) at 5:00 under the 
lights at Miller Field. "We 
really want to use it as a 
way to get back on track 
and continue to take steps 
forward," Donnelly said. 
The Vikings will travel to 
Danvers next Thursday.

GIRLS TENNIS 
TEAM DEFEATS 
ST. MARY'S

The Winthrop High 
girls tennis team turned 
in a superb performance 
to earn a 4-1 victory 
over non-league rival St. 
Mary's of Lynn last week. 

Leading the way for the 
Lady Vikings was their 
top player, Mira Ivanis, 
who won her match at 
first singles in straight 
sets over her Lady Spar-
tan counterpart, 6-4, 6-1. 
Anila Gjinovci, playing 
at third singles, won by an 
identical score, 6-4, 6-1. 

In the doubles match-
es, the first doubles tan-
dem of Alesia Collaku & 
Caitlin Fobert cruised to a 
straight-set triumph, 6-1, 
6-2, and the second dou-
bles duo of Sophia d'En-
tremont & Nadia Aldweib 
handily dispatched their 
St. Mary's rivals, 6-1, 6-0.

In the second singles 
match, Lady Viking Emily 
Barrera dropped a hard-
fought battle in a match 
that was decided by a 
tie-breaker set, 6-1, 4-6, 
(2-7).

The triumph evened 

Winthrop's record at 1-1 
after a 5-0 loss to non-
league opponent Water-
town in their season-open-
er the previous week.

"Our serving and 
ground strokes were 
sub-optimal and tentative, 
respectively, in the Water-
town match," said WHS 
head coach Jeff Beck, who 
has a new assistant coach 
this season, Heidy Baker, 
a long-time WHS science 
teacher and assistant vol-
leyball coach.  "I think we 
played rusty and nervous. 
Kudos to Watertown, 
which is a well-coached 
and disciplined team.

"But the win over St. 
Mary's was just the med-
icine we needed to soothe 
the wounds of the Water-
town loss. We played with 
good confidence and court 
awareness. Mid-match 
adjustments kept the win-
ning ways rolling to se-
cure the win," Beck added.

The Lady Vikings, for 
whom the early-season 
foul weather has forced 
many practices to be in-
doors with limited gym 
time, were scheduled to 
host Saugus yesterday 
(Wednesday) and Lynn 
Classical today (Thurs-
day). They will be off 
through the vacation week 
and will return to action 
on Monday, April 22, at 
home vs. Swampscott.

The Lady Viking are led 
by a trio of senior captains 
for the 2024 season, Emily 
Barrera, Alesia Collaku, 
and Mira Ivanis. They 
will be joined by fellow 
seniors Nadia Aldweib, 
Zineb Belghiti, Daniela 
Estrada; freshmen Yudi 
Arbaiza, Adrianna Baez, 
Chloe Bernal, Zaineb 
Fawzi, Keariss Mejia, Is-
abella Pereira, Sofia Silk, 
and Ella Spagnoli; juniors 
Sophia d'Entremont, Cait-
lin Fobert, Kaelyn Foley, 
Madeline Forsyth, Anila 
Gjinovci, and Esther Te-
woutchoyo; and sopho-
mores Alesja Merama and 
Stella Pelletier, 

SOFTBALL TEAM 
DROPS CLOSE 
BATTLE WITH 
EASTIE

The Winthrop High 

softball team dropped a 
hard-fought battle with 
East Boston this past 
Tuesday, 18-17, in which 
the Lady Jets prevailed in 
their last at-bat. 

"It was a tough loss," 
said WHS head coach Erin 
Vercruysse. "Hannah Bar-
rett pitched a great com-
plete game and we had 
big hits from Izzy Cash, 
Sophia Gonzalez, Amelia 
Spencer, Carolina Gonza-
lez, Fran Indrisano, Dean-
na Nee, and Barrett."

Vercruysse and her 
squad were scheduled to 
host Beverly yesterday 
(Wednesday) and travel 
to Saugus tomorrow (Fri-
day). They are off for the 
vacation week and will 
host East Boston in a re-
match at the Little League 
field on Monday, April 22.

GIRLS LACROSSE 
TO  HOST DANVERS 
NEXT THURSDAY

The Winthrop High 

girls lacrosse team will 
host Northeastern Confer-
ence North rival Danvers 
next Thursday morning 
(August 18) on the turf at 
Miller Field. The opening 
draw is set for 10:00.

This past Monday, 
coach Anthony Hatzis-
avas and his Lady Viking 
crew came out on the short 
end of a 16-1 decision to 
Swampscott (whose cap-
tain, Coco Clopton, who 
is headed to Umass-Low-
ell, notched her 200th ca-
reer point minutes into the 
game).

"Our lone goal was 
scored by Tegan Pereira," 
said Hatzisavas, whose 
squad is scheduled to 
travel to Beverly today 
(Thursday) and to non-
league foe Stoneham to-
morrow (Friday). "So far 
the team has been working 
very hard and is continu-
ing to get better."

Dempsey //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 7
high school days at the 
Rivers School to my col-
lege years at Harvard, to 
my professional career on 
the Boston Pride, playing 
hockey in Boston has been 
integral to my life and an 
important part of my iden-
tity. I am honored to cho-
sen for the all-time Boston 

Globe All-Scholastic sec-
ond team alongside sever-
al other players who have 
contributed to the game 
in significant ways. I am 
proud to call Boston home 
and I am honored to be 
recognized by the Globe 
for my contributions to 
hockey in New England.”
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Marie Teresa Doucette
Beloved mother, grandmother and sister
Marie Teresa Dou-

cette, beloved mother, 
grandmother and sister, 
passed away peacefully 
in her home in Winthrop 
on April 5th. In May, she 
would have been 88 years 
old.

Marie was born on May 
15, 1936 in Belmont to her 
late parents, Angelina and 
Artelio Scarfo. She was 
preceded in death by her 
husband, John “Lou” Dou-
cette, her brother, George 
Scarfo and her son-in-law, 
Anthony Cicconi.

Marie was the loving 
mother of Denise Cicco-
ni, John Doucette and his 
wife, Doreen, Robert Dou-
cette and his wife, Audrey. 
She will be missed by her 
grandchildren: Jonathan 
Doucette, Ryan Doucette, 
Danielle (Ben) Mills and 
Brandon (Reagan) Dou-
cette; as well as her sister, 
Lorraine Letterie and her 
nephew, James (Dawn) 
Letterie.

 As a young mom, she 
spent many hours in the 
hockey rink supporting her 
two sons playing ice hock-
ey. She loved attending St. 
John’s Church. She also 
loved the time she spent 
working at the Winthrop 
Arms and Belle’s, where 
she made many lifelong 
friends. She enjoyed go-
ing to Wonderland Ball-
room to dance and spend 
time with her friends.

The Funeral Mass was 
celebrated in the St. John 
the Evangelist Church, 
Winthrop on Tuesday, 

April 9. Rev. Peter Gra-
ziano celebrated the mass 
and offered prayers at the 
interment in the Cross 
Street section of Winthrop 
Cemetery.

In lieu of flowers, 
please send donations to 
her favorite charity, St. 
Jude Children’s Research 
Hospital at www.stjude.
org.

To sign the online 
guestbook, go to www.
caggianofuneralhome.
com.

Arrangements under 
the direction of the Cag-
giano-O’Maley-Frazier 
Funeral Home, Winthrop.

OBITUARIES

IT COSTS NO MORE TO HAVE.........

MAURICE W. KIRBY

FUNERAL HOME, INC.
• COMPARE OUR PRE-ARRANGED FUNERAL PLANS
• SPACIOUS PARKING AREA 
• SERVING ALL FAITHS

CALL FOR MORE INFORMATION

(617) 846-0909
210 WINTHROP ST., WINTHROP
WWW.MAURICEKIRBYFH.COM

Barbara Butters
Long active in Winthrop church and town 

organizations
Barbara J. (Baxter) But-

ters passed away peaceful-
ly on April 7 at the age of 
95.

Daughter of the late 
Clarence and Frances 
Baxter, she is returning 
into the loving arms of her 
husband, Francis “Bob” 
Butters. She leaves be-
hind her children, Steven 
and his wife, Madeleine, 
Jeffrey and his wife, Lin-
daMarie, Cynthia Scho-
field Draper and her hus-
band, John and Edwin 
Butters, as well as eight 
grandchildren, eight great 
grandchildren and one 
great-great grandchild.

As well as being a wife 
and mother, Barbara was 
very active in Winthrop 
for many years, starting 
when her children were 
young and she was a Den 
Mother, working at Hub 
Floral in Boston and Blue 
Cross Blue Shield, and the 
Governor Winthrop Nurs-
ing Home.

She was active in The 
Union Congregation-
al Church, sang in the 
choir, and helped with 
their Thrift Shop while 
meeting new people. 
Making friends was a joy 
for her. After their clos-
ing she joined The First 
Church-Winthrop United

Methodist and con-
tinued with her faith and 
her love of choir singing 
and working in the Thrift 
Shop.

She spent a lot of her 
time at the Senior Cen-
ter and among the many 
things there that she en-
joyed, Bingo was at the 

top of her list. She was 
an avid knitter and many 
have the mittens that she 
loved making. She contin-
ued to knit as long as she 
was able.

For many years, she ac-
companied her husband to 
the Zenith Lodge No. 42 
IOOF, where she was an 
adviser and helped with 
the Rainbow Group. She 
was a devoted member of 
the Women’s Group and 
she was Past Nobel Grand 
of Margret Winthrop Re-
bekah Lodge of #153 of 
Winthrop.

Services will be private 
and the family will an-
nounce a Celebration of 
Life in the near future.

In lieu of flowers, the 
family asks that donations 
be made in her name to the 
Alzheimer’s Association, 
309 Waverly Oaks Rd., 
Waltham, MA.02452.

Funeral arrangements 
were from the Maurice W. 
Kirby Funeral Home, 210 
Winthrop St., Winthrop, 
MA. 02152. To sign Bar-
bara’s guestbook, please 
visit: www.mauricekirby-
fh.com​. 

OBITUARIES
All obituaries and death 

notices will be at a cost of 
$150.00 per paper. 

Includes photo.No word Limit. 
Please send to 

obits@reverejournal.com
or call 781-485-0588

TORF FUNERAL
SERVICE

Pre-need planning with our 
price protection guarantee. 

Arrangements made at our  
facility or in the comfort of  

your own home
4 generations of  the Torf  Tradition:

Deborah Torf  Golden
Amy Torf  Golden

Hyman J. Torf  (1903-2000)
M.L. Torf  (1867-1940)

(617) 889-2900
(800)428-7161

www.torffuneralservice.com

JERAMY 
“JAKE” 
VASEL 

6th Year Anniversary

November 15, 1979 – 
April 14, 2018 

We love you and miss you so much Jake 

JERAMY “JAKE” 
VASEL

November 15, 1979 – 
April 14, 2018

6th Year Anniversary

Remembering you is easy             
We do it every day                    

Missing you is the heartache        
That never goes away 

The family of Robert “Bobby” 
Oliver would like to thank 

the Winthrop Police and Fire 
Departments, and the American 

Legion for their participation in the 
funeral for Winthrop’s 
last D-Day Veteran.

The family thanks you dearly.

Karen Ferullo
Humanities and Modern Language 

Department Manager at Suffolk University
Karen A. Ferullo of 

Lunenburg, formerly of 
Winthrop, passed away 
unexpectedly with her 
family by her side on April 
7th.

Karen is survived by 
her beloved wife, Ellen J. 
Rhode. She was the lov-
ing sister of Robert “Bob” 
Ferullo of Winthrop, Lynn 
Ardolino (Ferullo) and her 
husband, Eddie of Sau-
gus, Mark Ferullo and his 
wife, Carol of Winthrop, 
and Jeffrey Ferullo and 
his wife, Patti of Georgia; 
cherished aunt of Kevin, 
Taylor Marie, Edward An-
thony, Chris, Carlie and 
the great aunt of Rowan.

Karen was the Hu-
manities and Modern 
Language Department 
Manager at Suffolk Uni-
versity. She had an in-
quisitive mind and loved 
encouraging others. Kar-
en enjoyed entertaining, 
cooking and traveling. 
Some of her favorite des-
tinations were Aruba, 
France and Italy.

Family and friends are 
cordially invited to attend 
the visitation from the 
Caggiano-O’Maley-Fra-
zier Funeral Home today, 
Thursday, April 11 from 4 
to 8 p.m. A funeral service 
will be held in the funeral 
home at 7:30 PM.

In lieu of flowers, do-
nations can be made in 
Karen’s memory to the 
Alzheimer’s Association 
or the National MS Soci-
ety, Greater New England 
Chapter PO Box 289 Can-
ton, MA 02021 or go to 
www.alz.org or www.na-
tionalmssociety.org.

Annette Reilly
She and her husband owned tanning salons 

and distributed tanning products interntionally
Annette M. (Mazzone) 

Reilly of Saugus passed 
away peacefully on Mon-
day, April 1 at home after 
a long illness at the age of 
seventy-nine, just shy of 
her 80th birthday.

Annette, formerly of 
East Boston, Winthrop 
and Revere was a resident 
of Saugus for many years.

The cherished daughter 
of the late James V. Maz-
zone and Pauline (Paolil-
lo) Mazzone, Annette is 
survived by her husband, 
Robert G. Reilly; her 
daughter, Cherylann Reil-
ly-Tremblay and her hus-
band, James Tremblay of 
Saugus and her son, Scott 
Michael Reilly and his 
wife, Lisa Reilly of Sau-
gus as well as her grand-
children, Sophia Reilly 
and Scott Michael Reilly. 
Annette is also survived 
by her brother, James V. 
Mazzone of Rowley.

Annette was born in 
East Boston and devoted 
her life to raising her chil-
dren.

Annette and Robert 
opened their first Tan-
ning Salon (Tanorama) 
on Cambridge Street in 
Boston next to the Massa-
chusetts General Hospital. 
It was the busiest tanning 
salon in Boston. Annette 
worked every day at their 
Salon. They opened their 
second salon in Boston’s 
South End (Metropolitan 
Tanning Salon). Robert 
and Annette opened Inter-
national Tan Makers, Inc. 
(ITM) in Revere after sell-
ing their Boston salons. 
The Company (ITM) had 
distributors of its products 
both in the United States 
and in Europe.

Annette was a wonderful 
business owner, and being 
an international company, 
Annette and Robert trav-

eled extensively (including 
China, Hong Kong, Italy, 
Russia, and Greece, among 
other countries) and they 
experienced diverse cul-
tures and customs through 
their travels around the 
world. Annette loved trav-
eling and particularly en-
joyed cruising adventures.

Family and friends are 
invited to honor Annette’s 
life by gathering at the 
Vertuccio Smith & Vazza, 
Beechwood Home for Fu-
nerals, 262 Beach Street, 
Revere on Friday, April 
12th from 4 to 8 p.m. Park-
ing is available at the rear 
of the funeral home.

Her Funeral will be con-
ducted from the Funeral 
Home on Saturday, April 
13th at 10 a.m., followed 
by a Funeral Mass in St. 
Anthony of Padua Church, 
250 Revere Street, Revere 
at 11 a.m. Entombment 
will follow in Holy Cross 
Cemetery - Community 
Mausoleum, Malden. In 
lieu of flowers, remem-
brances may be made to 
Alzheimer’s Association, 
311 Arsenal Street, Water-
town, MA 02472. ​

To send online condo-
lences, please visit ​www.
vertucciosmithvazza.com​.

Funeral arrangements 
entrusted to the care and 
direction of the Vertuccio 
Smith & Vazza, Beech-
wood Home for Funerals.

©
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All types of services
for all types of people.

Some people prefer traditional funeral 
services. Others prefer cremation. 

Some want an elaborate ceremony. 
Then there are others who don’t 
want any ceremony at all. When 
it comes to funerals, there are 
as many options as there are 

people. And we take pride in 
being able to say we offer them all.

(617) 846-8700
www.CaggianoFuneralHome.com. 

www.CremationsbyCaggianoFH.com

Caggiano
FUNERAL HOME

147 Winthrop Street • Winthrop, Massachusetts 02152
Telephone: 617-846-8700 Fax: 617-846-8701

www.caggianofuneralhome.com

JOHN T. 
“JACK” 

HONAN
Oct. 31, 1955- April 17, 2023

One Year Anniversary

“Smell the sea and feel the sky,
Let your soul and spirit fly.”

We miss you, Jack!
All our love,

Dan, Steph, Bob, Tom, Julie, 
Katie, and Mary
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Special to the Transcript

Bill Hanney’s 
award-winning North 
Shore Music Theatre 
(NSMT) is set to return 
for an expanded season of 
exceptional musical enter-
tainment for North Shore 
audiences. The season 
includes an Encore Pro-
duction of “Jersey Boys”, 
an extended premiere pro-
duction of Disney’s “Fro-
zen”, and the 35th Anni-
versary Production of “A 
Christmas Carol”.  The 
box office is open, and all 
tickets and discount pack-
ages are available to pur-
chase online at www.nsmt.
org, by phone (978) 232-
7200 or at the Box Office 
located at 54 Dunham 
Road in Beverly, MA.

“I’m very excited to be 
working with the North 
Shore Music Theatre team 
to create an extra-long 
season for our audiences 
this year. We are working 
hard to surpass their high 
expectations and give 
them a full season of orig-
inal productions unlike 
any they have ever seen,” 
said Bill Hanney, NS-
MT’s owner and produc-
er. “With the recent news 
about many theatres strug-
gling to bounce back from 
the pandemic, I recognize 
how fortunate we are to 
have audiences returning 
in pre-pandemic numbers 
and a steady subscription 
base who continue to be-
lieve that we are their 
home for entertainment.”

North Shore Music 

Theatre’s 2024 Musi-
cal Season begins early 
with a special encore of 
the smash hit 2019 pro-
duction of “Jersey Boys” 
playing May 7 thru May 
19. Winner of the 2006 
Tony® Award for “Best 
Musical,” “Jersey Boys” 
is the compelling story of 
Frankie Valli and the Four 
Season featuring the leg-
endary top ten hits Sherry, 
Big Girls Don’t Cry, Walk 
Like A Man, Can’t Take 
My Eyes Off You and De-
cember, 1963 (Oh What A 
Night). “Jersey Boys” is 
presented through special 
arrangement with Theatri-
cal Rights Worldwide.

From June 4 thru June 
16, audiences can cele-
brate life, love laughter 
and tradition, with the 60th 
anniversary production of 
“Fiddler on the Roof”, the 
story of milkman Tevye’s 
search for husbands for 
his daughters to uphold 
his family’s religious and 
cultural traditions in their 
small pre-revolutionary 
Russian village. The clas-
sic Tony® and Oscar® 
-winning musical with 
a book by Joseph Stein, 
music by Jerry Bock, and ​
lyrics by Sheldon Harnick 
features the classic songs 
“Tradition,” “If I Were 
a Rich Man,” “Sunrise, 
Sunset” and “Matchmak-
er, Matchmaker.” “Fiddler 
on the Roof” is presented 
through special arrange-
ment with Music Theatre 
International.

When the heat is on in 
July, family audiences will 

melt for the New England 
regional premiere of Dis-
ney’s “Frozen” playing a 
special extended 3-week 
run from July 9 thru July 
28. This Broadway mu-
sical, based on the 2013 
Academy Award-winning 
animated film following 
the story of royal sisters 
Elsa and Anna, who are 
torn apart by Elsa’s myste-
rious icy powers. Disney’s 
“Frozen”, the worldwide 
sensation, with a book by 
Jennifer Lee and music and 
lyrics by double Emmy®, 
Grammy ®, Oscar®, and 
Tony® Award-Winners 
Kristen Anderson-Lopez 
& Robert Lopez, features 
the hit songs “Let It Go” 
and “Do You Want To 
Build A Snowman.” North 
Shore Music Theatre’s 
immersive production of 
Disney’s “Frozen” will 
feature newly re-imagined 
staging & musical num-
bers, along with original 
sets and costumes being 
designed and created just 
for this production. Dis-
ney’s “Frozen” is pre-
sented through special 
arrangement with Music 
Theatre International.

The summer ends with 
an uproarious production 
of “Tootsie” playing from 
August 13 thru August 
25. “Tootsie” is the laugh-
out-loud love letter to the 
theatre telling the story of 
Michael Dorsey, a talent-
ed but difficult actor who 
struggles to find work un-
til one show-stopping act 
of desperation lands him 
the role of a lifetime. Fea-

turing a hilarious Tony® 
Award-winning book by 
Robert Horn ​Book and an 
outrageously clever score 
by David Yazbeck, “Toot-
sie” is a joyful show so 
packed with punchlines, it 
should be called a “joke-
box” musical. “Tootsie” is 
presented through special 
arrangement with Music 
Theatre International.

The NSMT stage will 
rock this fall when the 
Tony® Award-winning 
“Million Dollar Quartet” 
plays from September 
24 thru October 6. Set on 
December 4, 1956, an ex-
traordinary twist of fate 
brings Johnny Cash, Jer-
ry Lee Lewis, Carl Per-
kins, and Elvis Presley 
together at Sun Records 
in Memphis for one of 
the greatest jam sessions 
ever. Audiences will relive 
the golden era of rock ‘n’ 
roll with hit songs includ-
ing “Blue Suede Shoes,” 
“Fever,” “Walk the Line,” 
“Sixteen Tons,” “Who Do 
You Love?,” “Great Balls 
of Fire,” “Hound Dog,” 
and more. “Million Dol-
lar Quartet” is presented 
through special arrange-
ment with Theatrical 
Rights Worldwide.

All tickets, discount 
packages, and gift cards & 
e-Certificates are available 
to purchase online (www.
nsmt.org), by phone (978) 
232-7200 or at the North 
Shore Music Theatre Box 
Office located at 54 Dun-
ham Road in Beverly, MA.

OBITUARIES
Mary Lou Callerame

A beautiful vibrant soul
Mary Lou Callerame 

was called home by our 
heavenly Father on Janu-
ary 6, 2024.  

Mary Lou was born in 
Winthrop to Lillian and 
James Cassens on October 
2, 1934. She was a

strong and independent 
child who placed a high 
value on family, coun-
try and faith.  She was a 
drummer and a compet-
itive swimmer in school 
and developed a love for 
the arts and sciences.  

She will always be re-
membered for her quick 
wit, easy smile, and ele-
gant beauty.   Her natural 
beauty was beguiling, and 
she won the Boston Blue 
Jeans contest as a teenag-
er.

Throughout her life-
time, she loved sports and 
could be found cheering 
on her favorite teams, the 
New England Patriots and 
the Boston Red Sox.  She 
was a true sports fanat-
ic. She enjoyed traveling, 
sports events, volunteer-
ing, patronizing the arts, 
stamp collecting and coin 
collecting.  During her 
lifetime, she supported 
many efforts to save en-
dangered wildlife and 
loved the outdoors.  

Mary Lou was pas-
sionate about her fami-
ly’s military legacy. As a 
teenager, she won a state 
essay contest for writing 
a moving letter describing 
her love of military ser-
vice and respect for her fa-
ther who was a decorated 
veteran and received the 
purple heart. She was truly 
proud to be a member of 
the Anasazi Chapter of the 
Daughters of the Ameri-
can Revolution(# 944913) 
and spoke often of her 
legacy of having five an-
cestors who fought in the 
Revolutionary War.  She 
beamed with pride when 
she spoke of her family 
members who were mili-
tary veterans.  Her love of 
country and family gen-
erated immense pride and 
loyal patriotism.  

Mary Lou had many 
admirable attributes in-
cluding her strong Cath-
olic faith, passion for the 
arts and passion for sci-
ence.  Her spirit, tenacity 
and vast intelligence made 
her an anomaly and won 
her multiple scholarships, 
which she used to at-
tend college and medical 
school.  

She graduated from 
Winthrop High School 
and went on to graduate 
from Emmanuel College 
of Boston in 1956. She 
was a trail blazer, as a fe-
male medical student at 
Tufts University School 
of Medicine in 1960.  She 
served her residency at the 
University of Rochester, 
NY, with a focus in Pa-
thology from 1962-1966.

She was involved in 
multiple studies and pub-
lished some of the pio-
neering research works 
in allergy and immunolo-
gy during the 1970s. Her 
works included ground-
breaking research in 
Cystic Fibrosis, Ige and 
Lupus.  The foundations 
of her research are well 
known in the medical 
community and highly re-
garded.

She shifted to Family 
Practice Medicine in the 
1980s and served the com-
munities of Whitesville, 
WV and Lake Havasu 
City, AZ, until her retire-
ment in 2010. She was well 
known and beloved in the 

communities in which she 
served.  She was known to 
spontaneously lend a hand 
or help someone in need 
whenever she could.   She 
was a member and presi-
dent of the Soroptimists 
of Lake Havasu and was a 
long-standing member of 
the Our Lady of the Lake 
Catholic Church.  

Throughout her career, 
she raised a family of six 
children and was a loving 
and loyal wife to Joseph 
Callerame for 49 years.  
She was an amazing 
role model and provided 
guidance for her children 
throughout her lifetime 
and took great pride in 
her children’s accomplish-
ments.  

After retirement, she 
moved to Phoenix, AZ to 
be closer to her grandchil-
dren and great grandchil-
dren.  

She was an active 
member of the St Thom-
as Moore Roman Cath-
olic Church in Glendale, 
AZ and volunteered in 
the Catechism.  Her faith 
was unwavering and she 
was so passionate about 
her faith that she consid-
ered becoming a nun after 
graduating high school. 
She also considered be-
coming an artist and spent 
many hours painting.  Her 
artworks adorn her home 
and the homes of her chil-
dren today.  ​

Her final two years 
were spent In Baton 
Rouge, LA, near her chil-
dren and grandchildren. 
She was loved by many 
and touched the lives of 
those around her.  

Mary Lou was pre-
ceded in death by her 
sisters, Grace and Mar-
jorie.  She is survived by 
her half-sister, Amy (Jeff 
Kulesus), St. George, UT 
and by her children: Al-
len (Paula), Rochester, 
NY; Kevin, MD, (Paula 
Shamsie), Baton Rouge, 
LA; Pamela NP (Richard 
Waychoff), Surprise, AZ; 
James (Marie), Vancou-
ver, WA; Brian (Paula 
Hoeffliger), Coarsegold, 
CA; and Keith (Meghan 
Bordeau) Albany, CA. 
Her grandchildren: Mar-
cus, Rochester, NY; Chloe 
Baton Rouge, LA; Keegan 
Honolulu, HI; Marissa 
(Shaun Roberts), Buck-
eye, AZ; Michael, Sur-
prise, AZ; Jack, Joseph 
and Jace, Vancouver, WA;  
Han and Josie, Ohio; her 
great, great grandchildren 
are Nathan and Tierney, 
Rochester, NY; Aden and 
Noah, Buckeye, AZ.

Condolences may be 
sent to her surviving 
daughter, Pam Waychoff 
NP at 17268 West Straight 
Arrow Lane, Surprise, AZ 
85387.

Mary Lou will be in-
terned with her mother, 
Lillian Cassens; sisters, 
Grace and Marjorie and 
husband, Joseph Call-
erame in the Winthrop 
Cemetery. A service will 
be held on April 20th at 
St John the Evangelist 
Church in Winthrop at 10 
a.m. followed by  burial at 
Winthrop Cemetery.

A full list of the activities, 
programs, trips, and ser-
vices offered at the Senior 
Center can be found in the 
newsletter, which is avail-
able at the Senior Center 
and on our website.

 
Monday, April 15

The Senior Center will 
be closed in observance 

of Patriots’ Day
 

Tuesday, April 16
9:00am-3:00pm: Com-

puter Usage
9:30am-10:30am: Exer-

cise Class ($1)
11 :00am-12 :00pm: 

Blood Pressures
11:00am: Grab & Go 

Lunch Pick-Up
12:30pm-2:30pm: Art 

Class with Dawn ($5)
1:00pm-2:00pm: Insur-

ance & Patient Advocacy
 
Wednesday, April 17 
9:00am-3:00pm: Com-

puter Usage

9:30am-10:30am: Yoga 
with Trish ($5)

10:00am-12:00pm: Be-
reavement & Caregiver 
Support Group

10 :00am-12 :00pm: 
Charlie Card Workshop

10 :00am-12 :00pm: 
Low Vision Support 
Group

1 0 : 3 0 a m - 11 : 3 0 a m : 
Zumba with Cindy ($5)

11:00am: Grab and Go 
Lunch Pick-Up

11:30-12:30pm: Tai Chi 
/ Qi Gong with Cindy ($5)

1:15pm-2:45pm: Italian 
Class

 
Thursday, April 18 

9:00am-3:00pm: Com-
puter Usage

9:30am-10:30am: Exer-
cise Class ($1)

10:30am-11:30am: Cof-
fee & Conversation

12 :00pm-12 :30pm: 
Dine In/Grab and Go 
Lunch Pick Up

12:45pm-3:00pm: Bin-
go

 
Friday, April 19

9 : 0 0 a m - 1 2 : 0 0 p m : 
Computer Usage

10 :00am-11 :00pm: 
Line Dancing ($5)

11:00am- Grab and Go 
Lunch Pick-Up

11:30 -12:30pm: Cre-
ative Writing Workshop

 
 Senior Lunch Pro-

gram: The Senior Center 
offers in-person dining 
on Thursdays from 12-
12:30pm. Grab and Go 
Lunches are also available 
for pick up Monday – Fri-
day between 11am and 
1pm. To reserve a lunch, 
please stop by the front 
desk or call the Senior 
Center at 617-846-8538 
by 11am the day before 
(for Monday lunch, reser-
vations must be made by 
11am on Friday). Menus 
are available on our web-
site and at the Senior Cen-
ter.  Please note, lunches 
cannot be held overnight; 

they must be picked up on 
the day that they were re-
quested for.

 
Senior Van. The Senior 

Van runs Monday - Thurs-
day from 8:45am-3pm. 
Reservations are on a first 
come, first served basis, 
and can be made by call-
ing the Senior Center at 
least two weekdays prior 
to the desired date.  Rides 
to medical appointments 
will be prioritized. A list 
of destinations and pricing 
is available on our website 
and in our newsletter.

 Winthrop Senior Center News
35 Harvard Street, Winthrop, MA 02152    

Hours: Mon-Thurs: 8:30am-3:30p.m. / Friday: 8:30am-1p.m.
Website: www.town.winthrop.ma.us   

Email: COAReception@town.winthrop.ma.us   Phone: 617-846-8538

Visit the Senior Center  
Online for more information

NSMT’s 2024 musical season to include an encore performance  
of ‘Jersey Boys’ and an extended 3-week run of ‘Disney’s Frozen!’

10 years ago
April 9, 2014
Coach Frank DeMar-

co's Winthrop High base-
ball team kicked off its 
season in fine fashion with 
a pair of impressive vic-
tories this past week by 
identical scores of 14-2 
against non-league rivals 
Mystic Valley and North 
Shore Tech. In the season 
opener against Mystic 
Valley, Ben Spinazzola 
and Matt Feeley had three 
hits apiece.  to lead theÂ 
offensive barrage. Bobby 
Fisher added two hits and 
two RBI, while Mike Rich 
stroked a double, stole 
two bases, and scored two 

runs. James Baxter and 
Vin Sparacino scored three 
runs apiece. In the pitching 
department, Brendan Van 
Dalinda started and tossed 
three shutout frames in 
which he fanned six ene-
my hitters. Jack Wallace 
and Chris Zuffante hurled 
an inning apiece to pre-
serve the victory.

The Winthrop High 
girls track team opened 
its spring season with an 
84-41 win over Lynn En-
glish last week. Among 
the highlights for the Lady 
Vikings were victories 
by Amy Sena and Carly 
O’Keefe, who tied for first 
in the 400 hurdles; Sena 

in the high jump; Lexi 
Vaccaro in the 100 dash; 
Abbey Love in the mile to 
lead a Winthrop sweep in 
that event with teammates 
Nina Leone and Kristen 
Ford; Isabella Kennedy in 
the two mile and 800; and 
Katherine Texiera in the 
shot-put.

Although the Winthrop 
High boys lacrosse team 
has dropped its first three 
contests of the season to 
Lynn, Dedham, and Mys-
tic Valley, WHS head 
coach Matt Serino has seen 
a lot of positive signs from 
his Viking squad. “Goal-
tender Andrew Almedia 
has played tremendously,” 

said Serino. “We also have 
received strong play from 
midfielders Chris Beau-
dry, Adam Holden, and 
Charlie Page and defense-
men Rolando Recinos and 
Hunter Gillis"

20 years ago
April 15, 2004
The WHS softball team 

dropped its season opener 
to Beverly, 9-8 in extra 
innings. Valerie Hughes 
went 2-for-5 with four 
stolen bases and two runs 
scored. Jen Ryan added 
two hits with two stolen 
bases and two runs scored. 

WHS SPORTS THROUGH THE YEARS

See SPORTS YEARS Page 13
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LEGAL NOTICE

#004-2024
Notice is hereby given in 
accordance with Chapter 
40A of the Massachu-
setts General Laws and 
Chapter 17 of the Code 
of the Town of Winthrop 
that the Winthrop Board 
of Appeals will conduct 
a public hearing on 
Thursday, April 25, 
2024, at or after 6:30 
p.m. held in the Harvey 
Hearing Room upon the 
application of person 
requesting:  40 Bates 
Avenue, Winthrop, MA 
02152  Kari and Ignacio 
Borroel- 40 Bates Avenue, 
Winthrop, MA 02152   
Applicant seeks a Special 
Permit to construct 
attached garage with a 
2nd story addition on 
the property (40 Bates 
Avenue, Winthrop, MA 
02152) according to the 
proposed building plans 
submitted.  A special per-
mit to alter or extend a 
non-conforming structure 
is requested.    
The public is invited to 
attend, and interested 
parties shall have an 
opportunity to be heard.
Copies of the application 
and plans are on file and 
available to review at the 

Town Hall Planning Of-
fice, Room 2A, Winthrop 
Town Hall. 
Darren Baird, Chairman
Barbara Evangelista, 
Interim Clerk 
Winthrop Board of 
Appeals        

4/11/24
W

LEGAL NOTICE
COMMONWEALTH

OF MASSACHUSETTS
THE TRIAL COURT

PROBATE AND
FAMILY COURT

Suffolk Division
24 New Chardon St.
Boston, MA 02114
(617)788-8300

CITATION ON 
PETITION FOR

ORDER OF 
COMPLETE 

SETTLEMENT 
Docket No.

SU23P0183EA
Estate of:
Mary Ann 
Moriarty

Also known as:
Mary A. Moriarty
Date of Death:
05/01/2022

A Petition for Order of 
Complete Settlement has 
been filed by Cathleen A. 
Pellicelli of Winthrop, MA 
requesting that the court 
enter a formal Decree 

of Complete Settlement 
including a determina-
tion of testacy and heirs 
at law determine testacy 
and the heirs at law as 
stated herein and other 
such relief as may be 
requested in the Petition.
IMPORTANT NOTICE
You have the right to 
obtain a copy of the Pe-
tition from the Petitioner 
or at the Court. You have 
a right to object to this 
proceeding. To do so, you 
or your attorney must file 
a written appearance and 
objection at this Court 
before 10:00 a.m. on 
04/30/2024.
This is NOT a hearing 
date, but a deadline by 
which you must file a 
written appearance and 
objection if you object to 
this proceeding. If you 
fail to file a written ap-
pearance and objection 
followed by an Affidavit 
of Objections within 
thirty (30) days of the 
return date, action may 
be taken without further 
notice to you.
WITNESS, Hon. Brian J. 
Dunn, First Justice of this 
Court.

Date: March 27, 2024
Stephanie L. Everett, Esq.,
Register of Probate

4/11/24
W

LEGAL NOTICE
LEGAL NOTICE
MORTGAGEE’S 

SALE OF 
REAL ESTATE

By virtue of and in 
execution of the Power 
of Sale contained in a 
certain mortgage given 
by Richard R. Coscia 
a/k/a Ralph R. Coscia 
and Carol A. Coscia to 
Mortgage Electronic Reg-
istration Systems, Inc., as 
mortgagee, as nominee 
for Quicken Loans Inc., its 
successors and assigns, 
dated April 8, 2004 
and recorded in Suffolk 
County Registry of Deeds 
in Book 34317, Page 
161 (the “Mortgage”), 
as affected by a Loan 
Modification Agreement 
dated November 2, 
2017, and recorded at 
said Registry of Deeds 
in Book 58972, Page 
159 of which mortgage 
U.S. Bank Trust National 
Association, not in its 
individual capacity but 
solely as owner trustee 
for RCF 2 Acquisition 
Trust is the present 
holder by Assignment 
from Mortgage Electronic 
Registration Systems, 
Inc., as mortgagee, as 
nominee for Quicken 
Loans Inc. its successors 
and assigns to HSBC 

Bank USA, N.A. dated 
February 24, 2012 and 
recorded at said Registry 
of Deeds in Book 49139, 
Page 254, and Assign-
ment from HSBC Bank 
USA, National Association 
to MCLP Asset Company, 
Inc. dated September 1, 
2022 and recorded at 
said Registry of Deeds in 
Book 68532, Page 182, 
and Assignment from 
MCLP Asset Company, 
Inc. to U.S. Bank Trust 
National Association, 
not in its individual 
capacity but solely as 
owner trustee for RCF 2 
Acquisition Trust dated 
September 13, 2022 and 
recorded at said Registry 
of Deeds in Book 68532, 
Page 185, for breach 
of conditions of said 
mortgage and for the 
purpose of foreclosing 
the same, the mortgaged 
premises located at 47 
Washington Avenue, Win-
throp, MA 02152 will be 
sold at a Public Auction 
at 12:00 PM on April 23, 
2024, at the mort-
gaged premises, more 
particularly described 
below, all and singular 
the premises described in 
said mortgage, to wit:
Land referred to in this 
commitment is described 
as all that certain 
property situated in the 
County of SUFFOLK and 

state of MA and being 
described in a deed 
dated Sep-20-1982, and 
recorded Sep-30-1982, 
among the land records 
of the County and state 
set forth above, and ref-
erenced as follows: Book 
10079 and Page 220.
The land in Winthrop, 
Suffolk County, Mas-
sachusetts, with all the 
buildings thereon, shown 
on a plan by Whitman 
and Breck, dated October 
1882, recorded with Suf-
folk Deeds in Book 1584, 
Page 592, bounded and 
described as follows:
Beginning at the 
Southwesterly corner of 
the premises and at the 
Southeasterly corner of 
land now or formerly of 
Goodwin and formerly 
of Hannah B. Belcher, at 
the beach and running; 
Northerly on said land of 
Goodwin, one hundred 
fifty-five (155) feet to 
Washington Avenue; 
thence turning at a 
right angle and running 
Easterly on Washington 
Avenue, eighty (80) 
feet; thence turning at a 
right angle and running 
Southerly on land now or 
formerly of Hildreth, one 
hundred fifty-one and 
42/100 (151.42) feet. to 
the beach; thence turning 
and running Westerly 
by said beach, eighty 

(80) feet to the point of 
beginning.
Recording Date: Sep-30-
1982. Execution date: 
Sep-20-1982
For mortgagor’s title see 
deeds recorded with the 
Suffolk County Registry 
of Deeds in Book 10079, 
Page 220 and in Book 
45094, Page 315 and in 
Book 50217, Page 137.
The premises will be sold 
subject to any and all 
unpaid taxes and other 
municipal assessments 
and liens, and subject 
to prior liens or other 
enforceable encumbranc-
es of record entitled to 
precedence over this 
mortgage, and subject 
to and with the benefit 
of all easements, restric-
tions, reservations and 
conditions of record and 
subject to all tenancies 
and/or rights of parties 
in possession.
Terms of the Sale:  Ca-
shier’s or certified check 
in the sum of $5,000.00 
as a deposit must be 
shown at the time and 
place of the sale in order 
to qualify as a bidder 
(the mortgage holder 
and its designee(s) 
are exempt from this 
requirement); high 
bidder to sign written 
Memorandum of Sale 
upon acceptance of bid; 
balance of purchase 

price payable by certified 
check in thirty (30) days 
from the date of the sale 
at the offices of mort-
gagee’s attorney, Korde 
& Associates, P.C., 900 
Chelmsford Street, Suite 
3102, Lowell, MA or such 
other time as may be 
designated by mortgag-
ee.  The description for 
the premises contained 
in said mortgage shall 
control in the event of 
a typographical error in 
this publication.
Other terms to be 
announced at the sale.
U.S. Bank Trust National 
Association, not in its 
individual capacity but 
solely as owner trustee 
for RCF 2 Acquisition 
Trust
Korde & Associates, P.C.
900 Chelmsford Street
Suite 3102
Lowell, MA 01851
(978) 256-1500

3/28/24, 4/04/24, 
4/11/24

W

LEGAL NOTICE

# 005-2024
Notice is hereby given in 
accordance with Chapter 
40A of the Massachu-

setts General Laws and 
Chapter 17 of the Code 
of the Town of Winthrop 
that the Winthrop Board 
of Appeals will conduct a 
public hearing on April 
25, 2024 at or after 6:30 
p.m. held at the Harvey 
Hearing Room, Town 
of Winthrop Town Hall 
upon the application of 
person requesting:Frank 
Constantino of 82 Main 
St. requesting a variance 
from provisions of Sec-
tion 17.060.20-General 
Regulations “A” Number 
of One-Two Family  
Residential Building on 
a Lot.  Any One Lot in a 
residential A District shall 
not contain more than 
one single family or two 
family dwelling. Also re-
questing a variance from 
Table of Dimensional 
Regulations
The public is invited to at-
tend, and interest parties 
shall have an opportunity 
to be heard. 
Copies of the application 
and plans are on file and 
available to review at the 
Town Hall Planning Of-
fice, Room 2A, Winthrop 
Town Hall. 
Darren Baird, Chairman
Barbara Evangelista, 
Interim Clerk 
Winthrop Board of 
Appeals        

4/11/24
W

LEGAL NOTICES

MBTA announces service information for the 2024 Boston Marathon
Special to the Transrcipt

The MBTA today an-
nounced service informa-
tion on Monday, April 15, 
the day of the 2024 Boston 
Marathon. Every year, the 
MBTA prepares for the 
Boston Marathon across 
all departments in many 
ways. It supports the an-
nual event with increased 
service to accommodate 
spectators and runners, 
acknowledges the cru-
cial role of public transit 
during this celebratory 
time, and expresses sin-
cere appreciation for its 
ridership and dedicated 
workforce.

Behind the scenes, a 
dedicated team of MBTA 
leaders from various de-
partments, including oper-
ations, track, signals, and 
safety, will be monitoring 
the system throughout the 
day, ready to troubleshoot 
any unforeseen issues that 
may arise. The MBTA’s 
Security team will have 
representatives in the Uni-
fied Coordination Center, 
located at the Massachu-
setts Emergency Manage-
ment Agency’s headquar-
ters in Framingham, 
which serves as the central 
hub for public safety op-
erations on race day. The 
Transit Police Department 
will also continue to mon-
itor the system with robust 
support available as need-

ed. Additional staff and 
Transit Ambassadors will 
be strategically positioned 
throughout the system to 
assist with passenger flow 
and answer any questions 
or concerns from riders.

Riders are encouraged 
to hold handrails and use 
care and caution while 
traversing stairs and esca-
lators due to anticipated 
crowding and high rider-
ship. Additional porters 
will also proactively iden-
tify and address cleaning 
needs throughout the sys-
tem, from sweeping floors 
and disposing of trash to 
maintaining restrooms and 
replenishing supplies.

 
MBTA Service Infor-

mation for the 2024 Bos-
ton Marathon:

For the first time ever, 
the Route 1 bus will oper-
ate with increased Satur-
day service from 9 AM to 
9 PM with buses arriving 
as frequently as every 5 
minutes (the Route 1 typ-
ically operates every 9-15 
minutes on Saturdays) – 
the Route 1 travels across 
both sides of the Mara-
thon route, making it an 
easy way for spectators 
to traverse the Marathon 
to cheer on runners. The 
Framingham/Worcester 
Commuter Rail Line will 
also offer additional in-
bound and outbound trips 
to accommodate anticipat-

ed increases in ridership.
To find the best Mara-

thon viewing location on 
the T, riders are encour-
aged to visit the MBTA’s 
Boston Marathon Guide 
at mbta.com/Marathon, 
which highlights MBTA 
stations closest to the Mar-
athon route and includes 
other helpful information 
on purchasing fares, park-
ing, and more.

 
Station Closures:
• For public safety rea-

sons, Copley Station is 
closed for the entire day 
on April 15. Riders are 
instead encouraged to use 
Arlington Station (serving 
all Green Line branches), 
Prudential Station (Green 
Line E branch), Hynes 
Convention Center Sta-
tion (Green Line B, C, 
and D branches), or Back 
Bay Station on the Orange 
Line.

• From approximately 
10 AM to 6 PM, above-
ground Green Line stops 
at South Street (B branch), 
Kent Street (C branch), 
and St. Mary’s Street (C 
branch) will be closed.

• In the interest of pub-
lic safety, the MBTA may 
adjust service or tempo-
rarily close additional sta-
tions near the finish line.

 
Service Information:
• The Green, Red, Or-

ange, Blue, and Silver 

lines will operate a regu-
lar weekday schedule on 
April 15 with additional 
service before and after 
the race.

• Buses will operate 
a Saturday schedule on 
April 15 with some routes 
detoured to accommodate 
the Marathon and other 
festivities. Route 1 will 
operate an increased Sat-
urday schedule from 9 
AM to 9 PM on Marathon 
Monday with buses arriv-
ing approximately every 
five minutes.

o   Riders are encour-
aged to subscribe to 
T-Alerts for more infor-
mation on bus route di-
versions. Visit mbta.com/
Marathon for a complete 
list of changes.

• All Commuter Rail 
lines will operate a regu-
lar weekday schedule on 
April 15. There will be a 
special Marathon Monday 
schedule in effect on the 
Framingham/Worcester 
Commuter Rail Line of-
fering four additional in-
bound and five additional 
outbound trips with more 
information on mbta.com 
soon.

• All ferry and RIDE 
paratransit services will 
operate a regular weekday 
schedule. The RIDE may 
be detoured to accommo-
date the Marathon and re-
lated events.

• Bicycles are prohib-

ited onboard all MBTA 
subway vehicles (includ-
ing folding bicycles) for 
the entire day on April 15. 
Additionally, bikes and 
scooters (including fold-
ing ones) will not be al-
lowed on board Framing-
ham/Worcester Commuter 
Rail Line trains starting 
at 5 PM on Sunday, April 
14 (the first inbound train 
impacted is No. 2512 and 
the first outbound train 
impacted is No. 2513) 
through end of service on 
April 15 due to anticipated 
extra Marathon ridership. 
Backpacks, coolers, cans, 
bottles, and large items are 
not permitted at the Mar-
athon.

Paying Fares:
• On the Commuter 

Rail, the MBTA recom-
mends purchasing the $10 
Holiday Weekend Pass, 
which will be available 
for passengers to travel all 
weekend from Saturday, 
April 13, through Monday, 
April 15. The $10 Holiday 
Weekend Pass is valid for 
all Commuter Rail lines 
and zones with unlimited 
hop-on and hop-off trav-
el. Passengers should note 
that Holiday Weekend 
Passes are not valid on 
subway or bus.

• For subway and bus 
travel for those that do not 
already have a monthly 
pass, the MBTA recom-

mends loading at least $5 
on a CharlieCard on Mar-
athon Monday, which is 
enough fare for a round 
trip on the subway. 

• For those traveling to 
the Boston area, a 7-day 
pass might be the most 
useful – the MBTA’s 7-day 
passes are $22.50 and pro-
vide unlimited travel for a 
week from the date of pur-
chase on the subway, bus-
es, Commuter Rail Zone 
1A, and Charlestown and 
East Boston ferries.

• For more informa-
tion on paying fares, visit 
mbta.com/fares and mbta.
com/Marathon.

 
Parking Information:
• Riders planning to 

park in an MBTA garage 
or lot on April 15 should 
allow additional travel 
time and note that some 
garages and lots may fill 
very quickly due to heavy 
parking demand. 

• More information is 
available at mbta.com/
Parking.

For more information, 
visit mbta.com/Marathon 
or connect with the T on X 
(the site formerly known 
as Twitter) @MBTA and 
@MBTA_CR, Facebook 
/TheMBTA, Instagram 
@theMBTA, Threads @
thembta, or TikTok @
thembta. 

Special to the Transcript 

On Monday, April 15, 
Winthrop resident Mika-
ra Loehning will run the 
128th Boston Marathon® 
presented by Bank of 
America on a 26.2-mile 
route from Hopkinton to 
Boston as a member of 
Team Make-A-Wish® 
Massachusetts and Rhode 
Island.

Make-A-Wish Massa-
chusetts and Rhode Is-
land is part of the Bank of 
America Official Charity 
program, with a team of 
10 runners for 2024. As 
a Team Make-A-Wish 
member, Loehning set a 
goal to raise $12,500 to 
help grant wishes for chil-
dren with critical illness-
es through Make-A-Wish 
Massachusetts and Rhode 
Island. The average cost 
to grant a wish is $12,500 
and as Loehning enters the 
final stretch of fundrais-

ing, her total continues to 
climb.

Loehning is excited to 
run as part of Team Make-
A-Wish with her brother 
and her cousin as the trio 
carries on their family’s 
long-standing tradition 
of generously supporting 
Make-A-Wish.

“Having the opportuni-
ty to make a child’s dream 
come true through their 
own wish means more 
to me than these words 
can describe,” says Loeh-
ning. “After marrying into 
the Loehning family, I was 
introduced to Make-A-
Wish by my in-laws, who 
are very active in with the 
charity. Our family holds 
Make-A-Wish Massachu-
setts and Rhode Island 
near and dear to our hearts; 
it is in essence a part of 
our family. My family has 
and will continue to find 
new and innovative ways 
to donate to this important 

and inspiring cause.” 
This will be Loehning’s 

second time running Bos-
ton. An employee of MS 
Walker, Loehning is the 
mother of three, including 
two young twins.

Visit massri.wish.org/
marathon to donate to 
Loehning’s fundraising 
page.

The fundraising efforts 
of Team Make-A-Wish for 
the marathon are part of 
the Make-A-Wish Massa-
chusetts and Rhode Island 
celebration of World Wish 
Month this April. World 
Wish Month is a global 
celebration of the Make-
A-Wish mission and the 
power of wishes to bring 
hope, strength, and joy to 
children who are facing 
life-threatening medical 
conditions. Opportunities 
throughout the month of 
April are available for 
people to take action as 
“WishMakers”—anyone 

who donates their time, 
talent or treasure to Make-
A-Wish to grant more 
life-changing wishes.

To learn more about 
Make-A-Wish Massachu-
setts and Rhode Island and 
find out how you can get 
involved as a volunteer, 
donor, or in many other 
ways during World Wish 
Month and beyond, vis-
it massri.wish.org/wish-
maker. The organization’s 
next fundraising event is 
its annual Wine and Wish-
es tasting event, Friday, 
May 3, at the Artists for 
Humanity EpiCenter in 
Boston.  

Make-A-Wish® Mas-
sachusetts and Rhode Is-
land creates life-changing 
wishes for children with 
critical illnesses. A wish 
can be a spark that helps 
a child believe anything 
is possible. In the face of 
life-threatening medical 
conditions, wishes enable 

children to experience 
profound joy, renewed 
strength and resiliency, 
and lasting hope to keep 
striving and dreaming for 
the future. Together with 
generous supporters and 
450+ volunteers, the or-
ganization has granted 
the wishes of over 10,000 
children in Massachusetts 
and Rhode Island since its 

founding, and its vision is 
to grant the wish of every 
medically eligible child. 
The organization is cele-
brating its 40th anniver-
sary in 2023 and relies 
on the generosity of the 
community to continue 
its wish-granting work. 
To learn more and get in-
volved, visit www.massri.
wish.org. 

Winthrop’s Loehning to run 128th Boston 
Marathon on behalf of Make-A-Wish

Mikara Loehning upon finishing her previous Boston Mar-
athon.
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The WHS baseball team 
dropped its NEC season 
opener to Lynn English, 
9-1. Matt Driscoll provid-
ed the lone highlight for 
the Vikings with a home 
run.

30 years ago
April 21,1994
Danny Godfrey pitched 

seven strong innings and 
socked a home run to lead 
the WHS baseball team to 
a 3-2 win over Salem.

Kim Milligan, playing 
at No. 1 singles for the 
WHS boys tennis team, 
was the lone winner for 
the Viking netmen in a 4-1 
loss to Gloucester.

The WHS softball team 
scored three runs in the 
bottom of the last inning 
to defeat Salem, 14-13. 
Janelle Forbes stroked a 
two-run single to tie the 
game and then Jamie Maz-
zone came through with a 
base hit with two outs to 
bring in Forbes with the 
winning run.

The WHS boys out-
door track team improved 
to 3-0 with a 77-35 romp 
over Lynn Classical. Todd 
Doherty, who has been a 

triple-winner in all three 
of the Vikings' meets this 
season, won the 100 me-
ter dash in 11.9; the triple 
jump with a leap of 40'-5"; 
and the 200 dash in 25.2.

40 years ago
April 25, 1984
Ken Sirianni captured 

the 880 and Lou Maz-
zone won the 220 dash at 
the Haverhill Invitational 
Meet this past weekend. In 
a dual meet with Glouces-
ter, Sirianni came within 
0.2 seconds of the school 
record in the 880 set by 
Doug Hill 10 years ago 
with a clocking of 1:59.4. 
The Viking trackmen en-
joyed a successful open-
ing week with wins over 
Gloucester and Salem.

The WHS softball team 
dropped its opening three 
contests this week. A lack 
of hitting plagued the 
Lady Vikings, who mus-
tered only 10 hits in the 
three contests.

Sal Tiano smacked a 
pair of triples for two RBI, 
but the WHS baseball 
team dropped a 5-4 deci-
sion to Beverly in extra 
innings. The Vikings now 

stand at 1-4 on the season.
Lady Viking standout 

Helen Balaouras racked 
up 24 points in wins over 
Salem and Gloucester for 
the Winthrop High girls 
track team.

50 years ago
April 24, 1974
Coach Ed Nazza-

ro's WHS baseball team 
opened the season with 
losses to Beverly and Dan-
vers. The Vikings man-

aged just three hits in each 
game.

A record number of 70 
girls are participating in 
the junior high track pro-
gram this spring.

60 years ago
April 23, 1964
Alan Graham's 

RBI-double provided the 
lone run for the WHS 
baseball team in a 9-1 loss 
to Marblehead.

CONTRACTOR

MOVERS

Ronnie Z.
Leave Your  

Moving To Us
Whether It Be One Piece or More!

Call Ronnie
781-321-2499

For A Free Estimate

10% OFF FOR SENIOR CITIZENS, 
VETERANS & DISABLED

2 col. x 1 inch
$120.00

HOME REPAIR

CONSTRUCTION

HOME
REPAIR?
Call AL COY
617-539-0489

Masonry &
Chimney Pointing,

Carpentry & Odd Jobs

We Clean
& Repair
Gutters

CLEANING SERVICES

Winthrop'Winthrop's s Professional Service DirectoryProfessional Service Directory

RICH BUILDERS
Winthrop, MA 02152
Licensed & Insured

617-212-7792 Cell
Interior & Exterior • Construction 

Remodeling • Painting
Over 25 years in business

FREE Estimates

L. P.
CONTRACTING

LUIGI:
(617) 846-0142

FREE ESTIMATES
… LICENSED …

INSURED

Building & Remodeling

Kitchen ✧ Bathroom
Additions ✧ Porches

Replacement windows
Garages ✧ Decks
Siding - All Types

mr. fix it
REPAIR MOST 

ANYTHING, DOORS, 
WINDOWS PORCHES, 

REPLACEMENT 
WINDOWS, FENCES, 

SIDING, FLOORS ETC.
SNOW PLOWING

LICENSED AND INSURED
CALL AL  

617-429-0606

handy man services

Advertise for 3 months for only:

1 col. x  
2 inches
$120.00

1 col. x 
1 inch
$5/wk

1 col. x 
1 inch
$5/wk

2 col. x 2 inches
$240.00

Spartan 
Cleaning 
ServiCe

Since 1978

COMMERCIAL  
RESIDENTIAL

CARPET AND UPHOLSTERY
CLEANING

Satisfaction Guaranteed
Call

617-593-4532
617-567-2926

Removes Dirt • Cleans • Deodorizes
Complete Office Cleaning

Tommy Feeley 781-771-4707Tommy Feeley 781-771-4707

Feeley & Daughters Clean-Up ServiceFeeley & Daughters Clean-Up Service
We remove all We remove all 
sorts of junk!sorts of junk!
Quick & Quick & 
convenient service.convenient service.

Free Free 
estimates!estimates!

2 col. x 2 inches
$240.00

M
OONEY ELECTRIC LLC

Residential & 
Commercial

Fully Licensed & Insured

KEVIN MOONEY
781-799-1862

• Painting & Decor
• Light Carpentry
• Finish Carpentry

More than 
30 years experience

Call Dennis
781-307-0947

DH HANDYMAN

Specializing in Home Renovations
Kitchen+Bath • Cabinets, Granite Counters •Doors+Window • Decks 

Enclosurer • Pavers + Blockwalls • Additions • Interior+Exterior Painting

ALL YOUR HOME OWNER NEEDS

PAINTING & REMODELING PAINTING & REMODELING 
SERVICESSERVICES

Call Don Falzarano
617-846-6553

LANDSCAPING

LANDSCAPING

RAY’S LANDSCAPING GARDENING SERVICES
Mowing - Weeding

Trimming: Bushes Shrubs
Everywhere in Front & Back Yard

New Lawn, Patios, Concrete, Brick work
Call RAY — 781-526-1181 Free Estimates!

STEVEN'S
LANDSCAPING & HARDSCAPING

Spring & Fall Clean Up • Tree Trimming
Mowing, Weeding & Edging

Hedge Trimming & Removal (shrub & bushes) 
New Lawns Installed (seed or sod)

Planting & Mulching • Fence Installation
Patios, Retaining Walls & Other Hardscapes

And more!
Call or Text

For a free estimate

781-244-9997Steven 

978-876-6566Diego

Schedule a free estimate 
617-592-6447

www.dipierroconstruction.com

In business for over 40 years!

Let us turn your house into a home

HANDYMANELECTRICIAN

BBii--WWeeeekkllyy  MMoowwiinngg  
Yard Clean Ups

Trimming | Mulch
Pressure Washing

bgservice617@gmail.com

B&G 
LANDSCAPING SERVICE 

781-407-1100781-407-1100
EXTERIORS

American Exterior and
Window Corporation

Contact us for all of your
Home improvement projects 

and necessities

Call Jeff or Bob
Toll Free: 1-888-744-1756

 americanexteriorforma.com

617-699-1782
Windows,Siding,Roofing, Carpentry 
& More! All estimates, consultations 

or inspections completed by MA 
licensed supervisors. 

*Over 50 years experience. 
*Better Business Bureau Membership.

Insured 
and

Registered

Complete Financing 
Available.

No Money Down.

Roberta Will
• Painting 

• Wall Papering 
• Decorative Painting 

• Murals 
617-846-8992

1 col. x  
1 inch
$60.00

For 3 Months
($5/wk)

PAINTING

John J. Recca 
Painting

Interior/Exterior 
Commercial/Residential

Fully Insured 
Quality Work

Reasonable Rates   
Free Estimates

781-241-2454

Joe Bertino OwnerJoe Bertino Owner
978-376-6661978-376-6661

Interior and Exterior PaintingInterior and Exterior Painting
Bertinopaintingcompany@gmail.com

PLUMBING

CALL
POOLS

COSMO POOLS
• NEW LINERS

• INSTALLATION
•POOL OPENINGS

CALL JOHN
781-589-0505

1 col. x  
2 inches

ROOFING REPAIRS

HOME RENOVATION
ROOFING-SIDING-PAINTING

SERVING THE BOSTON AREA SINCE 2002

marcelo
de souza

617-507-1703
Lic. & insured CSL 100141LOCALLOCAL

SONNY’S
IMMEDIATE

ROOFING
778811--224488--88229977

Residential - Commercial
All types of roofing & repairs
Painting & Carpentry
Licensed
Insured
Free estimates

sonnysimmediateservices.com

TO ADVERTISE IN OUR 
SERVICE DIRECTORY, PLEASE 

CALL 781-485-0588 OR EMAIL 
DEB@REVEREJOURNAL.COM

Sports Years //  CONTINUED FROM PAGE 11

CLASSIFIEDSCLASSIFIEDS

Charlestown  |  Chelsea  |  East Boston

Everett  |  Lynn  |  Revere  |  Winthrop

PCA NEEDED
EVERETT-Personal Care 
Assistant needed - 
Mornings 8am-2pm or 
evenings 3pm-7pm.
Hablo Español. Call 
Susan 617-389-6190

____________

HELP WANTED
"Marathon Mutts 
is looking for dog 
walkers! Available 
hours are Monday 
through Friday 

between 9AM & 3PM. 
Email Nellie for more 
information: nellie@
marathon-mutts.com “ 
3/27-4/17

HELP WANTED

YARD
SALES

CHARLESTOWN

WINTHROP

 

TAG SALE | APRIL 13 - 9A-1P
29 SOLEY ST

ANTIQUES AND FINE CHINA, HOME DECOR, 
FURNITURE, JEWELRY, MUSICAL  

INSTRUMENTS, BOOKS, DIGITAL CAMERAS 
& MORE

NO BABY ITEMS | CASH ONLY

SATURDAY. APRIL 20 |  8A – 12P
40 FREMONT ST. WINTHROP, MA.

FURNITURE, KITCHEN AND 
HOUSEHOLD ITEMS, BOOKS, ETC.

MOVING SALE - EVERYTHING MUST GO!
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FIND YOUR PLACE 
AT EBNHC

Check us out!

 Inspection Station
 Auto Repair

 Tires now offeringnow offering
CAR DETAILINGCAR DETAILING

call johncall john

now offeringnow offering
CAR DETAILINGCAR DETAILING

call johncall john

4 generations of

car care    repair

88 BROADWAY, REVERE | (617) 996-8371

owned and operated
by

tHe Digregorio faMiLY
since 1947

tom digregorio | john digregorio | paul florio





&

Mom’s The Word!

This is my mother - Mother ’s name __________________________________________________

Drawn By - Your name _________________________________________________

Phone # ______________________________________________________________

City __________________________________________________________________  

DRAW YOUR 

MOM!

Draw Your Mom
• Complete the picture by creating a picture of your mother
• Pens, pencils, markers or crayons, use colors

Email your photo to
 promo@reverejournal.com

Please include the publication in the email or text

Deadline for entries will be Friday, May 3rd. 
Entries will be published with in the May 8th issue

COLORING CONTEST
SHOW 
YOUR MOM HOW MUCH YOU LOVE HER!

THE MORE Things Change ...
Items selected from past issues of the Winthrop Sun, The Winthrop 
Review, The Winthrop Visitor,  The Transcript and The Sun-Transcript

30 years ago
April 21, 1994
The selectmen and Ad-

visory Committee have 
agreed that Town Meeting 
should defer taking action 
on all monetary articles 
at the upcoming Town 
Meeting until the state has 
released the annual cher-
ry sheets that will show 
how much local aid from 
the state will be coming to 
Winthrop. Town Meeting 
took the same action two 
years ago when the cherry 
sheets similarly were tar-
dy from the state.

Holy Rosary Parish 
pastor Rev. Francis M. 
Greaney has announced 
that Bernard Cardinal Law 
will be visiting the par-
ish this weekend. He will 
spend the afternoon here 
Saturday and then return 
Sunday to celebrate all 
four Masses. There then 
will be a reception for 
Cardinal Law in the after-
noon at the PSA Hall.

The Playmakers' lat-
est production, Lend Me 
a Tenor, will open this 
weekend.

The Fire Investigation 
Unit of the Winthrop Fire 
Dept. has labeled as sus-
picious a blaze that totally 
destroyed four boats and 
caused heat damage to 
three others at the Atlan-
tic Marina on Pleasant St. 
Saturday night.

William E. Meryman, 
local historian, poet, and 
frequent letter-to-the edi-
tor writer to the Sun-Tran-
script, passed away last 
week. He recently au-
thored a book, Winthrop 
Beach Memoirs.

40 years ago
April 25, 1984
Town Meeting will take 

up an article calling for 
the imposition of mooring 
fees for boats anchored 
in Winthrop waters when 
Town Meeting reconvenes 
Thursday evening.

The Board of Health 
has entered into a new 
contract of $235,000 for 

rubbish removal by the 
Paulino Co.

About 30 parents of 
Dalrymple School stu-
dents attended a School 
Committee meeting to 
voice their protests over 
the decision of the schools 
not to provide busing for 
Dalrymple students.

The School Commit-
tee passed a budget for 
the coming fiscal year of 
$6,454,376 based on a stu-
dent enrollment of 2236 
pupils. This is an increase 
of $233,931 over this 
year's budget.

50 years ago
April 24,1974
The School Committee 

has claimed that Town 
Meeting illegally cut the 
School Department bud-
get by $37,000, as ad-
vocated by the Advisory 
Committee, which had 
recommended that Town 
Meeting slash $37,000 
from the $106,000 line 
item for utility bills for the 
schools and skating rink. 
The School Committee 
voted to ask the Attorney 
General to represent the 
School Department to en-
force the state law that re-
quires every city and town 
to provide funding "suffi-
cient for the support of the 
public schools."

John D. O'Connell is the 
new chairman of the Win-
throp Housing Authority.

Tax Collector Phil 
Genovese has reported 
that four local motorists 
have had their driver's li-
censes suspended pursu-
ant to the new state law for 
failure to have paid their 
auto excise taxes.

WHDH radio person-
ality Jess Cain will be the 
featured speaker at the an-
nual WINARC fundrais-
er dinner at the Winthrop 
Yacht Club.

A local man was saved  
thanks to quick action by 
Dr. Shah in the emergency 
room at Winthrop Hospi-
tal after the man acciden-
tally had shot himself in 

the groin when his .38 cal-
iber gun fell to the ground 
and discharged.

Suffolk County Sheriff 
Thomas Eisenstadt has 
called for the immediate 
closing of the county jail 
at Deer Island because of 
the "decrepit and danger-
ous conditions" at the fa-
cility.

Walking Tall is playing 
at the Kincade Theatre.

60 years ago
April 23, 1964
Voters went to the polls 

for a special referendum 
and handily approved 
a question calling for a 
bond to construct a new 
senior high school by a 
vote of 2774-2063. The 
referendum had become 
necessary because an an-
ti-school group had filed 
a petition for the ballot 
question after Town Meet-
ing had unanimously ap-
proved the measure.

The first new business 
complex in the town in 
50 years cut the ribbon 
Monday with the dedi-
cation ceremonies of the 
new store block addition 
in the Centre. Occupying 
the new block will be Mi-
chael's Department Store, 
Harold's Bootery, and 
George Frattaroli Insur-
ance and Real Estate.

Mail Order Bride is 
playing at the Winthrop 
Theatre.

70 years ago
April 22, 1954
Two Winthrop men 

were arrested for the stick-
up attack of a local store 
owner. Lieut. Frank Per-
rone arrested Charles Del-
lamo and Stephen Walters, 
as well as the latter's wife, 
for their role in the assault 
on 85 year old Joseph 
Goodman, who was beat-
en and robbed in his store, 
Dave's Variety at 549 
Shirley St. Goodman is in 
critical condition at Mass. 
General.

A 29 year old local 
man, Robert Stanton, was 

arrested by police after 
a wild car chase through 
the town in which shots 
were fired at Stanton's 
vehicle, which he had sto-
len on Cliff Ave. Stanton 
was charged with various 
crimes, including drunk 
driving.

The possibility of Win-
throp being able to operate 
its own municipal bus line 
took a big step closer to 
becoming reality when a 
bill filed by State Senator 
Andrew P. Quigley was 
admitted unanimously by 
the Senate as a late-filed 
bill. If both the House and 
Senate approve the bill, 
it will come before local 
voters. Local commut-
ers have been up in arms 
about the recent fare in-
crease granted to the cur-
rent bus operator, Rapid 
Transit Inc.

The Mystic Valley Gas 
Co. has announced a re-
duction in gas rates for 
the second successive year 
since the introduction of 
natural gas to this area.

Motorists will be ex-
pected to stop their cars 
and seek shelter along 
with other pedestrians 
when a full-scale air raid 
test will be conducted in 
this area Saturday.

Gordon G. Fullerton 
Inc., a Chevy dealer in 
town since 1925, has an-
nounced the opening of its 
new and expanded show-
room at the corner of Main 
and Pleasant Sts.

Charlton Heston and 
Eleanor Parker star in The 
Naked Jungle at the Win-
throp Theatre.

80 years ago
April 22, 1944
The Presidential pri-

mary election for the se-
lection of delegates to the 
Democratic and Republi-
can national conventions 
is set for Tuesday.

A memorial service 
will be held this week for 
Sgt. Frank J. Mulone, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Antonio 
Mulone of Marshall St., 

who has been reported as 
missing in action since his 
plane was shot down by 
the Germans over Tuni-
sia on February 21, 1943, 
and who now is presumed 
dead. Sgt. Mulone was 
a 1936 graduate of Win-
throp High.

The Winthrop Memo-
rial Day Committee has 
obtained a plot in the local 
cemetery for the purpose 
of honoring all of the local 
men and women who have 
lost their lives in the pres-
ent world war.

Maurice W. Kirby was 
installed as the Exalted 
Ruler of the local Elks in 
impressive exercises at-
tended by 200 persons.

Spencer Tracy and Irene 
Dunn star in A Guy Named 
Joe at the Winthrop and 
State Theatres.

90 years ago
April 21, 1934
The Winthrop Beach 

Improvement Association 
honored town officials at 
its 13th annual banquet 
and meeting last week. 
More than 100 persons en-
joyed the excellent menu 
and festivities.

Shore Drive Blvd. 
once again took a heavy 
pounding from high tides 
and heavy seas this week, 
causing thousands of dol-
lars of damage to shore-
line properties. The need 
for additional jetties was 
highlighted by the storm's 
damage.

Thomas Taylor of the 
Winthrop Laundering Co. 
has been named president 
of a new organization of 
launderers from six com-
munities.

Clark Gable and Clau-
dette Colbert star in It 
Happened One Night at 
the Winthrop and State 
Theatres.

100 years ago
April 26, 1924
It took only 20 min-

utes for the Special Town 
Meeting to give its ap-

proval for an article calling 
for the purchase of the lot 
on Hermon for construc-
tion of a new junior high 
school on Hermon St. The 
lot contains 50,500 square 
feet and will cost $10,000.

Police Chief MacNeil 
told the selectmen that 
Winthrop is 90 percent 
"cleaner" than most cities 
and towns in the state as 
regards bootlegging ac-
tivity. He said his men are 
willing and able to enforce 
the law with the full coop-
eration of local citizens. As 
regards the recent rash of 
auto thefts, the chief said 
most of the eight cars tak-
en in the past two weeks 
were stolen by joyriders. 
However, the selectmen 
opined that the joyriders 
most likely were drunk, 
which indicates therefore 
that a liquor problem ex-
ists in the town.

A telephone operator 
for the Ocean exchange 
helped save the life of the 
baby boy of Mr. and Mrs. 
William Talcott, who was 
suffering from pneumo-
nia. The operator made a 
great effort to locate the 
family's doctor in East 
Boston, who was able to 
come to the baby's aid.

110 years ago
April 25, 1914
Winthrop in particular 

is interested in the activi-
ties of the American fleet 
off Tampico and Vercruz, 
Mexico, because sever-
al local boys are serving 
there. Robert Clark, Frank 
Clark, and Henry Ballem 
are on three of the U.S. 
Navy ships in that part of 
the world.

Margaret Winthrop Re-
bekah Lodge No. 153, 
IOOF, celebrated its 15th 
birthday at its hall Mon-
day evening. The evening 
was marked by the visi-
tation of the Rebekah as-
sembly officers and past 
noble grands.


